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WELL INDEX SHEET CULVERIN-1 Page 1 of 1
LOCATION: Survey: Volador 3D PERMIT: VIC/P56
Line: 299 BASIN: Gippsland
Trace: 883
Offset: 11.4m PARTICIPANTS: Nexus Energy (Op) 40%,
KNOC 30%, SCGAU P/L 20%,
Anzon Australia 10%
SURFACE Latitude: 3824’ 08.14"S WELL DESIGNATION: Exploration
LOCATION: Longitude: 148 39’ 14.92E STATUS: Plugged and Abandoned
Easting: 644 437.3mE STRUCTURE TYPE: Tilted fault block
Northing: 5748 256.4mN
. Ocean Patriot, Semi-
RIG NAME AND TYPE: submersible MODU
. . Diamond Offshore General
Datum: GDA9%4 RIG CONTRACTOR: Company (DOGC)
Spheroid: GRS80
Map Grid: MGA
Projection: UTM Zone 55
(Central
Meridian 147 E)
TOTAL DEPTH: Driller: 3758.0mMD HOLE SIZES: 914mm (36”) 607 — 650m
Logger: 3757.0mMD 445mm (172") 650 — 1525m
311mm (1274”) 1525 — 3758m
ELEVATION: Datum: LAT
RT-ASL (LAT): 21.5m CASING: Size Shoe
WD (LAT): 585.0m 762mm (30”) 650.3m
RT-ML: 606.5m 340mm (13%”) 1511.8m
SPUD DATE: 13:30hrs 16/12/2005 PLUGS: No. 1 3750 — 3560m
REACHED TD: 24:00hrs 06/01/2006 No. 2 2865 — 2735m
RIG RELEASED: 15:00hrs 15/01/2006 No. 3 1550 — 1421m
No. 4 721 - 625m
LWD LOGS
RUN NO HOLE SIZE TOOLS INTERVAL |COMMENTS
1 445mm (17%%")  |DM-GR 650-650 POOH due to suspect battery failure.
2 445mm (17%") |DM-GR 650-1525 Drilled to section TD.
3 311mm (12%") DM-DGR-EWR-P4-SLD-CTN-ACAL | 1525-3402 POOH due to slow ROP.
4 311mm (12%4") DM-DGR-EWR-P4-SLD-CTN-ACAL | 3402-3571 POOH due to slow ROP.
5 311mm (12%4") DM-DGR-EWR-P4-SLD-CTN-ACAL | 3571-3571 POOH due to Pulser failure.
6 311mm (1274") DM-DGR-EWR-P4-SLD-CTN-ACAL | 3571-3758 Lost comms with tool at 3714m.
WIRELINE LOGS
LOG TYPE SUITE/RUN |INTERVAL mRT | BHT/TIME COMMENTS
. . Main pass logged at 1800ft/hr hi res to 2775m then
PEX-HALS-DSI-GR 11 3758 - 607 87.9°C/22:15hrs 3478ft/hr in standard res to 607m.
. . Recorded VSP levels (15m spacing) to 3200m.
VSI(4)-GR 12 3690 - 607 91.0C/34:100rs |~ tinued checkshots at 100m spacing to 607m.
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Figure 1: Culverin-1 Location Map
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1

1.1

1.2

OPERATIONS SUMMARY

Move to Location / Run Anchors

The Ocean Patriot was released from Apache’s Fur Seal-1 location at 18:00hrs on the 5" of
November 2005 and towed to the Culverin-1 location (Figure 1) arriving at 03:00hrs on the
6" November and commenced running anchors. At 14:50hrs anchor winch No. 4 failed
destroying the gear box and allowing the anchor and anchor chain to fall to the seabed.
The rig was taken off hire at 15:00hrs and towed to Eden for repairs. On completion of
repairs and a hull survey, the rig was towed back to location, arriving on November 14",
and recommenced running anchors. At the same time preparations were made to spud the
well.

Drilling Operations
1.2.1 914mm (36”) Hole / 762mm (30”) Casing

The 914mm hole was drilled riser-less with returns to the seabed using a 445mm
(1772") bit and 914mm (36”) hole opener. The Bottom Hole Assembly (BHA) was
made up and run to seafloor at 607mMD and the well spudded at 13:30hrs on
16/12/2006. The 914mm (36”) hole was drilled using high viscosity sweeps for hole
cleaning to the section TD at 650mMD. The hole was circulated clean and the BHA
pulled out in preparation to run 762mm (30”) casing.

The 762mm (30”) casing and Permanent Guide Base (PGB) was made up, run in
hole and landed. The guide lines were installed before the casing was cemented
back to the seabed.

1.2.2 445mm (177%") Hole Section

A 445mm (17'2") BHA with directional and Gamma Measurement While Drilling
(MWD) tools was picked up and run in hole, but shallow tested unsuccessfully. The
BHA was pulled out of the hole, the MWD internals were replaced, then tested
successfully and run in the hole to the Permanent Guide Base. The guide ropes on
the PGB parted while attempting to stab the BHA into the wellhead during high
winds and seas. The BHA was pulled out of the hole and new ropes were installed.
The BHA was re-run, successfully stabbed into the PGB, run in hole and then drilled
out the cement and 672mm (30”) shoe. New 445mm (17°%”) hole was then drilled
riser-less with returns to the seabed from 560mMD to the section TD at 1525mMD.
The hole was circulated clean and the BHA was pulled out in preparation to run and
cement the 340mm (13%s”) casing.

1.2.3 340mm (13%”) Casing / Running Riser and Blow Out Preventers (BOP’s)

The 340mm (13%”) casing was run and landed at 1511mMD before being cemented
in place. After laying down the cement head, the riser handling equipment was
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1.2.4

rigged up and the BOP’s and riser run to the seabed. The BOP’s were successfully
landed and the wellhead connector tested before the diverter and surface
equipment was rigged up and pressure tested.

311mm (12%4”) Hole Section

The 311mm (1274”) BHA, including 311mm (12%4”) PDC bit, motor and triple combo
MWD/LWD string (Gamma-Resistivity-Density-Neutron) was made up run in the
hole and drilled out the cement, shoe track and 340mm (133s”) casing shoe, and 3m
of new formation while displacing the well to KCI-NaCI-PHPA-Glycol mud. A
formation leak-off test was carried out to an (Equivalent Mud Weight) EMW of
15.8ppg. The 311mm (1274”) hole was then drilled from 1544mMD to 3402mMD,
where the drill string was pulled out of hole to replace the bit. A new PDC bit was
run in the hole and drilling continued from 3402mMD to 3571mMD, where the drill
string was pulled out to inspect for a suspected washout. At the same time the BHA
was changed over to a rotary assembly (the down hole motor was taken out) and a
311mm (12%4") tri-cone bit was run back in the hole. While running in the MWD
failed, so the string was pulled out and the MWD tools replaced and the BHA
configuration adjusted before running back in to bottom, where drilling continued
from 3571mMD to the final TD of 3758mMD, which was reached at midnight on
January 6™ 20086.

After circulating the hole clean, the drill string was pulled out and Schlumberger
rigged up to run the following electric logs;

Run 1: PEX-HALS-DSI-GR
Run 2: VSI(4)-GR

1.3 Plug & Abandon (P&A) Operations

After evaluation of the logs a decision was made to plug and abandon the well. Four

cement plugs were set over the following intervals:

Plug 1:
Plug 2:
Plug 3:
Plug 4.

3750-3560mMD
2865-2735mMD
1550-1421mMD
721-625mMD

After tagging the last plug the riser and BOP’s were recovered before the 508mm (20”) and
762mm (30”) casing and PGB was cut and pulled. Once the guide base was recovered and

BOP’s

were set back on the carrier, the last of the drill pipe and BHA were laid down from

the derrick in preparation to de-ballast the rig and recover anchors. Anchor handling was
completed and the rig was handed over to Anzon at 15:00hrs on January 15™ 2006.

A total of 33.4 days was spent on the on the well (30.06 days from spud) with the last

drilling

report on January 15" 2006. Figure 2 shows how this compared to the pre-drill plan.
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Culverin-1 Time vs Depth Curve
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Figure 2: Culverin-1 Drilling Time/Depth Curve
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2 DRILLING AND COMPLETION DATA
A drilling and engineering end of well report is contained in Appendix 1, with copies of the
Daily Drilling Reports in Appendix 2. Documentation of the rig move and the final well
location survey is contained in Appendix 3. A schematic diagram of the well bore after P&A is
shown in Figure 3
2.1 Hole Sizes and Depths
Hole sizes and the depths to which they were drilled are as follows;
914mm / 36” 606.5 to 650mMD
445mm / 172" 650 to 1525mMD
311mm [ 12%4” 1525 to 3758mMD  (Total Depth)
2.2 Casing Data
Two casing strings were run in Culverin-1, as tabulated below;
TYPE Size Weight Grade | Thread Shoe Depth
Structural Casing 762mm | 679/461kg/m | X-52 | Lynx SA2 | 650.9mMD
(30”) (457/310ppf)
Surface Casing 340mm | 101kg/m L80 Buttress 1511.8mMD
(13%”) | (68ppf)
2.3 Cementing Data
Cementing operations on Culverin-1 were for the two casing strings and four P&A plugs. A
detailed cementing report is contained in Appendix 4.
2.4 Surveys
Directional surveying of the well path was conducted by Sperry Drilling Services using their
Measurement While Drilling (MWD) equipment. The measure points from this surveying are
contained in the table below and a full report is contained in Appendix 5.
Measured Inclination Direction Vertical Latitude Departure Vertical Dogleg
Depth Depth Section
(metres) (degrees) (degrees) (metres) (metres) (metres) (metres) (deg/30m)
681.95 1.26 227 681.9 51 S 547 W -5.1 TIE-IN
767.68 0.81 263.55 767.61 581 S 6.76 W -8.73 0.27
825.04 0.93 254.57 824.97 598 S 762 W -9.38 0.09
911.19 1.09 257.49 911.1 6.34 S 9.09 W -10.57 0.06
1027.78 0.85 2526 | 1027.68 6.84 S 11 W -12.13 0.06
1056.46 0.79 254.04 | 1056.35 6.96 S 1139 W -12.46 0.07
1085.16 0.77 260.55 | 1085.05 7.05 S 177 W -12.76 0.09
1113.81 0.62 255.11 1113.7 712 S 1211 W -13.02 0.18
1142.54 0.51 257.73 | 114243 719 S 12.38 W -13.24 0.11
1171.11 0.43 257.64 1171 724 S 1261 W -13.42 0.08
1228.35 0.22 250.9 | 1228.23 732 S 1293 W -13.68 0.12
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5 Nexus Energv Iitd
Measured Inclination Direction Vertical Latitude Departure Vertical Dogleg
Depth Depth Section
(metres) (degrees) (degrees) (metres) (metres) (metres) (metres) (deg/30m)
1257.08 0.17 244.39 1256.96 735 S 13.02 W -13.76 0.05
1342.79 0.06 257.65 1342.67 742 S 13.18 W -13.92 0.04
1371.46 0.03 247.14 1371.34 743 S 132 W -13.93 0.03
1428.75 0.11 336.43 1428.63 738 S 1324 W -13.92 0.06
1486.03 0.16 21.18 1485.91 726 S 13.23 W -13.82 0.06
1509.77 0.09 0.7 1509.65 721 S 1322 W -13.77 0.1
1525 0.09 0.7 1524.88 717 S 1322 W -13.74 0.24
1540.46 0.33 354.58 1540.34 71 S 1323 W -13.69 0.24
1569.11 0.36 350.12 1568.99 693 S 1325 W -13.57 0.04
1597.73 0.5 2.93 1597.61 6.71 S 13.26 W -13.4 0.18
1626.44 0.63 1.96 1626.32 643 S 1325 W -13.17 0.14
1655.17 0.86 9.39 1655.05 6.06 S 1321 W -12.85 0.26
1683.81 1.15 21.61 1683.68 558 S 13.07 W -12.39 0.38
1712.56 1.54 24.62 1712.43 49 S 128 W -11.74 0.42
1741.12 1.85 23.41 1740.97 419 S 1246 W -10.91 0.33
1769.9 212 24.21 1769.74 328 S 1205 W -9.94 0.28
1798.49 2.39 23.17 1798.3 225 S 116 W -8.85 0.28
1827.17 2.73 24.42 1826.96 1.08 S 11.09 W -7.61 0.36
1855.78 2.98 24.43 1855.53 022 N 105 W -6.22 0.27
1884.43 3.09 24.8 1884.14 16 N 987 W -4.74 0.12
1913.08 3.07 24.58 1912.75 3 N 922 W -3.24 0.02
1941.89 3.12 23.61 1941.52 442 N 859 W -1.73 0.08
1970.98 3.18 2411 1970.56 588 N 794 W -0.17 0.07
1999.06 3.22 24.85 1998.6 731 N 729 W 1.36 0.06
2027.82 3.27 25.23 2027.31 879 N 6.6 W 2.95 0.06
2056.65 3.24 27.04 2056.09 10.26 N 588 W 4.56 0.11
2085.12 3.33 26.59 2084.52 11.72 N 514 W 6.16 0.1
2113.64 3.4 27.83 2112.99 13.21 N 437 W 7.81 0.1
2142.04 3.46 29.61 2141.34 147 N 356 W 9.49 0.13
2170.63 3.6 30.3 2169.87 16.22 N 268 W 11.23 0.15
2199.17 3.77 30.65 2198.35 17.8 N 1.75 W 13.05 0.18
2227.87 3.85 36.05 2226.99 19.39 N 0.7 W 14.95 0.38
2256.54 3.99 35.43 2255.59 20.98 N 044 E 16.91 0.16
2285.35 4.14 37.21 2284.33 2263 N 165 E 18.95 0.2
2314.02 415 34.69 2312.93 2431 N 287 E 21.02 0.19
2342.6 4.24 35.48 2341.43 26.02 N 407 E 23.11 0.11
2371.3 4.2 37.23 2370.05 27.72 N 532 E 25.22 0.14
2399.91 4.28 37.96 2398.58 29.39 N 6.61 E 27.34 0.1
2428.46 43 38.32 2427.05 31.07 N 793 E 29.47 0.04
2457 .14 4.3 37.54 2455.65 32.77 N 925 E 31.62 0.06
2514.65 4.09 38.4 2513.01 36.09 N 1184 E 35.83 0.11
2543.24 4.05 40.48 2541.53 37.66 N 13.13 E 37.86 0.16
2572 4.01 40.97 2570.22 39.19 N 1445 E 39.88 0.05
2600.65 3.91 40.54 2598.8 40.69 N 15.74 E 41.85 0.11
2629.39 3.86 40.58 2627.47 4217 N 17.01 E 43.8 0.05
2658.02 3.89 41.3 2656.04 43.63 N 1828 E 45.73 0.06
2686.6 3.77 41.46 2684.55 45.06 N 1954 E 47.63 0.12
2715.15 3.77 40.42 2713.04 46.48 N 20.77 E 49.51 0.07
2743.83 3.8 42.1 2741.66 479 N 2202 E 51.4 0.12
2772.65 3.83 43.73 2770.41 493 N 2332 E 53.31 0.12
2801.66 3.84 42.76 2799.36 50.72 N 2465 E 55.24 0.07
2830.44 3.89 43.81 2828.07 52.13 N 2598 E 57.17 0.09
2859.14 3.95 44.31 2856.71 53.54 N 2735 E 59.12 0.08
2887.7 3.86 45.65 2885.2 5492 N 28.72 E 61.05 0.14
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Measured Inclination Direction Vertical Latitude Departure Vertical Dogleg
Depth Depth Section
(metres) (degrees) (degrees) (metres) (metres) (metres) (metres) (deg/30m)
2916.43 3.87 45.26 2913.86 56.27 N 301 E 62.96 0.03
2944 .96 3.83 45.79 2942.33 57.61 N 3147 E 64.86 0.06
2973.53 3.73 46.71 2970.84 58.92 N 3283 E 66.72 0.12
3002.19 3.72 46.75 2999.44 60.19 N 34.18 E 68.56 0.01
3059.49 3.72 46.57 3056.62 62.74 N 36.89 E 72.23 0.01
3088.21 3.81 46.46 3085.28 64.04 N 38.25 E 74.09 0.1
3116.08 3.75 45.37 3113.08 65.32 N 3957 E 75.91 0.1
3145.07 3.74 48.33 3142.01 66.61 N 40.95 E 77.77 0.2
3173.79 3.67 49.59 3170.67 67.83 N 4235 E 79.59 0.11
3202.65 3.71 48.97 3199.47 69.04 N 43.76 E 81.41 0.06
3231.77 3.53 48.2 3228.54 70.26 N 4514 E 83.22 0.2
3260.37 3.66 49.86 3257.08 7143 N 46.49 E 84.97 0.17
3317.48 3.72 47.74 3314.07 73.86 N 49.26 E 88.58 0.08
3346.36 3.65 50.41 3342.89 75.07 N 50.66 E 90.4 0.19
3375.03 3.69 54.03 3371.5 76.2 N 5211 E 92.17 0.25
3404.4 3.54 54.9 3400.81 77.27 N 53.62 E 93.95 0.17
3432.8 3.59 51.96 3429.16 7833 N 55.04 E 95.64 0.2
3461.32 3.48 51.53 3457.62 7941 N 56.42 E 97.35 0.12
3490.24 3.38 50.31 3486.49 80.5 N 57.76 E 99.03 0.13
3519.26 3.32 50.11 3515.46 81.59 N 59.06 E 100.68 0.06
3547.59 3.32 49.95 3543.75 82.64 N 60.32 E 102.29 0.01
3555.34 3.36 53.74 3551.48 8292 N 60.68 E 102.72 0.87
3583.83 3 50.85 3579.93 83.89 N 6193 E 104.25 0.41
3641.38 2.98 50.16 3637.4 85.8 N 64.24 E 107.18 0.02
3758 2.98 50.16 3753.86 89.68 N 689 E 113.09 0

2.5 Bit Record

Four bits were used to drill Culverin-1, one in the 17.5” hole section and three in the 124"
hole section. The bit record is included in Appendix 6.

2.6 Mud Data

M-I Australia Pty Ltd provided the drilling mud for Culverin-1. A summary table and a full
report of drilling fluids, physical mud properties and chemicals used are provided in
Appendix 7.

2.7 Testing

No formation testing was carried out on Culverin-1.

3 FORMATION EVALUATION

3.1 Mudlogging
3.1.1 Mudlogging

Geoservices Overseas S.A provided monitoring of basic drilling parameters from
spud. Full mudlogging services, including cuttings gas monitoring, was provided
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3.1.2

from first returns at 1525mMD to total depth using a Reserval gas chromatograph
with an FID chromatograph running in tandem as backup. The mudlog, gas log, drill
log and pressure logs recording lithology, penetration rate, mud gas, drilling and
other data were prepared and are contained in Enclosures 1 to 4 of this report. The
Geoservices Final Well Report is contained in Appendix 8.

Ditch Cutting Samples

Cuttings were collected and described from 1525m (first returns) to TD at 3758m.
The sampling intervals were 30m from 1525m to 2820m, 10m from 2820m to 3150m
and 5 m from 3150m to 3758mMD (TD). The numbers of cuttings samples sets

were;
Sample Type No. of Sets
Washed & Dried 5
Samplex Trays 1

The wellsite daily geological reports are provided in Appendix 9 and geologists’
cuttings descriptions in Appendix 10.

3.2 Coring

3.2.1

3.2.2

Coring

No conventional cores were taken in Culverin-1.

Sidewall Cores

No sidewall cores were taken in Culverin-1.

3.3 MWD/LWD Logging

A real-time MWD Gamma Ray (GR) log was obtained during drilling of the 177%” hole
section and a real-time suite comprising LWD GR-resistivity-neutron-density-sonic-caliper
was obtained in the 12%4” hole section, as summarized in the following table;

Run No. | Hole Size Tools Interval Comments
1 445mm (17 %%") DM-GR 650-650 POOH due to suspect battery failure.
2 445mm (17 '%2") DM-GR 650-1525 Drilled to section TD.
3 311mm (12 %4")| DM-DGR-EWR-P4-SLD-CTN-ACAL | 1525-3402 |POOH due to slow ROP.
4 311mm (12 %2")| DM-DGR-EWR-P4-SLD-CTN-ACAL | 3402-3571 |POOH due to slow ROP.
5 311mm (12 %2")| DM-DGR-EWR-P4-SLD-CTN-ACAL | 3571-3571 |POOH due to Pulser failure.
6 311mm (12 %2")| DM-DGR-EWR-P4-SLD-CTN-ACAL | 3571-3758 |Lost comms with tool at 3714m.

The Sperry LWD End of Well Report is contained in Appendix 11 (and Directional Drilling
EOWR in Appendix 5).

3.4 Wireline Logging

The following wire line logs were acquired by Schlumberger at TD;
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Log Type Suite/Run | Interval mRT BHT/Time Comments
PEX-HALS-DSI-GR 1M 3758 — 607 87.9°C / 22:15hrs |Main pass logged at 1800ft/hr hi res to 2775m then
3478ft/hr in standard res to 607m.
VSI(4)-GR 1/2 3690 - 607 91.0 C / 34:10hrs |Recorded VSP levels (15m spacing) to 3200m.
Continued check shots at 100m spacing to 607m.

3.5

3.6

4

41

4.2

4.3

Temperature Surveys

Wireline logs recorded the following maximum temperatures;

PEX-HALS-DSI-GR 87.8°C, 88.9°C and 88.9°C @ 3755m, 22.25hrs after circulation
stopped.

VSI(4)-GR (ZVSP) 91.0°C, 91.0°C and 91.0°C @ 3750m, 34.17hrs after circulation
stopped.

As shown in Figure 4, this data was used in a Horner-type plot to derive an extrapolated
bottom hole temperature of 96.2°C for Culverin-1.

Velocity Survey

A partial VSP / check shot survey was conducted using Schlumberger’s VSI (4) tool.
Schlumberger's Q-Borehole Survey Report is contained in Appendix 12.

POST WELL ANALYSIS

Palynology

Palynological age dating was carried out on 16 washed and dried cuttings samples by
Roger Morgan. The basic range chart is contained in Enclosure 5.

Vitrinite Reflectance Studies

Vitrinite reflectance measurement analysis was carried out on 6 cuttings samples by
Keiraville Konsultants. Detailed analysis, including means, range and number of
observations, exinite (liptinite) abundance and fluorescence characteristics, together with
brief notes on rock, coal and organic matter type, coal and organic matter abundance
factors are contained in Appendix 13.

TOC, Rock Eval and Extract GC Analysis

Six samples were sent for TOC and Rock Eval analysis and two samples for extract GC
analysis by Geotech. The results of these analyses are contained in Appendix 14.
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Rotary Table : 0m

LAT :21.5m
Water Depth - 585m
MMudline : 606.5mRT

Seafloor

762mm (30"). 679/461 kg/m (457/310 |
ppf). X-52. HT & ST-2 u

Structural Casing

508mm (20"), 192 kg/m (129 ppf) x 340mm
(13-3/8"). 101 kg/m (68ppf), L-80

Plug #4
625-725m

Not tagged

BTC Surface Casing 1z

Plug #3
1421 - 1550m
Tagged at 1421m
with 5 klbs

Plug #2
2735 - 2865m
Tagged at 2735m
with 5 klbs

Plug #1
3560 - 3750m

Not tagged

—

Final Total Depth - 3758mRT

650 3mRT

u ' Casing cut at 609 2ZmMD

1511.8mRT

Hole Size = 12-1/4"

Figure 3: Culverin-1 P&A Diagram
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Fun Mo, TYPEOF LOG Tirne Since Last Circ f BHT

1 PEX-HALS-DSI 22 hours 18mins/a7 8C

1 PER-HALS-DSI 22 hours 18mins/83.9C

2 Wl 3dhours 10mins/S1C

T iL logtc+tL)/tL

Run 1 878 2225 003584664 T= measured temp
Fun 1 B9 2225 003594664 tL = time since circ stopped
Run 2 9 3417 00237419 Tt: =time circulated on bottom

Mote: Time circulated on bottom = 1.92 hours
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Figure 4: Culverin-1 BHT Horner Plot
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Part 1 : Summary Data

- General Well Details
- HSE Performance
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Culverin 1

General Well Details

Well Objective :

1. To evaluate the hydrocarbon potential of the coastalbarrier sandstones at the
67.5Ma level (upper part of the Latrobe Group) and costal plain sandstones
occurring at the 68.5 to 70.3 Ma level (Intra-Latrobe Group)

2. Acquire suitable log data to adequately characterise the reservior sands and
correlate to nearby wells in a cost effective manner.

3. Should hydrocarbons be encountered, approval may be sought to deepen the
well to penetrate the 74 Ma marker (3,827mRT)

Country :
Licence:
Field :
Well :

Well Type :
Status :

Operating Company :

Australia

Vic P56

Gippsland Basin

Culverin 1

Exploration

Plugged and Abandoned
Nexus Energy Services Pty Ltd

Rig : DOGC - OCEAN PATRIOT
Latitude : 38 Deg 24 Min 8.14 Sec
Longitude : 148 Deg 39 Min 14.92 Sec
Spheroid : Australian National

Datum : GDA 94

Projection : 55 Zone

Seismic Line : Volador 3D Line 299
Shotpoint : 883

UTM North : 5748256.4

UTM East : 644437.3

RT - MSL : 21.5m

Water Depth : 585.0m

Planned TD: 3590.0m MDBRT

Driller's TD : 3758.0m MDBRT

Rig Move In Date / Time :

Spud Date / Time :

TD Reached Date / Time :
Rig Released Date / Time :

06 Nov 2005 / 03:00
16 Dec 2005/ 13:30
06 Jan 2006 / 24:00
15 Jan 2006 / 15:00

Total Days Spud : 29.44

Total Days on Operations : 334

Total Days Budgeted :

AFE Well Cost : $22,699,889
Actual Well Cost : $22,178,059
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HSE Summary

Well Name: Culverin 1
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HSE Events Number
Abandon Drill 7
Environental Issue 4

Fire Drill 5

JSA 484
Lost Workday Case 3

Man Overboard Drill 1
Safety Meeting 18
STOP Card NaN
Trip / Kick Dirill 2




Culverin 1

HSE Performance

Well Name: Culverin 1

Event (# of) Date Time Short Description Extended Description
Abandon Drill(1) 18 Dec 2005 1030 Held weekly abandon rig drill Load life boats 1 and 2 with 10 people
and discuss life boat equipment and
launching procedures.
Abandon Drill(1) 18 Dec 2005 1030 Held weekly abandon rig drill
Abandon Drill(1) 18 Dec 2005 1030 Held weekly abandon rig drill
Abandon Drill(1) 26 Dec 2005 1030 Held weekly abandon rig drill
Abandon Drill(1) 01 Jan 2006 10:30 Held weekly abandon rig drill
Abandon Drill(1) 08 Jan 2006 10:30 Held weekly abandon rig drill
Abandon Drill(1) 15 Jan 2006 10:30 Held weekly abandon rig drill
Environental Issue(1) 24 Dec 2005 Enviromental drill Simulated chemical spill on rig.
Environental Issue(1) 24 Dec 2005 Enviromental drill
Environental Issue(1) 29 Dec 2005 Environmental Audit Carry out environmental audit by Nexus
shorebase personnel.
Environental Issue(1) 29 Dec 2005 Environmental Audit Environmental audit by Nexus
shorebase personnel.
Fire Drill(1) 18 Dec 2005 Held weekly fire drill
Fire Drill(1) 26 Dec 2005 Held weekly fire drill
Fire Drill(1) 01 Jan 2006 10:30 Held weekly fire drill
Fire Drill(1) 08 Jan 2006 10:30 Held weekly fire drill
Fire Drill(1) 15 Jan 2006 10:30 Held weekly fire drill
JSA(13) 15 Dec 2005 Deck = 10, Mech =2, Drill = 1
JSA(18) 16 Dec 2005 Deck = 12, Mech = 1, Drill = 3, Sub Sea
=2
JSA(23) 17 Dec 2005 Deck = 10, Mech = 3, Drill = 7, Sub Sea
=3
JSA(17) 18 Dec 2005 Deck = 6, Mech = 3, Drill = 6, Sub Sea
=2
JSA(10) 19 Dec 2005 Deck = 4, Mech =0, Drill = 1, Sub Sea
=5
JSA(21) 20 Dec 2005 Deck = 12, Mech = 1, Drill = 7, Sub Sea
=0, marine =1
JSA(17) 21 Dec 2005 Deck = 7, Mech = 2, Drill = 5, Welder =
2, Marine = 2,
JSA(11) 23 Dec 2005 Deck = 2, Mech =1, Drill = 3, Sub Sea
=5
JSA(13) 24 Dec 2005 Deck = 6, Mech =0, Drill = 7, Sub Sea
=0
JSA(14) 25 Dec 2005 Deck = 8, Mech = 2, Drill = 2, Sub Sea
=0
JSA(19) 26 Dec 2005 Deck = 7, Mech =5, Drill = 2, Sub Sea
=2,Welder = 2, Marine = 1
JSA(19) 27 Dec 2005 Deck = 6, Mech = 3, Drill = 7,Welder =
2, Marine =1
JSA(14) 28 Dec 2005 Deck = 9, Drill = 3,Welder = 2,
JSA(12) 29 Dec 2005 Deck = 5, Mech = 3, Drill = 2,Welder =
2,
JSA(19) 29 Dec 2005 Deck = 6, Mech = 3, Drill = 7,Welder =
2, Marine =1
JSA(18) 31 Dec 2005 Deck = 8, Drill = 7,Welding = 2, Marine
=1
JSA(15) 01 Jan 2006 Deck = 6, Drill = 6, Welder = 2, Mech =
1
JSA(17) 02 Jan 2006 Deck = 7, Mech = 4, Drill = 4,Welder =
2
JSA(17) 03 Jan 2006 Deck = 3, Mech = 2, Drill = 10,Welder =
2
JSA(10) 04 Jan 2006 Deck =6, Drill =4
JSA(10) 05 Jan 2006 Deck = 6, Mech = 2, Drill = 2
JSA(16) 07 Jan 2006 Deck = 5, Mech = 2, Drill = 7, Welder =
1,Sub Sea=1
JSA(12) 08 Jan 2006 Deck = 4, Mech = 3, Drill = 2, Welder =
3

‘Copyright IDS 2006', TF/JG 20060404,
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Culverin 1

Well Name: Culverin 1

Event (# of) Date Time Short Description Extended Description
JSA(21) 09 Jan 2006 Deck = 6, Mech = 3, Drill = 10, Welder
=2
JSA(19) 10 Jan 2006 Deck = 7, Mech = 3, Drill = 8, Welder =
1
JSA(16) 11 Jan 2006 Deck = 6, Mech = 3, Drill = 5, Welder =
2
JSA(20) 12 Jan 2006 Deck = 7, Subsea = 2, Drill = 9, Welder
=2
JSA(19) 13 Jan 2006 Deck = 7, Subsea = 2, Drill = 6, Welder
=2, mech=2
JSA(18) 13 Jan 2006 Deck = 6, Marine = 1, Drill = 7, Welder
=3,Subsea=1
JSA(16) 15 Jan 2006 Deck = 6, Mech = 2, Drill = 5, Welder =
2, Subsea = 2
Man Overboard Drill(1) 30 Dec 2005 Held Man Over Board Drill
Safety Meeting(3) 18 Dec 2005 Weekly safety meetings with all crew Discussion on man riding operations.
members. Recent 3rd party finger amputation and
basic amputation first aid discussed.
GEMS work basket policies. Fire and
abandonment drills
Safety Meeting(3) 18 Dec 2005 Weekly safety meetings with all crew
members.
Safety Meeting(3) 26 Dec 2005 Weekly safety meetings with all crew
members.
Safety Meeting(3) 01 Jan 2006 Weekly safety meetings with all crew
members.
Safety Meeting(3) 08 Jan 2006 Weekly safety meetings with all crew
members.
Safety Meeting(3) 15 Jan 2006 Weekly safety meetings with all crew
members.
STOP Card(3) 15 Dec 2005 Safe = 1, Un-safe = 2
STOP Card(11) 16 Dec 2005 Safe = 6, Un-safe =5
STOP Card(7) 17 Dec 2005 Safe = 4, Un-safe = 3
STOP Card(2) 18 Dec 2005 Safe = 0, Un-safe = 2
STOP Card() 19 Dec 2005 Safe =4, Un-safe =1
STOP Card(4) 20 Dec 2005 Safe = 1, Un-safe = 3
STOP Card(5) 21 Dec 2005 Safe = 1, Un-safe = 4
STOP Card(5) 23 Dec 2005 Safe = 5, Un-safe =
STOP Card(8) 24 Dec 2005 Safe = 1, Un-safe = 7
STOP Card(9) 25 Dec 2005 Safe = 6, Un-safe = 3
STOP Card(17) 26 Dec 2005 Safe = 3, Un-safe = 14
STOP Card(7) 27 Dec 2005 Safe =2, Un-safe =5
STOP Card(9) 28 Dec 2005 Safe =5, Un-safe = 4
STOP Card(8) 29 Dec 2005 Safe = 2, Un-safe = 8
STOP Card(5) 29 Dec 2005 Safe =5
STOP Card(7) 29 Dec 2005 Safe =2, Un-safe =5
STOP Card(8) 31 Dec 2005 Safe = 4, Un-safe = 4
STOP Card(9) 01 Jan 2006 Safe =7, Un-safe = 2
STOP Card(16) 02 Jan 2006 Safe = 6, Un-safe = 10
STOP Card(9) 03 Jan 2006 Safe =5, Un-safe = 4
STOP Card(12) 04 Jan 2006 Safe = 3, Un-safe = 9
STOP Card(8) 05 Jan 2006 Safe = 4, Un-safe = 4
STOP Card(13) 07 Jan 2006 Safe =7, Un-safe = 6
STOP Card(10) 08 Jan 2006 Safe =7, Un-safe = 3
STOP Card(4) 09 Jan 2006 Safe = 3, Un-safe = 1
STOP Card(5) 10 Jan 2006 Safe = 2, Un-safe = 3
STOP Card(8) 11 Jan 2006 Safe = 2, Un-safe = 6
STOP Card(8) 12 Jan 2006 Safe = 6, Un-safe = 2
STOP Card(2) 12 Jan 2006 Safe = 2, Un-safe = 2
STOP Card(4) 13 Jan 2006 Safe =3, Un-safe =1
STOP Card(2) 15 Jan 2006 Safe=1,Un-safe=1
Trip / Kick Drill(2) 03 Jan 2006 Held Trip drill with each crew while RIH
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Part 2 : Drilling Engineering

- Well History
- Phase History
- Survey Data
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Well History

Well: Culverin 1

# Date Depth 24 Hour Summary

1 05 Nov 2005

2 06 Nov 2005 0.0m Tow to Culvering Location. Run & set anchor #4. While running anchor #8 anchor winch#4 failed destroying
the gear box allowing the anchor & anchor chain to fall to the sea bed. Bolster anchor # 8.
Rig off hire at 15:00 hrs. On tow to Two Fold Bay for repair.

14 Dec 2005 0.0m Run Anchors
4 15 Dec 2005 0.0m Complete running of anchors.
16 Dec 2005 650.0m Pick up 93 jnts of 5"dp. Make up 30" C.A.R.T. make up 36" BHA and RIH to 607m. Spud well and drill 36"

hole from 607m to 650m. Circulate hole clean and displace. Drop Totco survey(0.5deg @ 643m). POOH. Rig
up and ran 30" casing/PGB. Install guide lines.

6 17 Dec 2005 650.9m Ran and cemented 30" casing. Waited on cement samples to harden 4.5hrs. POOH, picked up 1172m of dp(
extra pipe picked up while waiting on MWD equipment preperation), made up and racked 18 3/4" CART,
Dowell cement express head. Layed out 36" BHA and picked up 17 1/2" BHA and Sperry Sun equipment.
Prepare rig deck areas for riser.

7 18 Dec 2005 650.0m Make up 17 1/2" BHA, RIH and shallow test MWD, tool failure. POOH to surface and change out tool
internals for back up unit. RIH to PGB, unable top stab. Soft line guide ropes parted, attempts to move rig
were restricted by high anchor tensions and rough weather. POOH and install new ropes. RIH and stab in ok.
Drill cmt and shoe. Drill 17 1/2" hole from 650m to 1006m using SW and hi vis sweeps. Surveys every 3

stands.

8 19 Dec 2005 1436.0m Drilled 17 1/2" hole from 1006m to 1436m.
24hr average ROP 17.9m/hr.

9 20 Dec 2005 1525.0m Drilled 445 mm (17 1/2") hole to 1525.0 mMDRT. Pulled out of hole to rig up and run 340 mm (13 3/8")
casing. Commenced running casing.

10 21 Dec 2005 1525.0m Landed 340 mm (13 3/8") casing and cemented in place at 1511.14 mMDRT. Laid down cement head and
rigged up riser handling equipment. Commenced running BOPs and riser.

11 22 Dec 2005 1525.0m Completed running BOPs and riser. Commenced making up slip-joint and landing joint to riser.

12 23 Dec 2005 1525.0m Landed out BOPs and tested wellhead connector. Pull-tested connections. Stroked out the slip-joint and

nippled up the surface equipment. Rigged up the diverter. Completed pressure tests. Rigged down riser
handling equipment. Slipped and cut drilling line. Laid down 445 mm (17 %2") BHA. Commenced making up
new 311 mm (12 ¥%") BHA.

13 24 Dec 2005 1544.0m Completed making up 311 mm (12 %") BHA. RIH and picked up drillpipe on the way in hole. Drilled out the
shoetrack. Displaced the well to mud. Drilled ahead 3 m of new formation. Conducted LOT to 1.89 sg EMW
at 1528.0 mMDRT. Drilled ahead to 1544.0 mMDRT.

14 25 Dec 2005 2131.0m Drilled ahead from 1544.0 - 2131.0 mMDRT.

15 26 Dec 2005 2641.0m Drilled ahead 311 mm (12 1/4") hole from 2131.0 mMDRT to 2641.0 mMDRT.

16 27 Dec 2005 3115.0m Drilled ahead from 2641.0 mMDRT to 3115.0 mMDRT. Top of the Latrobe Formation picked from LWD logs
and cuttings at 2824.0 mMDRT.

17 28 Dec 2005 3277.0m Drilled ahead from 3115.0 mMDRT to 3277.0 mMDRT.

18 29 Dec 2005 3385.0m Drilled ahead from 3277.0 mMDRT to 3385.0 mMDRT.

19 30 Dec 2005 3402.0m Drilled ahead from 3385.0 mMMDRT to 3402.0 mMDRT. POOH for bit trip. Downloaded LWD memory. Made
up new PDC bit and new motor. Started to RIH.

20 31 Dec 2005 3473.0m RIH to 3330.0 mMDRT. Logged down over sandstone from 3335.0 mMDRT to 3343m MDRT . Reamed down
to bottom. Commenced drilling ahead from 3402.0 mMDRT to 3473m MDRT

21 01 Jan 2006 3571.0m Drilled ahead from 3473.0 mMMDRT to 3571.0 mMDRT. POOH for suspected washout.

22 02 Jan 2006 3571.0m POOH to surface. Changed out BHA to a rotary assembly (removed down-hole motor) and a Smith rock-bit.

Completed making up new BHA with additional drill-collars and commenced RIH. BHA held up at 2100.0
mMDRT. Washed and reamed down to 2540.0 mMDRT. MWD failed at 2540.0 mMDRT. Commenced pulling
out of hole to replace MWD tools and adjust BHA configuration. Pulling out at 2020.0 mMDRT at midnight.

23 03 Jan 2006 3571.0m Continued pulling out of hole to replace LWD tools (pulser found to be damaged) and adjusted BHA
configuration. Re-calibrated pressure sensors on rig floor using cementing unit. Tested new LWD toolstring
and commenced RIH. Slipped & Cut drill-line at the casing shoe. Waited on Weather

24 04 Jan 2006 3619.0m RIH to bottom and began drilling ahead 311 mm (12 ¥2") hole from 3571.0 mMDRT. Drilling ahead at 3619.0
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25
26

27
28

29
30

31
32
33

34
35

05 Jan 2006
06 Jan 2006

07 Jan 2006
08 Jan 2006

09 Jan 2006
10 Jan 2006

11 Jan 2006
12 Jan 2006
13 Jan 2006

14 Jan 2006
15 Jan 2006

3697.0m
3758.0m

3758.0m
3758.0m

3758.0m
3758.0m

3758.0m
3758.0m
3758.0m

3758.0m
3758.0m

mMDRT at midnight.
Drilled ahead from 3619.0 MMDRT to 3697.0 mMDRT at midnight.

Drilled ahead from 3697.0 mMMDRT to 3758.0 mMDRT at midnight. TD well at 3758.0 mMMDRT. Commenced
POOH to log.

POOH, laid down LWD tools. Rigged up to run wireline.

Completed PEX run. Rigged up seismic tools and completed seismic survey. Rigged down wireline tools and
wireline. Commenced P & A program.

Set abandonment plugs #1, 2 & 3

Laid out drillpipe, tagged abandonment plug #3, set abandonment plug #4, displaced riser and C & K lines to
seawater, retrieved wearbushing, jetted wellhead and BOP's, rigged up to recover riser and BOP's

Unlatched BOP from wellhead and pulled marine riser and BOP's
Pulled and landed BOP's on carrier. Cut and pulled 20" casing. Cut and pulled 30" casing with PGB

POOH and recovered guidebase. Racked BOP's on carrier. RIH and laid out BHA and 5" drillpipe from
Derrick

Completed laying down 5" DP from derrick. De-ballast rig and recover anchors # 6, #2, #3, 7, #1 and #5

Completed recovering anchors.
Ocean Patriot on tight tow @ 15:00hrs, Jan 15, 2006. Rig handed over to Anzon Australia Limited

Statement of Facts obtained from vessels
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Time Breakdown by Phase

OVE/RIG- P D

2 fldst anchor bolstered) on previous well and rig move/tow to current location up to the start of anchoring op

ANCHORING
# to drilling draft and completion of load testing of anchors.

SURFACE HOLE
##lifig out shoe track. Drilling of Surface hole, from end of Conductor casing phase to pulling bit off bottom for

SURFACE CASING
PBH for casing, rigging up, running and cementing Surface Casing, Laying out running and cementing string.

INTERMEDIATE CASING
Yto POH for casing, rigging up running, landing and Cementing of Intermediate casing. , Laying out running and cem

INTERMEDIATE HOLE

85%

and Pressure Test BOP, LMR, Choke and Kill Lines/Valves.

PLUG AND ABANDON
Ehtplugs to retrieval of guide base and wellhead.

ANCHOR RETRIEVAL
5 €he end of Plug & Abandon, Suspension or Completion aperations. This phase ends when the last anchor
0.0
35

[Programmed = green, Unprogrammed = yellow, Trouble =

Total Time on Operations : 801.5 hrs
Total Productive Time : 702.5 hrs
Total Lost Time : 90 hrs

Total Unprogrammed Time : 9 hrs
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Survey Data

Well: Culverin 1

Mag Dec: Sidetrack # 0
MD m TVD m INCL deg CORR. AZ DOGLEG 'V'SECT deg N/Sm E/W m TOOLTYPE
deg deg/30m
681.95 681.89 13 227.0 0.1 -5.1 51 5.5 MWD
767.68 767.61 0.8 263.6 0.3 -5.8 5.8 6.8 MWD
825.04 824.97 0.9 254.6 0.1 -6.0 6.0 7.6 MWD
911.19 911.10 11 257.5 0.1 -6.3 6.3 9.1 MWD
1027.78 1027.67 0.9 252.6 0.1 -6.8 6.8 11.0 MWD
1056.00 0.8 254.0 MWD
1085.00 0.8 257.0 MWD
1113.00 0.6 252.0 MWD
1142.00 0.5 254.0 MWD
1171.00 0.4 260.0 MWD
1228.00 0.2 255.0 MWD
1257.00 0.2 257.0 MWD
1342.00 0.1 250.0 MWD
1371.00 0.0 247.0 MWD
1428.00 0.1 336.0 MWD
1486.00 0.2 21.2 MWD
1509.00 0.1 0.7 MWD
1525.00 0.1 0.7 MWD
1569.11 1568.99 0.4 350.1 0.0 2.2 6.9 13.3 MWD
1626.44 1626.32 0.6 2.0 0.1 -1.9 6.4 13.3 MWD
1712.56 1712.43 15 24.6 0.4 -0.7 5.0 12.8 MWD
1798.49 1798.30 2.4 23.2 0.3 15 2.2 11.7 MWD
1970.98 1970.56 3.2 24.1 0.1 8.1 5.9 7.9 MWD
2056.65 2056.09 3.2 27.0 0.1 11.6 10.3 5.9 MWD
2142.04 2141.34 35 29.6 0.1 14.7 14.7 3.6 MWD
2256.54 2255.59 4.0 35.4 0.2 20.1 21.0 0.4 MWD
2342.60 2341.43 4.2 35.5 0.1 26.0 26.0 4.1 MWD
2428.46 2427.05 43 38.3 0.0 32.0 31.1 7.9 MWD
2543.24 2541.53 4.1 40.5 0.2 37.7 37.7 13.1 MWD
2629.39 2627.47 3.9 40.6 0.1 42.2 42.2 17.0 MWD
2686.60 2684.55 3.8 415 0.1 45.1 45.1 195 MWD
2772.65 2770.41 3.8 43.7 0.1 54.4 49.3 233 MWD
2887.70 2885.20 3.9 45.7 0.1 62.0 54.9 28.7 MWD
2973.53 2970.84 3.7 46.7 0.1 67.4 58.9 32.8 MWD
3088.21 3085.28 3.8 46.5 0.1 64.0 64.0 38.3 MWD
3173.79 3170.67 3.7 49.6 0.1 80.0 67.8 42.4 MWD
3260.37 3257.07 3.7 49.9 0.2 71.4 71.4 46.5 MWD
3317.48 3314.07 3.7 47.7 0.1 88.8 73.9 49.3 MWD
3346.36 3342.89 3.7 50.4 0.2 90.6 75.1 50.7 MWD
3375.00 3371.50 3.7 54.0 0.2 92.3 76.2 52.1 MWD
3404.40 3400.80 35 54.9 0.2 94.1 77.3 53.6 MWD
3432.80 3429.16 3.6 52.0 0.2 95.7 78.3 55.0 MWD
3461.32 3457.63 35 52.0 0.1 97.4 79.4 56.4 MWD
3490.24 3486.49 3.4 50.3 0.1 99.1 80.5 57.8 MWD
3519.26 3515.46 3.3 50.1 0.1 100.7 81.6 59.1 MWD
3547.59 3543.75 3.3 50.0 0.0 102.3 82.6 60.3 MWD
3555.34 3551.48 3.4 53.7 0.9 102.8 82.9 60.7 MWD
3583.83 3579.93 3.0 50.9 0.4 104.3 83.9 61.9 MWD
3641.38 3637.40 3.0 50.2 0.0 107.2 85.8 64.2 MWD
3758.00 3753.86 3.0 50.2 0.0 113.1 89.7 68.9 MWD
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3758.00 3753.86 3.0 50.2 0.0 113.1 89.7 68.9 Extrapolation to FTD
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- Time Analysis
- Trouble Time Analysis
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Activity Report For Culverin 1

Date : 05 Nov 2005 Daily Cost : $ 4339992 Report Number : 1

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity

0.0 RM P RM 6 Apache released Ocean Patriot to Nexus at Fur Seal Loction. Tow to Culverin Location. Pacific
Wrangler on tow bridle. Far Grip following
24:00 hrs Position: 38deg 5.7min S, 148deg 343.1min E.

Date : 06 Nov 2005 Daily Cost : $ 334792 Report Number : 2

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity

0.0 RM P RM 3 Tow to Culverin location.

0.0 RM P RM 14 Pass #4 Anchor PCC to Far Grip. Anchor #4 on bottom at 09:00 hrs. PCC at rig 11:44 hrs.
Pass #8 Anchor PCC to Far Grip at 11:46 hrs. Run anchor #8.
At 14:50 hrs Anchor winch failed & winch gear box was serverly damaged. #4 anchor chain dropped
to the sea bed.
Rig off hire at 17:00 hrs and Statement Of Fact taken.
Haul in #8 anchor which was bolstered at 117:00 hrs. PCC on rig at 17:05 hrs.
Statement of Fact taken at 17:00 hrs.
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Activity Report For Culverin 1

Date : 14 Dec 2005 Daily Cost : $ 1161836 Report Number : 3
Depth (m) Phase Cls  Op R.C. Hrs  Activity
0.0 RM P RM 0.5 Back on Contract with Nexus after Rig Repair
0.0 A P AH 15 #8 Anchor on bottom @ 0500hrs and heave in to 95t pull.
Wrangler strip back #8 and pass PCC to rig @ 0620hrs.
Pass #5 PCC to Wrangler @ 0635hrs, unable to pay out on windlass.
0.0 A TU AH RE 1 Troubleshoot electrical fault on # 5 windlass.
0.0 A P AH 45 Run #5 Anchor @ 0732hrs, on bottom @ 0942hrs.
Wrangler strip back #5 and pass PCC to rig @ 1139hrs.
0.0 A P AH 12 Pass #1 PCC to Wrangler @ 1208hrs, on bottom @ 1413hrs.
Tension #4 & #8 Anchors, Re-deploy #1 @ 1555hrs on bottom @ 1648hrs.
Werangler strip back #1 and pass PCC to rig @ 1740hrs ( Wrangler to stand-by )
Release Far Grip from tow wire @ 1750hrs.
Pass #3 PCC to Far Grip @ 1857hrs, on bottom @ 2045hrs.
Far Grip strip back #3 and pass PCC to rig @ 2235hrs.
Pass #7 PCC to Far Grip @ 2250hrs, commence to run anchor.
Date : 15 Dec 2005 Daily Cost : $ 427492 Report Number : 4
Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity
0.0 A P AH 5 #7 Anchor on bottom @ 0109hrs.
Far Grip strip back, passed #7 PCC to rig @ 0253hrs.
Passed #2 PCC to Wrangler @ 0030hrs,Anchor on bottom @ 0249hrs.
Werangler strip back, passed #2 PCC to rig @ 0438hrs.
Passed #6 PCC to Far Grip @ 0305hrs, Anchor on bottom @ 0514hrs.
0.0 A TU AH RE 0.5 Troubleshoot electrical fault on # 6 windlass.
0.0 A P AH 2 Far Grip strip back, passed #6 PCC to rig @ 0725hrs.
0.0 A P AH 15 Cross tension all anchors.
0.0 A P AH 5 Ballast rig to drilling draft.
0.0 SH P PUP 15 Pick up 201m of 5" DP.
0.0 SH P PUP 0.5 Pull back and rack 201m DP in derrick.
0.0 SH TU RR RE 0.5 Repair Hydraulic fitting on racking arm.
0.0 SH P PUP 5 P/U 1 stand 9" DC with jetting sub and trip in picking up 550m DP.
0.0 SH PUP 0.5 Run in with DP from derrick and tag mudline @ 585m L.A.T. Water depth, (607.5m R/T- Mudline
LAT.)
0.0 SH P OA 2 Pull out and rack DP in derrick.
Date : 16 Dec 2005 Daily Cost : $ 585930 Report Number : 5
Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity
0.0 SH P PUP 3 Pick up 20 stands DP. 580m.
0.0 SH P OA 1 Rack back 20 stands DP.
0.0 SH P PUP 2 Pick up DP. 920m.
0.0 SH P HBHA 15 Picked up 18 jnts of HWDP and racked in derrick.
0.0 SH P HT 2 Made up and racked in derrick, 30" C.A.R.T. BOP hang off tool, 30" cementing stand.
0.0 SH P HBHA 2.5 Make up 36" drilling BHA and ran in hole to 192m.
0.0 SH P TI 15 Ran BHA in hole on DP to 607mRT.
650.0 SH P DA 2.5 Spud well and drill 36" hole from 607m to 650m. Pumped 75bbl sweep at mid stand and stand down,
spotted 100bbls of hi-vis around BHA prior to connection.Anderdrift tool not working.
650.0 SH P CHC 0.5 Displaced hole with 170bbls of pre-hydrated Bentonite. Dropped Totco single shot survey.
650.0 SH P TO 1 Pulled out of hole from 650m to 193m. No hole problems or overpull observed.
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Date : 16 Dec 2005

Daily Cost : $ 585930 Report Number : 5

650.0 SH P HBHA 1 Pulled out of hole BHA from 193m to surface racking all BHA in derrick.
Recover survey ¥2°.

650.0 SC RRC 0.5 Held Pre-casing JSA and rigged up for 30" casing.

650.0 SC CRN Ran 30" x 20" csg x/0 joint, 2 x intermediate joints and housing joint.

650.0 SC CRN 2 Ran 3 x dp stinger, made up 30" C.A.R.T to 30" housing joint and landed out in PGB. Install guide
lines.

650.0 SC TP RO VE 1 Had rig welder manufacture 2 x "C" plates due to #1 & #2 guide line spears releasing and not latching
correctly.

Date : 17 Dec 2005 Daily Cost : $ 487963 Report Number : 6

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity

650.0 SC P CRN 2 Ran 30" casing & PGB on drill pipe.

650.0 SC TP SKR OTH 1.5 Stabbed casing in open hole with ROV assistance and by moving the rig 4m stbd aft.

650.0 SC P CRN 0.5 Landed out casing with 5klbs of wt down. Circulate to ensure no fill. 2.1m stick up, 2 x zero bullseye
readings. Heading 273 deg. Circulate casing volume while holding JSA for cement job.

650.0 SC P CMC 15 Pumped 20bbls of S/W-Dye, mix and pump 200bbls of 15.8ppg cement slurry, displace with 64bbls of
S/W. Check floats holding-ok.

650.0 SC P WOcC 4.5 Waiting on surface cement samples to harden.

650.0 SC P CRN 1 Release 30" CART tool. Check bullseye indicators<¥%°. POOH & L/d 30" CART.

650.0 IC P CRN 1 P/u 18%" CART and stand in derrick. Make up 2nd 18 3/4" CART for handling well head on deck.

650.0 IH P PUP 6 P/u 722m of dp and rack in derrick.(Prepare Sperry Sun BHA on deck while picking up dp)

650.0 SH P HT 15 Break down TIW valves and side entry sub from 30" cement stand racked in derrick. Lay out 36" BHA.

650.0 IH P PUP 15 Pick up 143m of dp and rack in derrick while [preparing Sperry Sun BHA components.

650.0 IH P HT 0.5 Make up Dowell cement express head and rack in derrick on drifted HWDP.

650.0 IH P PUP 2 Pick up 257m of dp and rack in derrick while preparing Sperry Sun BHA components.
Total 5" dp picked up 2723m

650.0 IH P HBHA 0.5 Make up 17 1/2" BHA.

Date : 18 Dec 2005 Daily Cost : $ 454106 Report Number : 7

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs Activity

650.0 IH P HBHA 35 Made up 17 1/2" Sperry Sun BHA, drill collars etc. Made up Top Drive for shallow test of down hole
equipment on 1st stand of hwdp.

650.0 IH TP HBHA DTF 1.5 Attempt to test MWD tools. Failure to produce survey information. Gamma ok.
Change out stand pipe sensor after discussing with Sperry Sun in Perth. Re-test down hole tools, still
not transmitting survey data

650.0 IH TP HBHA DTF 3.5 POOH and Rack back BHA from 103m to access MWD internals at rotary table. Remove faulty unit
and install back up unit. Run in hole to 103m. Shallow test OK.
Battery module is the suspected faulty item.

650.0 IH P TI 1 Cont to RIH from 103m to PGB at 604m, guide ropes attached to guide lines

650.0 IH TP TI OTH 1 Move rig to assist with stabbing drill string in 30" housing.Initialy guide ropes ok but due to excess
current and movement 2 broke then the remaining 2.
Skid rig to assist with stabbing, due to 5-6m seas and 42knot winds the winch tension was excessive
before sea bed movement was achieved.

650.0 IH TP TI OTH 35 POOH from 604m to surface, install new soft line guide ropes to assist in stabbing.
RIH to PGB at 605m, stab and continue RIh to top of cement at 644m.

650.0 IH P DFS 0.5 Establish parameters and drill cement and shoe equipment from 644m to 650m, work through and
clean out shoe.
600 gpm, 900psi, 3-4000ftlbs, 90rpm,

1006.0 IH P DA 9.5 Drill 17 1/2" hole from 650m to 1006m.
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Culverin 1

Date : 18 Dec 2005

Daily Cost : $ 454106 Report Number : 7

Date : 19 Dec 2005

Daily Cost : $ 678903 Report Number : 8

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity
1436.0 IH P DA 24 Drill 17 1/2" hole from 1006m to 1436m
Take surveys every 3rd stand. @1428.75m, 0.11deg, 336.43azimuth,
1000-1100 gpm, 3400psi, 4-6000 ftlbs tg, 150-160rpm, String wt 240klbs, 20-35klbs WOB. Sweep
hole 85bbls per stand-35 Guar-50 PHG.
No hole problems to report.
24hr ROP 17.9m/hr
Section ROP 23.46m/hr
Date : 20 Dec 2005 Daily Cost : $ 570223 Report Number : 9
Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs Activity
1525.0 IH P DA 8.5 Drill 17 1/2" hole from 1436m to 1525m
Take surveys every 3rd stand. @1509m 0.09deg, 0.70 azimuth,
1000-1100 gpm, 3400psi, 4-6000 ftlbs tgq, 150-160rpm, String wt 240klbs, 30-35klbs WOB.
Sweep hole 85bbls per stand.
1525.0 IH P DIS 2 Take TD survey.@1525m 0.09deg, 0.70 azimuth,
Pump 150bbls of Guar Gum hi-vis sweep.
Pump 100bbls of Sea Water
Pump 840bbls of PHG hi-vis displacement mud, un-weighted.
Displace PHG to bottom of drill pipe
1525.0 IH P TO 2.5 POOH from 1525m to 242m. No hole problems observed.
Jet 30" housing on way out of hole.
Pipe strap on trip out +0.17m
1525.0 IH HBHA 2 POOH BHA and rack in derrick. Remove MWD probe and break off bit.
1525.0 IH RRC 1 Hold JSA for casing operatuions with all crews and rig up equipment
1525.0 IH CRN 15 Make up 13 3/8" shoe track and check floats. Baker lock connections.
Attach guide ropes
1525.0 IH CRN 5.5 Ran 13 3/8" casing to 885m. No hole problems to report.
1525.0 IH CRN 1 Rig down Tam packer, make up 18 3/4" well head to casing string,rig down FMS and all casing
equipment.
Date : 21 Dec 2005 Daily Cost : $ 636457 Report Number : 10
Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity
1525.0 IH P CRN 1 Complete making up 18 3/4 well head and Dowell Deep Sea express plug baskets.
1525.0 IH P CRN 15 Ran 13 3/8" casing string on 5" dp to 30" housing.
ROV observe landing and latching of Well Head in housing.
String weight 350klIbs, verify latch with 50k over pull, 400kibs ok.
Slack off to landing string weight.
1525.0 IH P Cic 15 Circulate 1.5 x casing volume with sea water.
Complete cement job JSA and equipment prep while circulating.
1525.0 IH CMC 2.5 Cement casing: 25bbls S/W-dye, Lead 300bbls 12.5ppg, Tail 209bbls 15.8ppg.
1525.0 IH CMC 1 Displace cement with 416bbls of sea water. Bump plugs 3.3bbls early, pressure up and test casing to
1500psi, ok.
Bleed off and check floats holding ok.
1525.0 IH P CRN 0.5 Rig down surface cement lines and back out Cameron 18 3/4" C.A.R.T.
PGB Bullseye readings: Fwd 1deg Stbd, Aft 1deg Stbd Aft.
1525.0 IH CRN 1 Pull out of hole landing string.
1525.0 IH CRN 1 Lay out 18 3/4" C.A.R.T from string, pick up and break out #2 18 3/4" handling tool. Break down
Dowell express cement head and double of HWDP.
1525.0 BOP P RR1 2 Hold JSA and rig up to run BOP's and marine riser.
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Date : 21 Dec 2005

Daily Cost : $ 636457 Report Number : 10

1525.0 BOP RR1 25 Make up double of Riser and Termination spool.

1525.0 BOP RR1 3.5 Skid BOP to well center on Normar transporter. Make up double and spool. Install guide lines.

1525.0 BOP RR1 3.5 Pick up BOPs from carrier(550kibs) and skid clear. un BOP to above splash zone and install Pod
line clamps. Land riser in spider, BOP's wet 530klbs.

Test Choke and Kill lines 250/7500psi 5/10mins.

1525.0 BOP P RR1 2.5 Run Bop's on Marine riser

Date : 22 Dec 2005 Daily Cost : $ 532613 Report Number : 11

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs Activity

1525.0 BOP P RR1 6 Continue to run BOP's on marine riser @271m (890")

1525.0 BOP P RR1 1 Pressure test choke and kill lines 250/7500psi, 5/10mins ok

1525.0 BOP P RR1 6 Continue to run Riser @393m ( 1290")

1525.0 BOP P RR1 1 Pressure test choke and kill lines 250/7500psi, 5/10mins ok

1525.0 BOP P RR1 7.5 Continue to run Riser @515m ( 1690')

1525.0 BOP P RR1 1 Pressure test choke and kill lines 250/7500psi 5/10mins ok

1525.0 BOP P RR1 15 Pick up slip joint and make up to string.

Total riser run: 35 x 50' Bouyed joints, 1 x 50' bare joint,1 x 25' Bare pup joint,

Date : 23 Dec 2005 Daily Cost : $ 498764 Report Number : 12

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity

1525.0 BOP P RR1 1 Completed making up landing joint to slip joint.

1525.0 BOP TP RR1 OTH 1 ROV camera system problems while on bottom monitoring BOP/PGB. Camera's were cutting out and
all visibility was lost. Topside black and white camera still working. Recover ROV and move top side
black and white camera to front pan tilt for landing bops'. Water had ingressed into camera electrics
cannister. Gain use of 2 cameras and dive ROV

1525.0 BOP P BOP 2 Lowered slip joint while monitoring with ROV
Installed Choke and kill and boost lines to slip joint.

1525.0 BOP P BOP 1 Pressure tested choke and kill gooseneck seals 250/7500psi 5/10mins. Ok. This test required by
GEMS.

1525.0 BOP P BOP 0.5 Latched SDL ring to slip joint.

Skidded rig and over well head with ROV assistance

1525.0 BOP P BOP 15 Re-establish #2 guide line, Monitor MRT's as lowering BOP to PGB post tops.

Installed storm saddles and service hoses to slip joint.
BOP landing weight prior to MRT's 685kibs.

1525.0 BOP P BOP 1 Landed and latch BOP, visual confirmation by ROV. Complete 50klbs overpull test on yellow pod.

Bulls eye readings:

PGB Fwd B/E 3/4deg stbd Aft B/E 3/4deg stbd fwd

LMRP #1 B/E 1/2deg Port fwd, LMRP #2 B/E 1/2deg Port fwd
BOP B/E 1deg sthd fwd.

1525.0 BOP BOP 1 Secure pod hoses. Make up RBQ plates and put BOP on line.

1525.0 BOP BOP 1 Break circulation with Dowell down choke and kill lines.
Close shear rams and test well head VX gasket to 250/2500psi 5/10mins on yellow pod. OK.
Complete 500psi pressure test on blue pod, 2nd pod test is a GEMS requirement.

1525.0 BOP BOP 1 Unlock slip joint and stroke open. Layed down landing joint.

1525.0 BOP BOP 1 Made up divertor to slip joint inner barrel. Land and latch in divertor housing.
Connect hydraulics and lock support and lock down dogs.

1525.0 BOP BOP 15 Rigged down riser spider, divertor running tool, install master bushings.

1525.0 BOP BOP 2.5 Clear rig floor of all riser and bop handling equipment. Install iron roughneck tracks. Change elevators
and bails

1525.0 IH P SC 2 Hung off blocks and slipped and cut 27.43m (90") of drilling line. Removed hang off lines and set
crown-o-matic.

1525.0 IH P HBHA 3.5 Ran 445mm (17 1/2") BHA in hole and laid out same.
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Date : 23 Dec 2005

Daily Cost : $ 498764 Report Number : 12

1525.0 IH P HBHA 25 Commenced making up 311mm (12 1/4") BHA.

Date : 24 Dec 2005 Daily Cost : $ 465794 Report Number : 13

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity

1525.0 IH P HBHA 3 Complete making up 311mm (12 1/4") BHA.

Up-link MWD, install Radio-active source.
Run BHA from derrick to 1st joint of HWDP. Shallow test Down hole motor and tools ok. 800gpm
650psi.

1525.0 IH HBHA 0.5 Picked up 55m(180") of HWDP.

1525.0 IH PUP 5.5 Picked up 745m (2444") of 127mm (5")dp.

Functioned divertor insert packer ok.

1525.0 IH P BOP 0.5 Function tested BOP's on yellow pod ok.

1525.0 IH TP BOP BORQ Attempt function test on blue pod, Run-away observed on open function for upper annular. Function
several times and uncontroled flow stopped. Change back to yellow pod and upper annular functions
ok. Proceed with operations after discussing equipment failure. Signs made for all BOP panels stating
not to operate upper annular on blue pod. Currently drilling on Yellow pod.

1525.0 IH TI 2 Ran in hole from 1014m to 1478m, Washed down to top of cement @1478m

1528.0 IH DFS 55 Drilled cement, plugs, shoe track. Displaced well to 9.5ppg mud while drilling out cmt and making 3m
of new hole to 1528m

1528.0 IH CHC 1 Circulated hole clean and ensured 9.5ppg in/out for Leak off test.

1528.0 IH LOT 1 Performed LOT against lower annular.
9.5ppg test mud weight, 1511.77m TVD, 1625psi, EMW 15.8ppg.1.89sg,

1544.0 IH P DA 3 Take SCR's, CLFL.

Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 1528m to 1544m.
Reduced parameters until stabilizers are out of casing(1558m)
String wt 240klbs, Tq 2-4000ftlbs, 50-60 rpm surface, 150rpm DH, WOB 5-10klbs, 1800psi, 790gpm.

Date : 25 Dec 2005 Daily Cost : $ 460984 Report Number : 14

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity

2131.0 IH P DA 24 Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 1544m to 2131m
String wt 275klbs, Tq 4-8000ftlbs, 150 rpm surface, 252rpm DH, WOB 15-18klbs, 2900psi, 900gpm.
Boost riser while drilling. Max gas for 24hr period 1.2%.

ROP average 24.45m/hr (including connections)
Survey results @2113.64m 3.4deg, 29.61 azimuth, 2112.98m TVD

Date : 26 Dec 2005 Daily Cost : $ 510764 Report Number : 15

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs Activity

2641.0 IH P DA 24 Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 2131m to 2641mMMDRT
String wt 310klbs, Tqg 4-8000ftlbs, 150 rpm surface, 260rpm DH, WOB 12-15klIbs, 3300psi, 900gpm.
Boost riser while drilling. Max gas for 24hr period 0.82%.

Increase mud weight from 1.14sg to 1.2sg (9.5ppg - 10ppg)
ROP average 21.25m/hr (including connections)
Survey results @2629.39m, 3.86deg, 40.58azimuth

Date : 27 Dec 2005 Daily Cost : $ 472057 Report Number : 16

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity

2787.0 IH P DA 8.5 Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 2641m to 2787m MDRT
String wt 310klbs, Tq 4-8000ftlbs, 150 rpm surface, 259rpm DH, WOB 12-20klbs, 3300psi, 900gpm.
Boost riser while drilling.

ROP average 17.17m/hr (including connections)
Survey results @2772.65m, 3.83deg, 43.73azimuth
2787.0 IH TP DA RE 0.5 Backed out saver sub on Top Drive during routine connection. Layed out single, installed new saver
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Date : 27 Dec 2005

Daily Cost : $ 472057 Report Number : 16

2991.0 IH P

2991.0 IH TP

3115.0 IH P

DA

DA

DA

RE 0.5

55

Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 2787m to 2991m MDRT

String wt 330klbs, Tqg 5-10000ftlbs, 150 rpm surface, 259rpm DH, WOB 5-10klbs, 3300psi, 900gpm.
Boost riser while drilling.

ROP average 22.6m/hr (including connections)

Survey results @2973.53m, 3.73deg, 46.71azimuth

Top Drive pipe handler failed to break out drill pipe during routine connection, change out front carrier
die while circulating down string.

Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 2991m to 3115m MDRT

String wt 340klbs, Tq 6-8000ftlbs, 150 rpm surface, 259rpm DH, WOB 10-12klbs, 3300psi, 900gpm.
Boost riser while drilling.Max gas for 24hr period 0.276%.

ROP average 22.5m/hr (including connections)

Survey results @3088.21m, 3.81deg, 46.46azimuth

Date : 28 Dec 2005

Daily Cost : $ 503334 Report Number : 17

Depth (m) Phase Cls

Op

R.C. Hrs

Activity

3226.0 IH P

3266.0 IH TP

3277.0 IH P

DA

DA

DA

10.5

WOW1.5

12

Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3115m to 3226m MDRT

String wt 340klbs, Tq 6-14000ftlbs, 80-150 rpm surface, 180-256rpm DH, WOB 5-20kIbs, 3900psi,
875gpm. Boost riser while drilling.

ROP averagel0.57m/hr (including connections)

Survey results @3202.65m, 3.71deg, 48.97 azimuth

Drilling operations suspended due to riser flex joint bullseye reading exceeding "GEM's" guidelines.
Circulate while trying to maneouver rig with anchor winches.
Wind 35-40 knots, Seas 1.5m WSW, Swell 1.5m NE

Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3226m to 3277m MDRT

String wt 340klbs, Tq 6-14000ftlbs, 80-150 rpm surface, 180-256rpm DH, WOB 5-25klbs, 4100psi,
860gpm. Boost riser while drilling.

ROP average 4.25m/hr (including connections)

Survey results @3202.65m, 3.71deg, 48.97 azimuth

Date : 29 Dec 2005

Daily Cost : $ 462947 Report Number : 18

Depth (m) Phase Cls

Op

R.C. Hrs

Activity

3356.0 IH P

3356.0 IH TP
3385.0 IH P

DA

DA
DA

155

RE 1

Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3277m to 3356m MDRT

String wt 350kIbs, Tq 4-14000ftlbs, 80-150 rpm surface, 180-256rpm DH, WOB 4-25klbs,
3800-4100psi, 840-900gpm. Boost riser while drilling.

ROP average 5.16m/hr (including connections)

Survey results @3317m, 3.72deg, 47.74 azimuth

Change out piston on #3 mud pump. fault find and repair blower motor fault.

Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3356m to 3385m MDRT

String wt 350klIbs, Tq 4-14000ftlbs, 100-150 rpm surface, 180-256rpm DH, WOB 4-25klbs, 4200psi,
890gpm. Boost riser while drilling.

ROP average 3.86m/hr (including connections)

Max gas for 24hr period 0.306%

Survey results @3346m, 3.65deg, 50.41 azimuth

Date : 30 Dec 2005

Daily Cost : $ 593639 Report Number : 19

Depth (m) Phase Cls

Op

R.C. Hrs

Activity

0.0 IH P

3390.0 IH TP

3402.0 IH P

DA

DA

DA
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RE 0.5

Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3385m to 3397m MDRT

String wt 350klIbs, Tq 4-14000ftlbs, 100-150 rpm surface, 180-256rpm DH, WOB 4-25klbs, 4200psi,
890gpm. Boost riser while drilling.

ROP average 3.86m/hr (including connections)

Survey results @3375m, 3.7deg, 76.2 azimuth

Elmagco auxillary brake problems. Fault find and make repairs.
Continue with 50% power available to Elmagco

Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3390m to 3402m MDRT

String wt 355klibs, Tq 4-14000ftlbs, 100-150 rpm surface, 180-256rpm DH, WOB 18-25kibs,
3900-4300psi, 875gpm. Boost riser while drilling. Average ROP = 2m/hr

POH to change bit.



Culverin 1

Date : 30 Dec 2005

Daily Cost : $ 593639 Report Number : 19

3402.0 IH TO 1 Flow checked and POOH from 3402m to 2867m, pulled tight @ 55klbs overpull

3402.0 IH REA 0.5 Made up top drive and back ream from 2867m to 2819m

3402.0 IH TO 6.5 Continued to POOH from 2819m to 268m, flow checked @ casing shoe. Calibrated MWD caliper @
1475m

3402.0 IH P TO 2 POOH with 311mm (12 1/4") BHA, remove radioactive source from LWD, broke off bit
(4-6-WT-S-X-1-RO-PR) and laid out mud motor

3402.0 IH TO 2 Picked up LWD from derrick and download data. Racked back same in derrick

3402.0 IH RS 0.5 Serviced top drive and pipe handler. Checked compensator chains

3402.0 IH TI 2 Picked up new motor (Sperrydrill 6/7 5 stage w/ 0 degree bend), made up new bit (Reed RSX616M)
and RIH with 311mm (12 1/4") BHA

3402.0 IH P Tl 1 Loaded radio active source into LWD and initiate tools

Date : 31 Dec 2005 Daily Cost : $ 431238 Report Number : 20

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity

3402.0 IH P TI 15 Continued to RIH with 12 1/4" BHA. Shallow pulse test MWD with 750 GPM and 750 psi, good test

3402.0 IH P TI 15 Picked up 27 joints 5" DP from catwalk

3402.0 IH P Tl 6 Continued to RIH with 12 1/4" BHA and 5" DP from Derrick to 3330m MDRT

3402.0 IH P RW 3 Reamed and washed from 3330m MDRT to 3380m MDRT. Performed confirmation pass with LWD
tools across interval

3402.0 IH P RW 0.5 Washed and reamed last single to bottom

3473.0 IH P DA 11.5 Drilled ahead 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3402m MDRT to 3473m MDRT, Average ROP = 6.2m/hr,
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Flow rate = 875 GPM, WOB = 17 - 24 kIbs, Rotary RPM = 80 - 110, Bit RPM = 190 - 220, Tq = 5000 -
9500 ft/lbs,



Culverin 1

Activity Report For Culverin 1

Date : 01 Jan 2006

Daily Cost : $ 466881 Report Number : 21

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity

3571.0 IH P DA 18.5 Continued to drill 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3473m MDRT to 3571m MDRT
Average ROP = 5.3m/hr, WOB = 20-24 klbs, Rotary RPM = 110, DH RPM = 228, Tq = 6000-8000 ftlb,
Flow = 872 GPM
Encountered drilling break at 3481m MDRT to 3487m MDRT, flow checked well (76m/hr, Gas = 45
units)
Max Gas = 186 units @ 3543.5m MDRT

3571.0 IH TU WSH WO 55 Conducted 15 minute flow check, good. POOH wet, checking for washout. Pulled 2 stands and made
up top drive, circulated to confirm continued pressure loss. POOH 10 stands, flow checked 10
minutes, good. Continued POOH checking for washout. Visually inspected tool joint seal faces of
each stand for wear.

Date : 02 Jan 2006 Daily Cost : $ 508563 Report Number : 22

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity

3571.0 IH TP WSH WO 65 Continued POOH checking for washout. Visually inspect tool joint seal faces of each stand for wear.
Flow checked at casing shoe and at HWDP. Downloaded sources from LWD tools. POOH and
inspected BHA for washout. Broke off bit and laid out motor

3571.0 IH TP TI WO 2 Made up 12 1/4" rotary BHA with Smith GF30BOVCPS (c/w 3 X 18 nozzles), install new HOC

3571.0 IH TP TI WO Initailized MWD and install sources in tool

3571.0 IH TP Tl WO 6.5 Picked up additional 8" DC's & RIH with 12 1/4" BHA, changed out drilling jar, continued RIH. Shallow
pulse tested MWD with 850 GPM @ 2000psi, OK. RIH with 5" DP from derrick to 2134m MDRT, filled
drillstring each 20 stands

3571.0 IH P TIT 5 Washed and reamed from 2134m MDRT to 2593m MDRT with 700 - 850 GPM, 2500 -3900 psi, 120
-145 RPM. MWD tools stopped communicating to surface. 200 psi pressure loss noted during
reaming (3900psi @ 850 gpm to 3700psi @ 900gpm).

3571.0 IH TP TO VE 2 Flow checked 15 minutes, good. POOH for LWD failure and potential washout from 2593m MDRT to
2020m MDRT. 60klbs overpull @ 2326m MDRT, worked drill string free

Date : 03 Jan 2006 Daily Cost : $ 439094 Report Number : 23

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity

3571.0 IH TP TO VE 15 Continued POOH for LWD failure (also POH wet looking for washout) from 2020m MDRT to 1510m
MDRT

3571.0 IH TP TO wo 1 Installed top drive and pump through drill string at 1510m MDRT to verify pump pressure loss. 220
SPM, 940 GPM, 3600 psi, ho pressure loss noted.
Presure test Pumps #1, #2 & #3 10 minutes each to 3800 psi against standpipe manifold to verify
mud pump and mudline integrity. Observed average pressure loss of 91psi over 10 minutes

3571.0 IH TP TO VE 25 Continued POOH for LWD failure (also POH wet looking for washout) from 1510m MDRT to 271m
MDRT

3571.0 IH TP TO VE 4 POOH with 12 1/4" BHA. Removed sources from LWD tools. Laid out LWD string. Downloaded data
and diagnostics information (Pulser falure)

3571.0 IH TP TI WO 3 Lined up Dowel cementing unit and pressure tested mud pumps and surface mud lines to 4200 psi.
Calibrated gauges between rig floor, mud loggers, MWD, and Dowell.
Picked up new 12 1/4" rotary BHA while pressure testing

3571.0 IH TP TI VE 4 Continued to pick up 12 1/4" BHA. Initialized LWD and installed sources. RIH and shallow pulse
tested LWD with 850 GPM @ 200 SPM and 1700 psi, good

3571.0 IH TP TI VE 25 RIH with 5" DP and filled drillstring each 20 stands to 1510m MDRT

3571.0 IH SC 15 Held Pre job safety meeting. Hung off blocks and slipped and cut 100 ft drilling line.

3571.0 IH RS 0.5 Serviced top drive

3571.0 IH TP WOW WOW3.5 Waiting on Weather to RIH. Excessive flex joint and riser angles
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NEXUS_AU_FWR.xsl (parent/child V1.2)

Winds: 40-45knts WSW
Seas; 3m
Swells; 4m



Culverin 1

Date : 03 Jan 2006

Daily Cost : $ 439094 Report Number : 23

Pitch 0.7 - 0.9
Roll; 0.8 - 0.9

Perform General rig maintenance and PM's

Date : 04 Jan 2006

Daily Cost : $ 447637 Report Number : 24

Depth (m) Phase Cls

Op

R.C.

Hrs

Activity

3571.0 IH TP WwOow WOW3.5 Waiting on Weather to RIH. Excessive flex joint and riser angles
Winds: 30-22knts WSW
Seas; 2.5m - 1.5m
Swells; 4m - 3m
Pitch 0.6
Roll; 0.8
Perform General rig maintenance and PM's

3571.0 IH TP wow WOw1l Repositioned rig to bring flex joint angle to < 1 degree

3571.0 IH TP T WO 45 Continued to RIH with 5" DP from 1510m MDRT to 3487m MDRT

3571.0 IH TP RW WO 1 Washed and reamed from 3487m MDRT to 3571m MDRT

3619.0 IH P DA 14 Drilled ahead 31mm (12 1/4") hole from 3571m MDRT to 3619m MDRT.
WOB = 25 - 34 klbs, RPM = 100- 150, SPM = 188 = 805 GPM, 4000 psi, Tq = 4500 - 6700 ftlb.
Average ROP = 3.4m/hr

Date : 05 Jan 2006 Daily Cost : $ 464894 Report Number : 25

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity

3697.0 IH P DA 24 Drilled ahead 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3619m MDRT to 3697m MDRT.
WOB = 30 - 41 klbs, RPM = 80- 120, SPM = 187 = 800 GPM, 4050 psi, Tq = 5500 - 7500 ftlb.
Average ROP = 3.55m/hr
Max Gas today = 103 units @ 3695m MDRT

Date : 06 Jan 2006 Daily Cost : $ 556712 Report Number : 26

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity

3697.0 IH P DA 4 Drilled ahead 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3697m MDRT to 3714m MDRT.
WOB = 30 - 35 klbs, RPM = 80- 120, SPM = 187 = 800 GPM, 4050 psi, Tq = 5500 - 7500 ftlb.
Average ROP = 4.3 m/hr
LWD tools stopped pulsing

3714.0 IH TU RR 0.5 Backed out IBOP on connection. Re aligned top drive and screwed back into IBOP. Torqued same to
78000 ftlbs. Comfirmed alignment of breakout/Make up system

3758.0 IH P DA 19.5 Troubleshooted LWD tools. No sucess.
Drilled Ahead 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3714m MDRT to 3758m MDRT
WOB =30 - 35, RPM =100 - 130, SPM = 188 = 800 GPM = 4050 psi, Tg = 7000 - 8500 ftlb, Average
ROP = 2.3 m/hr

Date : 07 Jan 2006 Daily Cost : $ 604571 Report Number : 27

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity

3758.0 IH P CS 2 Circulated bottoms up sample at 188 spm (800 GPM) from 3758m MDRT

3758.0 IH P TO 1 Flow checked 15 minuted, good. POOH from 3758m MDRT to 3668m MDRT

3758.0 IH P LOG 4.5 Logged up with LWD for confirmation data from 3668m MDRT to 3582m MDRT at 30m/hr and 20 - 25
RPM

3758.0 IH P TO 0.5 Pumped 25 bbl slug and POOH from 3582m MDRT to 3506m MDRT

‘Copyright IDS 2006', TF/JG 20060404,
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Culverin 1

Date : 07 Jan 2006

Daily Cost : $ 604571 Report Number : 27

3758.0 IH TP RR RE 1 Repaired hose on racking arm

3758.0 IH P TO 8 Continued POOH from 3506m MDRT to 36m MDRT. Flow checked at casing shoe and prior to BHA
entering BOP

3758.0 IH P RR RE 0.5 Removed sources from LWD tools. Plugged in and attempted to power down tools with no success

3758.0 IH P TO 15 Laid out LWD tools and BHA

3758.0 IH P LOG 1 Held JSA and rigged up to run Schlumberger wireline tools

3758.0 IH U LOG 15 Made up wireline tools for run #1, installed radioactive sources

3758.0 IH U LOG 2.5 RIH with log #1, GR/PEX/HALS/DSI. Performed repeat pass from 3675m MDRT to 3575m MDRT
(23:30 hrs)

Date : 08 Jan 2006 Daily Cost : $ 495998 Report Number : 28

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity

3758.0 IH U LOG 5 RIH with log #1, PEX combo GR/PEX/HALS/DSI. Performed repeat pass from 3675m MDRT to
3575m MDRT (23:30 hrs).
Perform main Log (from 00:10)
GR: TD to Seafloor,
PEX Hi Res: TD to 2775m MDRT,
HALS: TD to 1511m MDRT,
DSI: P&S and Upper Dipole mode from 3758m MDRT to 2775m MDRT, P&S Mode from 2775m
MDRT to 1511m MDRT

3758.0 IH LOG Rigged down Run #1 Wireline tools. Made up Run #2; VSP

3758.0 IH LOG 6 RIH and perform VSP.
Checkshots at 1559m, 2541m and 3509m MDRT
Main pass from 3750m to 3200m MDRT at 15m spacing and 3200m to sea floor at 100m spacing

3758.0 IH TP LOG OTH 05 Troubleshot network cabling problem with computer hardware in logging unit

3758.0 IH P LOG 3.5 Continued with VSP main pass from 3750m to 3200m MDRT at 15m spacing and 3200m to sea floor
at 100m spacing

3758.0 IH LOG 15 Wireline at surface. Laid down VSP toolstring. Rigged out wireline running equipment

3758.0 PA T 45 Picked up side entry sub and 2 X TIW valves, made up cementing stand and racked back same.
Picked up 5" mule shoe and RIH with 5" DP to 2293m MDRT

Date : 09 Jan 2006 Daily Cost : $ 535925 Report Number : 29

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity

3758.0 PA P T 3 Continued to RIH with 5" DP from 2293m MDRT to 3750m MDRT

3758.0 PA P CMD 0.5 Circulated bottoms up at 210 SPM = 900 GPM = 3200 psi. Rotate DP at 40 - 50 RPM

3758.0 PA TP RR RE 0.5 Worked on mud pump SCRs. Rotated and reciprocated drillstring during repairs

3758.0 PA CHC 1 Continued to circulate bottoms up at 210 SPM = 900 GPM = 3200 psi

3758.0 PA CMP 15 Held pre job safety meeting. Rigged up Dowell cementing line and pressure tested to 1000 psi. Mixed
and pumped abandonment plug # 1; 102 bbl 15.8 ppg, HTB blend + additives (see report). Displaced
with 195 bbls drilling fluid at 10.1 ppg
Plug #1 set from 3750m MDRT to 3560m MDRT.

3758.0 PA P TO 1 POOH from cement plug # 1 from 3750m MDRT to 3420m MDRT slowly

3758.0 PA P CHC 15 Circulated bottoms up to clear drillpipe

3758.0 PA P TO 1 POOH From 3420m MDRT to 2965m MDRT

3758.0 PA P CMD 0.5 Circulated and spotted 60 bbl high visc pill

3758.0 PA P TO 0.5 POOH from 2965m MDRT to 2865m MDRT

3758.0 PA P CMP 1 Held pre job safety meeting. Pressure tested cementing line to 1000 psi. Mixed and pumped

‘Copyright IDS 2006', TF/JG 20060404,
NEXUS_AU_FWR.xsl (parent/child V1.2)

abandonment plug # 2; 64.3 bbl 15.8 ppg, HTB blend + additives (see report). Displaced with 149
bbls drilling fluid at 10.1 ppg

Plug #2 set from 2865m MDRT to 2745m MDRT.



Culverin 1

Date : 09 Jan 2006

Daily Cost : $ 535925 Report Number : 29

3758.0 PA P TO 0.5 POOH from plug #2 from 2865m MDRT to 2575m MDRT

3758.0 PA P CHC 15 Circulated bottoms up

3758.0 PA P WOC 35 WOC. Laid down 54 jts 5" DP

3758.0 PA P TI 1 RIH and tagged TOC plug #2 with 5 klbs at 2735m MDRT

3758.0 PA P TO 2 POOH from 2735m MDRT to 1650m MDRT

3758.0 PA P CMD 0.5 Circulated and spotted 60 bbls high visc pill at 1650m MDRT

3758.0 PA P TO 0.5 POOH from 1650m MDRT to 1550m MDRT. Rigged up cementing hose

3758.0 PA P CMP 1 Held pre job safety meeting. Pressure tested cementing line to 1000 psi. Mixed and pumped
abandonment plug # 3; 70.4 bbl 15.8 ppg, HTB blend + additives (see report). Displaced with 74 bbls
drilling fluid at 10.1 ppg
Plug #3 set from 1550m MDRT to 1430m MDRT.

3758.0 PA TO 0.5 Rigged down cementing hose. POOH from cement plug #3

3758.0 PA CMD 1 Circualted bottoms up. Spotted 260 bbls inhibited mud in casing.

Date : 10 Jan 2006 Daily Cost : $ 474060 Report Number : 30

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity

3758.0 PA P PLD 3 Pumped slug. POOH and laid down 60 jts of 5" drillpipe from 1262m MDRT to 688m MDRT

3758.0 PA P Tl 1 RIH from 688m MDRT to 1204m MDRT to tag cement plug #3. Cement samples not firm.

3758.0 PA P PLD 15 Laid down drill pipe from 1204m MDRT to 917m MDRT.

3758.0 PA P TI 2 RIH from 917m MDRT and tag TOC plug #3 at 1421m MDRT with 5 klbs

3758.0 PA P TO 1 POOH from 1421m MDRT to 825m MDRT

3758.0 PA P CMD 0.5 Circulated and spotted 60 bbls high visc pill at 825m MDRT

3758.0 PA P TO 0.5 POOH from 825m MDRT to 721m MDRT. Rigged up cementing hose

3758.0 PA P CMP 1 Held pre job safety meeting. Pressure tested cementing line to 1000 psi. Mixed and pumped
abandonment plug # 4; 49.7 bbl 15.8 ppg, G cement + additives (see report). Displaced with 30 bbls
drilling fluid at 10.1 ppg
Plug #4 set from 721m MDRT to 625m MDRT.

3758.0 PA TO 0.5 POOH from cement plug #4 from 721m MDRT to 625m MDRT

3758.0 PA CHC Closed annular preventer, reverse circulated 2 X DP volumes (80 bbls). Displaced choke and kill lines
to seawater. Displaced riser and booster line to seawater

3758.0 PA P TO 25 Held JSA. POOH from 625m MDRT and laid out mule shoe. Cleaned cement from last 8 stands of
drillpipe

3758.0 PA CHC 15 Held JSA. Made up jet sub and wear bushing retrieval tool. RIH and jetted stack and wellhead areas.

3758.0 PA WH 25 Engaged wear bushing with retrieval tool and POOH. 35 klbs overpull to recover noted. Laid out
retrieval tool and jetting sub

3758.0 PA P CMP 1 Held JSA. Rigged up Dowell and high pressure test pump. Pressure tested choke and kill lines as per
DOGD requirements to 250 psi low and 14,000 psi high for 10 minutes each

3758.0 BOP RR2 1 Rigged down 350t elevators and picked up 500t elevators

3758.0 BOP RR2 15 Held JSA. Rig up floor to recover riser and BOP

Date : 11 Jan 2006 Daily Cost : $ 483017 Report Number : 31

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs Activity

3758.0 BOP P RR2 1 Continued to rig up riser handling equipment

3758.0 BOP P RR2 1 Picked up and installed diverter running tool. Verified tool lock with 10 kibs overpull

3758.0 BOP P RR2 1 Removed and laid out diverter

3758.0 BOP P RR2 15 Picked up landing joint and made up to slip joint. Scoped in slip joint
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Date : 11 Jan 2006

Daily Cost : $ 483017 Report Number : 31

3758.0 BOP RR2 0.5 Unlatched BOP's from wellhead

3758.0 BOP RR2 15 Removed storm saddles. Latch in SDL ring

3758.0 BOP RR2 3 Lowered slip joint. Removed choke and kill goosenecks and booster line. Picked up and laid out
landing joint. Moved rig 24 meters off location

3758.0 BOP P RR2 145 Eglled BOP's and laid out marine riser. Back loaded 26 joints to the Pacific Wrangler for shipment to

en

Date : 12 Jan 2006 Daily Cost : $ 460184 Report Number : 32

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs Activity

3758.0 BOP P RR2 35 Continued to pull BOP's and lay out marine riser.

3758.0 BOP P RR2 1 Pulled riser double and landed out BOP's on carrier

3758.0 BOP P RR2 5 Removed guidelines from BOP's. Removed clamps from pod hoses. Broke riser double and 5 ft
termination spool from BOP's. Skidded BOP's to starboard side and laid down riser double and
termination spool

3758.0 BOP P RR2 1.5 Rigged down riser handling equipment, rigged up 5" DP handling equipment and moved rig back over
location

3758.0 PA TI 35 Held JSA, Picked up 20" X 30" casing cutter assembly. RIH with 5" DP

3758.0 PA TI 0.5 Moved rig starboard forward to stab casing cutter assembly into wellhead

3758.0 PA CCT 0.5 ]!Engaged cutter asembly and tested with 40 kibs over pull. Commenced cutting casing. Cut 20" casing
ree

3758.0 PA TP TO VE 2 POOH with wellhead and 20" casing stub. Laid out same

3758.0 BOP TP HBHA VE 2 Held JSA. Changed out casing cutters blades, grapple, spacer sub and centralizer on casing cutter
assembly

3758.0 PA TP TI VE 2 RIH with casing cutter to 30" housing

3758.0 PA P CCT 1 Engaged casing cutter assembly into housing and test with 40 kibs overpull. Commenced cutting 30"
casing. Cut 30" casing

3758.0 PA P TO 15 POOH with guide base and 30" housing

Date : 13 Jan 2006 Daily Cost : $ 461375 Report Number : 33

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity

3758.0 PA P TO 1 Continued POOH with guide base and 30" housing

3758.0 PA P TO 0.5 Landed out and secured guide base on trolley. Backed out cap screws on guidebase to 30" housing.
Conducted 100m radius seabed survey with ROV after pulling PGB. Fugro documentation and DVD
to follow.

3758.0 PA P TO 15 Picked up 30" housing and 30" casing cut off to rig floor. Unlatched spear and laid out 30" housing.
Broke down and laid out 30" spear and casing cutting BHA

3758.0 PA P TO 15 Removed guidelines from guidebase. Moved guidebase on trolley to starboard side of moonpool

3758.0 PA P PLD 5.5 RIH with 8" DC's and 5" HWDP from derrick. Laid out same

3758.0 PA P PLD 4 RIH with 20 stands 5" DP and laid down same

3758.0 PA P PLD 35 RIH with 20 stands 5" DP and laid out same

3758.0 PA P PLD 4.5 RIH with 20 stands 5" DP and laid out same. Used rig tongs to break out over-torqued pipe

3758.0 PA P PLD 2 RIH with 20 stands 5" DP and laid out 10 singles

Date : 14 Jan 2006 Daily Cost : $ 489283 Report Number : 34

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity

3758.0

PA TP

WO OTH 0.5
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Waited on Medivac helicopter to depart to re-commence crane operations for laying out drillpipe.
(Medivac required due to sick person - no injury or safety incident occured)



Culverin 1

Date : 14 Jan 2006

Daily Cost : $ 489283 Report Number : 34

3758.0 PA PLD 3 Continued to lay down 5" DP

3758.0 AR OA 5.5 De-ballast rig.
Work on Elmago brake while de-ballasting rig.

3758.0 AR P AH 15 De-ballasting completed at 09:15
Commenced Pulling anchors as follows:
Boat------- Anchor--- PCC to Boat---Off Bottom----Anchor Racked-----PCC to Rig
Grip #6 06:45 07:35 10:40 10:47
Wrangler---#2 08:11. 10:00 13:06 13:21
Grip #3 11:09 11:48 13:42 14:03
Wrangler---#7 13:35 14:30 16:22 16:31
Grip #1 14:21 19:30 21:38 21:58
Grip: #5 22:16 23:05
Wrangler on put on tow bridle @ 18:20 hrs

Date : 15 Jan 2006 Daily Cost : $ 680037 Report Number : 35

Depth (m) Phase Cls Op R.C. Hrs  Activity

3758.0 AR P AH 2.5 Far Grip pulling bight of chain back to rig to release tension @ 0020hrs.
Tension dropping on #5 anchor, commence to heave in @ 0050hrs.
Anchor #5 @ 1350m chain out, tension dropping @ 0130hrs.
Far Grip reports work wire inadvertently paid out 700m @ 0215hrs

3758.0 AR TP AH OTH 3.5 Trouble shooted Far grip winch problems. Far Grip reported damage to low gear and only able to
work with high gear. Prepared to move vessel to acertain tonnage available in high gear

3758.0 AR P AH 9 Pulling anchors as follows:
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Boat------- Anchor--- PCC to Boat---Off Bottom----Anchor Racked-----PCC to Rig

Grip #5 08:18 08:41
Grip--------- #8 08:52 09:25 11:25 11:40
Grip--------- #4 11:57 12:50 14:53 N/A

Wrangler put on tow bridle @ 18:20 hrs Jan 14, 2006
Ocean Patriot on tight tow @ 15:00 Jan 15, 2006
Ocean Patriot handed over to Anzon Australia Limited @ 15:00 Jan 15, 2006

Statement of facts obtained from Ocean Patriot, Wrangler and Far Grip
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Time Analysis
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Time Analysis by Operational Code (% of 802 hrs)

REAM IN/OUT €0.1%)

DRILL FLOAT & SHOE TRACK (0.7Z)
WAIT ON OTHER (0.1%)

WAIT ON WEATHER (1.0%)

RIG SERVICE ¢0.1%)

WAIT OM CEMENT ¢1.0%)
LEAK-OFF TEST (0.1%)

OTHER ACTIWITY (1.1
REPAIR OTHER (o.1¥)
CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAM €1.2%)
RIG-UP TO RUN CSG (0.2E)
WASHOUT ¢1.58

CASING - CIRCULATE €0.28)
BOP : MIPPLE U/D AMD TEST (2.12)
CASING - CUT (o.zd)

CASING - RUN (2.74)

SKID RIG (Q.2Z¥)

RIG MOVE (2.9%)

DISPLACE MUD (o.2d)

PIPE - LAY DOWN (3.4%)
CIRCULATE SAMPLE (02X
PICK UP PIPE (3.4%)
WELL-HERD ©0.3%)

HANDLE BHA (3.4%)

RIG REPAIR (0.4%)

LOGGING (3.68)

CIRCULATE & CONDITION MUD (0.42)
RISER - RECOVER (4.7%)
SLIP/CUT ORILL LIME o4
RISER - RUN ¢5.0%)

HANDLE TOOLS (0.5%)
TRIP-OUT (6.9%)

REAMAASH (0,620

TRIP-IN (7.5%)

TRIP-IN TIGHT (0.6%3
ANCHOR HANDLING (7.9%)
CASING - CEMENT (0.68)
DRILLING AHEAD (33.4%)
CEMENT PLUG 0.7

0.6%

OO0 O DR EONOECECOCCOOOOENEROCOCODDEESEEREOENCOEOEOCOCOO
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nels

Time Breakdown by Class Codes
Time in hours
020406080002040608202204060283002C43638808284368860062064500686062G406G87002F406080

TROUBLE - UNPLANNED 8.0
UNPLANNED 9.0
TROUBLE - PLANNED 82.0

PLANNED 702.5
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Time Analysis by Class Codes (% of 802 hrs)

TROUBLE - UMPLANMED (1.0%)
TROUBLE - PLANNED ¢10.2%)
UMPLANKED (1.1%)
FLANKED (87 .62

10.2%

1.0%
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Trouble Time Analysis
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Culverin 1

Drilling : Lost Time Summary (% of 90 hrs)

LOGGING (0620
DRILLING AHEAD <4.4%)
WAIT ON OTHER (0.6%)
ANCHOR HANDLIMG (5.6%)
REAMAASH (1.1%)
HANDLE BHA (7.8%)
REPAIR OTHER (1.1%)
WAIT OM WEATHER (&.9%)
RISER - RUM ¢1.1¥)
WASHOUT ¢13.3%)

SKID RIG (1.7%)
TRIP-OUT (1d.4%>

BOP : MIPPLE U/D AMD TEST (2.28)
TRIP-IN (3d.4¥)

RIG REPAIR (Z.8%)

OO0 O DR EOEOECECOO

14.4%
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Culverin 1

Root Cause : Lost Time Summary (hrs)

Hrs lost
2 4 6 _ 8 10 12 14 16 18 20 22 24 26 28 30 32 34 36
DOWNHOLE TOOL FAILURE - 5.0

-}

RIG EQUIPMENT

VENDOR EQUIPMENT 23.5

WASHOUT 32.0

‘Copyright IDS 2006', TF/JG 20060404,
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Culverin 1

Root Cause : Lost Time Summary (% of 89.5 hrs)

BOPY s (2.2H)

OTHER €12.8%)

OOWWHOLE TOOL FAILURE (5.6%)
WENDOR EQUIPHENT (26.3%)
RIG EQUIPHENT (6.7%)
WASHOUT ¢35.8%)

WAIT OM WEATHER <10.62)

O OoEEMm

6.7%

35.8%
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Culverin 1

nels

NPT During Programmed Time

Date PHS Operation NPT Depth Description of Programmed Trouble Time

16 Dec 2005 SC REPAIR OTHER 1 650.0 | Had rig welder manufacture 2 x "C" plates due to #1 & #2 guide line
spears releasing and not latching correctly.

17 Dec 2005 SC SKID RIG 15 650.0 | Stabbed casing in open hole with ROV assistance and by moving the
rig 4m stbd aft.

18 Dec 2005 IH HANDLE BHA 15 650.0 | Attempt to test MWD tools. Failure to produce survey information.
Gamma ok.

Change out stand pipe sensor after discussing with Sperry Sun in
Perth. Re-test down hole tools, still not transmitting survey data

18 Dec 2005 IH HANDLE BHA 35 650.0 | POOH and Rack back BHA from 103m to access MWD internals at
rotary table. Remove faulty unit and install back up unit. Run in hole
to 103m. Shallow test OK.

Battery module is the suspected faulty item.

18 Dec 2005 IH TRIP-IN 1 650.0 | Move rig to assist with stabbing drill string in 30" housing. Initialy
guide ropes ok but due to excess current and movement 2 broke
then the remaining 2.

Skid rig to assist with stabbing, due to 5-6m seas and 42knot winds
the winch tension was excessive before sea bed movement was
achieved.

18 Dec 2005 IH TRIP-IN 35 650.0 | POOH from 604m to surface, install new soft line guide ropes to
assist in stabbing.

RIH to PGB at 605m, stab and continue RIh to top of cement at
644m.

23 Dec 2005 BOP |RISER - RUN 1 1525.0 | ROV camera system problems while on bottom monitoring
BOP/PGB. Camera's were cutting out and all visibility was lost.
Topside black and white camera still working. Recover ROV and
move top side black and white camera to front pan tilt for landing
bops'. Water had ingressed into camera electrics cannister. Gain use
of 2 cameras and dive ROV

24 Dec 2005 IH BOP : NIPPLE U/D AND 2 1525.0 | Attempt function test on blue pod, Run-away observed on open
TEST function for upper annular. Function several times and uncontroled
flow stopped. Change back to yellow pod and upper annular
functions ok. Proceed with operations after discussing equipment
failure. Signs made for all BOP panels stating not to operate upper
annular on blue pod. Currently drilling on Yellow pod.

27 Dec 2005 IH DRILLING AHEAD 0.5 2787.0 | Backed out saver sub on Top Drive during routine connection. Layed

out single, installed new saver sub on Top Drive and picked up a
replacement single of 127mm (5") dp.

27 Dec 2005 IH DRILLING AHEAD 0.5 2991.0 | Top Drive pipe handler failed to break out drill pipe during routine
connection, change out front carrier die while circulating down string.
28 Dec 2005 IH DRILLING AHEAD 15 3266.0 | Drilling operations suspended due to riser flex joint bullseye reading

exceeding "GEM's" guidelines. Circulate while trying to maneouver
rig with anchor winches.
Wind 35-40 knots, Seas 1.5m WSW, Swell 1.5m NE

29 Dec 2005 IH DRILLING AHEAD 1 3356.0 | Change out piston on #3 mud pump. fault find and repair blower
motor fault.

30 Dec 2005 IH DRILLING AHEAD 0.5 3390.0 | ElImagco auxillary brake problems. fault find and make repairs.
Continue with 50% power available to Elmagco

02 Jan 2006 IH WASHOUT 6.5 3571.0 | Continued POOH checking for washout. Visually inspect tool joint

seal faces of each stand for wear. Flow checked at casing shoe and
at HWDP. Downloaded sources from LWD tools. POOH and
inspected BHA for washout. Broke off bit and laid out motor

02 Jan 2006 IH TRIP-IN 2 3571.0 | Made up 12 1/4" rotary BHA with Smith GF30BOVCPS (c/w 3 X 18
nozzles), install new HOC.

02 Jan 2006 IH TRIP-IN 2 3571.0 | Initailized MWD and install sources in tool.

02 Jan 2006 IH TRIP-IN 6.5 3571.0 | Picked up additional 8" DC's & RIH with 12 1/4" BHA, changed out

drilling jar, continued RIH. Shallow pulse tested MWD with 850 GPM
@ 2000psi, OK. RIH with 5" DP from derrick to 2134m MDRT, filled
drillstring each 20 stands

02 Jan 2006 IH TRIP-OUT 2 3571.0 | Flow checked 15 minutes, good. POOH for LWD failure and potential
washout from 2593m MDRT to 2020m MDRT. 60kIbs overpull @
2326m MDRT, worked drill string free

03 Jan 2006 IH TRIP-OUT 15 3571.0 | Continued POOH for LWD failure (also POH wet looking for washout)
from 2020m MDRT to 1510m MDRT

‘Copyright IDS 2006', TF/JG 20060404,
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Culverin 1

NPT During Programmed Time

Date

PHS

Operation

NPT

Depth Description of Programmed Trouble Time

03 Jan 2006

03 Jan 2006

03 Jan 2006

03 Jan 2006

03 Jan 2006

03 Jan 2006
03 Jan 2006

04 Jan 2006

04 Jan 2006
04 Jan 2006
04 Jan 2006
07 Jan 2006
08 Jan 2006

09 Jan 2006

12 Jan 2006
12 Jan 2006

12 Jan 2006
14 Jan 2006

15 Jan 2006

IH

PA

PA
BOP

PA
PA

AR

TRIP-OUT

TRIP-OUT

TRIP-OUT

TRIP-IN

TRIP-IN

TRIP-IN
WAIT ON WEATHER

WAIT ON WEATHER

WAIT ON WEATHER
TRIP-IN
REAM/WASH

RIG REPAIR
LOGGING

RIG REPAIR

TRIP-OUT
HANDLE BHA

TRIP-IN
WAIT ON OTHER

ANCHOR HANDLING

25

25
3.5

35

35

3571.0

3571.0

3571.0

3571.0

3571.0

3571.0
3571.0

3571.0

3571.0
3571.0
3571.0
3758.0
3758.0

3758.0

3758.0
3758.0

3758.0
3758.0

3758.0

Installed top drive and pump through drill string at 1510m MDRT to
verify pump pressure loss. 220 SPM, 940 GPM, 3600 psi, no
pressure loss noted.

Presure test Pumps #1, #2 & #3 10 minutes each to 3800 psi against
standpipe manifold to verify mud pump and mudline integrity.
Observed average pressure loss of 91psi over 10 minutes

Continued POOH for LWD failure (also POOH wet looking for washout
from 1510m MDRT to 271m MDRT

POOH with 12 1/4" BHA. Removed sources from LWD tools. Laid out
LWD string. Downloaded data and diagnostics information (Pulser
falure).

Lined up Dowel cementing unit and pressure tested mud pumps and
surface mud lines to 4200 psi. Calibrated gauges between rig floor,
mud loggers, MWD, and Dowell.

Picked up new 12 1/4" rotary BHA while pressure testing

Continued to pick up 12 1/4" BHA. Initialized LWD and installed
sources. RIH and shallow pulse tested LWD with 850 GPM @ 200
SPM and 1700 psi, good

RIH with 5" DP and filled drillstring each 20 stands to 1510m MDRT

Waiting on Weather to RIH. Excessive flex joint and riser angles

Winds: 40-45knts WSW
Seas; 3m

Swells; 4m

Pitch 0.7 - 0.9

Roll; 0.8 - 0.9

Perform General rig maintenance and PM's
Waiting on Weather to RIH. Excessive flex joint and riser angles

Winds: 30-22knts WSW
Seas; 2.5m - 1.5m
Swells; 4m - 3m

Pitch 0.6

Roll; 0.8

Perform General rig maintenance and PM's

Repositioned rig to bring flex joint angle to < 1 degree

Continued to RIH with 5" DP from 1510m MDRT to 3487m MDRT
Washed and reamed from 3487m MDRT to 3571m MDRT
Repaired hose on racking arm

Troubleshot network cabling problem with computer hardware in
logging unit

Worked on mud pump SCRs. Rotated and reciprocated drillstring
during repairs

POOH with wellhead and 20" casing stub. Laid out same

Held JSA. Changed out casing cutters blades, grapple, spacer sub
and centralizer on casing cutter assembly

RIH with casing cutter to 30" housing

Waited on Medivac helicopter to depart to re-commence crane
operations for laying out drillpipe. (Medivac required due to sick
person - no injury or safety incident occured)

Trouble shooted Far grip winch problems. Far Grip reported damage

to low gear and only able to work with high gear. Prepared to move
vessel to acertain tonnage available in high gear

‘Copyright IDS 2006', TF/JG 20060404,
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APPENDIX 2

DAILY DRILLING REPORTS

Culverin-1 Basic Well Completion Report April 2006



DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 1

05 Nov 2005 _';(V)Qmi Culverin 1
Well Data

Country Australia | MDBRT 0.0m | Cur. Hole Size AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsla_nd TVDBRT 0.0m Last Casing OD AFE No. 3433-1001

Basin | b ogress 0.0m | Shoe TVDBRT Daily Cost $ 4339992

Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 0.00 | Shoe MDBRT Cum Cost $ 4339992
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 0.25 | FIT/LOT: /| Days Since Last LTI

Witr Dpth(MSL) 585.0m Planned TD MD

RT-ASL(MSL) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT

RT-ML 606.5m

Current Op @ 0600

Planned Op

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs
Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 05 Nov 2005

Phse Cls

(RC)

Op From To Hrs Depth

Activity Description

RM P RM 1800 [2400 |6.00 |0.0m

Apache released Ocean Patriot to Nexus at Fur Seal Loction. Tow to Culverin Location.
Pacific Wrangler on tow bridle. Far Grip following
24:00 hrs Position: 38deg 5.7min S, 148deg 343.1min E.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 06 Nov 2005
Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
RM P RM 0000 |0300 [3.00 |0.0m Tow to Culverin location.
RM P RM 0300 |0600 |3.00 |[0.0m (IN PROGRESS) Pass #4 Anchor PCC to Far Grip. Anchor #4 on bottom at 09:00 hrs.

PCC atrig 11:44 hrs.

Pass #8 Anchor PCC to Far Grip at 11:46 hrs. Run anchor #8.

At 14:50 hrs Anchor winch failed & winch gear box was serverly damaged. #4 anchor
chain dropped to the sea bed.

Rig off hire at 17:00 hrs and Statement Of Fact taken.

Haul in #8 anchor which was bolstered at 117:00 hrs. PCC on rig at 17:05 hrs.
Statement of Fact taken at 17:00 hrs.

Phase Data to 2400hrs, 05 Nov 2005

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 6/05 Nov 2005 |05 Nov 2005 6.00 0.250 0.0m
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m) Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
30" | 650.90 | 650.90 | 650.90 |
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 43
DOGC 8
ESS 8
DOGC 2
NEXUS 2
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 4
SCHLUMBERGER OILFIELD AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 2
CAMERON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 1

"Copyright IDS 2005', TF/JG 20050815, NEXUS_AU_drlig
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Personnel On Board

DOGC 3
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (RIG POSITIONING) 2
Total | 75
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Lost Workday Case 17 Aug 2005 | 80 Days sgkjfkagk hghdfgfgfggfigfgfgafgajfgggfgfag

akghhahfhjkhakjhkh
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 2

06 Nov 2005 From: Culverin 1
Well Data

Country Australia | MDBRT 0.0m | Cur. Hole Size AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsla_nd TVDBRT 0.0m Last Casing OD AFE No. 3433-1001

_ Basin | brogress 0.0m | Shoe TVDBRT Daily Cost $ 334792

Drill Co. boGC Days from spud 0.00 |Shoe MDBRT Cum Cost $ 4674784
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 1.05 |FIT/LOT: /" | Days Since Last LTI

Wir Dpth(MSL) 585.0m Planned TD MD

RT-ASL(MSL) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT

RT-ML 606.5m

Current Op @ 0600

Planned Op

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Tow to Culvering Location. Run & set anchor #4. While running anchor #8 anchor winch#4 failed destroying the gear box allowing the anchor & anchor
chain to fall to the sea bed. Bolster anchor # 8.
Rig off hire at 15:00 hrs. On tow to Two Fold Bay for repair.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 06 Nov 2005

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
RM P RM 0000 |0300 |3.00 |0.0m Tow to Culverin location.
RM P RM 0300 |1700 |14.00 |[0.0m Pass #4 Anchor PCC to Far Grip. Anchor #4 on bottom at 09:00 hrs. PCC at rig 11:44
hrs.

Pass #8 Anchor PCC to Far Grip at 11:46 hrs. Run anchor #8.

At 14:50 hrs Anchor winch failed & winch gear box was serverly damaged. #4 anchor
chain dropped to the sea bed.

Rig off hire at 17:00 hrs and Statement Of Fact taken.

Haul in #8 anchor which was bolstered at 117:00 hrs. PCC on rig at 17:05 hrs.
Statement of Fact taken at 17:00 hrs.

RM TP RM 1445 |1700 |2.25 |0.0m At 14:45 hrs, while paying out on anchor #8, anchor winch #4 failed & winch gear box
(RE) and motor was serverly damaged. #4 anchor chain dropped to the sea bed.

Haul in #8 anchor which was bolstered at 17:00 hrs. PCC on rig at 17:05 hrs. Pacific
Werangler still on tow bridle.

Statement of Fact taken at 17:00 hrs. Rig off contract at 17:00 hrs Nov 6, 2005.

Phase Data to 2400hrs, 06 Nov 2005

Phase Phase Hrs  Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days  Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 25.25|05 Nov 2005 |06 Nov 2005 25.25 1.052 0.0m
Bulk Stocks

Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Casing

OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m) Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
30" | 650.90 | 650.90 | 650.90 |

Personnel On Board

Company Pax Comment

DOGC 43
DOGC

ESS

DOGC

NEXUS

FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV)

SCHLUMBERGER OILFIELD AUSTRALIA PTY LTD
CAMERON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD

P N B NN O O
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Personnel On Board

DOGC 3
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (RIG POSITIONING) 2
Total | 75
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Lost Workday Case 17 Aug 2005 |81 Days sgkjfkagk hghdfgfgfggfigfgfgafgajfgggfgfag

akghhahfhjkhakjhkh
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 3

14 Dec 2005 From: Culverin 1

Well Data

Country Australia | MDBRT 0.0m | Cur. Hole Size AFE Cost $ 22699889

Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 0.0m | Last Casing OD AFE No. 3433-1001
_ Basin | b ogress 0.0m | Shoe TVDBRT Daily Cost $ 1161836

Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 0.00 | Shoe MDBRT Cum Cost $ 5836620

Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 221 | FIT/LOT: Days Since Last LTI

Witr Dpth(MSL) 585.0m Planned TD MD

RT-ASL(MSL) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT

RT-ML 606.5m

Current Op @ 0600 Running last anchor.

Planned Op Complete running anchors and de-ballast rig, pick up drillpipe.

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Run Anchors

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 14 Dec 2005

Phse Cls Op
(RC)

From

To Hrs Depth

Activity Description

RM P RM
A P AH

0430
0500

A TU |AH
(RE)

0630

0730

1200

1545

1745

0500
0630

0.50
1.50

0.0m
0.0m

0730 |1.00 |0.0m

1200 (450 |0.0m

2400 |12.00 |0.0m

1745 12.00 |0.0m

2400 |6.25 |0.0m

Back on Contract with Nexus after Rig Repair

#8 Anchor on bottom @ 0500hrs and heave in to 95t pull.
Wrangler strip back #8 and pass PCC to rig @ 0620hrs.
Pass #5 PCC to Wrangler @ 0635hrs, unable to pay out on windlass.

Troubleshoot electrical fault on # 5 windlass.

Run #5 Anchor @ 0732hrs, on bottom @ 0942hrs.
Wrangler strip back #5 and pass PCC to rig @ 1139hrs.

Pass #1 PCC to Wrangler @ 1208hrs, on bottom @ 1413hrs.

Tension #4 & #8 Anchors, Re-deploy #1 @ 1555hrs on bottom @ 1648hrs.
Werangler strip back #1 and pass PCC to rig @ 1740hrs ( Wrangler to stand-by )
Release Far Grip from tow wire @ 1750hrs.

Pass #3 PCC to Far Grip @ 1857hrs, on bottom @ 2045hrs.

Far Grip strip back #3 and pass PCC to rig @ 2235hrs.

Pass #7 PCC to Far Grip @ 2250hrs, commence to run anchor.

Re-deploy #1 anchor. On bottom @ 1648hrs. Meanwhile Electricians reset tension
gauges.

Wrangler strip back #1 and pass PCC to rig @ 1740hrs . Wrangler crew out of work
hours - stopped work and on stand-by to allow crew to rest )

Release Far Grip from tow wire @ 1750hrs.

Pass #3 PCC to Far Grip @ 1857hrs, on bottom @ 2045hrs.
Far Grip strip back #3 and pass PCC to rig @ 2235hrs.

Pass #7 PCC to Far Grip @ 2250hrs, commence to run anchor.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on

15 Dec 2005

Phse Cls Op
(RC)

From

To Hrs Depth

Activity Description

A P AH 0000

A TU  |AH
(RE)

0500

0530

0530

0500 |5.00 [0.0m

0530 |0.50 |0.0m

0600 |0.50 |0.0m

0600 |0.50 |0.0m

#7 Anchor on bottom @ 0109hrs.

Far Grip strip back, passed #7 PCC to rig @ 0253hrs.

Passed #2 PCC to Wrangler @ 0030hrs,Anchor on bottom @ 0249hrs.
Werangler strip back, passed #2 PCC to rig @ 0438hrs.

Passed #6 PCC to Far Grip @ 0305hrs, Anchor on bottom @ 0514hrs.

Troubleshoot electrical fault on # 6 windlass.

(IN PROGRESS) Tension #6 anchor to 120T and strip back; passed #6 PCC to rig at
07:19hrs. Meanwhile, commence cross tensioning anchors:

#4 (205T) & #8 (200T)

#1 (210T) & #5 (210T)

#2 (210T) & #6 (200T)

#3 (200T) & #7 (200T)

All held O.K.

(IN PROGRESS) Far Grip strip back, passed #6 PCC to rig @ 0725hrs.

‘Copyright IDS 2005', TF/JG 20050815, NEXUS_AU_drllg
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Phase Data to 2400hrs, 14 Dec 2005

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 25.75|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 25.75 1.073 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 27.25|14 Dec 2005 |14 Dec 2005 53.00 2.208 0.0m
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 11.8 11.8
Bentonite Bulk MT 47 47.0
Diesel m3 108.3 108.3
Fresh Water m3 145.8 145.8
Drill Water m3 103.5 103.5
Cement G MT 72.61 72.6
Cement HT (Silica) MT 1.83 1.8
Casing
0D (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m) Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
30" \ 650.90 650.90 \ 650.90 \
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 44
DOGC 3 extra
ESS 8
DOGC 7 other
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 6
SCHLUMBERGER OILFIELD AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 2
CAMERON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 1
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 2
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (RIG POSITIONING) 2
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 2
Total | 82
Marine
Weather on 14 Dec 2005
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir.  Wave Period
10.0nm \ 5kn \ 270.0deg 1,018.0mbar‘ 19C° \ 0.2m 270.0deg 2s
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height ~ Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments
272.0deg ‘ 1,801.00klb ‘ 1.0m ‘ 270.0deg ‘ 6s
Comments
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip Run Anchors Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 277
Fresh Water CuMtr 322
Drill Water CuMtr 501
Cement G Mt 80
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 173
Pacific Wrangler Run Anchors Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 325.2
Fresh Water CuMtr 127
Drill Water CuMtr 583
Cement G Mt 715
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 80
Bentonite Bulk Mt 42
‘Copyright IDS 2005', TF/JG 20050815, NEXUS_AU_drllg Page 2
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Helicopter Movement

Flight #

Company

Arr/Dep. Time

Pax In/Out

Comment

BRISTOW HELICOPTERS
AUSTRALIA PTY LTD

1534 / 1547

3/12
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 4

15 Dec 2005 From: Westman/Rodda Culverin 1
To: J.Ah-Cann -

Well Data

Country Australia | MDBRT 0.0m | Cur. Hole Size AFE Cost $ 22699889

Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 0.0m | Last Casing OD AFE No. 3433-1001

Basin Progress 0.0m | Shoe TVDBRT Daily Cost $ 427492

Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 0.00 | Shoe MDBRT Cum Cost $ 6264112

Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 3.35 | FIT/LOT: /| Days Since Last LTI 933

Wir Dpth(MSL) 585.0m Planned TD MD

RT-ASL(MSL) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT

RT-ML 606.5m

Current Op @ 0600

Planned Op

Picking up DP, mixing spud mud.

Offload and backload Pacific Wrangler.

Spud well and run 30" casing.

Summary of Period 0000

to 2400 Hrs

Complete running of anchors.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 15 Dec 2005

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)

A P AH 0000 |0500 |5.00 |0.0m #7 Anchor on bottom @ 0109hrs.
Far Grip strip back, passed #7 PCC to rig @ 0253hrs.
Passed #2 PCC to Wrangler @ 0030hrs,Anchor on bottom @ 0249hrs.
Wrangler strip back, passed #2 PCC to rig @ 0438hrs.
Passed #6 PCC to Far Grip @ 0305hrs, Anchor on bottom @ 0514hrs.

A TU AH 0500 |0530 |0.50 0.0m Troubleshoot electrical fault on # 6 windlass.

(RE)

A P AH 0530 |0900 |3.50 |0.0m Tension #6 anchor to 120T and strip back; passed #6 PCC to rig at 07:19hrs.
Meanwhile, commence cross tensioning anchors:
#4 (205T) & #8 (200T)
#1 (210T) & #5 (210T)
#2 (210T) & #6 (200T)
#3 (200T) & #7 (200T)
All held O.K.

A P AH 0530 |0730 |2.00 |0.0m Far Grip strip back, passed #6 PCC to rig @ 0725hrs.

A P AH 0730 |0900 |1.50 |0.0m Cross tension all anchors.

A P AH 0900 |1400 |5.00 |[0.0m Ballast rig to drilling draft.

SH P PUP [1400 |1530 |1.50 |[0.0m Pick up 201m of 5" DP.

SH P PUP 1530 |1600 |0.50 0.0m Pull back and rack 201m DP in derrick.

SH TU RR 1600 [1630 |0.50 |0.0m Repair Hydraulic fitting on racking arm.

(RE)

SH P PUP [1630 |2130 |5.00 |[0.0m P/U 1 stand 9" DC with jetting sub and trip in picking up 550m DP.

SH P PUP 2130 |2200 |0.50 |[0.0m Run in with DP from derrick and tag mudline @ 585m L.A.T. Water depth, (607.5m R/T-
Mudline L.A.T.)

SH P OA 2200 |[2400 |2.00 0.0m Pull out and rack DP in derrick.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on

16 Dec 2005

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)

SH P PUP | 0000 [0300 |[3.00 |0.0m Pick up 20 stands DP. 580m.

SH P OA 0300 |0400 [1.00 |0.0m Rack back 20 stands DP.

SH P PUP 0400 |0600 |2.00 |0.0m Pick up DP. 920m.

Phase Data to 2400hrs, 15 Dec 2005

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 25.75|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 25.75 1.073 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 44.75|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 70.50 2.938 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 10|15 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 80.50 3.354 0.0m
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Bulk Stocks

Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 11.8
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 47.0
Diesel m3 129.9 55 0 232.7
Fresh Water m3 35 334 0 147.4
Drill Water m3 17.6 0 85.9
Cement G MT 0 72.6
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 1.8
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m) Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
30" \ 650.90 \ 650.90 \ 650.90 \
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 44
DOGC 3 extra
ESS 7
DOGC 4 other
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 6
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 2
CAMERON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 1
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 2
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (RIG POSITIONING) 2
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 2
Total | 78
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
JSA 15 Dec 2005 |0 Days Deck = 10, Mech = 2, Drill =
1
STOP Card 15 Dec 2005 | 0 Days Safe = 1, Un-safe = 2
Marine
Weather on 15 Dec 2005
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir.  Wave Period
10.0nm ‘ 23kn ’ 45.0deg ‘1,014.0mbar‘ 21C° ’ 1.0m 45.0deg 2s
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments
272.0deg \ ’1,871.00k|b \ 1.5m \ 45.0deg ] 7s
Comments
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip on standby Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 267
Fresh Water CuMtr 318
Drill Water CuMtr 501
Cement G Mt 80
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 173
Pacific Wrangler backloading Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 183
Fresh Water CuMtr 122
Drill Water CuMtr 583
Cement G Mt 0
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 0
Bentonite Bulk Mt 0
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Helicopter Movement

Flight # Company

Arr/Dep. Time

Pax In/Out

Comment

1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS
AUSTRALIA PTY LTD

0941 /1006

3/7
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT #5

16 Dec 2005 From: Westman/ Webby Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -

Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 650.0m | Cur. Hole Size 36.000in | AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 650.0m | Last Casing OD AFE No. 3433-1001

| Basin | b ogress 43.0m | Shoe TVDBRT Daily Cost $ 585930
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 0.44 | Shoe MDBRT Cum Cost $ 6850042
Rig OCEANPATRIOT | bays on well 4.35 |FIT/LOT: /" | Days Since Last LTI 934
Wir Dpth(MSL) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL(MSL) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m

Current Op @ 0600

Planned Op

Waiting on 30" cement surface samples to set.

PGB heading 273deg, 2 x PGB bullseyes reading zero. Cement in place at 0530hrs, floats holding good.
Run and Cement 30" casing, POOH. Lay out 36" BHA. Make up 18 3/4" C.A.R.T, Pick up required Drill pipe, pick

up 17 1/2" section BHA.

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Pick up 93 jnts of 5"dp. Make up 30" C.A.R.T. make up 36" BHA and RIH to 607m. Spud well and drill 36" hole from 607m to 650m. Circulate hole
clean and displace. Drop Totco survey(0.5deg @ 643m). POOH. Rig up and ran 30" casing/PGB. Install guide lines.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 16 Dec 2005

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)

SH P PUP |0000 |0300 |3.00 |0.0m Pick up 20 stands DP. 580m.

SH P OA 0300 |0400 |1.00 |0.0m Rack back 20 stands DP.

SH P PUP 0400 |0600 [2.00 |0.0m Pick up DP. 920m.

SH P HBHA | 0600 |0730 |1.50 0.0m Picked up 18 jnts of HWDP and racked in derrick.

SH P HT 0730 |0930 |2.00 |0.0m Made up and racked in derrick, 30" C.A.R.T. BOP hang off tool, 30" cementing stand.

SH P HBHA |0930 |1200 |2.50 |[0.0m Make up 36" drilling BHA and ran in hole to 192m.

SH P TI 1200 [1330 |1.50 |0.0m Ran BHA in hole on DP to 607mRT.

SH P DA 1330 [1600 |2.50 |650.0m Spud well and drill 36" hole from 607m to 650m. Pumped 75bbl sweep at mid stand and
stand down, spotted 100bbls of hi-vis around BHA prior to connection.Anderdrift tool not
working.

SH P CHC |1600 |1630 |0.50 650.0m Displaced hole with 170bbls of pre-hydrated Bentonite. Dropped Totco single shot
survey.

SH P TO 1630 |[1730 |1.00 650.0m Pulled out of hole from 650m to 193m. No hole problems or overpull observed.

SH P HBHA 1730 |1830 |1.00 650.0m Pulled out of hole BHA from 193m to surface racking all BHA in derrick.

Recover survey ¥2°.

SC P RRC 1830 |1900 |0.50 650.0m Held Pre-casing JSA and rigged up for 30" casing.

SC P CRN [1900 |2100 |2.00 650.0m Ran 30" x 20" csg x/o joint, 2 x intermediate joints and housing joint.

SC P CRN [2100 |2300 |2.00 650.0m Ran 3 x dp stinger, made up 30" C.A.R.T to 30" housing joint and landed out in PGB.
Install guide lines.

SC TP RO 2300 [2400 |1.00 |650.0m Had rig welder manufacture 2 x "C" plates due to #1 & #2 guide line spears releasing

(VE) and not latching correctly.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on

17 Dec 2005

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
SC P CRN |0000 |0200 |2.00 |650.0m Ran 30"casing & PGB on drill pipe.
SC TP SKR 0200 |0330 |1.50 650.0m Stabbed casing in open hole with ROV assistance and by moving the rig 4m stbd aft.
(OTH)

SC P CRN |0330 |0400 |0.50 |650.0m Landed out casing with 5klbs of wt down. Circulate to ensure no fill. 2.1m stcik up, 2 x
zero bullseye readings. Heading 273 deg. Circulate casing volume while holding JSA
for cement job.

SC P CMC |0400 |0530 |1.50 650.0m Pumped 20bbls of S/W-Dye, mix and pump 200bbls of 15.8ppg cement slurry, displace
with 64bbls of S/W. Check floats holding-ok.

SC P WOC |0530 |0600 |0.50 650.0m (IN PROGRESS) Waiting on surface cement samples to harden.
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Phase Data to 2400hrs, 16 Dec 2005

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 25.75|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 25.75 1.073 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 44.75|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 70.50 2.938 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 28.5|15 Dec 2005 |16 Dec 2005 99.00 4.125 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 5.5/16 Dec 2005 |16 Dec 2005 104.50 4.354 650.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $ 7964
Mud Type: PHB spud | API FL: Cl: Solids(%vol): Viscosity 120sec/qt
PV
Sample-From: Active pit | Filter-Cake: K+C*1000: H20: vp
Time: 1600 | HTHP-FL: Hard/Ca: Qil(%): Gels 10s
. Gels 10m
Weight: 8.80ppg | HTHP-cake: MBT: Sand:
Fann 003
Temp: PM: pH: Fann 006
PF: PHPA: Fann 100
Fann 200
Comment Fann 300
Fann 600
Bit#1 Wear | 01 D L B G 02 R
0 0 NO A 0 | NO TD
Bitwear Comments: Bit has no signs of wear or damage.
Size ("): 17.500in | IADC# 117 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: REED HYCALOG |WOB(avg) 3.80klb |No. Size Progress 43.0m | Cum. Progress 43.0m
Type: Rock | RPM(avg) 110 | 1 16/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs 1.5h | Cum. On Btm Hrs 1.5h
Serial No.: B73369 |F.Rate  10.30bpm | 3 22/32nd" | |ADC Drill Hrs 2.5h | Cum IADC Drill Hrs 2.5h
Bit Model Titan T-11C | SPP 1888psi Total Revs Cum Total Revs 0
Depth In 607.0m |HSI ROP(avg) 28.67 m/hr | ROP(avg) 28.67 m/hr
Depth Out 650.0m | TFA 131
Bit Comment
BHA #1
Weight(Wet) Length 192.6m | Torque(max) D.C. (1) Ann Velocity
Wt Below Jar(Wet) String Torque(Off.Btm) D.C. (2) Ann Velocity
Pick-Up Torque(On.Btm) H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity
Slack-Off D.P. Ann Velocity
BHA Run Description
BHA Run Comment
Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.60m | 17.500in B73369
Hole Opener 2.42m | 36.000in 3.062in | 710163
Float Sub 0.92m 9.435in 3.062in | 186-0029
Anderdrift 3.09m 9.500in 3.000in | ADB 996
9.5in DC 27.18m 9.500in 3.000in
XIO 1.16m 9.500in 2.812in | MSO 193-01
8in DC 17.74m 8.000in 2.812in
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.812in | MSO 1930-2
5in HWDP 138.36m 5.000in 3.000in
Survey
MD Incl Azim TVD Vsec N/-S E/l-W DLS Tool Type
(m) (deg) (deg) (m) (deg) (m) (m) (deg/30m)
643.00 (05 [ [ ] \ | [
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Bulk Stocks

Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 80.63 74.99 167.4
Bentonite Bulk MT 22.89 35.43 59.5
Diesel m3 0 10.8 0 221.9
Fresh Water m3 31 24.9 0 1535
Drill Water m3 583 350.1 17.7 336.5
Cement G MT 63.7 -10.74 125.6
Cement HT (Silica) MT 1.83 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW Eff(%) SPM SPP  Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(in)  (ppY) (SPM)  (psi)  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (ps)) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
2 | A1700PT 6.500 | 8.70 97 100 | 1800 | 11.90
3 | A1700PT 6.500 | 8.70 97 100 | 1800 | 11.90
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m)  Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
30" \ 650.90 \ 650.90 \ 650.90 \
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 45
DOGC 3 extra
ESS 8
DOGC 1 other
NEXUS 3
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 6
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 3
CAMERON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 1
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 2
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (RIG POSITIONING) 2
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 2
Total | 76
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
JSA 16 Dec 2005 |0 Days Deck = 12, Mech = 1, Dirill =
3, Sub Sea =2
STOP Card 16 Dec 2005 |0 Days Safe = 6, Un-safe =5
Marine
Weather on 16 Dec 2005 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir. ~ Wave Period Anchors Tension (klb)
10.0nm ‘ 4kn ’ 225.0deg ‘1,012.0mbar‘ 19¢° ’ 0.1m 225.0deg 2s 1 243.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 273.0
3 216.0
272.0deg | 4,86200kb | 20m | 2250deg |  6s A 2050
Comments 5 331.0
6 331.0
7 337.0
8 317.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip on standby ltem Unit Used Quantity

Diesel
Fresh Water
Drill Water

CuMtr
CuMtr
CuMtr

254
313
40
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Item Unit Used Quantity
Cement G Mt 80
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 89
Pacific Wrangler En-route to town, ETA Item Unit Used Quantity
0630 17/12/05 Diesel CuMtr 178.7
Fresh Water CuMtr 116
Drill Water CuMtr
Cement G Mt
Cement HT (Silica) Mt
Barite Bulk Mt
Bentonite Bulk Mt
Helicopter Movement
Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS 1313/1328 8/10 First chopper had mechanical problems and
AUSTRALIA PTY LTD had to turn back. Loan chopper from
woodside completed crew change.
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 6

17 Dec 2005 From: Westman/ Webby Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -

Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 650.9m | Cur. Hole Size 36.000in | AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 650.9m | Last Casing OD 30.000in | AFE No. 3433-1001

_ Basin | b ogress 356.0m | Shoe TVDBRT Daily Cost $ 487963
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 1.44 | Shoe MDBRT 650.9m | Cum Cost $ 7338005
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 5.35 | FIT/LOT: /| Days Since Last LTI 942
Wir Dpth(MSL) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL(MSL) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 Trouble shoot Sperry Sun down hole tools. Swapping out internals of MWD with back up equipment.
Planned Op Drill out 20" casing shoe, commence drilling 17 1/2" hole to proposed TD of 1500m with sea water and hi-vis

sweeps. Survey hole with Sperry Sun.

Summary of Period 0000

to 2400 Hrs

Ran and cemented 30" casing. Waited on cement samples to harden 4.5hrs. POOH, picked up 1172m of dp( extra pipe picked up while waiting on
MWD equipment preperation), made up and racked 18 3/4" CART, Dowell cement express head. Layed out 36" BHA and picked up 17 1/2" BHA and

Sperry Sun equipment.
Prepare rig deck areas for riser.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 17 Dec 2005

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
SC P CRN [0000 |0200 |2.00 650.0m Ran 30"casing & PGB on drill pipe.
SC TP SKR |0200 |0330 [1.50 |650.0m Stabbed casing in open hole with ROV assistance and by moving the rig 4m stbd aft.
(OTH)

SC P CRN [0330 |0400 |0.50 650.0m Landed out casing with 5klbs of wt down. Circulate to ensure no fill. 2.1m stcik up, 2 x
zero bullseye readings. Heading 273 deg. Circulate casing volume while holding JSA
for cement job.

SC P CMC |0400 |0530 |1.50 650.0m Pumped 20bbls of S/W-Dye, mix and pump 200bbls of 15.8ppg cement slurry, displace
with 64bbls of S/W. Check floats holding-ok.

SC P WOC |0530 [1000 |4.50 |650.0m Waiting on surface cement samples to harden.

SC P CRN [1000 |1100 |1.00 |650.0m Release 30" CART tool. Check bullseye indicators<¥2°. POOH & L/d 30" CART.

IC P CRN [1100 |1200 |1.00 650.0m P/u 18%" CART and stand in derrick. Make up 2nd 18 3/4" CART for handling well head
on deck.

IH P PUP 1200 |1800 |6.00 |650.0m P/u 722m of dp and rack in derrick.(Prepare Sperry Sun BHA on deck while picking up
dp)

SH P HT 1800 (1930 |1.50 650.0m Break down TIW valves and side entry sub from 30" cement stand racked in derrick.
Lay out 36" BHA.

IH P PUP 1930 |2100 |1.50 650.0m Pick up 143m of dp and rack in derrick while [preparing Sperry Sun BHA components.

IH P HT 2100 |2130 |0.50 |650.0m Make up Dowell cement express head and rack in derrick on drifted HWDP.

IH P PUP 2130 |2330 |2.00 650.0m Pick up 257m of dp and rack in derrick while preparing Sperry Sun BHA components.
Total 5" dp picked up 2723m

IH P HBHA | 2330 |2400 |0.50 |650.0m Make up 17 1/2" BHA.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 18 Dec 2005
Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
IH P HBHA | 0000 |0330 |3.50 650.0m Made up 17 1/2" Sperry Sun BHA, drill collars etc. Made up Top Drive for shallow test

IH TP HBHA | 0330
(DTF)

IH TP HBHA | 0500

of down hole equipment on 1st stand of hwdp.

0500 |1.50 650.0m Attempt to test MWD tools. Failure to produce survey information. Gamma ok.
Change out stand pipe sensor after discussing with Sperry Sun in Perth. Re-test down
hole tools, still not transmitting survey data

0600 |1.00 |650.0m (IN PROGRESS) POOH and Rack back BHA from 103m to access MWD internals at

(DTF) rotary table. Remove faulty unit and install back up unit. Run in hole to 103m. Shallow
test OK.
Battery module is the suspected faulty item.
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Phase Data to 2400hrs, 17 Dec 2005

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 25.75|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 25.75 1.073 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 44.75|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 70.50 2.938 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 100.50 4.188 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 117.00 4.875 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 118.00 4917 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 10.5/17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 128.50 5.354 650.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $ 3057
Mud Type: PHG Hi-Vis | API FL: cl: Solids(%vol): Viscosity 120sec/qt
PV
Sample-From: Pits | Filter-Cake: K+C*1000: H20: vp
Time: 2300 | HTHP-FL: Hard/Ca: Oil(%): Gels 10s
X Gels 10m
Weight: 8.70ppg | HTHP-cake: MBT: Sand:
Fann 003
Temp: PM: pH: Fann 006
PF: PHPA: Fann 100
Fann 200
Comment Fann 300
Fann 600
Bit# 2 Wear | o1 D L B G 02 R
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 17.500in | IADC# 117 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: REED HYCALOG | WOB(avg) 10.20kib |No. Size Progress 356.0m | Cum. Progress 356.0m
Type: Rock | RPM(avg) 145 | 1 16/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs 6.1h | Cum. On Btm Hrs 6.1h
Serial No.: B73369 |F.Rate 981.00bpm | 3 22/32nd" | |ADC Drill Hrs Cum IADC Drill Hrs 0.0h
Bit Model Titan T-11 | SPP 830psi Total Revs 53 | Cum Total Revs 53
Depth In 650.9m | HSI ROP(avg) 58.36 m/hr | ROP(avg) 58.36 m/hr
Depth Out TFA 1.31
Bit Comment
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 167.4
Bentonite Bulk MT 3.29 0 56.2
Diesel m3 0 10.8 0 2111
Fresh Water m3 30 26.4 0 157.1
Drill Water m3 461 192.6 0 604.9
Cement G MT 0 37.4 0 88.2
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0.0
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m)  Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
30" \ 650.90 \ 650.90 650.90 \
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 46
DOGC 3 extra
ESS 8
NEXUS 3
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 6
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 3
CAMERON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 1
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 2
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Personnel On Board

GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 2
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 2 Sperry Sun
WEATHERFORD AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 4
Total | 80
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
JSA 17 Dec 2005 |0 Days Deck =10, Mech = 3, Drill =
7, Sub Sea =3
STOP Card 17 Dec 2005 |0 Days Safe = 4, Un-safe = 3
Marine
Weather on 17 Dec 2005 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir. ~ Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ 30kn ’ 225.0deg ‘1,009.0mbar‘ 19¢° ’ 2.0m 225.0deg 3s 1 254.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 278.0
3 220.0
272.0deg | 4598.00kb | 10m | 2250deg |  6s A 2910
Comments 5 328.0
6 335.0
7 340.0
8 313.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip on standby Iltem Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 244
Fresh Water CuMtr 310
Drill Water CuMtr 40
Cement G Mt 80
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 89
Pacific Wrangler In town loading riser Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 178.7
Fresh Water CuMtr 116
Drill Water CuMtr
Cement G Mt
Cement HT (Silica) Mt
Barite Bulk Mt
Bentonite Bulk Mt
Helicopter Movement
Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS 1400/ 1410 713
AUSTRALIA PTY LTD
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 7

18 Dec 2005 From: Westman/ Webby Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -

Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 650.0m | Cur. Hole Size 36.000in | AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 1,006.0m | Last Casing OD 30.000in | AFE No. 3433-1001

_ Basin Progress 356.0m Shoe TVDBRT Daily Cost $ 454106
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 2.44 | Shoe MDBRT 650.9m | Cum Cost $ 7792111
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 6.35 | FIT/LOT: /| Days Since Last LTI 943
Wir Dpth(MSL) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL(MSL) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 Drilling ahead 17 1/2" hole @1144m
Planned Op Drill ahead to TD of, circulate and condition hole for casing. Displace hole to PHG, trip to 20" shoe. If ok trip out

for casing, if problems encountered then wipe back to btm and repeat above. POOH and run 13 3/8" casing.

Summary of Period 0000

to 2400 Hrs

make up 17 1/2" BHA, RIH and shallow test MWD, tool failure. POOH to surface and change out tool internals for back up unit. RIH to PGB, unable
top stab. Soft line guide ropes parted, attempts to move rig were restricted by high anchor tensions and rough weather. POOH and install new ropes.
RIH and stab in ok. Drill cmt and shoe. Drill 17 1/2" hole from 650m to 1006m using SW and hi vis sweeps. Surveys every 3 stands.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 18 Dec 2005

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
IH P HBHA | 0000 |0330 |3.50 650.0m Made up 17 1/2" Sperry Sun BHA, drill collars etc. Made up Top Drive for shallow test
of down hole equipment on 1st stand of hwdp.
IH TP HBHA | 0330 |0500 |1.50 650.0m Attempt to test MWD tools. Failure to produce survey information. Gamma ok.
(DTF) Change out stand pipe sensor after discussing with Sperry Sun in Perth. Re-test down
hole tools, still not transmitting survey data
IH TP HBHA [0500 |0830 |3.50 |650.0m POOH and Rack back BHA from 103m to access MWD internals at rotary table.
(DTF) Remove faulty unit and install back up unit. Run in hole to 103m. Shallow test OK.
Battery module is the suspected faulty item.
IH P TI 0830 |0930 |1.00 650.0m Cont to RIH from 103m to PGB at 604m, guide ropes attached to guide lines
IH TP TI 0930 |1030 |1.00 650.0m Move rig to assist with stabbing drill string in 30" housing.Initialy guide ropes ok but due
(OTH) to excess current and movement 2 broke then the remaining 2.
Skid rig to assist with stabbing, due to 5-6m seas and 42knot winds the winch tension
was excessive before sea bed movement was achieved.
IH TP TI 1030 |[1400 |3.50 650.0m POOH from 604m to surface, install new soft line guide ropes to assist in stabbing.
(OTH) RIH to PGB at 605m, stab and continue Rlh to top of cement at 644m.
IH P DFS 1400 |1430 |0.50 650.0m Establish parameters and drill cement and shoe equipment from 644m to 650m, work
through and clean out shoe.
600 gpm, 900psi, 3-4000ftlbs, 90rpm,
IH P DA 1430 [2400 |9.50 |1,006.0m |Drill 17 1/2" hole from 650m to 1006m.
Take surveys every 3rd stand.
600-1100 gpm, 2500psi, 3-4000 ftlbs tg, 120-150rpm, String wt 220klbs, 5-20klbs
WOB.
Sweep hole 75 to 85bbls per stand.
Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 19 Dec 2005

Phse Cls

(RC)

Op From

To Hrs Depth Activity Description

IH P DA 0000

0600 |6.00 1,436.0m | (IN PROGRESS) Drill 17 1/2" hole from 1006m to 1436m

WOB. Sweep hole 85bbls per stand-35 Guar-50 PHG.
No hole problems to report.

24hr ROP 17.9m/hr

Section ROP 23.46m/hr

Take surveys every 3rd stand. @1428.75m, 0.11deg, 336.43azimuth,
1000-1100 gpm, 3400psi, 4-6000 ftlbs tq, 150-160rpm, String wt 240klbs, 20-35kIbs

Phase Data to 2400hrs, 18 Dec 2005

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 25.75|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 25.75 1.073 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 44.75|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 70.50 2.938 0.0m
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Phase Data to 2400hrs, 18 Dec 2005

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 100.50 4.188 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 117.00 4.875 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 118.00 4.917 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 34.5|17 Dec 2005 |18 Dec 2005 152.50 6.354 1,006.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $ 6209
Mud Type: PHG Hi-Vis | API FL: 18.0cc/30min | Cl: 2200mg/l | Solids(%vol): Viscosity 100sec/qt
PV 9
Sample-From: Pits | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: H20: vp 22Ib/100cf2
Time: 1920 | HTHP-FL: Hard/Ca: 80mg/l | Oil(%): Gels 10s 18
. Gels 10m 18
Weight: 8.60ppg | HTHP-cake: MBT: 18 | Sand:
Fann 003 16
Temp: 20C° PM: pH: 9 [Fann 006 17
PF: 0.08 | PHPA: Fann 100 2
Fann 200 29
Comment Fann 300 31
Fann 600 40
Bit#2 Wear I o1 D L B G 02 R
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 17.500in | IADC# 117 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: REED HYCALOG | WOB(avg) 10.20klb |No. Size Progress 356.0m | Cum. Progress 712.0m
Type: Rock | RPM(avg) 145 | 1 16/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs 6.1h | Cum. On Btm Hrs 12.2h
Serial No.: B73369 |F.Rate 981.00bpm | 3 22/32nd" | |ADC Drill Hrs 9.5h | Cum IADC Drill Hrs 9.5h
Bit Model Titan T-11 | SPP 830psi Total Revs 53 | Cum Total Revs 106
Depth In 650.9m | HSI ROP(avg) 58.36 m/hr | ROP(avg) 58.36 m/hr
Depth Out TFA 131
Bit Comment
BHA # 2
Weight(Wet) 65.00klb | Length 242.6m | Torque(max) 4000ft-lbs | D.C. (1) Ann Velocity
Wt Below Jar(Wet) 48.00klb | String 220.00klb | Torque(Off.Btm) 1000ft-Ibs | D.C. (2) Ann Velocity
Pick-Up 220.00klb | Torque(On.Btm) 3000ft-lbs | H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity
Slack-Off 220.00klb D.P. Ann Velocity
BHA Run Description Stabilized rotary assembly. MWD.
BHA Run Comment
Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.60m | 17.500in B73369 Bit#1, re-run 1
Near Bit Stab 2.65m | 17.500in 3.000in | SBD2376
Pony DC 3.06m 9.625in 3.000in | 177-472
Stab 2.51m | 17.250in 3.000in | SBD2380
MWD Tools 9.87m 9.500in 2.375in | 209351
Stab 2.51m | 17.250in 3.000in | SBD2379
9.5in DC 27.18m 9.500in 3.000in
XIO 1.16m 9.500in 3.000in | MS01930-0
8in DC 26.63m 8.000in 3.000in
Drilling Jars 9.31m 8.000in 3.062in | 11150D
8in DC 17.71m 8.000in 3.000in
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
5in HWDP 138.22m 5.000in 3.000in
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 167.4
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Bulk Stocks

Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Bentonite Bulk MT 7.86 0 48.4
Diesel m3 0 10.8 0 200.3
Fresh Water m3 30 29.8 0 157.3
Drill Water m3 118 0 486.9
Cement G MT 0 0 0 88.2
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW  Eff (%) SPM SPP Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(i) (ppg) (SPM)  (ps))  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
1 |12P160 6.500 | 8.60 97 100 | 2450 | 12.00
2 | 12P160 6.500 | 8.60 97 100 | 2450 | 12.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m)  Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m TVD (m)
30" \ 650.90 \ 650.90 \ 650.90 \
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 46
DOGC 3 extra
ESS 8
NEXUS 3
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 6
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 3
CAMERON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 1
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 2
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 2
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 2 Sperry Sun
WEATHERFORD AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 4
Total | 80
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks

Abandon Drill 18 Dec 2005 |0 Days Held weekly abandon rig Load life boats 1 and 2 with 10 people and discuss life boat

drill equipment and launching procedures.
Fire Drill 18 Dec 2005 |0 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 18 Dec 2005 |0 Days Deck = 6, Mech = 3, Drill =

6, Sub Sea =2
Safety Meeting 18 Dec 2005 | 0 Days Weekly safety meetings with | Discussion on man riding operations. Recent 3rd party

all crew members. finger amputation and basic amputation first aid discussed.

GEMS work basket policies. Fire and abandonment drills

STOP Card 18 Dec 2005 |0 Days Safe = 0, Un-safe = 2
Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data
Available 1,911bbl |Losses 1,020bbl
Reserve 1,911bbl | Sweeps 1,020bbl
Marine
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Weather on 18 Dec 2005 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir. ~ Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
8.0nm ‘ 45kn ‘ 225.0deg 1,011.0mbar‘ 16C° 3.0m 225.0deg 3s 1 291.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 265.0
3 220.0
272.0deg | 463200kb | 30m | 2250deg |  8s . 550
Comments 5 287.0
6 317.0
7 390.0
8 331.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip on standby Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 236
Fresh Water CuMtr 307
Drill Water CuMtr 40
Cement G Mt 80
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 89
Pacific Wrangler In town waiting on Item Unit Used Quantity
weather to improve Diesel CuMtr
prior. Fresh Water CuMtr
Drill Water CuMtr
Cement G Mt
Cement HT (Silica) Mt
Barite Bulk Mt
Bentonite Bulk Mt
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 8

19 Dec 2005 From: Westman/ Webby Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -

Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 1,436.0m Cur. Hole Size 36.000in | AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsla_nd TVDBRT 1,436.0m Last Casing OD 30.000in | AFE No. 3433-1001

_ Basin | b ogress 430.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 650.9m | Daily Cost $ 678903
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 3.44 | Shoe MDBRT 650.9m | Cum Cost $ 8471014
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 7.35 | FIT/LOT: /| Days Since Last LTI 944
Wir Dpth(MSL) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL(MSL) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m

Current Op @ 0600

Planned Op

Drill 17 1/2" hole from 1436m to 1499m

ROP 10.5m/hr

TD 17 1/2" section to 1525m. Circulate and condition hole for Casing. Displace and trip out of hole to 20" shoe.

Wiper trip if required, Cont to POOH. Rig up and run 13 3/8" casing.

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Drilled 17 1/2" hole from 1006m to 1436m.

24hr average ROP 17.9m/hr.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 19 Dec 2005

Phse Cls

(RC)

Op

From

To Hrs Depth

Activity Description

IH P DA 0000

2400 |24.00 |1,436.0m

No hole problems to report.
24hr ROP 17.9m/hr
Section ROP 23.46m/hr

Drill 17 1/2" hole from 1006m to 1436m
Take surveys every 3rd stand. @1428.75m, 0.11deg, 336.43azimuth,
1000-1100 gpm, 3400psi, 4-6000 ftlbs tq, 150-160rpm, String wt 240kIbs, 20-35kIbs
WOB. Sweep hole 85bbls per stand-35 Guar-50 PHG.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on

20 Dec 2005

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
IH P DA 0000 |0600 |6.00 |1,525.0m |(INPROGRESS) Drill 17 1/2" hole from 1436m to 1525m
Take surveys every 3rd stand. @1509m 0.09deg, 0.70 azimuth,
1000-1100 gpm, 3400psi, 4-6000 ftlbs tq, 150-160rpm, String wt 240klbs, 30-35klbs
WOB.
Sweep hole 85bbls per stand.
Phase Data to 2400hrs, 19 Dec 2005
Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 25.75|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 25.75 1.073 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 44.75|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 70.50 2.938 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 100.50 4.188 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5|16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 117.00 4.875 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 118.00 4.917 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 58.5(17 Dec 2005 |19 Dec 2005 176.50 7.354 1,436.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $ 5570
Mud Type: PHG Hi-Vis | API FL: 14.0cc/30min | Cl: 2200mg/l | Solids(%vol): Viscosity 110sec/qt
PV 14
Sample-From: Pits | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: H20: vp 26Ib/1000f2
Time: 1945 | HTHP-FL: Hard/Ca: 20mg/l | Oil(%): Gels 10s 22
Gels 10m 28
Weight: 8.70ppg | HTHP-cake: MBT: 20 | Sand:
Fann 003 20
Temp: 20C° PM: pH: 9.2 |Fann 006 21
PF: 0.18 | PHPA: Fann 100 28
Fann 200 35
Comment 1318bbls of Hi vis pumped during 24hr drilling period Fann 300 40
Fann 600 54
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Bit # 2 Wear o1 D B G 02 R
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 17.500in | IADC# 117 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: REED HYCALOG | WOB(avg) 23.00klb |No. Size Progress 430.0m | Cum. Progress 1,142.0m
Type: Rock | RPM(avg) 152 | 1 16/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs 21.9h | Cum. On Btm Hrs 34.1h
Serial No.: B73369 |F.Rate 1,046.00bpm | 3 22/32nd" | |ADC Drill Hrs 24.0h | Cum IADC Drill Hrs 33.5h
Bit Model Titan T-11 | SPP 2743psi Total Revs 227 | Cum Total Revs 333
Depth In 650.9m | HSI ROP(avg) 19.63 m/hr | ROP(avg) 33.49 m/hr
Depth Out TFA 131
Bit Comment
BHA # 2
Weight(Wet) 65.00klb | Length 242.6m | Torque(max) 8000ft-Ibs | D.C. (1) Ann Velocity
Wt Below Jar(Wet) 48.00klb | String 240.00klb | Torque(Off.Btm) 1000ft-Ibs | D.C. (2) Ann Velocity
Pick-Up 240.00klb | Torque(On.Btm) 4000ft-lbs | H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity
Slack-Off 240.00kIb D.P. Ann Velocity
BHA Run Description Stabilized rotary assembly. MWD.
BHA Run Comment
Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment

Bit 0.60m | 17.500in B73369 Bit#1, re-run 1

Near Bit Stab 2.65m | 17.500in 3.000in | SBD2376

Pony DC 3.06m 9.625in 3.000in | 177-472

Stab 2.51m | 17.250in 3.000in | SBD2380

MWD Tools 9.87m 9.500in 2.375in | 209351

Stab 2.51m | 17.250in 3.000in | SBD2379

9.5in DC 27.18m 9.500in 3.000in

XIO 1.16m 9.500in 3.000in | MS01930-0

8in DC 26.63m 8.000in 3.000in

Drilling Jars 9.31m 8.000in 3.062in | 11150D

8in DC 17.71m 8.000in 3.000in

XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2

5in HWDP 138.22m 5.000in 3.000in
Survey

MD Incl Azim TVD Vsec N/-S E/-W DLS Tool Type
(m) (deg) (deg) (m) (deg) (m) (m) (deg/30m)
1056.00 0.8 254.0
1085.00 0.8 257.0
1113.00 0.6 252.0
1142.00 0.5 254.0
1171.00 0.4 260.0
1228.00 0.2 255.0
1257.00 0.2 257.0
1342.00 0.1 250.0
1371.00 0.0 247.0
1428.00 0.1 336.0
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance

Barite Bulk MT 0 0 167.4
Bentonite Bulk MT 9.07 0 39.3
Diesel m3 0 21.7 0 178.6
Fresh Water m3 33 34.3 0 156.0
Drill Water m3 144.4 0 342.5
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Bulk Stocks

Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Cement G MT 0 0 0 88.2
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW Eff(%) SPM SPP  Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(in)  (ppY) (SPM)  (psi)  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (ps)) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
1 |12P160 6.500 | 8.70 97 112 | 3400 | 13.30
2 |12P160 6.500 | 8.70 97 112 | 3400 | 13.30
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m) Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
30" | 650.90 \ 650.90 \ 650.90 |
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 46
DOGC 3 extra
ESS 8
NEXUS 3
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 6
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 3
CAMERON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 1
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 2
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 2
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 2 Sperry Sun
WEATHERFORD AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 4
Total | 80
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Drill 18 Dec 2005 |1 Day Held weekly abandon rig Load life boats 1 and 2 with 10 people and discuss life boat
drill equipment and launching procedures.
Fire Drill 18 Dec 2005 |1 Day Held weekly fire drill
JSA 19 Dec 2005 |0 Days Deck =4, Mech =0, Drill =
1, Sub Sea =5
Safety Meeting 18 Dec 2005 |1 Day Weekly safety meetings with | Discussion on man riding operations. Recent 3rd party
all crew members. finger amputation and basic amputation first aid discussed.
GEMS work basket policies. Fire and abandonment drills
STOP Card 19 Dec 2005 |0 Days Safe = 4, Un-safe = 1
Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data
Available 1,881bbl |Losses 1,318bbl
Reserve 1,881bbl | Sweeps 1,318bbl
Marine
Weather on 19 Dec 2005 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir.  Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm \ 35kn \ 225.0deg 1,015.0mbar‘ 15C° \ 2.0m 225.0deg 3s 1 287.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 243.0
3 220.0
272.0deg ‘ 4,612.00klb ‘ 3.0m ‘ 225.0deg ‘ 8s A 289.0
Comments 5 322.0
6 317.0
7 370.0
8 317.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
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(Date/Time)

Far Grip En-route to Town Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 230
Fresh Water CuMtr 307
Drill Water CuMtr 40
Cement G Mt 80
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 89
Pacific Wrangler On location with Riser Item Unit Used Quantity
and fuel. Diesel CuMtr 6753
Fresh Water CuMtr 165
Drill Water CuMtr
Cement G Mt
Cement HT (Silica) Mt
Barite Bulk Mt
Bentonite Bulk Mt 5
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 9

20 Dec 2005 From: Westman/ Webby Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -
Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 1,525.0m | Cur. Hole Size 17.500in | AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 1,525.0m | Last Casing OD 30.000in | AFE No. 3433-1001
_ Basin | b ogress 89.0m |Shoe TVDBRT 650.9m | Daily Cost $570223
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 4.44 | Shoe MDBRT 650.9m | Cum Cost $ 9041237
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 8.35 | FIT/LOT: /| Days Since Last LTI 945
Wir Dpth(MSL) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL(MSL) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 340mm casing ran to 1511m. Pumping cement for 340mm casing cement.
Planned Op Run and cement 340 mm (13 3/8") casing. Run Riser and BOP's.

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Drilled 445 mm (17 1/2") hole to 1525.0 mMDRT. Pulled out of hole to rig up and run 340 mm (13 3/8") casing. Commenced running casing.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 20 Dec 2005

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
IH P DA 0000 |0830 [8.50 |1,525.0m |Drill 17 1/2" hole from 1436m to 1525m
Take surveys every 3rd stand. @1509m 0.09deg, 0.70 azimuth,
1000-1100 gpm, 3400psi, 4-6000 ftlbs tq, 150-160rpm, String wt 240klbs, 30-35klbs
WOB.
Sweep hole 85bbls per stand.
IH P DIS 0830 |1030 |2.00 1,525.0m | Take TD survey.@1525m 0.09deg, 0.70 azimuth,
Pump 150bbls of Guar Gum hi-vis sweep.
Pump 100bbls of Sea Water
Pump 840bbls of PHG hi-vis displacement mud, un-weighted.
Displace PHG to bottom of drill pipe
IH P TO 1030 [1300 |2.50 [1,525.0m |POOH from 1525m to 242m. No hole problems observed.
Jet 30" housing on way out of hole.
Pipe strap on trip out +0.17m
IH P HBHA | 1300 |1500 |2.00 1,525.0m | POOH BHA and rack in derrick. Remove MWD probe and break off bit.
IH P RRC 1500 |1600 |1.00 1,525.0m | Hold JSA for casing operatuions with all crews and rig up equipment
IH P CRN [1600 |1730 |1.50 1,525.0m | Make up 13 3/8" shoe track and check floats. Baker lock connections.
Attach guide ropes
IH P CRN [1730 |2300 |5.50 1,525.0m | Ran 13 3/8" casing to 885m. No hole problems to report.
IH P CRN [2300 |2400 [1.00 |1,525.0m |Rigdown Tam packer, make up 18 3/4" well head to casing string,rig down FMS and all
casing equipment.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 21 Dec 2005

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
IH P CRN |0000 |0100 |1.00 1,525.0m | Complete making up 18 3/4 well head andDowell Deep Sea express plug baskets.
IH P CRN [0100 |0230 |1.50 1,525.0m | Ran 13 3/8" casing string on 5" dp to 30" housing.
ROV observe landing and latching of Well Head in housing.
String weight 350klbs, verify latch with 50k over pull, 400klbs ok.
Slack off to landing string weight.
IH P CiCc 0230 |0400 |1.50 1,525.0m | Circulate 1.5 x casing volume with sea water.
Complete cement job JSA and equipment prep while circulating.
IH P CMC |0400 |0600 |2.00 1,525.0m | (IN PROGRESS) Cement casing:25bbls S/W-dye, Lead 300bbls 12.5ppg, Tail 209bbls
15.8ppg.
Phase Data to 2400hrs, 20 Dec 2005
Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 25.75|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 25.75 1.073 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 44.75|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 70.50 2.938 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 100.50 4.188 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 117.00 4.875 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 118.00 4917 650.0m
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Phase Data to 2400hrs, 20 Dec 2005

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) \ 82.5[17 Dec 2005 |20 Dec 2005 | 200.50 8.354 1,525.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $ 1529
Mud Type: PHG Hi-Vis | API FL: 14.0cc/30min | Cl: 600mg/l | Solids(%vol): 2% |Viscosity 105sec/qt
PV 14
Sample-From: Pits | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: H20: vp 3o|b/1oocf2
Time: 2200 |HTHP-FL: Hard/Ca: 40mg/l | Oil(%): Gels 10s 22
Gels 10m 27
Weight: 8.70ppg | HTHP-cake: MBT: 20 | Sand:
Fann 003 20
Temp: 20C° PM: pH: 9 [Fann 006 21
PF: 0.1 | PHPA: Fann 100 2
Fann 200 35
Comment Completed drilling pumping 80bbls of Hi-vis per stand drilled. At TD sweept hole with 150bbls of |Fann 300 40
guar gum and displaced with 840bbls of PHG(un-weighted) Fann 600 54
Bit # 2 Wear | o1 D L B G 02 R
1 2 ER A | NO TD
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 17.500in | IADC# 117 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: REED HYCALOG |WOB(avg) 30.00klb |No. Size Progress 89.0m | Cum. Progress 1,231.0m
Type: Rock | RPM(avg) 156 | 1 16/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs 7.5h | Cum. On Btm Hrs 41.6h
Serial No.: B73369 |F.Rate  26.00bpm | 3 22/32nd" | |ADC Drill Hrs 8.5h | Cum IADC Drill Hrs 42.0h
Bit Model Titan T-11 | SPP 3124psi Total Revs 227 | Cum Total Revs 560
Depth In 650.9m | HSI ROP(avg) 11.87 m/hr | ROP(avg) 29.59 m/hr
Depth Out 1,525.0m | TFA 131
Bit Comment
BHA # 2
Weight(Wet) 65.00klb | Length 242.6m | Torque(max) 8000ft-Ibs | D.C. (1) Ann Velocity
Wt Below Jar(Wet) 48.00klb | String 240.00klb | Torque(Off.Btm) 1000ft-lbs | D.C. (2) Ann Velocity
Pick-Up 240.00klb | Torque(On.Btm) 4000ft-lbs | H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity
Slack-Off 240.00kIb D.P. Ann Velocity
BHA Run Description Stabilized rotary assembly. MWD.
BHA Run Comment
Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.60m | 17.500in B73369 Bit#1, re-run 1
Near Bit Stab 2.65m | 17.500in 3.000in | SBD2376
Pony DC 3.06m 9.625in 3.000in | 177-472
Stab 2.51m | 17.250in 3.000in | SBD2380
MWD Tools 9.87m 9.500in 2.375in | 209351
Stab 2.51m | 17.250in 3.000in | SBD2379
9.5in DC 27.18m 9.500in 3.000in
X/O 1.16m 9.500in 3.000in | MS01930-0
8in DC 26.63m 8.000in 3.000in
Drilling Jars 9.31m 8.000in 3.062in | 11150D
8in DC 17.71m 8.000in 3.000in
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
5in HWDP 138.22m 5.000in 3.000in
Survey
MD Incl Azim TVD Vsec N/-S E/-W DLS Tool Type
(m) (deg) (deg) (m) (deg) (m) (m) (deg/30m)
1486.00 0.2 21.2
1509.00 0.1 0.7
1525.00 0.1 0.7
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Bulk Stocks

Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 167.4
Bentonite Bulk MT 3.99 0 35.3
Diesel m3 300 17.5 0 461.1
Fresh Water m3 29 21.3 0 163.7
Drill Water m3 114.3 0 228.2
Cement G MT 0 0 0 88.2
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW Eff(%) SPM SPP  Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(in)  (ppY) (SPM)  (psi)  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (ps)) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
1 |12P160 6.500 | 8.60 97 100 | 2450 | 12.00
2 |12P160 6.500 | 8.60 97 100 | 2450 | 12.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m)  Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
30" 650.00 650.00 650.00
13 3/8" 1511.14 1511.14 604.00
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 45
DOGC 3 extra
ESS 8
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 6
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 3
CAMERON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 1
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 5
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 2 Sperry Sun
WEATHERFORD AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 4
Total | 85
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Drill 18 Dec 2005 | 2 Days Held weekly abandon rig Load life boats 1 and 2 with 10 people and discuss life boat
drill equipment and launching procedures.
Fire Drill 18 Dec 2005 | 2 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 20 Dec 2005 |0 Days Deck = 12, Mech = 1, Drill =
7, Sub Sea =0, marine =1
Safety Meeting 18 Dec 2005 | 2 Days Weekly safety meetings with | Discussion on man riding operations. Recent 3rd party
all crew members. finger amputation and basic amputation first aid discussed.
GEMS work basket policies. Fire and abandonment drills
STOP Card 20 Dec 2005 |0 Days Safe = 1, Un-safe = 3
Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data
Available 597bbl | Losses 1,769bbl
Reserve 597bbl | Sweeps 1,769bbl
Marine
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Weather on 20 Dec 2005 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir. ~ Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ 12kn ‘ 225.0deg l,OlG.Ombar‘ 17¢° ‘ 0.5m 225.0deg 2s 1 287.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 238.0
3 216.0
272.0deg | 477800kb | 30m | 2250deg | 7s A 2560
Comments 5 291.0
6 322.0
7 362.0
8 315.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip Town Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 230
Fresh Water CuMtr 307
Drill Water CuMtr 40
Cement G Mt 80
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 89
Pacific Wrangler On location with Riser Item Unit Used Quantity
and fuel. Diesel CuMtr 3636
Fresh Water CuMtr 160
Drill Water CuMtr
Cement G Mt
Cement HT (Silica) Mt
Barite Bulk Mt
Bentonite Bulk Mt 5
Helicopter Movement
Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS 0925 /0933 11/6
AUSTRALIA PTY LTD
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 10

21 Dec 2005 From: Westman/ Webby Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -
Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 1,525.0m | Cur. Hole Size 17.500in | AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 1,525.0m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001
_ Basin Progress 0.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1,511.1m | Daily Cost $ 636457
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 5.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1,511.2m | Cum Cost $ 9677694
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 9.35 | FIT/LOT: /| Days Since Last LTI 946
Wir Dpth(MSL) 585.0M | b1 ned TD MD 3,612.0m
RT-ASL(MSL) 21.5m Planned TD TVDRT 3,612.0m
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 Running riser @257m (845").
Planned Op Continue running BOPs and riser.

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Landed 340 mm (13 3/8") casing and cemented in place at 1511.14 mMDRT. Laid down cement head and rigged up riser handling equipment.
Commenced running BOPs and riser.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 21 Dec 2005

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)

IH P CRN [0000 |0100 |1.00 1,525.0m | Complete making up 18 3/4 well head andDowell Deep Sea express plug baskets.

IH P CRN [0100 |0230 |1.50 1,525.0m | Ran 13 3/8" casing string on 5" dp to 30" housing.
ROV observe landing and latching of Well Head in housing.
String weight 350klbs, verify latch with 50k over pull, 400klbs ok.
Slack off to landing string weight.

IH P CIC 0230 |0400 |1.50 |1,525.0m |Circulate 1.5 x casing volume with sea water.
Complete cement job JSA and equipment prep while circulating.

IH P CMC |0400 |0630 |2.50 1,525.0m | Cement casing:25bbls S/W-dye, Lead 300bbls 12.5ppg, Tail 209bbls 15.8ppg.

IH P CMC |0630 |0730 [1.00 |1,525.0m |Displace cement with 416bbls of sea water. Bump plugs 3.3bbls early, pressure up and
test casing to 1500psi, ok.
Bleed off and check floats holding ok.

IH P CRN [0730 |0800 |0.50 1,525.0m | Rig down surface cement lines and back out Cameron 18 3/4" C.A.R.T.
PGB Bullseye readings: Fwd 1deg Stbd, Aft 1deg Stbd Aft.

IH P CRN [0800 |0900 |1.00 1,525.0m | Pull out of hole landing string.

IH P CRN [0900 |1000 |1.00 1,525.0m |Lay out 18 3/4" C.A.R.T from string, pick up and break out #2 18 3/4" handling tool.
Break down Dowell express cement head and double of HWDP.

BOP |P RR1 1000 |1200 |2.00 1,525.0m | Hold JSA and rig up to run BOP's and marine riser.
Skid rig 15m to Port

BOP |P RR1 1200 |1430 |2.50 1,525.0m | Make up double of Riser and Termination spool.

BOP |P RR1 1430 |1800 |3.50 1,525.0m | Skid BOP to well center on Normar transporter. make up double and spool. Install guide
lines.

BOP |P RR1 1800 |2130 |3.50 1,525.0m | Pick up BOPs from carrier(550klbs) and skid clear, Run BOP to above splash zone and
install Pod line clamps. Land riser in spider, BOP's wet 530klbs.
Test Choke and Kill lines 250/7500psi 5/10mins.

BOP |P RR1 2130 |2400 |2.50 1,525.0m | Run Bop's on Marine riser

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 22 Dec 2005

Phse Cls

(RC)

Op From

To Hrs Depth

Activity Description

BOP |P

[RR1 |0000 [0600 |6.00 [1,525.0m |Continue to run BOP's on marine riser @271m (890"

Phase Data to 2400hrs, 21 Dec 2005

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth

RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 25.75|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 25.75 1.073 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 44.75|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 70.50 2.938 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 100.50 4.188 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 117.00 4.875 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 118.00 4.917 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 92.5(17 Dec 2005 |21 Dec 2005 210.50 8.771 1,525.0m
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Phase Data to 2400hrs, 21 Dec 2005

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) \ 14[21 Dec 2005 |21 Dec 2005 | 224.50 9.354 1,525.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $ 5570
Mud Type: PHG Hi-Vis | API FL: 13.0cc/30min | Cl: 600mg/l | Solids(%vol): Viscosity 100sec/qt
PV 10
Sample-From: Pits | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: H20: vp 35|b/1006f2
Time: 0900 |HTHP-FL: Hard/Ca: 40mg/l | Oil(%): Gels 10s 24
i Gels 10m 26
Weight: 8.70ppg | HTHP-cake: MBT: 18 | Sand:
Fann 003 21
Temp: 20C° PM: pH: 9 [Fann 006 24
PF: 0.1 | PHPA: Fann 100 82
Fann 200 35
Comment Cleaned pits in prep for mixing new mud. Fann 300 45
Fann 600 55
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 167.4
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 35.3
Diesel m3 0 0 0 461.1
Fresh Water m3 0 0 0 163.7
Drill Water m3 0 0 228.2
Cement G MT 0 0 0 88.2
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0.0
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m)  Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
30" 650.00 650.00 650.00
13 3/8" 1511.14 1511.14 604.00

Personnel On Board

Company Pax Comment
DOGC 45
DOGC 3 extra
ESS 8
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 6
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 3
CAMERON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 1
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 5
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 2 Sperry Sun
WEATHERFORD AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 4
Total | 85
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Dirill 18 Dec 2005 |3 Days Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Fire Drill 18 Dec 2005 | 3 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 21 Dec 2005 |0 Days Deck =7, Mech = 2, Drill =
5, Welder = 2, Marine = 2,
Safety Meeting 18 Dec 2005 | 3 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 21 Dec 2005 |0 Days Safe =1, Un-safe = 4
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Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data

Available 210bbl |Losses Obbl
Reserve 210bbl
Comment 210bbls of hi-vis sweep kept for drilling out 13 3/8 shoe track etc.
Marine
Weather on 21 Dec 2005 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir.  Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
8.0nm \ 35kn \ 225.0deg 1,014.0mbar‘ 23c° \ 2.0m 225.0deg 3s 1 265.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height ~ Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 238.0
3 216.0
272.0deg | 4240.00kb | 25m | 2250deg | 8s A 278.0
Comments 5 324.0
6 331.0
7 357.0
8 304.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip Town Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 230
Fresh Water CuMtr 307
Drill Water CuMtr 40
Cement G Mt 80
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 89
Pacific Wrangler On location with Riser Item Unit Used Quantity
and fuel. Diesel CuMtr 352.9
Fresh Water CuMtr 155
Drill Water CuMtr
Cement G Mt
Cement HT (Silica) Mt
Barite Bulk Mt
Bentonite Bulk Mt 5
Helicopter Movement
Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS 1231/1240 0/0 Freight chopper en-route to Crystal ocean

AUSTRALIA PTY LTD
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 11

22 Dec 2005 From: Ron King/ Webby Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -
Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 1,525.0m | Cur. Hole Size 17.500in | AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 1,525.0m | Last Casing OD 30.000in | AFE No. 3433-1001
_ Basin | b ogress 0.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 650.9m | Daily Cost $532613
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 6.44 | Shoe MDBRT 650.9m | Cum Cost $ 10210307
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 10.35 | FIT/LOT: /| Days Since Last LTI 948
Wir Dpth(MSL) 585.0M | b1 ned TD MD 3,612.0m
RT-ASL(MSL) 21.5m Planned TD TVDRT 3,612.0m
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 Preparing to land BOP's.
Planned Op Land out BOPs and test wellhead connector. Pull-test connections. Stroke out the slip-joint and nipple up the

surface equipment. Rig up the diverter. Complete pressure tests. Prepare to pick up BHA.

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Completed running BOPs and riser. Commenced making up slip-joint and landing joint to riser.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 22 Dec 2005

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description

(RC)
BOP |P RR1 0000 |0600 |6.00 1,525.0m | Continue to run BOP's on marine riser @271m (890"
BOP |P RR1 0600 |0700 |1.00 1,525.0m | Pressure test choke and kill lines 250/7500psi, 5/10mins ok
BOP |P RR1 |0700 |1300 |6.00 1,525.0m | Continue to run Riser @393m ( 1290")
BOP |P RR1 1300 |1400 |1.00 1,525.0m | Pressure test choke and kill lines 250/7500psi, 5/10mins ok
BOP |P RR1 [1400 |2130 |7.50 |1,525.0m |Continue to run Riser @515m ( 1690")
BOP |P RR1 2130 |2230 |1.00 1,525.0m | Pressure test choke and kill lines 250/7500psi 5/10mins ok
BOP |P RR1 [2230 |2400 |1.50 |1,525.0m |Pick up slipjoint and make up to string.

Total riser run: 35 x 50' Bouyed joints, 1 x 50' bare joint,1 x 25' Bare pup joint,

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 23 Dec 2005

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
BOP |P RR1 [0000 |0100 |1.00 |1,525.0m |Completed making up landing joint to slip joint.
BOP | TP RR1 0100 |0200 |1.00 1,525.0m | ROV camera system problems while on bottom monitoring BOP/PGB. Camera's were
(OTH) cutting out and all visibility was lost. Topside black and white camera still working.

Recover ROV and move top side black and white camera to front pan tilt for landing
bops'. Water had ingressed into camera electrics cannister. Gain use of 2 cameras and

dive ROV
BOP |P RR1 0200 |0400 |2.00 1,525.0m | Lower slip joint while monitoring with ROV
Install Choke and kill and boost lines to slip joint.
BOP |P RR1 0400 |0430 |0.50 1,525.0m | Pressure test choke and kill gooseneck seals 250/7500psi 5/10mins. ok
BOP |P RR1 0430 |0530 |1.00 1,525.0m | Skid rig and over well head with ROV assistance
BOP |P RR1 [0530 |0600 |0.50 |1,525.0m |Re-establish#2 guide line, Monitor MRT's as lowering to PGB post tops.

BOP landing weight prior to MRT's 685klbs.
Prepare to land BOP's

Phase Data to 2400hrs, 22 Dec 2005

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth

RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 25.75/05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 25.75 1.073 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 44.75|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 70.50 2.938 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 100.50 4.188 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 117.00 4.875 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 118.00 4.917 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 92.5/17 Dec 2005 |21 Dec 2005 210.50 8.771 1,525.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 38|21 Dec 2005 |22 Dec 2005 248.50 10.354 1,525.0m
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WBM Data Cost Today $ 5570
Mud Type: PHG Hi-Vis | API FL: 14.0cc/30min | Cl: 2200mg/l | Solids(%vol): Viscosity 110sec/qt
PV l4cp
Sample-From: Pits | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: H20: vp 261b/100f2
Time: 1945 | HTHP-FL: Hard/Ca: 20mg/l | Oil(%): Gels 10s 22
X Gels 10m 28
Weight: 8.70ppg | HTHP-cake: MBT: 20 | Sand:
Fann 003 20
Temp: 20C° PM: pH: 9.2 |Fann 006 21
PF: 0.18 | PHPA: Fann 100 28
Fann 200 35
Comment 1318bbls of Hi vis pumped during 24hr drilling period Fann 300 40
Fann 600 54
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 167.4
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 35.3
Diesel m3 0 10.7 0 450.4
Fresh Water m3 27 31 0 159.7
Drill Water m3 115 0 216.7
Cement G MT 0 80.5 0 7.7
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0.0
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m) Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
30" 650.00 650.00 650.00
13 3/8" 1511.14 1511.14 604.00
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 46
DOGC 3 extra
ESS 8
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 6
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 3
CAMERON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 1
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 6
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 4 Sperry Sun
Total | 85
HSE Summary
Events Date of last ~ Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Drill 18 Dec 2005 | 4 Days Held weekly abandon rig Load life boats 1 and 2 with 10 people and discuss life boat
drill equipment and launching procedures.
Fire Drill 18 Dec 2005 |4 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 18 Dec 2005 | 4 Days Deck = 6, Mech = 3, Drill =
6, Sub Sea =2
Safety Meeting 18 Dec 2005 | 4 Days Weekly safety meetings with | Discussion on man riding operations. Recent 3rd party
all crew members. finger amputation and basic amputation first aid discussed.
GEMS work basket policies. Fire and abandonment drills
STOP Card 18 Dec 2005 | 4 Days Safe =0, Un-safe = 2
Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data
Available 1,881bbl |Losses 1,318bbl
Reserve 1,881bbl | Sweeps 1,318bbl
Marine
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Weather on 22 Dec 2005 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir. ~ Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ 15kn ‘ 225.0deg l,OlG.Ombar‘ 16C° ‘ 1.0m 225.0deg 3s 1 265.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 238.0
3 216.0
272.0deg | 415800kb | 20m | 2250deg |  8s A 78,0
Comments 5 324.0
6 331.0
7 357.0
8 304.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip On Location waiting to Item Unit Used Quantity
off load deck cargo and Diesel CuMir 571
drill water Fresh Water CuMtr 429
Drill Water CuMtr 660
Cement G Mt 80
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 89
Pacific Wrangler On location wating for Item Unit Used Quantity
back load Diesel CuMtr 190.8
Fresh Water CuMtr 150
Drill Water CuMtr
Cement G Mt
Cement HT (Silica) Mt
Barite Bulk Mt
Bentonite Bulk Mt 5
Helicopter Movement
Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS 0922 /0935 15/15
AUSTRALIA PTY LTD
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 12

23 Dec 2005 From: Ron King/ Webby Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -

Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 1,525.0m | Cur. Hole Size 17.500in | AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 1,525.0m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001

_ Basin Progress 0.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1,511.8m | Daily Cost $0
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 7.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1,511.8m | Cum Cost $ 10210307
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 11.35 | FIT/LOT: /| Days Since Last LTI 948
Wir Dpth(MSL) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL(MSL) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 Making up drill pipe while RIH to drill out shoetrack. 0600hrs depth 565m.
Planned Op RIH and drill out shoetrack. Function test BOP's Displace well to mud. Drill ahead 3m of new formation. Conduct

LOT. Drill ahead.

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Landed out BOPs and tested wellhead connector. Pull-tested connections. Stroked out the slip-joint and nippled up the surface equipment. Rigged up
the diverter. Completed pressure tests. Rigged down riser handling equipment. Slipped and cut drilling line. Laid down 445 mm (17 %2") BHA.
Commenced making up new 311 mm (12 ¥%4") BHA.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 23 Dec 2005

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
BOP [P RR1 |0000 |0100 |1.00 |1,525.0m |Completed making up landing joint to slip joint.
BOP | TP RR1 |0100 |0200 |1.00 1,525.0m | ROV camera system problems while on bottom monitoring BOP/PGB. Camera's were
(OTH) cutting out and all visibility was lost. Topside black and white camera still working.

Recover ROV and move top side black and white camera to front pan tilt for landing
bops'. Water had ingressed into camera electrics cannister. Gain use of 2 cameras and
dive ROV

BOP |P BOP 0200 |0400 |2.00 1,525.0m | Lowered slip joint while monitoring with ROV
Installed Choke and kill and boost lines to slip joint.

BOP |P BOP [0400 |0500 |1.00 |1,525.0m |Pressure tested choke and kill gooseneck seals 250/7500psi 5/10mins. ok. This test
required by GEMS.

BOP |P BOP |0500 |0530 |0.50 [1,525.0m |Latched SDL ring to slip joint.
Skidded rig and over well head with ROV assistance

BOP |P BOP 0530 |0700 |1.50 1,525.0m | Re-establish #2 guide line, Monitor MRT's as lowering BOP to PGB post tops.
Installed storm saddles and service hoses to slip joint.
BOP landing weight prior to MRT's 685klbs.

BOP |P BOP 0700 |0800 |1.00 1,525.0m | Landed and latch BOP, visual confirmation by ROV. Complete 50klbs overpull test on
yellow pod.
Bulls eye readings:
PGB Fwd B/E 3/4deg stbd Aft B/E 3/4deg stbd fwd
LMRP #1 B/E 1/2deg Port fwd, LMRP #2 B/E 1/2deg Port fwd
BOP B/E 1deg stbd fwd.

BOP |P BOP |0800 |0900 |1.00 |1,525.0m |Secure pod hoses. Make up RBQ plates and put BOP on line.

BOP |P BOP [0900 |1000 |1.00 1,525.0m | Break circulation with Dowell down choke and kill lines.
Close shear rams and test well head VX gasket to 250/2500psi 5/10mins on yellow pod.
OK.
Complete 500psi pressure test on blue pod, 2nd pod test is a GEMS requirement.

BOP |P BOP 1000 |1100 |1.00 1,525.0m | Unlock slip joint and stroke open. Layed down landing joint.

BOP |P BOP 1100 |1200 |1.00 1,525.0m | Made up divertor to slip joint inner barrel. Land and latch in divertor housing.
Connect hydraulics and lock support and lock down dogs.

BOP |P BOP 1200 |1330 |1.50 1,525.0m | Rigged down riser spider, divertor running tool, install master bushings.

BOP |P BOP 1330 |1600 |2.50 1,525.0m | Clear rig floor of all riser and bop handling equipment. Install iron roughneck tracks.
Change elevators and bails

IH P SC 1600 |[1800 |2.00 1,525.0m | Hung off blocks and slipped and cut 27.43m (90') of drilling line. Removed hang off lines
and set crown-o-matic.

IH P HBHA 1800 |2130 |3.50 1,525.0m | Ran 445mm (17 1/2") BHA in hole and laid out same.

IH P HBHA | 2130 |2400 |2.50 1,525.0m | Commenced making up 311mm (12 1/4") BHA.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 24 Dec 2005
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Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
IH P HBHA [0000 |0300 |3.00 |1,525.0m |Complete making up 311mm (12 1/4") BHA.
Up-link MWD, install Radio-active source.
Run BHA from derrick to 1st joint of HWDP. Shallow test Down hole motor and tools ok.
800gpm 650psi.
IH P HBHA [0300 |0330 |0.50 |[1,525.0m |Picked up 55m(180') of HWDP.
IH P PUP |0330 |0600 |2.50 |1,525.0m |Picked up 297.6m (976.3") of 127mm (5")dp.
Bit depth @0600hrs 565m
Phase Data to 2400hrs, 23 Dec 2005
Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 25.75|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 25.75 1.073 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 44.75|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 70.50 2.938 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 100.50 4.188 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 117.00 4.875 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 118.00 4.917 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 100.5|17 Dec 2005 |23 Dec 2005 218.50 9.104 1,525.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 54|21 Dec 2005 |23 Dec 2005 272.50 11.354 1,525.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $ 20167
Mud Type:KCL-NaCl-Polymer | API FL: 6.8cc/30min | CI: 35500mg/l | Solids(%vol): 6% |Viscosity 50sec/qt
PV 9cp
Sample-From: Active Pit | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: 3% |H20: 94% |yp 121b/100ft2
Time: 2310 | HTHP-FL: Hard/Ca: 80mg/l | Oil(%): 0% |Gels 10s 3
Gels 101 3
Weight: 9.50ppg | HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: Sand: 0 —
Fann 003 3
Temp: PM: pH: 9.5 |Fann 006 4
PF: 0.15 | PHPA: Oppb |73 100 13
Fann 200 18
Comment Started mixing mud after Bops landed. Mixed 1000bbls of 3% KCL/NaCl/Polymer mud Fann 300 21
weighted to 9.5ppg and filled sandtraps, further mixing is in progress Fann 600 30
Bit#3 Wear | o1 D L B G 02 R
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 12.250in | IADC# M422 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: REED HYCALOG | WOB(avg) No. Size Progress Cum. Progress 0.0m
Type: PDC | RPM(avg) 2 28/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs Cum. On Btm Hrs 0.0h
Serial No.: 211010 |F.Rate 4 18/32nd" ||ADC Drill Hrs Cum IADC Drill Hrs 0.0h
Bit Model RSX 616 | SPP Total Revs Cum Total Revs 0
Depth In 1,525.0m | HSI ROP(avg) N/A | ROP(avg) 0.00 m/hr
Depth Out TFA 2.197
Bit Comment
BHA # 3
Weight(Wet) 40.00klb | Length 268.4m | Torque(max) D.C. (1) Ann Velocity 256fpm
Wt Below Jar(Wet) 30.00klb | String Torque(Off.Btm) D.C. (2) Ann Velocity 384fpm
Pick-Up Torque(On.Btm) H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
Slack-Off D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
BHA Run Description Annular velocity based on 900gpm
BHA Run Comment
Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.25m | 12.250in 211010 Reed Hycalog RSX 616M
Mud Motor 8.58m 9.625in 6.135in | 963006 244mm(9 5/8") Sperrydrill Lobe 6/7 -
5.0 stg Motor
XIO 1.22m 9.438in 2.875in | A639
Stab 1.81m | 12.125in 2.875in | 694776 Non-mag integral blade string stab
MWD 24.39m 8.000in 1.920in
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PC.

Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
DIR/HCIM-EWR-DGR-CTN-SLD-ACAL-H
8in DC 9.06m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600035
Stab 2.10m | 12.125in 2.875in | 47607 Integral blade string stabilizer
8in DC 8.68m 8.000in 2.875in | 1860026
Drilling Jars 9.31m 8.188in 3.063in | 11150D Drilling jars used in surface hole
section.
8in DC 8.81m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600031
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
5in HWDP 192.98m 5.000in 2.875in
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 167.4
Bentonite Bulk MT 5 2.23 0 38.1
Diesel m3 0 4.7 -17.3 428.4
Fresh Water m3 25 12.3 0 172.4
Drill Water m3 100 170.8 0 145.9
Cement G MT 0 0 0 7.7
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0.0
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m) Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
30" 650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
13 3/8" 1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 44
DOGC 3 extra
ESS 8
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 3
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 3
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 6
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 4 Sperry Sun
Total | 79
HSE Summary
Events Date of last ~ Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Drill 18 Dec 2005 |5 Days Held weekly abandon rig L
drill
Fire Drill 18 Dec 2005 |5 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 23 Dec 2005 |0 Days Deck = 2, Mech =1, Drill =
3, Sub Sea =5
Safety Meeting 18 Dec 2005 |5 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 23 Dec 2005 |0 Days Safe = 5, Un-safe =
Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data
Available 1,000bbl |Losses Obbl
Reserve 1,000bbl
Marine
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Weather on 23 Dec 2005 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir. ~ Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ 25kn ‘ 225.0deg 1,010.0mbar‘ 15C° ‘ 0.5m 225.0deg 3s 1 269.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 236.0
3 220.0
272.0deg | 408.00klb 4,428.00kb | 15m | 225.0deg |  8s A 280.0
Comments 5 324.0
6 328.0
7 357.0
8 306.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip On Location off loading Iltem Unit Used Quantity
cargo. Diesel CuMtr 556
Fresh Water CuMtr 426
Drill Water CuMtr 660
Cement G Mt 80
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 89
Pacific Wrangler On location wating for Item Unit Used Quantity
back load Diesel CuMtr 190.8
Fresh Water CuMtr 50
Drill Water CuMtr
Cement G Mt
Cement HT (Silica) Mt
Barite Bulk Mt
Bentonite Bulk Mt
Recieved 100m3 of Potable water/ 5mt Bentonite
Helicopter Movement
Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS 0945 /0958 8/14
AUSTRALIA PTY LTD
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 13

24 Dec 2005 From: Ron King/ Webby Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -
Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 1,544.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 1,544.0m |Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001
Basin Progress 19.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1,511.8m | Daily Cost $ 465794
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 8.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1,511.8m | Cum Cost $ 11174865
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 12.35 | FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 949
Wir Dpth(MSL) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL(MSL) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 Drilling 311mm (12 1/4") hole @1670m
Planned Op Drill ahead 311 mm (12 1/4") hole.

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Completed making up 311 mm (12 %") BHA. RIH and picked up drillpipe on the way in hole. Drilled out the shoetrack. Displaced the well to mud.
Drilled ahead 3 m of new formation. Conducted LOT to 1.89 sg EMW at 1528.0 mMDRT. Drilled ahead to 1544.0 mMDRT.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 24 Dec 2005

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)

IH P HBHA |0000 |0300 [3.00 |1,525.0m |Complete making up 311mm (12 1/4") BHA.
Up-link MWD, install Radio-active source.
Run BHA from derrick to 1st joint of HWDP. Shallow test Down hole motor and tools ok.
800gpm 650psi.

IH P HBHA [0300 |0330 |0.50 |[1,525.0m |Picked up 55m(180') of HWDP.

IH P PUP |0330 |0900 |5.50 [1,525.0m |Picked up 745m (2444") of 127mm (5")dp.
Functioned divertor insert packer ok.

IH P BOP 0900 |0930 |0.50 1,525.0m | Function tested BOP's on yellow pod ok.

IH TP BOP [0930 |1130 |2.00 |1,525.0m |Attempt function test on blue pod, Run-away observed on open function for upper

(BORC annular. Function several times and uncontroled flow stopped. Change back to yellow

pod and upper annular functions ok. Proceed with operations after discussing
equipment failure. Signs made for all BOP panels stating not to operate upper annular
on blue pod. Currently drilling on Blue pod.

IH P TI 1130 |1330 |2.00 1,525.0m | Ran in hole from 1014m to 1478m, Washed down to top of cement @1478m

IH P DFS 1330 |1900 |5.50 1,528.0m | Drilled cement, plugs, shoe track. Displaced well to 9.5ppg mud while drilling out cmt
and making 3m of new hole to 1528m

IH P CHC [1900 |2000 |1.00 1,528.0m | Circulated hole clean and ensured 9.5ppg in/out for Leak off test.

IH P LOT [2000 |2100 |1.00 |1,528.0m |Performed LOT against lower annular.
9.5ppg test mud weight, 1511.77m TVD, 1625psi, EMW 15.8ppg.1.89sg,

IH P DA 2100 [2400 |3.00 |1,544.0m |Take SCR's, CLFL.
Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 1528m to 1544m.
Reduced parameters until stabilizers are out of casing(1558m)
String wt 240klbs, Tq 2-4000ftlbs, 50-60 rpm surface, 150rpm DH, WOB 5-10klbs,
1800psi, 790gpm.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on

25 Dec 2005

Phse Cls

(RC)

Op From

To Hrs Depth

Activity Description

IH P DA 0000

0600 |6.00 1,670.0m

Drilled 311mm 12 1/4" hole from 1544m to 1670m
String wt 240klbs, Tq 2-4000ftlbs, 100 rpm surface, 210rpm DH, WOB 15-20klbs,
1800psi, 850gpm.

Phase Data to 2400hrs, 24 Dec 2005

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth

RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 25.75|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 25.75 1.073 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 44.75|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 70.50 2.938 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 100.50 4.188 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 117.00 4.875 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 118.00 4.917 650.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 54|21 Dec 2005 |23 Dec 2005 172.00 7.167 1,525.0m
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Phase Data to 2400hrs, 24 Dec 2005

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) \ 124.5/17 Dec 2005 |24 Dec 2005 | 296.50 12.354 1,544.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $ 27976
Mud Type:KCL-NaCl-Polymer | API FL: 6.6cc/30min | Cl: 36000mg/ | Solids(%vol): 5% |Viscosity 48sec/qt
Sample-From: Active Pit | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: 3% | H20: 95% s\P/ 13|b/1]l;)00(;2
Time: 2100 |HTHP-FL: Hard/Ca: 240mg/l | Oil(%): 0% |Gels 10s 4
Weight: 9.50ppg | HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: 1 | Sand: 0 i:rllsnlo?)r; 2
Temp: 20C° PM: pH: 9.5 |Fann 006 4
PF: 0.35 | PHPA: Oppb E::: ;gg ig
Comment Fann 300 23
Fann 600 33
Bit # 3 Wear I o1 L B G 02 R
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 12.250in | IADC# M422 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: REED HYCALOG |WOB(avg) 10.00klb |No. Size Progress 19.0m | Cum. Progress 19.0m
Type: PDC | RPM(avg) 50 | 2 28/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs 3.2h | Cum. On Btm Hrs 3.2h
Serial No.: 211010 |F.Rate  14.00bpm | 4 18/32nd" | |ADC Drill Hrs 3.0h | Cum IADC Drill Hrs 3.0h
Bit Model RSX 616 | SPP 1750psi Total Revs 34 | Cum Total Revs 34
Depth In 1,525.0m | HSI ROP(avg) 5.94 m/hr | ROP(avg) 5.94 m/hr
Depth Out TFA 2.197
Bit Comment
BHA #3
Weight(Wet) 40.00klb |Length 268.4m | Torque(max) 10000ft-Ibs | D.C. (1) Ann Velocity 256fpm
Wt Below Jar(Wet) 30.00klb | String 240.00klb | Torque(Off.Btm) 2000ft-Ibs | D.C. (2) Ann Velocity 384fpm
Pick-Up 240.00klb | Torque(On.Btm) 4000ft-lbs | H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
Slack-Off 240.00kIb D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm

BHA Run Description

Annular velocity based on 900gpm

BHA Run Comment

PeC.

Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.25m | 12.250in 211010 Reed Hycalog RSX 616M
Mud Motor 8.58m 9.625in 6.135in | 963006 244mm(9 5/8") Sperrydrill Lobe 6/7 -
5.0 stg Motor
XIO 1.22m 9.438in 2.875in | A639
Stab 1.81m | 12.125in 2.875in | 694776 Non-mag integral blade string stab
MWD 24.39m 8.000in 1.920in
DIR/HCIM-EWR-DGR-CTN-SLD-ACAL-H
8in DC 9.06m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600035
Stab 2.10m | 12.125in 2.875in | 47607 Integral blade string stabilizer
8in DC 8.68m 8.000in 2.875in | 1860026
Drilling Jars 9.31m 8.188in 3.063in | 11150D Drilling jars used in surface hole
section.
8in DC 8.81m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600031
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
5in HWDP 192.98m 5.000in 2.875in
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 35.44 0 132.0
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 38.1
Diesel m3 0 11.2 0 417.2
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Bulk Stocks

Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Fresh Water m3 21 55.4 0 138.0
Drill Water m3 480 107.9 -42.1 475.9
Cement G MT 0 0 0 7.7
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW Eff(%) SPM SPP  Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(in)  (ppY) (SPM)  (psi)  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (ps)) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
2 |12P160 6.000 | 9.50 97 93 | 1800 | 9.50 |1528.0 20 125 | 2.00 30 | 150 | 3.00 40 | 190 | 4.00
3 |12P160 6.000 | 9.50 97 93 | 1800 | 9.50
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m) Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
30" 650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
13 3/8" 1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 44
DOGC 3 extra
ESS 8
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 3
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 3
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 6
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 4 Sperry Sun
Total | 79
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Drill 18 Dec 2005 |6 Days Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Environental Issue 24 Dec 2005 |0 Days Enviromental drill Simulated chemical spill on rig.
Fire Drill 18 Dec 2005 | 6 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 24 Dec 2005 |0 Days Deck = 6, Mech =0, Drill =
7, Sub Sea =0
Safety Meeting 18 Dec 2005 |6 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 24 Dec 2005 |0 Days Safe =1, Un-safe = 7
Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data
Available 2,098bbl |Losses 173bbl Equip. Descr. Mesh Size
Active 433.1bbl | Equipment 108bbl | Shakerl VSM 100 4x84
Shaker2 VSM 100 4x84
Hole 1,164.9bbl | Dumped 65bbl | > o<er X
Shaker3 VSM 100 4x52
Reserve 500bbl Shaker4 BEM650 4x120
Marine
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Weather on 24 Dec 2005 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir. ~ Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ 35kn ‘ 248.0deg 1,009.0mbar‘ 15C° ‘ 3.0m 248.0deg 3s 1 287.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 265.0
3 225.0
272.0deg | 396.00klb |4,548.00kb | 30m | 225.0deg |  8s A 2820
Comments 5 309.0
6 320.0
7 353.0
8 309.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip On Location waiting to Item Unit Used Quantity
gﬁl:oadt deck cargo and 5o CuMtr 536
it water Fresh Water CuMtr 423
Drill Water CuMtr 180
Cement G Mt 80
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 89
Transfered 480m3 of drill water to rig. Plan was to take 660m3 but transfer pump failed. Will resume once weather calms and pump is repaired.
Pacific Wrangler On location wating for Item Unit Used Quantity
back load Diesel CuMtr 1694
Fresh Water CuMtr 45
Drill Water CuMtr 0
Cement G Mt 0
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 0
Bentonite Bulk Mt 0
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 14

25 Dec 2005 From: Ron King/ Webby Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -

Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 2,131.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 2,130.3m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001

_ Basin Progress 587.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1,511.8m | Daily Cost $ 460984
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 9.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1,511.8m | Cum Cost $ 11635849
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 13.35 | FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 950
Wir Dpth(MSL) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL(MSL) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 Drilling ahead 311 mm (12 1/4") hole at 2257m mMDRT
Planned Op Drill ahead.
Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs
Drilled ahead from 1544.0 - 2131.0 mMDRT.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 25 Dec 2005

Phse Cls

(RC)

Op From

To Hrs Depth

Activity Description

IH P DA 0000

2400 |24.00 |2,131.0m

Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 1544m to 2131m
String wt 275klbs, Tq 4-8000ftlbs, 150 rpm surface, 252rpm DH, WOB 15-18klbs,
2900psi, 900gpm. Boost riser while drilling. Max gas for 24hr period 1.2%.
ROP average 24.45m/hr (including connections)

Survey results @2113.64m 3.4deg, 29.61 azimuth, 2112.98m TVD

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on

26 Dec 2005

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
IH P DA 0000 |0600 |6.00 2,257.0m | Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 2131m to 2257mMDRT
String wt 2800klIbs, Tq 4-8000ftlbs, 150 rpm surface, 252rpm DH, WOB 12-15klibs,
3000psi, 900gpm. Boost riser while drilling. Max gas for 6hr period 0.6% from 2163m.
ROP average 21m/hr (including connections)
Survey results @2227.87m, 3.85deg, 36.05 azimuth
Phase Data to 2400hrs, 25 Dec 2005
Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 25.75|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 25.75 1.073 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 44.75|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 70.50 2.938 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 100.50 4.188 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5|16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 117.00 4.875 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 118.00 4.917 650.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 54|21 Dec 2005 |23 Dec 2005 172.00 7.167 1,525.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 148.5|17 Dec 2005 |25 Dec 2005 320.50 13.354 2,131.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $ 23715
Mud Type:KCL-NaCl-Polymer | API FL: 6.0cc/30min | CI: 36500mg/l | Solids(%vol): 6% |Viscosity S6sec/qt
PV 15
Sample-From: Active Pit | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: 3% | H20: 94% |vp 20|b/1006f2
Time: 2100 |HTHP-FL: Hard/Ca: 200mg/l | Qil(%): 0% |Gels 10s 4
Gels 10 5
Weight: 9.60ppg | HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: 1 | Sand: 1 =
Fann 003 4
Temp: 20C° PM: pH: 9 [Fann 006 6
PF: 0.1 | PHPA: 1ppb |Fan 100 2
Fann 200 29
Comment Fann 300 35
Fann 600 50
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Bit#3 Wear o1 D L B G 02 R
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 12.250in | IADC# M422 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: REED HYCALOG | WOB(avg) 15.00klb |No. Size Progress 587.0m | Cum. Progress 606.0m
Type: PDC | RPM(avg) 140 | 2 28/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs 18.4h | Cum. On Btm Hrs 21.6h
Serial No.: 211010 |F.Rate  21.00bpm | 4 18/32nd" | |ADC Drill Hrs 24.0h | Cum IADC Drill Hrs 27.0h
Bit Model RSX 616 | SPP 2450psi Total Revs 297 | Cum Total Revs 331
Depth In 1,525.0m | HSI ROP(avg) 31.90 m/hr | ROP(avg) 28.06 m/hr
Depth Out TFA 2.197
Bit Comment
BHA # 3
Weight(Wet) 40.00klb | Length 268.4m | Torque(max) 10000ft-Ibs | D.C. (1) Ann Velocity 256fpm
Wt Below Jar(Wet) 30.00klb | String 275.00klb | Torque(Off.Btm) 3000ft-Ibs | D.C. (2) Ann Velocity 384fpm
Pick-Up 280.00klb | Torque(On.Btm) 6000ft-Ibs | H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
Slack-Off 280.00klb D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
BHA Run Description Annular velocity based on 900gpm
BHA Run Comment
Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.25m | 12.250in 211010 Reed Hycalog RSX 616M
Mud Motor 8.58m 9.625in 6.135in | 963006 244mm(9 5/8") Sperrydrill Lobe 6/7 -
5.0 stg Motor
XIO 1.22m 9.438in 2.875in | A639
Stab 1.81m | 12.125in 2.875in | 694776 Non-mag integral blade string stab
MWD 24.39m 8.000in 1.920in
DIR/HCIM-EWR-DGR-CTN-SLD-ACAL-H
8in DC 9.06m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600035
Stab 2.10m | 12.125in 2.875in | 47607 Integral blade string stabilizer
8in DC 8.68m 8.000in 2.875in | 1860026
Drilling Jars 9.31m 8.188in 3.063in | 11150D Drilling jars used in surface hole
section.
8in DC 8.81m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600031
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
5in HWDP 192.98m 5.000in 2.875in
Survey
MD Incl Azim TVD Vsec N/-S E/-W DLS Tool Type
(m) (deg) (deg) (m) (deg) (m) (m) (deg/30m)
1569.11 0.4 350.1 1568.99 -2.2 6.9 13.3 0.0 MWD
1626.44 0.6 2.0 1626.32 -1.9 6.4 13.3 0.1 MWD
1712.56 15 24.6 1712.43 -0.7 5.0 12.8 0.4 MWD
1798.49 24 23.2 1798.30 15 2.2 11.7 0.3 MWD
1970.98 3.2 24.1 1970.56 8.1 5.9 7.9 0.1 MWD
2056.65 3.2 27.0 2056.09 11.6 10.3 5.9 0.1 MWD
2142.04 3.5 29.6 2141.34 14.7 14.7 3.6 0.1 MWD
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 8.89 0 123.1
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 38.1
Diesel m3 0 11.2 0 406.0
Fresh Water m3 29 11.2 0 155.8
Drill Water m3 0 253.2 0 222.7
Cement G MT 0 0 0 7.7
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0.0
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Pumps

Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW Eff (%) SPM SPP  Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(i) (ppg) (SPM)  (ps))  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
2 |12P160 6.000 | 9.50 97 105 | 2900 | 10.69 |2128.0 30 250 3.00 40 | 300 | 4.00 50 | 350 | 5.00
3 | 12P160 6.000 | 9.50 97 105 | 2900 | 10.69 |2128.0 30 250 3.00 40 | 300 | 4.00 50 | 350 | 5.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m)  Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m TVD (m)
30" 650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
13 3/8" 1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 44
DOGC 3 extra
ESS 8
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 3
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 3
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 6
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 4 Sperry Sun
Total | 79
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Drill 18 Dec 2005 | 7 Days Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Environental Issue 24 Dec 2005 |1 Day Enviromental drill
Fire Drill 18 Dec 2005 | 7 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 25 Dec 2005 |0 Days Deck = 8, Mech = 2, Drill =
2, Sub Sea =0
Safety Meeting 18 Dec 2005 |7 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 25 Dec 2005 |0 Days Safe = 6, Un-safe = 3
Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data
Available 2,512bbl |Losses 329bbl Equip. Descr. Mesh Size
Active 399.9bbl | Equipment 329bb| | Shakerl VSM 100 4x145
Hole 1,433.1bbl Shaker2 VSM 100 4x84
Shaker3 VSM 100 4 x84
Reserve 679bbl Shakerd BEM650 4120
Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data
Available 1,881bbl |Losses 1,318bbl
Reserve 1,881bbl | Sweeps 1,318bbl
Marine
Weather on 25 Dec 2005 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height ~Wave Dir.  Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ 20kn ‘ 292.0deg 1,012.0mbar‘ 12C° ‘ 3.0m 292.0deg 3s 1 317.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height ~ Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 265.0
3 216.0
272.0deg | 396.00kib 4,484.00kb | 40m | 247.0deg |  8s A 2450
Comments 5 273.0
6 342.0
7 397.0
8 359.0
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Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip At rig on stand by. Iltem Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 521
Fresh Water CuMtr 420
Drill Water CuMtr 180
Cement G Mt 80
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 89
Pacific Wrangler Departed location ETA Item Unit Used Quantity
gﬂﬁ‘ifoume 0800hrs Diesel CuMtr 1624
Fresh Water CuMtr 43
Drill Water CuMtr 0
Cement G Mt 0
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 0
Bentonite Bulk Mt 0
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 15

26 Dec 2005 From: Ron King/ Webby Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -
Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 2,641.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 2,639.0m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001
Basi
asin Progress 510.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1,511.8m | Daily Cost $ 510764
Drill Co. DOGC
Days from spud 10.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1,511.8m | Cum Cost $ 12146613
Ri OCEAN PATRIOT .
9 Days on well 14.35 | FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 951
Wir Dpth(MSL) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL(MSL) 2LSM | blanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 Drilling ahead 311 mm (12 1/4") hole in Lakes Entrance formation at 2758.0 mMDRT.
Planned Op Drill ahead 311 mm (12 1/4") hole.

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Drilled ahead 311 mm (12 1/4") hole from 2131.0 mMMDRT to 2641.0 mMDRT. Top of Lakes Entrance Formation picked at 2508.0 mMDRT.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 26 Dec 2005

Phse Cls

(RC)

Op

From

To Hrs Depth

Activity Description

IH P DA 0000

2400 |24.00 |2,641.0m

Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 2131m to 2641mMDRT
String wt 310klbs, Tq 4-8000ftlbs, 150 rpm surface, 260rpm DH, WOB 12-15klbs,
3300psi, 900gpm. Boost riser while drilling. Max gas for 24hr period 0.82%.
Increase mud weight from 1.14sg to 1.2sg (9.5ppg - 10ppg)
ROP average 21.25m/hr (including connections)

Survey results @2629.39m, 3.86deg, 40.58azimuth

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on

27 Dec 2005

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
IH P DA 0000 |0600 |6.00 2,758.0m | Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 2641m to 2758m MDRT
String wt 310klbs, Tq 4-8000ftlbs, 150 rpm surface, 259rpm DH, WOB 12-20kIbs,
3300psi, 900gpm. Boost riser while drilling. Max gas for 6hr period 0.02%.
ROP average 19.5m/hr (including connections)
Survey results @2715.15m, 3.77deg, 40.42azimuth
Phase Data to 2400hrs, 26 Dec 2005
Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 25.75|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 25.75 1.073 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 44.75|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 70.50 2.938 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 100.50 4.188 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 117.00 4.875 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 118.00 4.917 650.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 54|21 Dec 2005 |23 Dec 2005 172.00 7.167 1,525.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 172.5|17 Dec 2005 |26 Dec 2005 344.50 14.354 2,641.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $ 57591
Mud Type:KCL-NaCl-Polymer | API FL: 4.0cc/30min | CI: 65000mg/l | Solids(%vol): 10% |Viscosity S5sec/qt
PV 16¢cp
Sample-From: Active Pit | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: 6% |H20: 90% |vp 251b/100f2
Time: 2300 | HTHP-FL: 13.6cc/30min | Hard/Ca: 240mg/l | Oil(%): 0% |Gels 10s 6
Gels 10 9
Weight: 10.00ppg | HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: 5 | Sand: 0.8 o
Fann 003 5
Temp: 22C° PM: pH: 5 |Fann 006 7
PF: 0.04 | PHPA: 1ppp |Fann100 %
Fann 200 34
Comment NaCl 6%. Fann 300 a1
Fann 600 57
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Bit#3 Wear o1 D L B G 02 R
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 12.250in | IADC# M422 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: REED HYCALOG | WOB(avg) 13.00klb |No. Size Progress 510.0m | Cum. Progress 1,116.0m
Type: PDC | RPM(avg) 150 | 2 28/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs 17.1h | Cum. On Btm Hrs 38.7h
Serial No.: 211010 |F.Rate  21.09bpm | 4 18/32nd" | |ADC Drill Hrs 24.0h | Cum IADC Drill Hrs 51.0h
Bit Model RSX 616 | SPP 2950psi Total Revs 271 | Cum Total Revs 602
Depth In 1,525.0m | HSI ROP(avg) 29.82 m/hr | ROP(avg) 28.84 m/hr
Depth Out TFA 2.197
Bit Comment
BHA # 3
Weight(Wet) 40.00klb | Length 268.4m | Torque(max) 12000ft-Ibs | D.C. (1) Ann Velocity 256fpm
Wt Below Jar(Wet) 30.00klb | String 310.00klb | Torque(Off.Btm) 3000ft-Ibs | D.C. (2) Ann Velocity 384fpm
Pick-Up 300.00klb | Torque(On.Btm) 7000ft-Ibs | H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
Slack-Off 310.00kIb D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
BHA Run Description Annular velocity based on 900gpm
BHA Run Comment
Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.25m | 12.250in 211010 Reed Hycalog RSX 616M
Mud Motor 8.58m 9.625in 6.135in | 963006 244mm(9 5/8") Sperrydrill Lobe 6/7 -
5.0 stg Motor
XIO 1.22m 9.438in 2.875in | A639
Stab 1.81m | 12.125in 2.875in | 694776 Non-mag integral blade string stab
MWD 24.39m 8.000in 1.920in
DIR/HCIM-EWR-DGR-CTN-SLD-ACAL-H
8in DC 9.06m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600035
Stab 2.10m | 12.125in 2.875in | 47607 Integral blade string stabilizer
8in DC 8.68m 8.000in 2.875in | 1860026
Drilling Jars 9.31m 8.188in 3.063in | 11150D Drilling jars used in surface hole
section.
8in DC 8.81m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600031
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
5in HWDP 192.98m 5.000in 2.875in
Survey
MD Incl Azim TVD Vsec N/-S E/-W DLS Tool Type
(m) (deg) (deg) (m) (deg) (m) (m) (deg/30m)
2256.54 4.0 35.4 2255.59 20.1 21.0 0.4 0.2 MWD
2342.60 4.2 355 2341.43 26.0 26.0 4.1 0.1 MWD
2428.46 4.3 38.3 2427.05 32.0 311 7.9 0.0 MWD
2543.24 4.1 40.5 2541.53 37.7 37.7 13.1 0.2 MWD
2629.39 3.9 40.6 2627.47 42.2 42.2 17.0 0.1 MWD
2686.60 3.8 41.5 2684.55 45.1 45.1 19.5 0.1 MWD
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 0 123.1
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 38.1
Diesel m3 0 14 0 392.0
Fresh Water m3 31 37.9 0 148.9
Drill Water m3 474 1415 0 555.2
Cement G MT 0 7.7 0 -0.0
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0.0
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Pumps

Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW  Eff (%) SPM SPP Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(i) (ppg) (SPM)  (ps))  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
2 |12P160 6.000 | 9.50 97 104 | 3360 | 10.54 (2500.0 30 275 3.00 40 | 350 | 4.00 50 | 410 | 5.00
3 | 12P160 6.000 | 9.50 97 104 | 3360 | 10.54 |2500.0 30 275 3.00 40 | 350 | 4.00 50 | 400 | 5.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m)  Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m TVD (m)
30" 650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
13 3/8" 1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 44
DOGC 3 extra
ESS 8
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 3
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 3
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 6
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 4 Sperry Sun
Total | 79
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Drill 26 Dec 2005 |0 Days Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Fire Drill 26 Dec 2005 |0 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 26 Dec 2005 |0 Days Deck =7, Mech =5, Drill =
2, Sub Sea =2,Welder = 2,
Marine =1
Safety Meeting 26 Dec 2005 |0 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 26 Dec 2005 |0 Days Safe = 3, Un-safe = 14
Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data
Available 2,491bbl |Losses 376bbl Equip. Descr. Mesh Size
Active 434.9bbl | Equipment 376bbl | Shakerl VSM 100 4x120
Shaker2 VSM 100 4x120
Hole 1,666.1bbl axer X
Shaker3 VSM 100 4 x84
Reserve 390bbl Shakerd BEM650 4x120
Marine
Weather on 26 Dec 2005 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir. ~ Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ 18kn ’ 225.0deg ‘1,017.0mbar‘ 15C° ’ 1.0m 225.0deg 3s 1 320.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 269.0
3 216.0
272.0deg | 420.00kib |4,438.00kb | 2.5m | 225.0deg |  8s . 2510
Comments 5 273.0
6 342.0
7 397.0
8 359.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip At rig on stand by. Item Unit Used Quantity

Diesel

CuMtr

502
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Item Unit Used Quantity
Fresh Water CuMtr 76
Drill Water CuMtr 50
Cement G Mt 80
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 89
Recieved 474m3 of drill water/Potable water
Pacific Wrangler Melbourne loading Item Unit Used Quantity
Cargo Diesel CuMtr
Fresh Water CuMtr
Drill Water CuMtr 0
Cement G Mt 0
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 0
Bentonite Bulk Mt 0
‘Copyright IDS 2005', TF/JG 20050815, NEXUS_AU_drllg Page 4

Printed on 26 Dec 2005




DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 16

27 Dec 2005 From: Ron King/ Webby Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -
Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 3115.0m Cur. Hole Size 12.250in AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 3112.0m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001
Basi
asin Progress 474.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1511.8m | Daily Cost $ 472057
Drill Co. DOGC
Days from spud 11.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1511.8m | Cum Cost $ 12618670
Ri OCEAN PATRIOT .
9 Days on well 15.35 FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 952
Wir Dpth(MSL) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL(MSL) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 Drilling ahead 311mm (12 1/4") @3195mMDRT
Planned Op Drill ahead 311 mm (12 %4") hole.

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Drilled ahead from 2641.0 mMDRT to 3115.0 mMDRT. Top of the Latrobe Formation picked from LWD logs and cuttings at 2824.0 mMDRT.

FORMATION
Name Top
Near 68.5 Ma Sand 3103.00m

Near 70.3 Ma Sand
Near 70.3 Ma Sand
TD
TD

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 27 Dec 2005

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)

IH P DA 0000 |0830 |8.50 2787.0m | Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 2641m to 2787m MDRT

String wt 310klbs, Tq 4-8000ftlbs, 150 rpm surface, 259rpm DH, WOB 12-20klbs,
3300psi, 900gpm. Boost riser while drilling.

ROP average 17.17m/hr (including connections)

Survey results @2772.65m, 3.83deg, 43.73azimuth

IH TP DA 0830 |0900 |0.50 2787.0m | Backed out saver sub on Top Drive during routine connection. Layed out single,
(RE) installed new saver sub on Top Drive and picked up a replacement single of 127mm
(5")dp.

IH P DA 0900 |1800 |9.00 |2991.0m |Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 2787m to 2991m MDRT

String wt 330klbs, Tq 5-10000ftlbs, 150 rpm surface, 259rpm DH, WOB 5-10klbs,
3300psi, 900gpm. Boost riser while drilling.

ROP average 22.6m/hr (including connections)

Survey results @2973.53m, 3.73deg, 46.71azimuth

IH TP DA 1800 |[1830 |0.50 2991.0m | Top Drive pipe handler failed to break out drill pipe during routine connection, change
(RE) out front carrier die while circulating down string.

IH P DA 1830 [2400 |5.50 |3115.0m |Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 2991m to 3115m MDRT

String wt 340klbs, Tq 6-8000ftlbs, 150 rpm surface, 259rpm DH, WOB 10-12klbs,
3300psi, 900gpm. Boost riser while drilling.Max gas for 24hr period 0.276%.
ROP average 22.5m/hr (including connections)

Survey results @3088.21m, 3.81deg, 46.46azimuth

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 28 Dec 2005

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)

IH P DA 0000 |0600 |6.00 |3195.0m |Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3115m to 3195m MDRT

String wt 340klbs, Tq 6-14000ftlbs, 80-150 rpm surface, 180-256rpm DH, WOB
5-20klbs, 3900psi, 875gpm. Boost riser while drilling. Max gas for 24hr period 0.112%.
ROP average 13.3m/hr (including connections)

Survey results @3173.79m, 3.67deg, 49.59 azimuth

Operations For Period Hrs to Hrs on
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Phase Data to 2400hrs, 27 Dec 2005

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 25.75|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 25.75 1.073 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 44.75|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 70.50 2.938 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 100.50 4.188 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 117.00 4.875 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 118.00 4917 650.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 54|21 Dec 2005 |23 Dec 2005 172.00 7.167 1525.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 196.5|17 Dec 2005 |27 Dec 2005 368.50 15.354 3115.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $ 20507
Mud Type:KCL-NaCl-Polymer | API FL: 4.0cc/30min | Cl: 75000mg/I | Solids(%vol): 10% |Viscosity S7sec/qt
Sample-From: Active Pit | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: 6% |H20: 90% \F;\F/’ 26|b/l](-)70(;llz
Time: 2100 | HTHP-FL: 12.8cc/30min | Hard/Ca: 260mg/l | Oil(%): 0% |Gels 10s 7
Weight: 10.20ppg | HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: 6 | Sand: 1.25 i:;lo(;: 2
Temp: 25C° PM: pH: 9 |Fann 006 7
PF: 0.05 | PHPA: 1ppb ::: ;gg 22
Comment NaCl 8%. Fann 300 43
Fann 600 60
Bit#3 Wear | o1 D B G 02 R
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 12.250in | IADC# M422 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: REED HYCALOG | WOB(avg) 11.90klb |No. Size Progress 474.0m | Cum. Progress 1590.0m
Type: PDC | RPM(avg) 150 | 2 28/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs 16.2h | Cum. On Btm Hrs 54.9h
Serial No.: 211010 |F.Rate  20.90bpm | 4 18/32nd" | |ADC Drill Hrs 0.0h | Cum IADC Drill Hrs 51.0h
Bit Model RSX 616 | SPP 3420psi Total Revs 255 | Cum Total Revs 857
Depth In 1525.0m | HSI ROP(avg) 29.26 m/hr | ROP(avg) 28.96 m/hr
Depth Out TFA 2.197
Bit Comment
BHA # 3
Weight(Wet) 40.00klb |Length 268.4m | Torque(max) 14400ft-Ibs | D.C. (1) Ann Velocity 256fpm
Wt Below Jar(Wet) 30.00kIb | String 340.00kIb | Torque(Off.Btm) 4100ft-lbs | D.C. (2) Ann Velocity 384fpm
Pick-Up 330.00kIb | Torque(On.Btm) 7700ft-lbs | H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
Slack-Off 340.00klb D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm

BHA Run Description

Annular velocity based on 900gpm

BHA Run Comment

PeC.

Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment

Bit 0.25m | 12.250in 211010 Reed Hycalog RSX 616M

Mud Motor 8.58m 9.625in 6.135in | 963006 244mm(9 5/8") Sperrydrill Lobe 6/7 -
5.0 stg Motor

XIO 1.22m 9.438in 2.875in | A639

Stab 1.81m | 12.125in 2.875in | 694776 Non-mag integral blade string stab

MWD 24.39m 8.000in 1.920in
DIR/HCIM-EWR-DGR-CTN-SLD-ACAL-H

8in DC 9.06m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600035

Stab 2.10m | 12.125in 2.875in | 47607 Integral blade string stabilizer

8in DC 8.68m 8.000in 2.875in | 1860026

Drilling Jars 9.31m 8.188in 3.063in | 11150D Drilling jars used in surface hole
section.

8in DC 8.81m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600031

X/O 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
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Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
5in HWDP 192.98m 5.000in 2.875in
Survey
MD Incl Azim TVD Vsec N/-S E/-W DLS Tool Type
(m) (deg) (deg) (m) (deg) (m) (m) (deg/30m)
2772.65 3.8 43.7 2770.41 54.4 49.3 233 0.1 MWD
2887.70 3.9 45.7 2885.20 62.0 54.9 28.7 0.1 MWD
2973.53 3.7 46.7 2970.84 67.4 58.9 32.8 0.1 MWD
3088.21 3.8 46.5 3085.28 64.0 64.0 38.3 0.1 MWD
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 0 123.1
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 38.1
Diesel m3 0 16.8 0 375.2
Fresh Water m3 30 28.8 0 150.1
Drill Water m3 0 151.5 0 403.7
Cement G MT 79.93 0 0 79.9
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW Eff(%) SPM SPP  Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(in)  (ppY) (SPM)  (psi)  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (ps)) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
2 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 103 | 3740 | 10.48 (3074.0 30 340 | 3.00 40 | 400 | 4.00 50 | 490 | 5.00
3 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 103 | 3740 | 10.48 (3074.0 30 340 | 3.00 40 | 400 | 4.00 50 | 490 | 5.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m)  Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 43
DOGC 3 extra Crane operator, dogman, welder
ESS 8
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 3
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 3
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3 One swaco hand for new shaker being assessed for Diamond
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 6
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 5 One trainee
Total | 79
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Drill 26 Dec 2005 |1 Day Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Fire Drill 26 Dec 2005 |1 Day Held weekly fire drill
JSA 27 Dec 2005 |0 Days Deck = 6, Mech = 3, Drill =
7,Welder = 2, Marine =1
Safety Meeting 26 Dec 2005 |1 Day Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 27 Dec 2005 |0 Days Safe = 2, Un-safe =5
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Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data

Available 2,540bbl |Losses 335bbl Equip. Descr. Mesh Size
Active 386.3bbl | Equipment 335ppl | Shakerl VSM 100 4x 165
Shaker2 VSM 100 4 x 120
Hole 1,882.7bbl
Shaker3 VSM 100 4x120
Reserve 271bbl Shakera BEM650 4x 165
Marine
Weather on 27 Dec 2005 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height ~Wave Dir.  Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ 12kn ‘ 45.0deg ‘1020.0mbar ‘ 18C° \ 0.2m 45.0deg 3s 1 320.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 269.0
3 216.0
272.0deg | 432.00klb |4444.20kb | 10m | 225.0deg |  8s A 2510
Comments 5 273.0
6 342.0
7 397.0
8 359.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip At rig recieving Crystal Item Unit Used Quantity
Ocean's cargo which -
was offloaded from the E:zzreulWater 43§
Pacific Wrangler at Drill Water 50
2330hrs Cement G 0
Cement HT (Silica) 54
Barite Bulk 89
On completion of recieving 9 lifts she will travel to the Crystal Ocean and wait for first light to transfer fuel and cargo.
Pacific Wrangler Arrived at rig 2315hrs, Item Unit Used Quantity
off loaded 9 lifts for Diesel 6213
Crystal Ocean. Fresh Water 195
Drill Water 620
Cement G 0
Cement HT (Silica) 0
Barite Bulk 0
Bentonite Bulk 42
Once Far Grip has completed her cargo transfer she will off load deck cargo.
Helicopter Movement
Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS 0925 /0940 12 /12
AUSTRALIA PTY LTD
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 17

28 Dec 2005 From: Ron King/ Webby Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -
Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 3277.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 3274.0m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001
Basin .
! Progress 162.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1511.8m | Daily Cost $ 503334
Drill Co. DOGC
Days from spud 12.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1511.8m | Cum Cost $ 13122004
Ri OCEAN PATRIOT .
9 Days on well 16.35 | FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 953
Wir Dpth(MSL) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL(MSL) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m

Current Op @ 0600
Planned Op

Drilling ahead at 3308.0 mMDRT in the Latrobe Group.
Drill ahead 311 mm (12 %4") hole.

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Drilled ahead from 3115.0 mMMDRT to 3277.0 mMDRT.

Near 70.3 Ma Sand
Near 70.3 Ma Sand
TD
TD

FORMATION
Name Top
Near 68.5 Ma Sand 3103.00m

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 28 Dec 2005

Cls
(RC)

Phse Op

From

To

Hrs

Depth

Activity Description

IH P DA

DA
(RE)

DA

0000

1030

1200

1030

1200

2400

10.50

1.50

12.00

3226.0m

3266.0m

3277.0m

Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3115m to 3226m MDRT

String wt 340klbs, Tq 6-14000ftlbs, 80-150 rpm surface, 180-256rpm DH, WOB
5-20klIbs, 3900psi, 875gpm. Boost riser while drilling.

ROP average10.57m/hr (including connections)

Survey results @3202.65m, 3.71deg, 48.97 azimuth

guidelines. Circulate while trying to maneouver rig with anchor winches.
Wind 35-40 knots, Seas 1.5m WSW, Swell 1.5m NE

Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3226m to 3277m MDRT

String wt 340klbs, Tq 6-14000ftlbs, 80-150 rpm surface, 180-256rpm DH, WOB
5-25klbs, 4100psi, 860gpm. Boost riser while drilling.

ROP average 4.25m/hr (including connections)

Survey results @3202.65m, 3.71deg, 48.97 azimuth

Drilling operations suspended due to riser flex joint bullseye reading exceeding "GEM's"

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on

29 Dec 2005

Phse Cls

(RC)

Op

From

To

Hrs

Depth

Activity Description

IH P DA

0000

0600

6.00

3308.0m

Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3277m to 3308m MDRT

String wt 350kIbs, Tq 4-14000ftlbs, 80-150 rpm surface, 180-256rpm DH, WOB
5-20klbs, 3800-4100psi, 860gpm. Boost riser while drilling.

ROP average 5.16m/hr (including connections)

Survey results @3260m, 3.66deg, 49.86 azimuth

Operations For Period Hrs to Hrs on

Phase Data to 2400hrs, 28 Dec 2005

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth

RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 25.75|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 25.75 1.073 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 44.75|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 70.50 2.938 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 100.50 4.188 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 117.00 4.875 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 118.00 4917 650.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 54|21 Dec 2005 |23 Dec 2005 172.00 7.167 1525.0m
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Phase Data to 2400hrs, 28 Dec 2005

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) \ 220.5[17 Dec 2005 |28 Dec 2005 | 392.50 16.354 3277.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $ 49325
Mud Type:KCL-NaCl-Polymer | API FL: 4.0cc/30min | Cl: 81500mg/l | Solids(%vol): 10% |Viscosity S7seclqt
PV 17cp
Sample-From: Active Pit | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: 8% | H20: 90% |vp 261b/100ft2
Time: 2100 |HTHP-FL: 12.0cc/30min | Hard/Ca: 260mg/l | Oil(%): 0% |Gels 10s 6
Gels 10 9
Weight: 10.30ppg | HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: 6 | Sand: 1.25 =
Fann 003 5
Temp: 32C° PM: pH: 9 [Fann 006 7
PF: 0.05 | PHPA: 1ppb |Fann 100 %
Fann 200 36
Comment NaCl 8%. Ditch magnet metal recovery 60 grams Fann 300 43
Fann 600 60
Bit#3 Wear | o1 D L B G 02 R

Bitwear Comments:

Size ("): 12.250in | IADC# M422 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run

Mfr: REED HYCALOG |WOB(avg) 13.20klb |No. Size Progress 162.0m | Cum. Progress 1752.0m

Type: PDC | RPM(avg) 140 | 2 28/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs 17.5h | Cum. On Btm Hrs 72.4h

Serial No.: 211010 |F.Rate  20.47bpm | 4 18/32nd" | |ADC Drill Hrs 22.5h | Cum IADC Drill Hrs 73.5h

Bit Model RSX 616 | SPP 3800psi Total Revs 275 | Cum Total Revs 1132

Depth In 1525.0m | HSI ROP(avg) 9.26 m/hr | ROP(avg) 24.20 m/hr

Depth Out TFA 2.197

Bit Comment

BHA #3

Weight(Wet) 40.00klb |Length 268.4m | Torque(max) 14000ft-Ibs | D.C. (1) Ann Velocity 256fpm

Wt Below Jar(Wet) 30.00klb | String 350.00kIb | Torque(Off.Btm) 3000ft-Ibs | D.C. (2) Ann Velocity 384fpm
Pick-Up 350.00kIb | Torque(On.Btm) 8000ft-lbs | H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
Slack-Off 360.00kIb D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm

BHA Run Description Annular velocity based on 900gpm

BHA Run Comment

Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.25m | 12.250in 211010 Reed Hycalog RSX 616M
Mud Motor 8.58m 9.625in 6.135in | 963006 244mm(9 5/8") Sperrydrill Lobe 6/7 -
5.0 stg Motor
XIO 1.22m 9.438in 2.875in | A639
Stab 1.81m | 12.125in 2.875in | 694776 Non-mag integral blade string stab
MWD 24.39m 8.000in 1.920in
DIR/HCIM-EWR-DGR-CTN-SLD-ACAL-H
8in DC 9.06m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600035
Stab 2.10m | 12.125in 2.875in | 47607 Integral blade string stabilizer
8in DC 8.68m 8.000in 2.875in | 1860026
Drilling Jars 9.31m 8.188in 3.063in | 11150D Drilling jars used in surface hole
section.
8in DC 8.81m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600031
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
5in HWDP 192.98m 5.000in 2.875in
Survey
MD Incl Azim TVD Vsec N/-S E/-W DLS Tool Type
(m) (deg) (deg) (m) (deg) (m) (m) (deg/30m)
3173.79 3.7 49.6 3170.67 80.0 67.8 42.4 0.1 MWD
3260.37 3.7 49.9 3257.07 71.4 71.4 46.5 0.2 MWD
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Bulk Stocks

Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 5.85 0 117.2
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 38.1
Diesel m3 0 23.3 0 351.9
Fresh Water m3 31 35.3 0 145.8
Drill Water m3 300 108.5 0 595.2
Cement G MT 0 0 79.9
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW  Eff (%) SPM SPP Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(in)  (ppY) (SPM)  (psi)  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (ps)) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
2 |12P160 6.000 | 10.30 97 101 | 4100 | 10.24 (3275.0 30 320 | 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
3 |12P160 6.000 | 10.30 97 101 | 4100 | 10.24 |3275.0 30 320 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m)  Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 43
DOGC 3 extra Crane operator, dogman, welder
ESS 8
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 3
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 3
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3 One swaco hand for new shaker being assessed for Diamond
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 6
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 5 One trainee
Total | 79
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Drill 26 Dec 2005 |2 Days Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Fire Drill 26 Dec 2005 |2 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 28 Dec 2005 |0 Days Deck =9, Drill = 3,Welder =
2,
Safety Meeting 26 Dec 2005 |2 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 28 Dec 2005 |0 Days Safe =5, Un-safe = 4
Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data
Available 3,140bbl | Losses 341bbl Equip. Descr. Mesh Size
Active 498.3bbl | Equipment 341bbl | Shakerl VSM 100 4x 165
Hole 1,956.7bbl Shaker2 VSM 100 4x 165
Shaker3 VSM 100 4x120
Reserve 685bbl Shaker4 BEM650 4x165
Marine
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Weather on 28 Dec 2005 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir. ~ Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ 10kn ‘ 225.0deg ‘1011.0mbar ‘ 20c° ‘ 1.0m 247.0deg 3s 1 247.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 269.0
3 176.0
272.0deg | 444.00klb |4656.20kb | 20m | 225.0deg |  8s . 256.0
Comments 5 265.0
6 333.0
7 298.0
8 282.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip 0100 | Currently at Crystal Item Unit Used Quantity
Ocean servicing her Diesel CuMir 788
T‘:eh?rg?ngirtgo Fresh Water CuMtr 73
q Drill Water CuMtr 50
Cement G Mt 0
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 89

SOF's at Departure from Patriot. Fuel 488m3, Drill water 50m3, potable water 73m3, Barite 89mt, Sil Cement 54mt.
Deprature time 0100hrs

Pacific Wrangler At rig Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 607.7
Fresh Water CuMtr 190
Drill Water CuMtr 320
Cement G Mt 132
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 0
Bentonite Bulk Mt 42

Passed 300m3 of drill water to rig.
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 18

29 Dec 2005 From: Ron King/ Webby Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -
Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 3385.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 3381.0m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001
Basi
asin Progress 108.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1511.8m | Daily Cost $ 462947
Drill Co. DOGC
Days from spud 13.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1511.8m | Cum Cost $ 13584951
Ri OCEAN PATRIOT .
9 Days on well 17.35 | FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 954
Wir Dpth(MSL) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL(MSL) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 Drilling ahead at XXXX.0 mMDRT in the Latrobe Group.
Planned Op Drill ahead 311 mm (12 %4") hole.
Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs
Drilled ahead from 3277.0 mMDRT to 3385.0 mMMDRT.
FORMATION
Name Top
Near 68.5 Ma Sand 3103.00m
Near 70.3 Ma Sand
Near 70.3 Ma Sand 3335.00m
TD
TD
Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 29 Dec 2005
Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
IH P DA 0000 |1530 |15.50 |3356.0m |Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3277m to 3356m MDRT
String wt 350kIbs, Tq 4-14000ftlbs, 80-150 rpm surface, 180-256rpm DH, WOB
4-25kIbs, 3800-4100psi, 840-900gpm. Boost riser while drilling.
ROP average 5.16m/hr (including connections)
Survey results @3317m, 3.72deg, 47.74 azimuth
IH TP DA 1530 |1630 |1.00 3356.0m | Change out piston on #3 mud pump. fault find and repair blower motor fault.
(RE)
IH P DA 1630 |2400 |7.50 3385.0m | Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3356m to 3385m MDRT
String wt 350klbs, Tq 4-14000ftlbs, 100-150 rpm surface, 180-256rpm DH, WOB
4-25kIbs, 4200psi, 890gpm. Boost riser while drilling.
ROP average 3.86m/hr (including connections)
Max gas for 24hr period 0.306%
Survey results @3346m, 3.65deg, 50.41 azimuth
Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 30 Dec 2005
Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
IH P DA 0000 |0600 |6.00 0.0m Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3385m to 3397m MDRT
String wt 350klbs, Tq 4-14000ftlbs, 100-150 rpm surface, 180-256rpm DH, WOB
4-25klbs, 4200psi, 890gpm. Boost riser while drilling.
ROP average 3.86m/hr (including connections)
Survey results @m, deg, azimuth
Operations For Period Hrs to Hrs on
Phase Data to 2400hrs, 29 Dec 2005
Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 25.75/05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 25.75 1.073 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 44.75|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 70.50 2.937 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 100.50 4.187 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 117.00 4.875 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1/17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 118.00 4917 650.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 54|21 Dec 2005 |23 Dec 2005 172.00 7.167 1525.0m
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Phase Data to 2400hrs, 29 Dec 2005

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) \ 244.5[17 Dec 2005 |29 Dec 2005 | 416.50 17.354 3385.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $ 2468
Mud Type:KCL-NaCl-Polymer | API FL: 4.0cc/30min | Cl: 82000mg/l | Solids(%vol): 10% |Viscosity S7seclqt
PV 17cp
Sample-From: Active Pit | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: 7% | H20: 90% |vp 30lb/100f2
Time: 2100 |HTHP-FL: 12.0cc/30min | Hard/Ca: 320mg/l | Oil(%): 0% |Gels 10s 7
Gels 10 9
Weight: 10.20ppg | HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: 6 | Sand: 1.25 =
Fann 003 6
Temp: 33C° PM: pH: 9 [Fann 006 8
PF: 0.05 | PHPA: 1ppb |Fann 100 2
Fann 200 40
Comment NaCl 8%. Ditch magnet metal recovery 52grams Fann 300 47
Fann 600 64
Bit#3 Wear | o1 D L B G 02 R

Bitwear Comments:

Size ("): 12.250in | IADC# M422 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run

Mfr: REED HYCALOG |WOB(avg) 13.20klb |No. Size Progress 108.0m | Cum. Progress 1860.0m

Type: PDC | RPM(avg) 100 | 2 28/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs 18.3h | Cum. On Btm Hrs 90.7h

Serial No.: 211010 |F.Rate  20.26bpm | 4 18/32nd" | |ADC Drill Hrs 0.0h | Cum IADC Drill Hrs 73.5h

Bit Model RSX 616 | SPP 3800psi Total Revs 275 | Cum Total Revs 1407

Depth In 1525.0m | HSI ROP(avg) 5.90 m/hr | ROP(avg) 20.51 m/hr

Depth Out TFA 2.197

Bit Comment

BHA #3

Weight(Wet) 40.00klb |Length 268.4m | Torque(max) 14000ft-Ibs | D.C. (1) Ann Velocity 256fpm

Wt Below Jar(Wet) 30.00klb | String 350.00kIb | Torque(Off.Btm) 3000ft-Ibs | D.C. (2) Ann Velocity 384fpm
Pick-Up 350.00kIb | Torque(On.Btm) 6000ft-lbs | H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
Slack-Off 360.00kIb D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm

BHA Run Description Annular velocity based on 900gpm

BHA Run Comment

Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.25m | 12.250in 211010 Reed Hycalog RSX 616M
Mud Motor 8.58m 9.625in 6.135in | 963006 244mm(9 5/8") Sperrydrill Lobe 6/7 -
5.0 stg Motor
XIO 1.22m 9.438in 2.875in | A639
Stab 1.81m | 12.125in 2.875in | 694776 Non-mag integral blade string stab
MWD 24.39m 8.000in 1.920in
DIR/HCIM-EWR-DGR-CTN-SLD-ACAL-H
8in DC 9.06m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600035
Stab 2.10m | 12.125in 2.875in | 47607 Integral blade string stabilizer
8in DC 8.68m 8.000in 2.875in | 1860026
Drilling Jars 9.31m 8.188in 3.063in | 11150D Drilling jars used in surface hole
section.
8in DC 8.81m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600031
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
5in HWDP 192.98m 5.000in 2.875in
Survey
MD Incl Azim TVD Vsec N/-S E/-W DLS Tool Type
(m) (deg) (deg) (m) (deg) (m) (m) (deg/30m)
3317.48 3.7 47.7 3314.07 88.8 73.9 49.3 0.1 MWD
3346.36 3.7 50.4 3342.89 90.6 75.1 50.7 0.2 MWD
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Bulk Stocks

Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 0 117.2
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 38.1
Diesel m3 0 18.7 0 333.2
Fresh Water m3 29 15.4 0 159.4
Drill Water m3 0 113 0 482.2
Cement G MT 0 0 79.9
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW Eff(%) SPM SPP  Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(in)  (ppY) (SPM)  (psi)  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (ps)) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
2 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 101 | 4200 | 10.24 (3275.0 30 320 | 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
3 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 101 | 4200 | 10.24 (3275.0 30 320 | 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m)  Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 41
DOGC 3 extra Crane operator, dogman, welder
ESS 8
NEXUS 7 Michele Zaunbrecher, Julie Ang
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 3
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 2
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3 One swaco hand for new shaker being assessed for Diamond
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 6
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 5 One trainee
Total | 78
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Drill 26 Dec 2005 |3 Days Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Environental Issue 29 Dec 2005 |0 Days Environmental Audit Carry out environmental audit by Nexus shorebase
personnel.
Fire Drill 26 Dec 2005 |3 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 29 Dec 2005 |0 Days Deck = 5, Mech = 3, Drill =
2,Welder = 2,
Safety Meeting 26 Dec 2005 |3 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 29 Dec 2005 |0 Days Safe = 2, Un-safe = 8
Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data
Available 2,907bbl |Losses 235bbl Equip. Descr. Mesh Size
Active 496bbl | Equipment 235bbl | Shakerl VSM 100 4x 165
Hole 2.006bbl Shaker2 VSM 100 2x120/2x 165
Shaker3 VSM 100 2x120/2x 165
Reserve 405bbl Shaker4 BEM650 2x120/2x 165
Marine
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Weather on 29 Dec 2005 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir. ~ Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ 5kn ‘ 270.0deg ‘1014.0mbar ‘ 17¢° ‘ 2.0m 270.0deg 2s 1 245.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 269.0
3 209.0
272.0deg | 456.00klb |4578.40kb | 20m | 2480deg | 7 A 2600
Comments 5 373.0
6 353.0
7 304.0
8 278.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 357
Fresh Water CuMtr 67
Drill Water CuMtr 50
Cement G Mt 0
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 89
SOF's:
Fuel 362m3, Potable water 70m3, Drill water 50m3, silica cmt 54t, barite 89t.
Fuel usage by Crystal Ocean 126m3.
Pacific Wrangler At rig Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 607.7
Fresh Water CuMtr 190
Drill Water CuMtr 320
Cement G Mt 132
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 0
Bentonite Bulk Mt 42
Passed 300m3 of drill water to rig.
Helicopter Movement
Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS 0920 /0925 9/10
AUSTRALIA PTY LTD
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 19

30 Dec 2005 From: Ron King/ Geoff Webster Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -
Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 3402.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 3398.5m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001
Basin .
! Progress 17.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1511.8m | Daily Cost $ 593639
Drill Co. DOGC
Days from spud 14.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1511.8m | Cum Cost $ 14178590
Ri OCEAN PATRIOT .
9 Days on well 18.35 | FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 955
Wir Dpth(MSL) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL(MSL) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 RIH with 5" DP to mMDRT.
Planned Op Drill ahead 311 mm (12 %4") hole.

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Drilled ahead from 3385.0 mMDRT to 3402.0 mMDRT. POOH for bit trip. Downloaded LWD memory. Made up new PDC bit and new motor. Started to
RIH.

FORMATION
Name Top
Near 68.5 Ma Sand 3103.00m

Near 70.3 Ma Sand
Near 70.3 Ma Sand

TD
TD
Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 30 Dec 2005
Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
IH P DA 0000 |0200 |2.00 |0.0m Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3385m to 3397m MDRT
String wt 350klbs, Tq 4-14000ftlbs, 100-150 rpm surface, 180-256rpm DH, WOB
4-25klbs, 4200psi, 890gpm. Boost riser while drilling.
ROP average 3.86m/hr (including connections)
Survey results @3375m, 3.7deg, 76.2 azimuth
IH TP DA 0200 |0230 |0.50 |3390.0m |Elmagco auxillary brake problems. fault find and make repairs.
(RE) Continue with 50% power available to Elmagco
IH P DA 0230 |0830 |6.00 |3402.0m |Drilled 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3390m to 3402m MDRT
String wt 355klbs, Tq 4-14000ftlbs, 100-150 rpm surface, 180-256rpm DH, WOB
18-25klbs, 3900-4300psi, 875gpm. Boost riser while drilling. Average ROP = 2m/hr
IH P TO 0830 [0930 |1.00 |3402.0m |Flow checked and POOH from 3402m to 2867m, pulled tight @ 55kIbs overpull
IH P REA 0930 [1000 |0.50 |[3402.0m |Made up top drive and back ream from 2867m to 2819m
IH P TO 1000 [1630 |6.50 |3402.0m |Continued to POOH from 2819m to 268m, flow checked @ casing shoe. Calibrated
MWD caliper @ 1475m
IH P TO 1630 (1830 |2.00 |3402.0m |POOH with 311mm (12 1/4") BHA, remove radioactive source from LWD, broke off bit
(4-6-WT-S-X-1-RO-PR) and laid out mud motor
IH P TO 1830 [2030 |2.00 |3402.0m |Picked up LWD from derrick and download data. Racked back same in derrick
IH P RS 2030 [2100 |0.50 |[3402.0m |Serviced top drive and pipe handler. Checked compensator chains
IH P TI 2100 [2300 |2.00 |3402.0m |Picked up new motor (Sperrydrill 6/7 5 stage w/ O degree bend), made up new bit (Reed
RSX616M) and RIH with 311mm (12 1/4") BHA
IH P Tl 2300 [2400 |1.00 |3402.0m |Loaded radio active source into LWD and initiate tools
Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 31 Dec 2005
Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
IH P Tl 0000 |0130 [1.50 |3402.0m |Continued to RIH with 12 1/4" BHA. Shallow pulse test MWD with 750 GPM and 750
psi, good test
IH P TI 0130 |0300 |1.50 |[3402.0m |Picked up 27 joints 5" DP from catwalk
IH P Tl 0300 |0600 |3.00 |3402.0m |Continued to RIH with 12 1/4" BHA and 5" DP from Derrick

Operations For Period Hrs to Hrs on
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Phase Data to 2400hrs, 30 Dec 2005

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 25.75|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 25.75 1.073 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 44.75|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 70.50 2.937 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 100.50 4.187 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 117.00 4.875 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 118.00 4917 650.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 54|21 Dec 2005 |23 Dec 2005 172.00 7.167 1525.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 268.5/17 Dec 2005 |30 Dec 2005 440.50 18.354 3402.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $ 21860
Mud Type:KCL-NaCl-Polymer | API FL: 4.0cc/30min | Cl: 82500mg/l | Solids(%vol): 10% |Viscosity 60sec/qt
Sample-From: Active Pit | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: 7% |H20: 90% \F;\F/’ 28|b/l](-:(3)(;§
Time: 2100 | HTHP-FL: 11.8cc/30min | Hard/Ca: 260mg/l | Oil(%): 0% |Gels 10s 7
Weight: 10.20ppg | HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: 7 | Sand: 1 i:;lo(;: 2
Temp: 32C° PM: pH: 7 |Fann 006 7
PF: 0.04 | PHPA: 1ppb |~ ;gg Z
Comment NaCl 8%. Fann 300 44
Fann 600 60
Bit#3 Wear | o1 D B G 02 R
4 6 WT S 2 RO PR
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 12.250in | IADC# M422 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: REED HYCALOG | WOB(avg) 13.20klb |No. Size Progress 17.0m | Cum. Progress 1877.0m
Type: PDC | RPM(avg) 100 | 2 28/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs 6.0h | Cum. On Btm Hrs 96.7h
Serial No.: 211010 |F.Rate  20.26bpm | 4 18/32nd" | |ADC Drill Hrs 8.0h | Cum IADC Drill Hrs 81.5h
Bit Model RSX 616 | SPP 3800psi Total Revs 1463 | Cum Total Revs 2870
Depth In 1525.0m | HSI ROP(avg) 2.83 m/hr | ROP(avg) 19.41 m/hr
Depth Out 3402.0m | TFA 2.197
Bit Comment
Bit# 4 Wear | o1 D L B G 02 R
NO
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 12.250in | IADC# M422 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: REED HYCALOG | WOB(avg) No. Size Progress Cum. Progress 0.0m
Type: PDC | RPM(avg) 2 28/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs Cum. On Btm Hrs 0.0h
Serial No.: 211406 | F.Rate 4 18/32nd" ||ADC Drill Hrs Cum IADC Drill Hrs 0.0h
Bit Model RSX 616 | SPP Total Revs Cum Total Revs 0
Depth In 3402.0m | HSI ROP(avg) N/A | ROP(avg) 0.00 m/hr
Depth Out TFA 2.197
Bit Comment
BHA # 3
Weight(Wet) 40.00klb | Length 268.4m | Torque(max) 14000ft-Ibs | D.C. (1) Ann Velocity 256fpm
Wt Below Jar(Wet) 30.00klb | String 350.00kIb | Torque(Off.Btm) 3000ft-Ibs | D.C. (2) Ann Velocity 384fpm
Pick-Up 350.00klb | Torque(On.Btm) 6000ft-Ibs | H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
Slack-Off 360.00kIb D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm

BHA Run Description

Annular velocity based on 900gpm

BHA Run Comment
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PC.

Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.25m | 12.250in 211010 Reed Hycalog RSX 616M
Mud Motor 8.58m 9.625in 6.135in | 963006 244mm(9 5/8") Sperrydrill Lobe 6/7 -
5.0 stg Motor
XIO 1.22m 9.438in 2.875in | A639
Stab 1.81m | 12.125in 2.875in | 694776 Non-mag integral blade string stab
MWD 24.39m 8.000in 1.920in
DIR/HCIM-EWR-DGR-CTN-SLD-ACAL-HPC.
8in DC 9.06m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600035
Stab 2.10m | 12.125in 2.875in | 47607 Integral blade string stabilizer
8in DC 8.68m 8.000in 2.875in | 1860026
Drilling Jars 9.31m 8.188in 3.063in | 11150D Drilling jars used in surface hole
section.
8in DC 8.81m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600031
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
5in HWDP 192.98m 5.000in 2.875in
BHA #4
Weight(Wet) 57.00klb | Length 268.3m | Torque(max) D.C. (1) Ann Velocity 256fpm
Wt Below Jar(Wet) 30.00klb | String Torque(Off.Btm) D.C. (2) Ann Velocity 384fpm
Pick-Up Torque(On.Btm) H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
Slack-Off D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
BHA Run Description Annular velocity based on 900gpm
BHA Run Comment
Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.24m | 12.250in 211406 Reed Hycalog RSX 616M
Mud Motor 8.54m 9.625in 6.135in | 963271 244mm(9 5/8") Sperrydrill Lobe 6/7 -
5.0 stg Motor
XIO 1.22m 9.438in 2.875in | S18819-11
Stab 1.81m | 12.125in 2.875in | 694776 Non-mag integral blade string stab
MWD 24.39m 8.000in 1.920in
DIR/HCIM-EWR-DGR-CTN-SLD-ACAL-H
8in DC 9.06m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600035
Stab 2.10m | 12.125in 2.875in | 47607 Integral blade string stabilizer
8in DC 8.68m 8.000in 2.875in | 1860026
Drilling Jars 9.31m 8.188in 3.063in | 11150D Drilling jars used in surface hole
section.
8in DC 8.81m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600031
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
5in HWDP 192.98m 5.000in 2.875in
Survey
MD Incl Azim TVD Vsec N/-S E/-W DLS Tool Type
(m) (deg) (deg) (m) (deg) (m) (m) (deg/30m)
3375.00 |37 54.0 (3371.50  |923 76.2 (521 02 MWD
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 3.42 0 113.8
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 38.1
Diesel m3 100 27.1 0 406.1
Fresh Water m3 26 25.1 0.5 160.8
Drill Water m3 0 78.3 -0.4 403.5
Cement G MT 0 0 79.9
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW Eff(%) SPM SPP  Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
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Pumps

Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
(in)  (ppY) (SPM)  (psi)  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (ps)) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
2 | 12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 101 | 4200 | 10.24 |3275.0 30 320 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
3 | 12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 101 | 4200 | 10.24 |3275.0 30 320 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m) Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 40
DOGC 3 extra Crane operator, dogman, welder
ESS 8
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 3
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 2
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3 One swaco hand for new shaker being assessed for Diamond
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 6
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 5 One trainee
Total | 75
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Drill 26 Dec 2005 |4 Days Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Environental Issue 29 Dec 2005 |1 Day Environmental Audit Carry out environmental audit by Nexus shorebase
personnel.
Fire Drill 26 Dec 2005 |4 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 29 Dec 2005 |1 Day Deck = 6, Mech = 3, Drill =
7,Welder = 2, Marine =1
Safety Meeting 26 Dec 2005 |4 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 29 Dec 2005 |1 Day Safe =2
Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data
Available 3,204bbl | Losses Obbl Equip. Descr. Mesh Size
Hole 2.103.9bbl Shaker2 VSM 100 4x 165
Shaker3 VSM 100 4x120
Reserve 740bbl Shakerd BEM650 4% 165
Marine
Weather on 30 Dec 2005 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir.  Wave Period Anchors Tension (klb)
10.0nm ‘ 15kn ] 0.0deg ‘1014.0mbar ‘ 18C° ] 0.5m 0.0deg 2s 1 247.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 269.0
3 198.0
272.0deg ‘ 456.00klb ‘ 4578.40klb ‘ 1.0m ‘ 270.0deg \ 7s . 262.0
Comments 5 366.0
6 359.0
7 298.0
8 284.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip Standby Ocean Patriot Iltem Unit Used Quantity

Diesel CuMtr

347
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Item Unit Used Quantity

Fresh Water CuMtr 67
Drill Water CuMtr 50
Cement G Mt 0
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 89

Depart Ocean Patriot 07:00 for Crystal Ocean, (Fuel on board = 355m3)

Arrive Ocean Patriot 15:43 from Crystal Ocean (Fuel on board = 347m3) Fuel hose caught in Prop.

Pacific Wrangler 18:30 | Enroute to Eden Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 484
Fresh Water CuMtr 185
Drill Water CuMtr 320
Cement G Mt 132
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 0
Bentonite Bulk Mt 42

Depart for Crystal Ocean @ 16:50 from Ocean Patriot. Fuel on board = 487.2m3). Unable to transfer fuel to Crystal Ocean, Depart for Eden @ 18:30 (Fuel on board =

484m3)

Helicopter Movement

Flight #

Company

Arr/Dep. Time

Pax In/Out

Comment

BRISTOW HELICOPTERS
AUSTRALIA PTY LTD

0910 /0933

9/12
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 20

31 Dec 2005 From: Ron King/ Geoff Webster Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -
Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 3473.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 3469.3m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001
Basin | pragress 71.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1511.8m | Daily Cost $0
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 15.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1511.8m | Cum Cost $ 11635849
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 18.77 | FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 956
Wir Dpth(MSL) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL(MSL) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 Drilling ahead 311 mm (12 1/4") hole at 3524.0 mMMDRT.
Planned Op Drill ahead 311 mm (12 1/4") hole

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

RIH to 3330.0 mMDRT. Logged down over sandstone from 3335.0 mMDRT to 3343m MDRT . Reamed down to bottom. Commenced drilling ahead
from 3402.0 mMDRT to 3473m MDRT

FORMATION
Name Top
Latrobe 2824.00m
Base Funa Flounder Channel 2835.00m
Top 67.5 Ma Sand 2836.00m
Near 68.5 Ma Sand 3103.00m
TD
Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 31 Dec 2005
Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
IH P TI 0000 |0130 |1.50 |3402.0m |Continued to RIH with 12 1/4" BHA. Shallow pulse test MWD with 750 GPM and 750
psi, good test
IH P TI 0130 |0300 |1.50 |[3402.0m |Picked up 27 joints 5" DP from catwalk
IH P Tl 0300 |0900 |6.00 |3402.0m |Continued to RIH with 12 1/4" BHA and 5" DP from Derrick to 3330m MDRT
IH P RW 0900 |1200 |3.00 3402.0m | Reamed and washed from 3330m MDRT to 3380m MDRT. Performed confirmation
pass with LWD tools across interval
IH P RW 1200 (1230 |0.50 |3402.0m |Washed and reamed last single to bottom
IH P DA 1230 (2400 |11.50 |3473.0m |Drilled ahead 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3402m MDRT to 3473m MDRT, Average ROP
=6.2m/hr, Flow rate = 875 GPM, WOB = 17 - 24 kibs, Rotary RPM = 80 - 110, Bit RPM
=190 - 220, Tq = 5000 - 9500 ft/Ibs,

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 01 Jan 2006

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)

IH P DA 0000 |0600 |6.00 |3524.0m |Continued to drill 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3473m MDRT to 3524m MDRT

Average ROP = 8.5m/hr, WOB = 20-24 klbs, Rotary RPM = 110, DH RPM = 228, Tq =
4500-8000 ftlb, Flow = 872 GPM

Encountered drilling break at 3481m MDRT to 3487m MDRT, flow checked well
(76m/hr, Gas = 45 units)

Max Gas = 92 units @ 3500m MDRT

Operations For Period Hrs to Hrs on
Phase Data to 2400hrs, 31 Dec 2005

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth

RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 23.5/05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 23.50 0.979 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 33|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 56.50 2.354 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 86.50 3.604 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 103.00 4.292 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 104.00 4.333 650.0m
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Phase Data to 2400hrs, 31 Dec 2005

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 54|21 Dec 2005 |23 Dec 2005 158.00 6.583 1525.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 292.5|17 Dec 2005 |31 Dec 2005 450.50 18.771 3473.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $ 302
Mud Type:KCL-NaCl-Polymer | API FL: 3.6¢c/30min | Cl: 84000mg/l | Solids(%vol): 10% |Viscosity 62sec/qt
PV 17cp
Sample-From: Active Pit | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: 7% | H20: 90% |yp 331b/100f2
Time: 20:30 | HTHP-FL: 12.0cc/30min | Hard/Ca: 200mg/l | Oil(%): 0% |Gels 10s 8
Gels 101 11
Weight: 10.20ppg | HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: 6 | sand: 15 o 0
Fann 003 7
Temp: 29C° PM: 0.1 |pH: 9 |Fann 006 9
PF: 0.05 | PHPA: 1ppb [P 100 %
Fann 200 42
Comment NaCl 8%. Fann 300 50
Ditch magnet recovery = 142 grams Fann 600 67
Bit#4 Wear | o1 D B G 02 R
NO
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 12.250in | IADC# M422 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: REED HYCALOG | WOB(avg) 22.00klb |No. Size Progress 71.0m | Cum. Progress 71.0m
Type: PDC | RPM(avg) 110 | 2 28/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs 11.8h | Cum. On Btm Hrs 11.8h
Serial No.: 211406 |F.Rate 875.00bpm | 4 18/32nd" | |ADC Drill Hrs 11.5h | Cum IADC Drill Hrs 11.5h
Bit Model RSX 616 | SPP 4000psi Total Revs Cum Total Revs 0
Depth In 3402.0m | HSI ROP(avg) 6.02 m/hr | ROP(avg) 6.02 m/hr
Depth Out TFA 2.197
Bit Comment
BHA # 4
Weight(Wet) 57.00klb | Length 268.3m | Torque(max) 9500ft-Ibs | D.C. (1) Ann Velocity 256fpm
Wt Below Jar(Wet) 30.00klb | String 365.00kIb | Torque(Off.Btm) 4000ft-Ibs | D.C. (2) Ann Velocity 384fpm
Pick-Up 355.00klb | Torque(On.Btm) 7000ft-Ibs | H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
Slack-Off 365.00kIb D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
BHA Run Description Annular velocity based on 900gpm
BHA Run Comment
Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.24m | 12.250in 211406 Reed Hycalog RSX 616M
Mud Motor 8.54m 9.625in 6.135in | 963271 244mm(9 5/8") Sperrydrill Lobe 6/7 -
5.0 stg Motor
XIO 1.22m 9.438in 2.875in | S18819-11
Stab 1.81m | 12.125in 2.875in | 694776 Non-mag integral blade string stab
MWD 24.39m 8.000in 1.920in
DIR/HCIM-EWR-DGR-CTN-SLD-ACAL-H
8in DC 9.06m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600035
Stab 2.10m | 12.125in 2.875in | 47607 Integral blade string stabilizer
8in DC 8.68m 8.000in 2.875in | 1860026
Drilling Jars 9.31m 8.188in 3.063in | 11150D Drilling jars used in surface hole
section.
8in DC 8.81m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600031
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
5in HWDP 192.98m 5.000in 2.875in
Survey
MD Incl Azim TVD Vsec N/-S E/-W DLS Tool Type
(m) (deg) (deg) (m) (deg) (m) (m) (deg/30m)
340440  [35 [54.9 (3400.80  [94.1 177.3 53.6 0.2 \
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Survey

MD Incl Azim TVD Vsec N/-S E/-W DLS Tool Type
(m) (deg) (deg) (m) (deg) (m) (m) (deg/30m)
3432.80 3.6 52.0 3429.16 95.7 78.3 55.0 0.2
3461.32 3.5 52.0 3457.63 97.4 79.4 56.4 0.1
3490.24 3.4 50.3 3486.49 99.1 80.5 57.8 0.1
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 0 113.8
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 38.1
Diesel m3 0 15.8 0 390.3
Fresh Water m3 29 26.6 0 163.2
Drill Water m3 0 24 0.1 379.6
Cement G MT 0 0 79.9
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW  Eff (%) SPM SPP Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(in)  (ppY) (SPM)  (psi)  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (ps)) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
2 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 102 | 4200 | 10.38 [3440.0 30 350 3.00 40 | 440 | 4.00 50 | 525 | 5.00
3 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 102 | 4200 | 10.38 (3440.0 30 350 | 3.00 40 | 440 | 4.00 50 | 525 | 5.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m)  Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 40
DOGC 3 extra Crane operator, dogman, welder
ESS 8
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 3
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 2
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3 One swaco hand for new shaker being assessed for Diamond
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 6
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 5 One trainee
Total | 75
HSE Summary
Events Date of last ~ Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Drill 26 Dec 2005 |5 Days Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Environental Issue 29 Dec 2005 |2 Days Environmental Audit Carry out environmental audit by Nexus shorebase
personnel.
Fire Drill 26 Dec 2005 |5 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 31 Dec 2005 |0 Days Deck = 8, Drill = 7,Welding =
2, Marine =1
Man Overboard Dirill 30 Dec 2005 |1 Day Held Man Over Board Drill
Safety Meeting 26 Dec 2005 |5 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 31 Dec 2005 |0 Days Safe = 4, Un-safe = 4
Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data
Available 2,956bbl |Losses 100bbl Equip. Descr. Mesh Size
Active 409.8bbl | Equipment 100bb| | Shakerl VSM 100 4x 165
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Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data

Hole 2,046.2bbl Equip. Descr. Mesh Size
Reserve 500bbl Shaker2 VSM 100 4 x 165
Shaker3 VSM 100 1x 120, 3 X 165
Shaker4 BEM650 1X 120, 3x 165
Marine
Weather on 31 Dec 2005 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir.  Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ 15kn ’ 45.0deg ‘1015.0mbar ‘ 20C° ’ 0.5m 45.0deg 2s 1 247.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 269.0
3 198.0
272.0deg | 456.00kib |4578.40kb | 10m | 2250deg |  6s A 2620
Comments 5 366.0
6 359.0
7 298.0
8 284.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip 20:30 | Off Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 340
Fresh Water CuMtr 61
Drill Water CuMtr 50
Cement G Mt 0
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 89
Depart Ocean Patriot ETA Melbourne 2 Jan 2006 @ 02:00
SOF's:
Fuel 340m3, Potable water 61m3, Drill water 50m3, silica cmt 54t, barite 89t.
Pacific Wrangler 20:30 Standby Ocean Patriot Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 467.4
Fresh Water CuMtr 175
Drill Water CuMtr 320
Cement G Mt 132
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 0
Bentonite Bulk Mt 42
Loaded electric line logging tools in Eden, sail to Ocean Patriot
Helicopter Movement
Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS / / No Flights today

AUSTRALIAPTY LTD
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 21

01 Jan 2006 From: Ron King/ Geoff Webster Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -
Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 3571.0m Cur. Hole Size 12.250in AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 3567.1m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001
Basin .
! Progress 98.0m Shoe TVDBRT 1511.8m Daily Cost $ 466881
Drill Co. DOGC
Days from spud 16.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1511.8m | Cum Cost $ 15076709
Ri OCEAN PATRIOT .
9 Days on well 19.77 FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 957
Wir Dpth(MSL) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL(MSL) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 POOH from 85m MDRT and inspected BHA for washout
Planned Op Drill ahead 311 mm (12 1/4") hole to TD.

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Drilled ahead from 3473.0 mMDRT to 3571.0 mMDRT. POOH for suspected washout.

FORMATION

Name Top

Base Funa Flounder Channel 2835.00m

Top 67.5 Ma Sand 2836.00m

Near 68.5 Ma Sand 3103.00m

Near 70.3 Ma Sand 3478.00m

TD

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 01 Jan 2006

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description

(RC)

IH P DA 0000 |1830 |18.50 |3571.0m |Continued to drill 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3473m MDRT to 3571m MDRT

Average ROP = 5.3m/hr, WOB = 20-24 klbs, Rotary RPM = 110, DH RPM = 228, Tq =
6000-8000 ftlb, Flow = 872 GPM

Encountered drilling break at 3481m MDRT to 3487m MDRT, flow checked well
(76m/hr, Gas = 45 units)

Max Gas = 186 units @ 3543.5m MDRT

IH P WSH [1830 |2400 |550 |3571.0m |Conducted 15 minute flow check, good. POOH wet, checking for washout. Pulled 2
stands and made up top drive, circulated to confirm continued pressure loss. POOH 10
stands, flow checked 10 minutes, good. Continued POOH checking for washout.
Visually inspected tool joint seal faces of each stand for wear.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 02 Jan 2006
Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)

IH P WSH |0000 |0600 |6.00 |3571.0m |Continued POOH checking for washout. Visually inspect tool joint seal faces of each
stand for wear. Flow checked at casing shoe and at HWDP. Downloaded sources from
LWD tools. POOH and inspected BHA for washout. Broke off bit and laid out motor

Operations For Period Hrs to Hrs on
Phase Data to 2400hrs, 01 Jan 2006

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth

RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 23.5|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 23.50 0.979 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 33|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 56.50 2.354 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 86.50 3.604 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 103.00 4.292 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1(17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 104.00 4.333 650.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 54|21 Dec 2005 |23 Dec 2005 158.00 6.583 1525.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 316.5/17 Dec 2005 |01 Jan 2006 474.50 19.771 3571.0m
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oC.

WBM Data Cost Today $ 20199
Mud Type:KCL-NaCl-Polymer | API FL: 3.6¢c/30min | Cl: 82000mg/l | Solids(%vol): 10% |Viscosity 62sec/qt
PV 18cp
Sample-From: Active Pit | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: 7% |H20: 90% |vp 271b/100f2
Time: 19:00 | HTHP-FL: 12.0cc/30min | Hard/Ca: 260mg/l | Oil(%): 0% |Gels 10s 7
Gels 10 9
Weight: 10.20ppg | HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: 6 | Sand: 1.25 —n
Fann 003 6
Temp: 33C° PM: 0.2 |pH: 9 |Fann 006 8
PF: 0.04 | PHPA: 1ppb |Fann100 2
Fann 200 37
Comment NaCl 8%. Fann 300 45
Ditch magnet recovery = 220 grams Fann 600 64
Bit#4 Wear | o1 D L B G 02 R
NO
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 12.250in | IADC# M422 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: REED HYCALOG | WOB(avg) 24.30kib |No. Size Progress 98.0m | Cum. Progress 169.0m
Type: PDC | RPM(avg) 2 28/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs 15.2h | Cum. On Btm Hrs 27.0h
Serial No.: 211406 |F.Rate  18.90bpm | 4 18/32nd" | |ADC Drill Hrs 18.5h | Cum IADC Drill Hrs 30.0h
Bit Model RSX 616 | SPP 3737psi Total Revs Cum Total Revs 0
Depth In 3402.0m |HSI ROP(avg) 6.45 m/hr | ROP(avg) 6.26 m/hr
Depth Out TFA 2.197
Bit Comment
BHA #4
Weight(Wet) 57.00klb | Length 268.3m | Torque(max) 14ft-lbs | D.C. (1) Ann Velocity 256fpm
Wt Below Jar(Wet) 30.00klb | String 365.00klb | Torque(Off.Btm) 5ft-lbs | D.C. (2) Ann Velocity 384fpm
Pick-Up 355.00kIb | Torque(On.Btm) 8ft-Ibs | H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
Slack-Off 365.00kIb D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
BHA Run Description Annular velocity based on 900gpm
BHA Run Comment
Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.24m | 12.250in 211406 Reed Hycalog RSX 616M
Mud Motor 8.54m 9.625in 6.135in | 963271 244mm(9 5/8") Sperrydrill Lobe 6/7 -
5.0 stg Motor
XIO 1.22m 9.438in 2.875in | S18819-11
Stab 1.81m | 12.125in 2.875in | 694776 Non-mag integral blade string stab
MWD 24.39m 8.000in 1.920in
DIR/HCIM-EWR-DGR-CTN-SLD-ACAL-H
8in DC 9.06m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600035
Stab 2.10m | 12.125in 2.875in | 47607 Integral blade string stabilizer
8in DC 8.68m 8.000in 2.875in | 1860026
Drilling Jars 9.31m 8.188in 3.063in | 11150D Drilling jars used in surface hole
section.
8in DC 8.81m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600031
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
5in HWDP 192.98m 5.000in 2.875in
Survey
MD Incl Azim TVD Vsec N/-S E/-W DLS Tool Type
(m) (deg) (deg) (m) (deg) (m) (m) (deg/30m)
3519.26 33 50.1 3515.46 100.7 81.6 59.1 0.1 MWD
3547.59 3.3 50.0 3543.75 102.3 82.6 60.3 0.0 MWD
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 0 113.8
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Bulk Stocks

Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 38.1
Diesel m3 0 27.8 0 362.5
Fresh Water m3 28 30.5 0.1 160.8
Drill Water m3 0 108.5 -0.3 270.8
Cement G MT 0 0 79.9
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW  Eff (%) SPM SPP Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(i) (ppg) (SPM)  (ps))  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
2 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 101 | 4100 | 10.24 (3275.0 30 320 | 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
3 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 101 | 4100 | 10.24 (3275.0 30 320 | 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m)  Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m TVD (m)
650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 43 extra Crane operator, dogman, welder
ESS 8
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 3
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 2
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3 One swaco hand for new shaker being assessed for Diamond
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 6
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 5 One trainee
Total | 75
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Dirill 01 Jan 2006 |0 Days Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Environental Issue 29 Dec 2005 |3 Days Environmental Audit Environmental audit by Nexus shorebase personnel.
Fire Drill 01 Jan 2006 |0 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 01 Jan 2006 |0 Days Deck = 6, Drill = 6, Welder =
2,Mech =1
Man Overboard Dirill 30 Dec 2005 |2 Days Held Man Over Board Dirill
Safety Meeting 01 Jan 2006 |0 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 01 Jan 2006 |0 Days Safe =7, Un-safe = 2
Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data
Available 3,276bbl | Losses Obbl Equip. Descr. Mesh Size
Active 4550Dbl Shakerl VSM 100 145, 165, 120, 165
Hole 2.091bbl Shaker2 VSM 100 180, 180, 84, 120
Shaker3 VSM 100 2 X 165,2 X120
Reserve 730bbl Shaker4 BEM650 2 X 165, 2 X 120
Marine
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AUSTRALIA PTY LTD

Weather on 01 Jan 2006 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir. ~ Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ 40kn ‘ 240.0deg ‘1011.0mbar ‘ 19c° ‘ 2.0m 248.0deg 2s 1 247.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 269.0
3 198.0
272.0deg | 456.00klb |4578.40kb | 20m | 248.0deg |  6s A 2620
Comments 5 366.0
6 359.0
7 298.0
8 284.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip 20:30 | Off Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 340
Fresh Water CuMtr 61
Drill Water CuMtr 50
Cement G Mt 0
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 89
Depart Ocean Patriot ETA Melbourne 2 Jan 2006 @ 02:00
SOF's( Dec 31, 2005):
Fuel 340m3, Potable water 61m3, Drill water 50m3, silica cmt 54t, barite 89t.
Pacific Wrangler 20:30 Standby Ocean Patriot Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 457.4
Fresh Water CuMtr 175
Drill Water CuMtr 320
Cement G Mt 132
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 0
Bentonite Bulk Mt 42
Helicopter Movement
Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS / / No Flights today
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 22

02 Jan 2006 From: Ron King/ Geoff Webster Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -

Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 3571.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 3567.1m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001

_ Basin Progress 0.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1511.8m | Daily Cost $ 508563
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 17.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1511.8m | Cum Cost $ 15585272
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 20.77 |FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 958
Wir Dpth(MSL) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL(MSL) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 Tripping out of hole to change out MWD.
Planned Op Change out MWD tools and adjust BHA and drill ahead 311 mm (12 ¥4") hole to TD.

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

POOH to surface. Changed out BHA to a rotary assembly (removed down-hole motor) and a Smith rock-bit. Completed making up new BHA with
additional drill-collars and commenced RIH. BHA held up at 2100.0 mMDRT. Washed and reamed down to 2540.0 mMDRT. MWD failed at 2540.0
mMDRT. Commenced pulling out of hole to replace MWD tools and adjust BHA configuration. Pulling out at 2020.0 MMDRT at midnight.

FORMATION

Name Top

Base Funa Flounder Channel 2835.00m

Top 67.5 Ma Sand 2836.00m

Near 68.5 Ma Sand 3103.00m

Near 70.3 Ma Sand 3478.00m

TD

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 02 Jan 2006

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)

IH TU WSH [0000 |0630 |6.50 |3571.0m |Continued POOH checking for washout. Visually inspect tool joint seal faces of each

(WO) stand for wear. Flow checked at casing shoe and at HWDP. Downloaded sources from
LWD tools. POOH and inspected BHA for washout. Broke off bit and laid out motor

IH TU TI 0630 |0830 |2.00 |[3571.0m |Made up 12 1/4" rotary BHA with Smith GF30BOVCPS (c/w 3 X 18 nozzles), install new
(WO) HOC

IH TU TI 0830 |1030 |2.00 |3571.0m |Initailized MWD and install sources in tool
(WO)

IH TU TI 1030 |1700 |6.50 3571.0m | Picked up additional 8" DC's & RIH with 12 1/4" BHA, changed out drilling jar, continued
(WO) RIH. Shallow pulse tested MWD with 850 GPM @ 2000psi, OK. RIH with 5" DP from

derrick to 2134m MDRT, filled drillstring each 20 stands
IH TU TIT 1700 |2200 |5.00 3571.0m |Washed and reamed from 2134m MDRT to 2593m MDRT with 700 - 850 GPM, 2500

(WO) -3900 psi, 120 -145 RPM. MWD tools stopped communicating to surface. 200 psi
pressure loss noted during reaming (3900psi @ 850 gpm to 3700psi @ 900gpm).
IH TU TOT |2200 |2400 |2.00 |3571.0m |Flow checked 15 minutes, good. POOH for LWD failure and potential washout from
(WO) 2593m MDRT to 2020m MDRT. 60klbs overpull @ 2326m MDRT, worked drill string
free
Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 03 Jan 2006
Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
IH TU TO 0000 |0130 |1.50 |3571.0m |Continued POOH wet looking for washout from 2020m MDRT to 1510m MDRT
(WO)
IH TU TO 0130 |0230 |1.00 |3571.0m |Installed top drive and pump through drill string at 1510m MDRT to verify pump
(WO) pressure loss. 220 SPM, 940 GPM, 3700 psi, no pressure loss noted.

Presure test Pumps #1, #2 & #3 10 minutes each to 3800 psi against standpipe
manifold to verify mud pump and mudline integrity.

IH TU TO 0230 (0600 |3.50 [3571.0m |Continued POOH wet looking for washout from 1510m MDRT to 162m MDRT
(WO)

Operations For Period Hrs to Hrs on
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Phase Data to 2400hrs, 02 Jan 2006

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 23.5/05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 23.50 0.979 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 33|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 56.50 2.354 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 86.50 3.604 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 103.00 4.292 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 104.00 4.333 650.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 54|21 Dec 2005 |23 Dec 2005 158.00 6.583 1525.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 340.5/17 Dec 2005 |02 Jan 2006 498.50 20.771 3571.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $ 21860
Mud Type:KCL-NaCl-Polymer | API FL: 4.0cc/30min | Cl: 82500mg/l | Solids(%vol): 10% |Viscosity 60sec/qt
Sample-From: Active Pit | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: 7% |H20: 90% \F;\F/’ 28|b/l](-:(3)(;§
Time: 2100 | HTHP-FL: 11.8cc/30min | Hard/Ca: 260mg/l | Oil(%): 0% |Gels 10s 7
Weight: 10.20ppg | HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: 7 | Sand: 1 S:;lo(;: 2
Temp: 32C° PM: pH: 7 |Fann 006 7
PF: 0.04 | PHPA: 1ppb |~ ;gg Z
Comment NaCl 8%. Fann 300 44
Fann 600 60
Bit # 4 Wear I o1 ) B G 02 R
3 5 WT 1 LT PP
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 12.250in | IADC# M422 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: REED HYCALOG | WOB(avg) No. Size Progress Cum. Progress 169.0m
Type: PDC | RPM(avg) 2 28/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs Cum. On Btm Hrs 27.0h
Serial No.: 211406 |F.Rate 4 18/32nd" | |ADC Drill Hrs Cum IADC Drill Hrs 30.0h
Bit Model RSX 616 | SPP Total Revs Cum Total Revs 0
Depth In 3402.0m | HSI ROP(avg) ROP(avg) 6.26 m/hr
Depth Out 3571.0m | TFA 2.197
Bit Comment
Bit#5 Wear | o1 D B G 02 R
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 12.250in | IADC# 5-3-7 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: SMITH BITS | WOB(avg) 10.00klb |No. Size Progress Cum. Progress 0.0m
Type: Rock | RPM(avg) 140 | 3 18/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs Cum. On Btm Hrs 0.0h
Serial No.: MX1628 |F.Rate  20.20bpm IADC Drill Hrs Cum IADC Dirill Hrs 0.0h
Bit Model GF30BOVCPS | SPP 3700psi Total Revs Cum Total Revs 0
Depth In 3571.0m | HSI ROP(avg) N/A | ROP(avg) 0.00 m/hr
Depth Out TFA 0.7455
Bit Comment
BHA #4
Weight(Wet) 57.00klb | Length 268.3m | Torque(max) D.C. (1) Ann Velocity 256fpm
Wt Below Jar(Wet) 30.00klb | String Torque(Off.Btm) D.C. (2) Ann Velocity 384fpm
Pick-Up Torque(On.Btm) H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
Slack-Off D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm

BHA Run Description

Annular velocity based on 900gpm

BHA Run Comment
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Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.24m | 12.250in 211406 Reed Hycalog RSX 616M
Mud Motor 8.54m 9.625in 6.135in | 963271 244mm(9 5/8") Sperrydrill Lobe 6/7 -
5.0 stg Motor
XIO 1.22m 9.438in 2.875in | S18819-11
Stab 1.81m | 12.125in 2.875in | 694776 Non-mag integral blade string stab
MWD 24.39m 8.000in 1.920in
DIR/HCIM-EWR-DGR-CTN-SLD-ACAL-H
8in DC 9.06m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600035
Stab 2.10m | 12.125in 2.875in | 47607 Integral blade string stabilizer
8in DC 8.68m 8.000in 2.875in | 1860026
Drilling Jars 9.31m 8.188in 3.063in | 11150D Drilling jars used in surface hole
section.
8in DC 8.81m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600031
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
5in HWDP 192.98m 5.000in 2.875in
BHA #5
Weight(Wet) 65.00klb | Length 271.2m | Torque(max) D.C. (1) Ann Velocity 256fpm
Wt Below Jar(Wet) 50.00klb | String Torque(Off.Btm) D.C. (2) Ann Velocity 384fpm
Pick-Up Torque(On.Btm) H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
Slack-Off D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
BHA Run Description Annular velocity based on 900gpm
BHA Run Comment
Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.33m | 12.250in MX1628 Smith GF30BOVCPS
Near Bit Stab 2.13m | 12.125in 2.812in | 47604
Drill Collar 2.96m 8.188in 2.812in | 49058
Stab 1.81m | 12.125in 2.875in | 694776 Non-mag integral blade string stab
MWD 24.39m 8.000in 1.920in
DIR/HCIM-EWR-DGR-CTN-SLD-ACAL-H
8in DC 70.95m 8.000in 2.875in
Stab 2.10m | 12.125in 2.875in | 47607 Integral blade string stabilizer
8in DC 8.68m 8.000in 2.875in | 1860026
Drilling Jars 9.66m 8.188in 3.063in | MHAO00206
8in DC 8.81m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600031
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
5in HWDP 138.22m 5.000in 2.875in
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 0 113.8
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 38.1
Diesel m3 0 22.1 0 340.4
Fresh Water m3 25 28.8 -0.1 156.9
Drill Water m3 320 245 0.1 566.4
Cement G MT 0 0 79.9
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW Eff(%) SPM SPP  Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(i) (ppg) (SPM)  (ps))  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
2 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 101 | 4200 | 10.24 |3275.0 30 320 | 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 101 | 4200 | 10.24 (3275.0 30 320 | 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
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Csg Shoe MD (m)

Csg Shoe TVD (m)

Csg Landing Depth MD
(m)

Csg Landing Depth

LOT/FIT (ppg)

TVD (m)
650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 43 extra Crane operator, dogman, welder
ESS 8
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 3
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 2
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3 One swaco hand for new shaker being assessed for Diamond
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 6
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 5 One trainee
Total | 75
HSE Summary
Events Date of last ~ Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Drill 01 Jan 2006 |1 Day Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Environental Issue 29 Dec 2005 |4 Days Environmental Audit Environmental audit by Nexus shorebase personnel.
Fire Drill 01 Jan 2006 |1 Day Held weekly fire drill
JSA 02 Jan 2006 |0 Days Deck =7, Mech = 4, Drill =
4,Welder = 2
Man Overboard Dirill 30 Dec 2005 |3 Days Held Man Over Board Dirill
Safety Meeting 01 Jan 2006 |1 Day Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 02 Jan 2006 |0 Days Safe = 6, Un-safe = 10

Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data

Available 3,204bbl | Losses Obbl Equip. Descr. Mesh Size
Shaker2 VSM 100 4x 165
Hole 2,103.9bbl
Shaker3 VSM 100 4 x 120
Reserve 740bbl Shakerd BEM650 4% 165
Marine
Weather on 02 Jan 2006 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height ~Wave Dir.  Wave Period Anchors Tension (klb)
10.0nm ‘ 25kn ‘ 225.0deg ‘1014.0mbar ‘ 18C° ] 2.0m 225.0deg 2s 1 309.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 281.0
3 163.0
272.0deg | 456.00kib |4578.40kbb | 3.0m | 225.0deg |  6s A 2300.0
Comments 5 293.0
6 311.0
7 410.0
8 353.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip 20:30 | Off Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 340
Fresh Water CuMtr 61
Drill Water CuMtr 50
Cement G Mt 0
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 89
Depart Ocean Patriot ETA Melbourne 2 Jan 2006 @ 02:00
SOF's( Dec 3, 2005):
Fuel 340m3, Potable water 61m3, Drill water 50m3, silica cmt 54t, barite 89t.
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Pacific Wrangler Standby Ocean Patriot Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 446.7
Fresh Water CuMtr 165
Drill Water CuMtr 0
Cement G Mt 132
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 0
Bentonite Bulk Mt 42

Offloaded Electric wireline tools and 320m3 drillwater

Helicopter Movement

Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS / / No Flights today
AUSTRALIA PTY LTD
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 23

03 Jan 2006 From: Ron King/ Geoff Webster Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -

Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 3571.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 3567.1m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001

_ Basin Progress 0.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1511.8m | Daily Cost $ 439094
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 18.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1511.8m | Cum Cost $ 16024366
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 21.77 |FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 959
Wir Dpth (LAT) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL (LAT) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 RIH with 5" DP from 1510m MDRT to 2100m MDRT
Planned Op RIH, Ream and clean to bottom. Drill ahead 311 mm (12 ¥4") hole.

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Continued pulling out of hole to replace LWD tools (pulser found to be damaged) and adjusted BHA configuration. Re-calibrated pressure sensors on
rig floor using cementing unit. Tested new LWD toolstring and commenced RIH. Slipped & Cut drill-line at the casing shoe. Waited on Weather

FORMATION
Name Top
Base Funa Flounder Channel 2835.00m
Top 67.5 Ma Sand 2836.00m
Near 68.5 Ma Sand 3103.00m
Near 70.3 Ma Sand 3478.00m
TD
Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 03 Jan 2006
Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
IH TP TO 0000 |0130 |1.50 |[3571.0m |Continued POOH for LWD failure (also POH wet looking for washout) from 2020m
(VE) MDRT to 1510m MDRT
IH TP TO 0130 [0230 |1.00 |[3571.0m |Installed top drive and pump through drill string at 1510m MDRT to verify pump
(WO) pressure loss. 220 SPM, 940 GPM, 3600 psi, no pressure loss noted.
Presure test Pumps #1, #2 & #3 10 minutes each to 3800 psi against standpipe
manifold to verify mud pump and mudline integrity. Observed average pressure loss of
91psi over 10 minutes
IH TP TO 0230 |0500 |2.50 |[3571.0m |Continued POOH for LWD failure (also POH wet looking for washout) from 1510m
(VE) MDRT to 271m MDRT
IH TP TO 0500 |[0900 |4.00 |[3571.0m |POOH with 12 1/4" BHA. Removed sources from LWD tools. Laid out LWD string.
(VE) Downloaded data and diagnostics information (Pulser falure)
IH TU TI 0900 |1200 |3.00 |[3571.0m |Lined up Dowel cementing unit and pressure tested mud pumps and surface mud lines
(WO) to 4200 psi. Calibrated gauges between rig floor, mud loggers, MWD, and Dowell.
Picked up new 12 1/4" rotary BHA while pressure testing
IH TP TI 1200 [1600 |4.00 |3571.0m |Continued to pick up 12 1/4" BHA. Initialized LWD and installed sources. RIH and
(VE) shallow pulse tested LWD with 850 GPM @ 200 SPM and 1700 psi, good
IH TP TI 1600 [1830 |2.50 |3571.0m |RIH with 5" DP and filled drillstring each 20 stands to 1510m MDRT
(VE)
IH P SC 1830 [2000 |1.50 |3571.0m |Held Pre job safety meeting. Hung off blocks and slipped and cut 100 ft drilling line.
IH P RS 2000 (2030 |0.50 |3571.0m |Serviced top drive
IH TP WOW |2030 |2400 |3.50 |3571.0m |Waiting on Weather to RIH. Excessive flex joint and riser angles
(WOw)
Winds: 40-45knts WSW
Seas; 3m
Swells; 4m
Pitch 0.7 - 0.9
Roll; 0.8 - 0.9
Perform General rig maintenance and PM's

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 04 Jan 2006
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Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
IH TP WOW | 0000 |0330 |3.50 |3571.0m |Waiting on Weather to RIH. Excessive flex joint and riser angles
(WOW)
Winds: 30-35knts WSW
Seas; 3m
Swells; 4m
Pitch 0.7 - 0.9
Roll; 0.8 - 0.9
Perform General rig maintenance and PM's
IH TP WOW [0330 (0430 |1.00 |3571.0m |Repositioned rig to bring flex joint angle to < 1 degree
(WOW)
IH TP TI 0430 |0600 |1.50 |3571.0m |Continued to RIH with 5" DP from 1510m MDRT to 2100m MDRT
(WOW)
Operations For Period Hrs to Hrs on
Phase Data to 2400hrs, 03 Jan 2006
Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 23.5|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 23.50 0.979 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 33|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 56.50 2.354 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 86.50 3.604 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 103.00 4.292 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1(17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 104.00 4.333 650.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 54|21 Dec 2005 |23 Dec 2005 158.00 6.583 1525.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 364.5|17 Dec 2005 |03 Jan 2006 522.50 21.771 3571.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $0
Mud Type:KCL-NaCl-Polymer | API FL: 3.8cc/30min | Cl: 78000mg/l | Solids(%vol): 10% |Viscosity S7sec/qt
PV 16¢cp
Sample-From: Active Pit | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: 7% |H20: 90% |vp 271b/100f2
Time: 21:50 | HTHP-FL: 11.6cc/30min | Hard/Ca: 200mg/l | Oil(%): 0% |Gels 10s 6
Gels 101 8
Weight: 10.20ppg | HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: 7.5 | Sand: 1 —
Fann 003 5
Temp: PM: 0.35 | pH: 8.5 |Fann 006 7
PF: 0.06 | PHPA: 1ppb |Fann100 z
Fann 200 37
Comment NaCl 8%. Fann 300 43
Fann 600 59
Bit#5 Wear I o1 D L G 02 R
1 1 NO A | NO DTF
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 12.250in | IADC# 5-3-7 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: SMITH BITS |WOB(avg) 6.00klb |No. Size Progress Cum. Progress 0.0m
Type: Rock | RPM(avg) 140 | 3 18/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs Cum. On Btm Hrs 0.0h
Serial No.: MX1628 |F.Rate  20.20bpm IADC Dirill Hrs Cum IADC Dirill Hrs 0.0h
Bit Model GF30BOVCPS | SPP 3700psi Total Revs Cum Total Revs 0
Depth In 3571.0m |HSI ROP(avg) N/A | ROP(avg) 0.00 m/hr
Depth Out 3571.0m | TFA 0.7455
Bit Comment
Bit # 5RR Wear | 01 D L B G 02 R
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 12.250in | IADC# 5-3-7 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
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PC.

Mfr: SMITH BITS | WOB(avg) No. Size Progress Cum. Progress 0.0m
Type: Rock | RPM(avg) 3 20/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs Cum. On Btm Hrs 0.0h
Serial No.: MX1628 | F.Rate IADC Drill Hrs Cum IADC Dirill Hrs 0.0h
Bit Model GF30BOVCPS | SPP Total Revs Cum Total Revs 0
Depth In 3571.0m | HSI ROP(avg) N/A | ROP(avg) 0.00 m/hr
Depth Out TFA 0.9204
Bit Comment
BHA #5
Weight(Wet) 65.00klb | Length 271.2m | Torque(max) D.C. (1) Ann Velocity 256fpm
Wt Below Jar(Wet) 50.00klb | String Torque(Off.Btm) D.C. (2) Ann Velocity 384fpm
Pick-Up Torque(On.Btm) H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
Slack-Off D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
BHA Run Description Annular velocity based on 900gpm
BHA Run Comment
Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.33m | 12.250in MX1628 Smith GF30BOVCPS
Near Bit Stab 2.13m | 12.250in 2.812in | 47604
Drill Collar 2.96m 8.188in 2.812in | 49058
Stab 1.81m | 12.125in 2.875in | 694776 Non-mag integral blade string stab
MWD 24.39m 8.000in 1.920in
DIR/HCIM-EWR-DGR-CTN-SLD-ACAL-H
8in DC 70.95m 8.000in 2.875in
Stab 2.10m | 12.125in 2.875in | 47607 Integral blade string stabilizer
8in DC 8.68m 8.000in 2.875in | 1860026
Drilling Jars 9.66m 8.188in 3.063in | MHAO00206
8in DC 8.81m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600031
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
5in HWDP 138.22m 5.000in 2.875in
BHA # 6
Weight(Wet) 65.00klb | Length 276.3m | Torque(max) D.C. (1) Ann Velocity 256fpm
Wt Below Jar(Wet) 45.00klb | String Torque(Off.Btm) D.C. (2) Ann Velocity 384fpm
Pick-Up Torque(On.Btm) H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
Slack-Off D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
BHA Run Description Annular velocity based on 900gpm
BHA Run Comment
Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.33m | 12.250in MX1628 Smith GF30BOVCPS
Bit Sub 1.10m 8.500in 1860001
8in DC 9.04m 7.875in 2.875in | 1860001
Stab 1.81m | 12.125in 2.875in | 694776 Non-mag integral blade string stab
MWD 24.41m 8.000in 1.920in
DIR/HCIM-EWR-DGR-CTN-SLD-ACAL-H
8in DC 9.06m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600011
Stab 2.10m | 12.125in 2.875in | 47607 Integral blade string stabilizer
8in DC 70.57m 8.000in 2.875in
Drilling Jars 9.66m 8.188in 3.063in | MHAO00206
8in DC 8.81m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600031
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
5in HWDP 138.22m 5.000in 2.875in
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 0 113.8
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Bulk Stocks

Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 38.1
Diesel m3 0 9.3 -0.1 331.0
Fresh Water m3 25 16.4 0.1 165.6
Drill Water m3 0 12 -0.1 554.3
Cement G MT 0 0 79.9
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW  Eff (%) SPM SPP Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(i) (ppg) (SPM)  (ps))  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
2 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 101 | 4200 | 10.24 (3275.0 30 320 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
3 | 12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 101 | 4200 | 10.24 |3275.0 30 320 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m)  Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m TVD (m)
650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 45 extra Crane operator, dogman, welder
ESS 8
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 3
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 2
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3 One swaco hand for new shaker being assessed for Diamond
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 6
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 4 One trainee
Total | 76
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Dirill 01 Jan 2006 |2 Days Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Environental Issue 29 Dec 2005 |5 Days Environmental Audit Environmental audit by Nexus shorebase personnel.
Fire Drill 01 Jan 2006 |2 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 03 Jan 2006 |0 Days Deck = 3, Mech = 2, Drill =
10,Welder = 2
Man Overboard Dirill 30 Dec 2005 |4 Days Held Man Over Board Dirill
Safety Meeting 01 Jan 2006 |2 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 03 Jan 2006 |0 Days Safe =5, Un-safe = 4
Trip / Kick Drill 03 Jan 2006 |0 Days Held Trip drill with each
crew while RIH
Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data
Available 3,200bbl |Losses Obbl Equip. Descr. Mesh Size
Active 413bbl Shakerl VSM 100 145, 165, 2 X 84
Hole 2.127bbl Shaker2 VSM 100 2X180,2 X 84
Shaker3 VSM 100 2X165,2X 84
Reserve 660bbl Shaker4 BEM650 2 X 165, 2 X 120
Marine
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Weather on 03 Jan 2006

Rig Support

Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir. ~ Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ 45kn ‘ 248.0deg ‘1013.0mbar ‘ 16C° ‘ 3.0m 248.0deg 2s 1 245.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 287.0
3 187.0
272.0deg | 456.00klb |4578.40kb | 40m | 248.0deg |  6s A 2310
Comments 5 280.0
6 192.0
7 328.0
8 302.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip 24:00 3 Jan 2006 On Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 513
Fresh Water CuMtr 610
Drill Water CuMtr 480
Cement G Mt 48
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 89
Depart South Wharf @ 22:45, 2 Jan 2006. ETA Ocean Patriot 24:00 3 Jan 2006
Pacific Wrangler Standby Ocean Patriot Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 435.4
Fresh Water CuMtr 160
Drill Water CuMtr 0
Cement G Mt 132
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 0
Bentonite Bulk Mt 42
Helicopter Movement
Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS 09:28 / 09:55 3/4
AUSTRALIA PTY LTD
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 24

04 Jan 2006 From: Ron King/ Geoff Webster Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -
Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 3619.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 3613.0m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001
Basi
asin Progress 48.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1511.8m | Daily Cost $ 447637
Drill Co. DOGC
Days from spud 19.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1511.8m | Cum Cost $ 16472003
Ri OCEAN PATRIOT .
9 Days on well 22.77 FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 960
Wir Dpth (LAT) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL (LAT) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 Drilling ahead 311 mm (12 ¥2") hole at 3643.0 mDRT.
Planned Op Drill ahead 311 mm (12 %4") hole.

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

RIH to bottom and began drilling ahead 311 mm (12 %4") hole from 3571.0 mMDRT. Drilling ahead at 3619.0 mMDRT at midnight.

FORMATION

Name Top

Base Funa Flounder Channel 2835.00m
Top 67.5 Ma Sand 2836.00m
Near 68.5 Ma Sand 3103.00m
Near 70.3 Ma Sand 3478.00m
TD

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 04 Jan 2006

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
IH TU WOW |[0000 |0330 |3.50 |3571.0m |Waiting on Weather to RIH. Excessive flex joint and riser angles
(WO)
Winds: 30-22knts WSW
Seas; 2.5m - 1.5m
Swells; 4m - 3m
Pitch 0.6
Roll; 0.8
Perform General rig maintenance and PM's
IH TU WOW [0330 |0430 |1.00 |3571.0m |Repositioned rig to bring flex joint angle to < 1 degree
(WO)
IH TU TI 0430 |0900 |4.50 |3571.0m |Continued to RIH with 5" DP from 1510m MDRT to 3487m MDRT
(WO)
IH TU RW 0900 |1000 |1.00 3571.0m | Washed and reamed from 3487m MDRT to 3571m MDRT
(WO)
IH P DA 1000 |[2400 |14.00 |3619.0m |Drilled ahead 31mm (12 1/4") hole from 3571m MDRT to 3619m MDRT.
WOB = 25 - 34 klbs, RPM = 100- 150, SPM = 188 = 805 GPM, 4000 psi, Tqg = 4500 -
6700 ftlb. Average ROP = 3.4m/hr

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 05 Jan 2006

Phse Cls

(RC)

Op

From

To Hrs Depth

Activity Description

IH P DA

0000

0600 |6.00 |3643.0m

Drilled ahead 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3619m MDRT to 3643m MDRT.
WOB = 25 - 34 klbs, RPM = 80- 100, SPM = 187 = 800 GPM, 4000 psi, Tq = 50000 -
6000 ftlb. Average ROP = 4m/hr

Operations For Period Hrs to Hrs on

Phase Data to 2400hrs, 04 Jan 2006

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth

RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 23.5/05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 23.50 0.979 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 33|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 56.50 2.354 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 86.50 3.604 650.0m
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Phase Data to 2400hrs, 04 Jan 2006

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 103.00 4.292 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 104.00 4.333 650.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 54|21 Dec 2005 |23 Dec 2005 158.00 6.583 1525.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 388.5|17 Dec 2005 |04 Jan 2006 546.50 22.771 3619.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $ 5830
Mud Type:KCL-NaCl-Polymer | API FL: 3.6¢¢/30min | Cl: 79000mg/! | Solids(%vol): 10% |Viscosity 64sec/qt
PV 17
Sample-From: Flow line | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: 7% |H20: 90% |vp 33Ib/100cf2
Time: 21:20 | HTHP-FL: 11.0cc/30min | Hard/Ca: 200mg/l | Oil(%): 0% |Gels 10s 8
Gels 10 11
Weight: 10.20ppg | HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: 7.5 | Sand: 1 =
Fann 003 7
Temp: 49C° PM: 0.4 | pH: 9 [Fann 006 9
PF: 0.08 | PHPA: 1ppb |7 100 %
Fann 200 43
Comment NaCl 8%. Fann 300 50
Ditch Magent recovery = 140 grams Fann 600 67
Bit # 5RR Wear I o1 D L B G 02 R
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 12.250in | IADC# 5-3-7 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: SMITH BITS | WOB(avg) 26.90klb |No. Size Progress 48.0m | Cum. Progress 48.0m
Type: Rock | RPM(avg) 107 | 3 20/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs 12.6h | Cum. On Btm Hrs 12.6h
Serial No.: MX1628 |F.Rate  19.10bpm IADC Dirill Hrs 14.0h | Cum IADC Drill Hrs 14.0h
Bit Model GF30BOVCPS | SPP 3954psi Total Revs Cum Total Revs 0
Depth In 3571.0m |HSI ROP(avg) 3.81 m/hr | ROP(avg) 3.81 m/hr
Depth Out TFA 0.9204
Bit Comment Krevs this 24 hrs = 81
Krevs this bitrun = 81
BHA # 6
Weight(Wet) 65.00klb | Length 276.3m | Torque(max) 6700ft-Ibs | D.C. (1) Ann Velocity 256fpm
Wt Below Jar(Wet) 45.00klb | String 385.00klb | Torque(Off.Btm) 2500ft-Ibs | D.C. (2) Ann Velocity 384fpm
Pick-Up 375.00klb | Torque(On.Btm) 4000ft-lbs | H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
Slack-Off 385.00kIb D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
BHA Run Description Annular velocity based on 900gpm
BHA Run Comment
Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.33m | 12.250in MX1628 Smith GF30BOVCPS
Bit Sub 1.10m 8.500in 1860001
8in DC 9.04m 7.875in 2.875in | 1860001
Stab 1.81m | 12.125in 2.875in | 694776 Non-mag integral blade string stab
MWD 24.41m 8.000in 1.920in
DIR/HCIM-EWR-DGR-CTN-SLD-ACAL-H
8in DC 9.06m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600011
Stab 2.10m | 12.125in 2.875in | 47607 Integral blade string stabilizer
8in DC 70.57m 8.000in 2.875in
Drilling Jars 9.66m 8.188in 3.063in | MHA00206
8in DC 8.81m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600031
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
5in HWDP 138.22m 5.000in 2.875in

PC.
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Survey

MD Incl Azim TVD Vsec N/-S E/-W DLS Tool Type
(m) (deg) (deg) (m) (deg) (m) (m) (deg/30m)
3555.34 34 53.7 3551.48 102.8 82.9 60.7 0.9 MWD
3583.83 3.0 50.9 3579.93 104.3 83.9 61.9 0.4 MWD
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 0 113.8
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 38.1
Diesel m3 0 11.2 0.1 319.9
Fresh Water m3 27 22.3 0 170.3
Drill Water m3 0 24.1 0 530.2
Cement G MT 0 0 79.9
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW Eff(%) SPM SPP  Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(in)  (ppY) (SPM)  (psi)  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (ps)) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
1 |A1700 6.000 | 10.20 97 94 | 4000 | 9.58 |3600.0 30 380 | 3.00 40 | 475 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
2 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 94 | 4000 9.58 [3600.0 30 390 3.00 40 | 480 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
3 | 12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 0 0 | 0.00 [3275.0 30 320 | 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m)  Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 45 extra Crane operator, dogman, welder
ESS 8
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 3
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 2
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3 One swaco hand for new shaker being assessed for Diamond
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 6
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 4 One trainee
Total | 76
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Dirill 01 Jan 2006 |3 Days Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Environental Issue 29 Dec 2005 |6 Days Environmental Audit Environmental audit by Nexus shorebase personnel.
Fire Drill 01 Jan 2006 |3 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 04 Jan 2006 |0 Days Deck = 6, Drill = 4
Man Overboard Dirill 30 Dec 2005 |5 Days Held Man Over Board Drill
Safety Meeting 01 Jan 2006 |3 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 04 Jan 2006 |0 Days Safe = 3, Un-safe = 9

Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data

Available 3,085bbl |Losses
Active 410.1bbl | Equipment
Hole 2,104.9bbl

Reserve 570bbl

131bbl
131bbl

Equip.
Shakerl VSM 100
Shaker2 VSM 100
Shaker3 VSM 100

Descr.

Mesh Size
3 X165,1 X 145
2 X 145, 165, 120
2X145,2 X120
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Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data

Equip. Descr. Mesh Size
Shaker4 BEM650 2 X 165,2 X120
Marine
Weather on 04 Jan 2006 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir.  Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ 12kn ‘ 225.0deg ‘1016.0mbar ‘ 18C° ‘ 1.0m 225.0deg 2s 1 240.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height ~ Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 276.0
3 198.0
272.0deg | 456.00klb |4578.40kb | 30m | 225.0deg |  6s A 2340
Comments 5 324.0
6 185.0
7 322.0
8 337.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip 24:00 3 Jan 2006 On Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 334
Fresh Water CuMtr 600
Drill Water CuMtr 480
Cement G Mt 48
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 89
18:00 Travel to Crystal Ocean (Fuel on bard = 476m3) offload fuel to Crystal Ocean and return to Standby Ocean Patriot @ 22:15 hrs (Fuel on board = 336m3)
Pacific Wrangler 22:15 4 Jan 2006 | Enroute Melbourne, Item Unit Used Quantity
ETA 02:00 6 Jan 2006 [zt UM 5739
Fresh Water CuMtr 155
Drill Water CuMtr 0
Cement G Mt 132
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 0
Bentonite Bulk Mt 42

10:30; Travel to Crystal Ocean (Fuel on board = 428.7m3), offload Fuel to Crystal Ocean, return to Standby Ocean Patriot @ 17:30 hrs (Fuel on board = 224.7m3)

Helicopter Movement

Flight # Company

Arr/Dep. Time

Pax In/Out

Comment

1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS /

AUSTRALIA PTY LTD

/

No Flights today
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 25

05 Jan 2006 From: Ron King/ Geoff Webster Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -
Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 3697.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 3693.0m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001
Basi
asin Progress 78.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1511.8m | Daily Cost $ 464894
Drill Co. DOGC
Days from spud 20.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1511.8m | Cum Cost $ 16936897
Ri OCEAN PATRIOT .
9 Days on well 23.77 |FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 961
Wir Dpth (LAT) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL (LAT) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m

Current Op @ 0600
Planned Op

Drilling ahead 311 mm (12 ¥4") hole at 3718.0 mMDRT.
Drill ahead 311 mm (12 %4") hole.

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Drilled ahead from 3619.0 mMDRT to 3697.0 mMDRT at midnight.

FORMATION

Name Top

Base Funa Flounder Channel 2835.00m
Top 67.5 Ma Sand 2836.00m
Near 68.5 Ma Sand 3103.00m
Near 70.3 Ma Sand 3478.00m
TD

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 05 Jan 2006

Cls
(RC)

Phse Op From

To Hrs

Depth

Activity Description

IH P DA 0000

2400 |24.00

3697.0m

Drilled ahead 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3619m MDRT to 3697m MDRT.
WOB = 30 - 41 klbs, RPM = 80- 120, SPM = 187 = 800 GPM, 4050 psi, Tg = 5500 -
7500 ftlb. Average ROP = 3.55m/hr

Max Gas today = 103 units @ 3695m MDRT

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on

06 Jan 2006

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)

IH P DA 0000 |0400 |4.00 |3697.0m |Drilled ahead 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3697m MDRT to 3714m MDRT.
WOB = 30 - 35 klbs, RPM = 80- 120, SPM = 187 = 800 GPM, 4050 psi, Tq = 5500 -
7500 ftlb. Average ROP = 4.3 m/hr
LWD tools stopped pulsing

IH U RR 0400 |0430 |0.50 |3714.0m |Backed out IBOP on connection. Re aligned top drive and screwed back into IBOP.
Torqued same to 78000 ftlbs. Comfirmed alignment of breakout/Make up system

IH P DA 0430 |0600 [1.50 |3718.0m |Troubleshooted LWD tools. No sucess.
Drilled Ahead 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3714m MDRT to 3718m MDRT

Operations For Period Hrs to Hrs on

Phase Data to 2400hrs, 05 Jan 2006

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth

RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 23.5|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 23.50 0.979 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 33|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 56.50 2.354 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 86.50 3.604 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 103.00 4.292 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 104.00 4.333 650.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 54|21 Dec 2005 |23 Dec 2005 158.00 6.583 1525.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 412.5|17 Dec 2005 |05 Jan 2006 570.50 23.771 3697.0m
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WBM Data Cost Today $0
Mud Type:KCL-NaCl-Polymer | API FL: 3.6¢c/30min | Cl: 79000mg/! | Solids(%vol): 10% |Viscosity 61sec/qt
PV 16¢cp
Sample-From: Active Pit | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: 7% |H20: 90% |vp 30b/100f2
Time: 22:30 | HTHP-FL: 11.0cc/30min | Hard/Ca: 200mg/l | Oil(%): 0% |Gels 10s 8
Gels 10 12
Weight: 10.20ppg | HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: 7.5 | Sand: 8 —
Fann 003 6
Temp: 49C° PM: 0.3 | pH: 9 |Fann 006 9
PF: 0.06 | PHPA: 1ppb |Fann100 2
Fann 200 39
Comment NaCl 8%. Fann 300 46
Ditch Magent recovery = 186 grams Fann 600 62
Bit # 5RR Wear | o1 D L B G 02 R
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 12.250in | IADC# 5-3-7 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: SMITH BITS | WOB(avg) 34.00klb |No. Size Progress 78.0m | Cum. Progress 126.0m
Type: Rock | RPM(avg) 101 | 3 20/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs 22.0h | Cum. On Btm Hrs 34.6h
Serial No.: MX1628 |F.Rate  19.00bpm IADC Drill Hrs 24.0h | Cum IADC Drill Hrs 38.0h
Bit Model GF30BOVCPS | SPP 4014psi Total Revs 139 | Cum Total Revs 139
Depth In 3571.0m |HSI ROP(avg) 3.55 m/hr | ROP(avg) 3.64 m/hr
Depth Out TFA 0.9204
Bit Comment
BHA # 6
Weight(Wet) 65.00klb | Length 276.3m | Torque(max) 7700ft-Ibs | D.C. (1) Ann Velocity 256fpm
Wt Below Jar(Wet) 45.00klb | String 385.00klb | Torque(Off.Btm) 2500ft-Ibs | D.C. (2) Ann Velocity 384fpm
Pick-Up 375.00klb | Torque(On.Btm) 6400ft-Ibs | H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
Slack-Off 385.00kIb D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
BHA Run Description Annular velocity based on 900gpm
BHA Run Comment
Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.33m | 12.250in MX1628 Smith GF30BOVCPS
Bit Sub 1.10m 8.500in 1860001
8in DC 9.04m 7.875in 2.875in | 1860001
Stab 1.81m | 12.125in 2.875in | 694776 Non-mag integral blade string stab
MWD 24.41m 8.000in 1.920in
DIR/HCIM-EWR-DGR-CTN-SLD-ACAL-H
8in DC 9.06m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600011
Stab 2.10m | 12.125in 2.875in | 47607 Integral blade string stabilizer
8in DC 70.57m 8.000in 2.875in
Drilling Jars 9.66m 8.188in 3.063in | MHA00206
8in DC 8.81m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600031
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
5in HWDP 138.22m 5.000in 2.875in
Survey
MD Incl Azim TVD Vsec N/-S E/l-W DLS Tool Type
(m) (deg) (deg) (m) (deg) (m) (m) (deg/30m)
3641.38  |3.0 150.2 (3637.40  |107.2 185.8 (64.2 0.0 MWD
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 0 113.8
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 0 38.1
Diesel m3 0 26.8 -0.1 293.0
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Bulk Stocks

Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Fresh Water m3 35 34.6 0 170.7
Drill Water m3 0 55.3 0 474.9
Cement G MT 0 0 79.9
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW Eff(%) SPM SPP  Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(in)  (ppY) (SPM)  (psi)  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (ps)) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
1 |A1700 6.000 | 10.20 97 94 | 4000 | 9.58 |3600.0 30 380 | 3.00 40 | 475 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
2 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 94 | 4000 | 9.58 |3600.0 30 390 | 3.00 40 | 480 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
3 | 12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 0 0 | 0.00 [3275.0 30 320 | 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m) Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 48 extra Crane operator, dogman, welder
ESS 9
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 3
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 2
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3 One swaco hand for new shaker being assessed for Diamond
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 6
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 4 One trainee
Total | 80
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Drill 01 Jan 2006 |4 Days Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Environental Issue 29 Dec 2005 |7 Days Environmental Audit Environmental audit by Nexus shorebase personnel.
Fire Drill 01 Jan 2006 |4 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 05 Jan 2006 |0 Days Deck = 6, Mech = 2, Drill = 2
Man Overboard Dirill 30 Dec 2005 |6 Days Held Man Over Board Dirill
Safety Meeting 01 Jan 2006 |4 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 05 Jan 2006 |0 Days Safe = 4, Un-safe = 4

Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data

Available 2,945bbl |Losses 90bbl Equip. Descr. Mesh Size

Active 434.5bbl | Equipment 90bbl | Shakerl VSM 100 2X230,2 X165

Hole 2,140.5bbl | Desilter s0bbi | Shaker2 VSM'100 3X 230, 165
Shaker3 VSM 100 4 X 120

Reserve 370bbl Shaker4 BEM650 2 X 200, 2 X 165

Marine
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Weather on 05 Jan 2006 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir. ~ Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ 35kn ‘ 70.0deg ‘1020.0mbar ‘ 21C° 2.0m 70.0deg 55 1 236.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 216.0
3 196.0
272.0deg | 552.00klb |4411.40kb | 25m | 70.0deg | 8s A 266.0
Comments 5 260.0
6 203.0
7 267.0
8 260.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip 24:00 3 Jan 2006 On Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 320
Fresh Water CuMtr 595
Drill Water CuMtr 480
Cement G Mt 48
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 54
Barite Bulk Mt 89
Mt 42
Pacific Wrangler 22:15 4 Jan 2006 | Enroute Melbourne, Item Unit Used Quantity
ETA 02:00 6 Jan 2006 Diesel CuMt 223.9
Fresh Water CuMtr 155
Drill Water CuMtr 0
Cement G Mt 132
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 0
Bentonite Bulk Mt 42
Helicopter Movement
Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS 09:55/10:25 11/7
AUSTRALIA PTY LTD
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 26

06 Jan 2006 From: Ron King/ Geoff Webster Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -
Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 3758.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $ 22699889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 3753.8m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001
Basin Progress 61.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1511.8m | Daily Cost $ 556712
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 21.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1511.8m | Cum Cost $ 17493609
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 24.77 |FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 962
Wir Dpth (LAT) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL (LAT) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 Recording LWD Wipe from 3575.0 - 3630.0 mMDRT.
Planned Op Drill ahead 311 mm (12 ¥%") hole to TD, POOH, run wireline logs.

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Drilled ahead from 3697.0 mMDRT to 3758.0 mMDRT at midnight. TD well at 3758.0 mMMDRT. Commenced POOH to log.

FORMATION

Name Top

Base Funa Flounder Channel 2835.00m
Top 67.5 Ma Sand 2836.00m
Near 68.5 Ma Sand 3103.00m
Near 70.3 Ma Sand 3478.00m
TD

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 06 Jan 2006

Phse Cls

(RC)

Op

From

To Hrs Depth

Activity Description

IH P DA

RR

DA

0000

0400

0430

0400 |4.00 |[3697.0m

0430 |0.50 |[3714.0m

2400 |19.50 |3758.0m

Drilled ahead 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3697m MDRT to 3714m MDRT.
WOB = 30 - 35 klbs, RPM = 80- 120, SPM = 187 = 800 GPM, 4050 psi, Tg = 5500 -
7500 ftlb. Average ROP = 4.3 m/hr

LWD tools stopped pulsing

Backed out IBOP on connection. Re aligned top drive and screwed back into IBOP.
Torqued same to 78000 ftlbs. Comfirmed alignment of breakout/Make up system

Troubleshooted LWD tools. No sucess.

Drilled Ahead 311mm (12 1/4") hole from 3714m MDRT to 3758m MDRT

WOB = 30 - 35, RPM =100 - 130, SPM = 188 = 800 GPM = 4050 psi, Tgq = 7000 - 8500
ftib, Average ROP = 2.3 m/hr

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 07 Jan 2006

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
IH P CS 0000 |0200 |2.00 |[3758.0m |Circulated bottoms up sample at 188 spm (800 GPM) from 3758m MDRT
IH P TO 0200 |0300 |1.00 |[3758.0m |Flow checked 15 minuted, good. POOH from 3758m MDRT to 3668m MDRT
IH U LOG |[0300 |0600 |3.00 |3758.0m |(INPROGRESS) Logged up with LWD for confirmation data from 3668m MDRT to
3582m MDRT at 30m/hr and 20 - 25 RPM

Operations For Period Hrs to Hrs on

Phase Data to 2400hrs, 06 Jan 2006

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth

RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 23.5/05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 23.50 0.979 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 33|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 56.50 2.354 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 86.50 3.604 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 103.00 4.292 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 104.00 4.333 650.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 54|21 Dec 2005 |23 Dec 2005 158.00 6.583 1525.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 436.5|17 Dec 2005 |06 Jan 2006 594.50 24.771 3758.0m
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WBM Data Cost Today $ 302
Mud Type:KCL-NaCl-Polymer | API FL: 3.8cc/30min | Cl: 79000mg/! | Solids(%vol): 10% |Viscosity 59sec/qt
PV 15¢cp
Sample-From: Active Pit | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: 7% |H20: 90% |vp 30b/100f2
Time: 21:30 | HTHP-FL: 11.0cc/30min | Hard/Ca: 240mg/l | Oil(%): 0% |Gels 10s 7
Gels 10 11
Weight: 10.20ppg | HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: 5 | Sand: 7B
Fann 003 6
Temp: 49C° PM: 0.3 | pH: 9 |Fann 006 9
PF: 0.06 | PHPA: 1ppb |Fann100 2
Fann 200 39
Comment NaCl 8%. Fann 300 45
Ditch Magent recovery = 92 grams Fann 600 60
Bit # 5RR Wear | o1 D L B G 02 R
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 12.250in | IADC# 5-3-7 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: SMITH BITS | WOB(avg) 37.00klb |No. Size Progress 61.0m | Cum. Progress 187.0m
Type: Rock | RPM(avg) 115 | 3 20/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs 21.3h | Cum. On Btm Hrs 55.9h
Serial No.: MX1628 |F.Rate  19.00bpm IADC Drill Hrs 23.5h | Cum IADC Drill Hrs 61.5h
Bit Model GF30BOVCPS | SPP 4045psi Total Revs 154 | Cum Total Revs 293
Depth In 3571.0m |HSI ROP(avg) 2.86 m/hr | ROP(avg) 3.35 m/hr
Depth Out TFA 0.9204
Bit Comment
BHA # 6
Weight(Wet) 65.00klb | Length 276.3m | Torque(max) 8700ft-Ibs | D.C. (1) Ann Velocity 256fpm
Wt Below Jar(Wet) 45.00klb | String 385.00klb | Torque(Off.Btm) 3000ft-Ibs | D.C. (2) Ann Velocity 384fpm
Pick-Up 375.00klb | Torque(On.Btm) 7200ft-Ibs | H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
Slack-Off 385.00kIb D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
BHA Run Description Annular velocity based on 900gpm
BHA Run Comment
Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.33m | 12.250in MX1628 Smith GF30BOVCPS
Bit Sub 1.10m 8.500in 1860001
8in DC 9.04m 7.875in 2.875in | 1860001
Stab 1.81m | 12.125in 2.875in | 694776 Non-mag integral blade string stab
MWD 24.41m 8.000in 1.920in
DIR/HCIM-EWR-DGR-CTN-SLD-ACAL-H
8in DC 9.06m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600011
Stab 2.10m | 12.125in 2.875in | 47607 Integral blade string stabilizer
8in DC 70.57m 8.000in 2.875in
Drilling Jars 9.66m 8.188in 3.063in | MHA00206
8in DC 8.81m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600031
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
5in HWDP 138.22m 5.000in 2.875in
Survey
MD Incl Azim TVD Vsec N/-S E/l-W DLS Tool Type
(m) (deg) (deg) (m) (deg) (m) (m) (deg/30m)
3758.00  [3.0 150.2 (375386  |113.1 189.7 68.9 0.0 MWD
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 -78.44 354
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 -15.9 22.2
Diesel m3 0 32.1 0 260.9
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Bulk Stocks

Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Fresh Water m3 33 30.2 0 1735
Drill Water m3 0 96.3 0 378.6
Cement G MT 0 0 79.9
Cement HT (Silica) MT 54 0 0 54.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW Eff(%) SPM SPP  Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(in)  (ppY) (SPM)  (psi)  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (ps)) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
1 |A1700 6.000 | 10.20 97 94 | 4000 9.58 (3600.0 30 380 3.00 40 | 475 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
2 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 94 | 4000 9.58 (3600.0 30 390 3.00 40 | 480 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
3 | 12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 0 0 0.00 |3275.0 30 320 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m) Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 50
ESS 8
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 3
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 2
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3 One swaco hand for new shaker being assessed for Diamond
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 6
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 4 One trainee
SCHLUMBERGER OILFIELD AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 7
Total | 88
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Dirill 01 Jan 2006 |5 Days Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Environental Issue 29 Dec 2005 |8 Days Environmental Audit Environmental audit by Nexus shorebase personnel.
Fire Drill 01 Jan 2006 |5 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 05 Jan 2006 |1 Day Deck = 6, Mech = 2, Drill = 2
Man Overboard Dirill 30 Dec 2005 |7 Days Held Man Over Board Drill
Safety Meeting 01 Jan 2006 |5 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 05 Jan 2006 |1 Day Safe = 4, Un-safe = 4

Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data

Available 2,748bbl |Losses 134bbl Equip. Descr. Mesh Size

Active 469.6bbl | Equipment 134bb | Shakerl VSM 100 230,2X 165,120

Hole 2,168.4bbl | Desilter 63bbi | O1aKer2 VSM 100 2X 230, 2 X 200
Shaker3 VSM 100 4X120

Reserve 110bpbl Shaker4 BEM650 2 X 200, 2 X 165

Marine
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Weather on 06 Jan 2006 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir. ~ Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ 16kn ‘ 110.0deg ‘1020.0mbar ‘ 20c° ‘ 0.5m 110.0deg -1s 1 243.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 276.0
3 231.0
272.0deg | 552.00klb |4279.00kb | 15m | 80.0deg |  6s . 366.0
Comments 5 265.0
6 201.0
7 326.0
8 245.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip 24:00 3 Jan 2006 On Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 308
Fresh Water CuMtr 590
Drill Water CuMtr 480
Cement G Mt 48
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 154
Mt 68

Transferred 54 mt HTB cement to Ocean Patriot. Transferred 16 mt Bentonite and 78 mt Barite from Ocean Patriot to Far Grip. Transferring G blend cement from Ocean

Patriot to Far Grip.

Pacific Wrangler 22:15 4 Jan 2006 | Enroute Melbourne, Item Unit Used Quantity
ETA 02:00 6 Jan 2006 5 CuMir 273.9
Fresh Water CuMtr 155
Drill Water CuMtr 0
Cement G Mt 132
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 0
Bentonite Bulk Mt 42
Helicopter Movement
Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS 10:18/10:35 13/5
AUSTRALIA PTY LTD
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DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 27

07 Jan 2006 From: Ron King/ Geoff Webster Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -

Well Data

Country Australia | MDBRT 3758.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $ 22699889

Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 3753.8m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001
_ Basin Progress 0.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1511.8m | Daily Cost $ 604571

Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 22.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1511.8m | Cum Cost $ 18098180

Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 25.77 |FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 963

Wir Dpth (LAT) 585.0m Planned TD MD

RT-ASL (LAT) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT

RT-ML 606.5m

Current Op @ 0600 Wireline Logging.

Planned Op Run wireline logs.

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

POOH, laid down LWD tools. Rigged up to run wireline.

FORMATION

Name Top

Base Funa Flounder Channel 2835.00m

Top 67.5 Ma Sand 2836.00m

Near 68.5 Ma Sand 3103.00m

Near 70.3 Ma Sand 3478.00m

TD

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 07 Jan 2006

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
IH P CS 0000 |0200 |2.00 |[3758.0m |Circulated bottoms up sample at 188 spm (800 GPM) from 3758m MDRT
IH P TO 0200 |0300 |1.00 |[3758.0m |Flow checked 15 minuted, good. POOH from 3758m MDRT to 3668m MDRT
IH U LOG |0300 |0730 |4.50 |3758.0m |Logged up with LWD for confirmation data from 3668m MDRT to 3582m MDRT at
30m/hr and 20 - 25 RPM
IH P TO 0730 |0800 |0.50 |3758.0m |Pumped 25 bbl slug and POOH from 3582m MDRT to 3506m MDRT
IH TU RR 0800 |0900 |1.00 |[3758.0m |Repaired hose on rackingarm
(RE)
IH P TO 0900 |1700 |8.00 |[3758.0m |Continued POOH from 3506m MDRT to 36m MDRT. Flow checked at casing shoe and
prior to BHA entering BOP
IH TU RR 1700 [1730 |0.50 |3758.0m |Removed sources from LWD tools. Plugged in and attempted to power down tools with
(RE) no success
IH P TO 1730 [1900 |1.50 |3758.0m |Laid out LWD tools and BHA
IH P LOG 1900 [2000 |1.00 |3758.0m |Held JSA and rigged up to run Schlumberger wireline tools
IH P LOG 2000 [2130 |1.50 |3758.0m |Made up wireline tools for run #1, installed radioactive sources
IH P LOG |[2130 |2400 |2.50 |3758.0m |RIH withlog#1, GR/PEX/HALS/DSI. Performed repeat pass from 3675m MDRT to

3575m MDRT (23:30 hrs)

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 08 Jan 2006

Phse

Cls
(RC)

Op

From

To

Hrs

Depth

Activity Description

IH

IH

P

P

LOG

LOG

0000

0500

0500

0600

5.00

1.00

3758.0m

3758.0m

RIH with log #1, PEX combo GR/PEX/HALS/DSI. Performed repeat pass from 3675m
MDRT to 3575m MDRT (23:30 hrs).

Perform main Log (from 00:10)

GR: TD to Seafloor,

PEX Hi Res: TD to 2775m MDRT,

HALS: TD to 1511m MDRT,

DSI: P&S and Upper Dipole mode from 3758m MDRT to 2775m MDRT, P&S Mode
from 2775m MDRT to 1511m MDRT

Rigged down Run #1 Wireline tools

Operations For Period Hrs to Hrs on
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Phase Data to 2400hrs, 07 Jan 2006

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 23.5/05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 23.50 0.979 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 33|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 56.50 2.354 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 86.50 3.604 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 103.00 4.292 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 104.00 4.333 650.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 54|21 Dec 2005 |23 Dec 2005 158.00 6.583 1525.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 460.5(17 Dec 2005 |07 Jan 2006 618.50 25.771 3758.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $ 0
Mud Type:KCL-NaCl-Polymer | API FL: 3.6cc/30min | Cl: 79000mg/I | Solids(%vol): 10% |Viscosity 59sec/qt
PV 16
Sample-From: Active Pit | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: 7% |H20: 90% |vp 28|b/loocﬂp2
Time: 20:00 | HTHP-FL: 11.0cc/30min | Hard/Ca: 240mg/l | Oil(%): 0% |Gels 10s 7
. ) ) " . ) Gels 10m 10
Weight: 10.20ppg | HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: 5 | Sand: 7 T 003 5
Temp: 49C° PM: 0.35 | pH: 9 |Fann 006 8
PF: 0.04 | PHPA: 1ppb |Fann100 it
Fann 200 38
Comment NaCl 8%. Fann 300 44
Ditch Magent recovery = N/A Fann 600 60
Bit # 5RR Wear I o1 D L B G 02 R
3 3 WT A E | CT TD
Bitwear Comments:
Size ("): 12.250in | IADC# 5-3-7 Nozzles Drilled over last 24 hrs Calculated over Bit Run
Mfr: SMITH BITS | WOB(avg) 37.00klb |No. Size Progress 0.0m | Cum. Progress 187.0m
Type: Rock | RPM(avg) 115 | 3 20/32nd" | On Bottom Hrs 0.0h | Cum. On Btm Hrs 55.9h
Serial No.: MX1628 |F.Rate  19.00bpm IADC Drill Hrs 0.0h | Cum IADC Dirill Hrs 61.5h
Bit Model GF30BOVCPS | SPP 4045psi Total Revs Cum Total Revs 293
Depth In 3571.0m |HSI ROP(avg) N/A | ROP(avg) 3.35 m/hr
Depth Out 3758.0m |TFA 0.9204
Bit Comment
BHA #6
Weight(Wet) 65.00klb | Length 276.3m | Torque(max) D.C. (1) Ann Velocity 256fpm
Wt Below Jar(Wet) 45.00klb | String 385.00kIb | Torque(Off.Btm) D.C. (2) Ann Velocity 384fpm
Pick-Up 375.00klb | Torque(On.Btm) H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
Slack-Off 385.00kIb D.P. Ann Velocity 176fpm
BHA Run Description Annular velocity based on 900gpm
BHA Run Comment
Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bit 0.33m | 12.250in MX1628 Smith GF30BOVCPS
Bit Sub 1.10m 8.500in 1860001
8in DC 9.04m 7.875in 2.875in | 1860001
Stab 1.81m | 12.125in 2.875in | 694776 Non-mag integral blade string stab
MWD 24.41m 8.000in 1.920in
DIR/HCIM-EWR-DGR-CTN-SLD-ACAL-H
8in DC 9.06m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600011
Stab 2.10m | 12.125in 2.875in | 47607 Integral blade string stabilizer
8in DC 70.57m 8.000in 2.875in
Drilling Jars 9.66m 8.188in 3.063in | MHA00206
8in DC 8.81m 8.000in 2.875in | 18600031
XIO 1.16m 8.500in 2.875in | MS01930-2
5in HWDP 138.22m 5.000in 2.875in
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Survey

MD Incl Azim TVD Vsec N/-S E/-W DLS Tool Type
(m) (deg) (deg) (m) (deg) (m) (m) (deg/30m)
3758.00  [3.0 150.2 (375386 |113.1 189.7 68.9 0.0 | Extrapolation to FTD
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 0 354
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 0 22.2
Diesel m3 0 29.9 0 231.0
Fresh Water m3 23 22.7 0 173.8
Drill Water m3 0 241 0 354.5
Cement G MT 0 -61.9 18.0
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0 54.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW Eff(%) SPM SPP  Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(in)  (ppY) (SPM)  (psi)  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (ps)) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
1 |A1700 6.000 | 10.20 97 94 | 4000 | 9.58 |3600.0 30 380 | 3.00 40 | 475 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
2 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 94 | 4000 | 9.58 |3600.0 30 390 | 3.00 40 | 480 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
3 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 0 0 | 0.00 |3275.0 30 320 | 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m) Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 50
ESS 8
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 3
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 2
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3 One swaco hand for new shaker being assessed for Diamond
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 6
HALLIBURTON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD - SPERRY SUN 4 One trainee
SCHLUMBERGER OILFIELD AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 7
Total | 88
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Dirill 01 Jan 2006 |6 Days Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Environental Issue 29 Dec 2005 |9 Days Environmental Audit Environmental audit by Nexus shorebase personnel.
Fire Drill 01 Jan 2006 |6 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 07 Jan 2006 |0 Days Deck =5, Mech = 2, Drill =
7, Welder =1, Sub Sea =1
Man Overboard Dirill 30 Dec 2005 |8 Days Held Man Over Board Dirill
Safety Meeting 01 Jan 2006 |6 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 07 Jan 2006 |0 Days Safe = 7, Un-safe = 6
Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data
Available 2,748bbl |Losses Obbl Equip. Descr. Mesh Size
Active 363.9bbl Shakerl VSM 100 230, 2 X 165, 120
Hole 2.274.1bbl Shaker2 VSM 100 2 X 230, 2 X 200
Shaker3 VSM 100 4 X120
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Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data

Reserve 110bbl Equip. Descr. Mesh Size
Shaker4 BEM650 2 X 200, 2 X 165
Marine
Weather on 07 Jan 2006 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir.  Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ okn ‘ 0.0deg ‘1020.0mbar ‘ 22C° ‘ 0.3m 0.0deg 0s 1 306.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height ~ Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 281.0
3 223.0
272.0deg | 528.00klb |4147.00kb | 10m | 90.0deg | 6s . 350.0
Comments 5 256.0
6 205.0
7 322.0
8 254.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip 24:00 3 Jan 2006 On Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 299
Fresh Water CuMtr 585
Drill Water CuMtr 480
Cement G mt 105
Cement HT (Silica) mt
Barite Bulk mt 154
Bentonite Bulk mt 68
Transferred 61 mt G cement from Ocean Patriot
Pacific Wrangler 22:15 4 Jan 2006 | Enroute Ocean Patriot, Item Unit Used Quantity
ETA 06:00 8 Jan 2006 Diesel CuMt 223.9
Fresh Water CuMtr 155
Drill Water CuMtr 0
Cement G Mt 132
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 0
Bentonite Bulk Mt 42
Helicopter Movement
Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS / / No flight today

AUSTRALIAPTY LTD
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Last BOP Test:

DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 28

08 Jan 2006 From: Ron King/ Geoff Webster Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -

Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 3758.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $22,699,889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 3753.8m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001

_ Basin Progress 0.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1511.8m | Daily Cost $495,998
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 23.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1511.8m | Cum Cost $18,594,178
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 26.77 |FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 964
Wir Dpth (LAT) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL (LAT) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 Pumping plug #1 to P & A well.
Planned Op Complete P & A program.

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Completed PEX run. Rigged up seismic tools and completed seismic survey. Rigged down wireline tools and wireline. Commenced P & A program.

FORMATION

Name Top

Base Funa Flounder Channel 2835.00m
Top 67.5 Ma Sand 2836.00m
Near 68.5 Ma Sand 3103.00m
Near 70.3 Ma Sand 3478.00m
TD

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 08 Jan 2006

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)

IH P LOG |0000 |0500 |5.00 |[3758.0m |RIH withlog#1, PEX combo GR/PEX/HALS/DSI. Performed repeat pass from 3675m
MDRT to 3575m MDRT (23:30 hrs).
Perform main Log (from 00:10)
GR: TD to Seafloor,
PEX Hi Res: TD to 2775m MDRT,
HALS: TD to 1511m MDRT,
DSI: P&S and Upper Dipole mode from 3758m MDRT to 2775m MDRT, P&S Mode
from 2775m MDRT to 1511m MDRT

IH P LOG |0500 |0800 |3.00 |[3758.0m |Rigged down Run #1 Wireline tools. Made up Run #2; VSP

IH P LOG |0800 |1400 |6.00 |3758.0m |RIH and perform VSP.
Checkshots at 1559m, 2541m and 3509m MDRT
Main pass from 3750m to 3200m MDRT at 15m spacing and 3200m to sea floor at
100m spacing

IH TP LOG 1400 |1430 |0.50 3758.0m | Troubleshot network cabling problem with computer hardware in logging unit

(OTH)

IH P LOG 1430 |1800 |3.50 |3758.0m |Continued with VSP main pass from 3750m to 3200m MDRT at 15m spacing and
3200m to sea floor at 100m spacing

IH P LOG 1800 [1930 |1.50 |3758.0m |Wireline at surface. Laid down VSP toolstring. Rigged out wireline running equipment

PA P TI 1930 (2400 |4.50 |3758.0m |Picked up side entry sub and 2 X TIW valves, made up cementing stand and racked
back same. Picked up 5" mule shoe and RIH with 5" DP to 2293m MDRT

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on

09 Jan 2006

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)

PA P TI 0000 |0300 |3.00 |3758.0m |Continued to RIH with 5" DP from 2293m MDRT to 3750m MDRT
PA P CMD |0300 |0330 |0.50 3758.0m | Circulated bottoms up at 210 SPM = 900 GPM = 3200 psi. Rotate DP at 40 - 50 RPM
PA TP RR 0330 |0400 |0.50 |[3758.0m |Worked on mud pump SCRs. Rotated and reciprocated drillstring during repairs

(RE)
PA P CMD |0400 |0500 |1.00 |3758.0m |Continued to circulate bottoms up at 210 SPM =900 GPM = 3200 psi
PA P CMP |0500 |0600 |1.00 |3758.0m |Mixed and pumped abandonment plug # 1; 102 bbl 15.8 ppg, HTB blend + additives.

Operations For Period Hrs to Hrs on
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Last BOP Test:

Phase Data to 2400hrs, 08 Jan 2006

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 23.5/05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 23.50 0.979 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 33|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 56.50 2.354 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 86.50 3.604 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 103.00 4.292 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 104.00 4.333 650.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 54|21 Dec 2005 |23 Dec 2005 158.00 6.583 1525.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 480/|17 Dec 2005 |08 Jan 2006 638.00 26.583 3758.0m
PLUG AND ABANDON(PA) 4.5/08 Jan 2006 |08 Jan 2006 642.50 26.771 3758.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $0
Mud Type:KCL-NaCl-Polymer | API FL: 3.6¢cc/30min | Cl: 79000mg/l | Solids(%vol): 10% |Viscosity S9sec/qt
PV 16
Sample-From: Active Pit | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: 7% | H20: 90% |vp 28|b/1000f2
Time: 20:00 | HTHP-FL: 11.0cc/30min | Hard/Ca: 240mg/l | Oil(%): 0% |Gels 10s 7
Gels 10 10
Weight: 10.20ppg | HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: 5 | sand: 7 —_—
Fann 003 6
Temp: 49C° PM: 0.35 | pH: 9 |Fann 006 8
PF: 0.04 | PHPA: 1ppb |2 100 2
Fann 200 38
Comment NaCl 8%. Fann 300 44
Ditch Magent recovery = N/A Fann 600 60
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 -0.1 35.3
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 0 22.2
Diesel m3 0 9.9 0 2211
Fresh Water m3 25 22 0 176.8
Drill Water m3 0 12 0 342.5
Cement G MT 0 0 18.0
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0 54.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW Eff(%) SPM SPP  Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(i) (ppg) (SPM)  (ps))  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
1 |A1700 6.000 | 10.20 97 3600.0 30 380 3.00 40 | 475 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
2 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 3600.0 30 390 3.00 40 | 480 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
3 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 0 0 0.00 (3275.0 30 320 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m)  Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 50
ESS 8
NEXUS 5
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 6
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 2
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3 One swaco hand for new shaker being assessed for Diamond
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 6
SCHLUMBERGER OILFIELD AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 7
CAMERON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 1
Total | 88
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Last BOP Test:

HSE Summary

Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Drill 08 Jan 2006 |0 Days Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Environental Issue 29 Dec 2005 |10 Days Environmental Audit Environmental audit by Nexus shorebase personnel.
Fire Drill 08 Jan 2006 |0 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 08 Jan 2006 |0 Days Deck = 4, Mech = 3, Drill =
2, Welder =3
Man Overboard Dirill 30 Dec 2005 |9 Days Held Man Over Board Drill
Safety Meeting 08 Jan 2006 |0 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 08 Jan 2006 |0 Days Safe =7, Un-safe = 3

Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data

Printed on 09 Jan 2006

Available 2,748bbl |Losses Obbl Equip. Descr. Mesh Size
Active 363.9bbl Shakerl VSM 100 230, 2 X 165, 120
Shaker2 VSM 100 2 X 230,2 X 200
Hole 2,274.1bbl
Shaker3 VSM 100 4 X120
Reserve 110bbl Shaker4 BEM650 2 X 200, 2 X 165
Marine
Weather on 08 Jan 2006 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir. ~ Wave Period Anchors Tension (klb)
10.0nm ‘ 21kn ’ 90.0deg ‘1019.0mbar ‘ 22C° ’ 0.5m 90.0deg 3s 1 298.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 287.0
3 223.0
272.0deg | 528.00klb |433L.00kb | 15m | 135.0deg |  8s A 240.0
Comments 5 265.0
6 198.0
7 320.0
8 247.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip 23:10 8 Jan 2006 | Enroute Eden, ETA Item Unit Used Quantity
09:00 hrs 9 Jan 2006 Dicsel CuMit 287
Fresh Water CuMtr 580
Drill Water CuMtr 480
Cement G mt 105
Cement HT (Silica) mt
Barite Bulk mt 154
Bentonite Bulk mt 68
Pacific Wrangler 04:40 08 Jan, 2006 On Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 366.4
Fresh Water CuMtr 201
Drill Water CuMtr 650
Cement G Mt 137
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 0
Bentonite Bulk Mt 42
Depart Ocean Patriot for Crystal Ocean 08:00 (Fuel on board = 623.85 m3). Return Ocena PAtriot (Fuel on Board = 370.68 m3) @ 13:00
Helicopter Movement
Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS 09:27 /1 09:55 717
AUSTRALIA PTY LTD
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Last BOP Test:

DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 29

09 Jan 2006 From: Ron King/ Geoff Webster Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -

Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 3758.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $22,699,889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 3753.8m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001

_ Basin Progress 0.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1511.8m | Daily Cost $535,925
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 24.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1511.8m | Cum Cost $19,130,103
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 27.77 |FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 965
Wir Dpth (LAT) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL (LAT) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 RIH to tag Abandonment plug # 3
Planned Op Tag plug #3, POOH and set abandonment plug #4, POOH, recover wear bushing. Recover BOP's and riser

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Set abandonment plugs #1, 2 & 3

FORMATION

Name Top

Base Funa Flounder Channel 2835.00m

Top 67.5 Ma Sand 2836.00m

Near 68.5 Ma Sand 3103.00m

Near 70.3 Ma Sand 3478.00m

TD

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 09 Jan 2006

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)

PA P Tl 0000 |0300 |3.00 |3758.0m |Continued to RIH with 5" DP from 2293m MDRT to 3750m MDRT

PA P CMD |0300 |0330 |0.50 |[3758.0m |Circulated bottoms up at 210 SPM =900 GPM = 3200 psi. Rotate DP at 40 - 50 RPM

PA TP RR 0330 |0400 |0.50 |[3758.0m |Worked on mud pump SCRs. Rotated and reciprocated drillstring during repairs

(RE)

PA P CHC |0400 |0500 |1.00 |3758.0m |Continued to circulate bottoms up at 210 SPM =900 GPM = 3200 psi

PA P CMP |0500 |0630 |1.50 |3758.0m |Held pre job safety meeting. Rigged up Dowell cemnting line and pressure tested to
1000 psi. Mixed and pumped abandonment plug # 1; 102 bbl 15.8 ppg, HTB blend +
additives (see report). Displaced with 195 bbls drilling fluid at 10.1 ppg
Plug #1 set from 3750m MDRT to 3560m MDRT.

PA P TO 0630 |0730 |1.00 |3758.0m |POOH from cement plug# 1 from 3750m MDRT to 3420m MDRT slowly

PA P CHC |0730 |0900 |1.50 |3758.0m |Circulated bottoms up to clear drillpipe

PA P TO 0900 |1000 |1.00 |3758.0m |POOH From 3420m MDRT to 2965m MDRT

PA P CMD [1000 |1030 |0.50 |3758.0m |Circulated and spotted 60 bbl high visc pill

PA P TO 1030 [1100 |0.50 |3758.0m |POOH from 2965m MDRT to 2865m MDRT

PA P CMP [1100 |1200 |1.00 |3758.0m |Held pre job safety meeting. Pressure tested cementing line to 1000 psi. Mixed and
pumped abandonment plug # 2; 64.3 bbl 15.8 ppg, HTB blend + additives (see report).
Displaced with 149 bbls drilling fluid at 10.1 ppg
Plug #2 set from 2865m MDRT to 2745m MDRT.

PA P TO 1200 [1230 |0.50 |3758.0m |POOH from plug #2 from 2865m MDRT to 2575m MDRT

PA P CHC |1230 |1400 [1.50 |3758.0m |Circulated bottoms up

PA P WOC |1400 [1730 |3.50 |[3758.0m |WOC. Laid down 54 jts 5" DP

PA P TI 1730 [1830 |1.00 |[3758.0m |RIH and tagged TOC plug #2 with 5 klbs at 2735m MDRT

PA P TO 1830 [2030 |2.00 |3758.0m |POOH from 2735m MDRT to 1650m MDRT

PA P CMD [2030 |2100 |0.50 |3758.0m |Circulated and spotted 60 bbls high visc pill at 1650m MDRT

PA P TO 2100 |2130 |0.50 |[3758.0m |POOH from 1650m MDRT to 1550m MDRT. Rigged up cementing hose

PA P CMP |2130 |2230 [1.00 |3758.0m |Held pre job safety meeting. Pressure tested cementing line to 1000 psi. Mixed and
pumped abandonment plug # 3; 70.4 bbl 15.8 ppg, HTB blend + additives (see report).
Displaced with 74 bbls drilling fluid at 10.1 ppg
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Last BOP Test:

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
Plug #3 set from 1550m MDRT to 1430m MDRT.
PA P TO 2230 [2300 |0.50 |3758.0m |Rigged down cementing hose. POOH from cement plug #3
PA P CMD |2300 |2400 [1.00 |3758.0m |Circualted bottoms up. Spotted 260 bbls inhibited mud in casing.

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 10 Jan 2006

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
PA P TO 0000 |0300 |3.00 |[3758.0m |Pumped slug. POOH and laid down 60 jts of 5" drillpipe from 1262m MDRT to 688m
MDRT
PA P TI 0300 |0400 |1.00 3758.0m | RIH from 688m MDRT to 1204m MDRT to tag cement plug #3. Cement samples not
firm.
PA P TO 0400 |0530 |1.50 3758.0m | Laid down drill pipe from 1204m MDRT to 917m MDRT.
PA P TI 0530 |0600 |0.50 3758.0m | RIH from 917m MDRT to 975m MDRT to tag cement plug #3
Operations For Period Hrs to Hrs on
Phase Data to 2400hrs, 09 Jan 2006
Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 23.5|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 23.50 0.979 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 33|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 56.50 2.354 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 86.50 3.604 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 103.00 4.292 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 104.00 4.333 650.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 54|21 Dec 2005 |23 Dec 2005 158.00 6.583 1525.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 480|17 Dec 2005 |08 Jan 2006 638.00 26.583 3758.0m
PLUG AND ABANDON(PA) 28.5|08 Jan 2006 |09 Jan 2006 666.50 27.771 3758.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $0
Mud Type:KCL-NaCl-Polymer | API FL: 3.6¢cc/30min | Cl: 79000mg/l | Solids(%vol): 10% |Viscosity S9sec/qt
PV 16
Sample-From: Active Pit | Filter-Cake: 1/32nd" | K+C*1000: 7% | H20: 90% |yp 28Ib/1000f2
Time: 20:00 | HTHP-FL: 11.0cc/30min | Hard/Ca: 240mg/l | Oil(%): 0% |Gels 10s 7
Gels 101 10
Weight: 10.20ppg | HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: 5 | sand: 7 —_—
Fann 003 6
Temp: 49C° PM: 0.35 | pH: 9 |Fann 006 8
PF: 0.04 | PHPA: 1ppb | 100 2
Fann 200 38
Comment NaCl 8%. Fann 300 44
Ditch Magent recovery = N/A Fann 600 60
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 8.2 0 27.1
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 0 22.2
Diesel m3 0 12.7 0 208.4
Fresh Water m3 26 21.8 0.1 181.1
Drill Water m3 0 36.1 0 306.4
Cement G MT 0 0 18.0
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 54 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW Eff (%) SPM SPP  Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(in)  (ppY) (SPM)  (ps))  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (ps)) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
A1700 6.000 | 10.20 97 3600.0 30 380 3.00 40 | 475 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 3600.0 30 390 3.00 40 | 480 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 0 0 0.00 |3275.0 30 320 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
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Last BOP Test:

Csg Shoe MD (m)

Csg Shoe TVD (m)

Csg Landing Depth MD
(m)

Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)

TVD (m)
650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 50
ESS 8
NEXUS 3
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 8 6 X ROV, 2 X Surveyors
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 2
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3 One swaco hand for new shaker being assessed for Diamond
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 3
SCHLUMBERGER OILFIELD AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 2
CAMERON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 1
MO47 CREW 2
SMITH BITS 1
Total | 83
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Dirill 08 Jan 2006 |1 Day Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Environental Issue 29 Dec 2005 |11 Days Environmental Audit Environmental audit by Nexus shorebase personnel.
Fire Drill 08 Jan 2006 |1 Day Held weekly fire drill
JSA 09 Jan 2006 |0 Days Deck = 6, Mech = 3, Drill =
10, Welder = 2
Man Overboard Dirill 30 Dec 2005 |10 Days Held Man Over Board Dirill
Safety Meeting 08 Jan 2006 |1 Day Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 09 Jan 2006 |0 Days Safe =3, Un-safe = 1

Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data

Available 2,748bbl |Losses Obbl Equip. Descr. Mesh Size
Active 363.9bbl Shakerl VSM 100 230, 2 X 165, 120
Hole 2.274.1bbl Shaker2 VSM 100 2 X230, 2 X 200
Shaker3 VSM 100 4 X120
Reserve 110bbl Shakerd BEM650 2 X 200, 2 X 165
Marine
Weather on 09 Jan 2006 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir.  Wave Period Anchors Tension (klb)
10.0nm ‘ 12kn ] 0.0deg ‘1015.0mbar ‘ 24C° ] 0.5m 0.0deg -1s 1 302.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 281.0
3 223.0
272.0deg | 528.00kib |4331.00kb | 15m | 70.0deg |  8s A 2510
Comments 5 267.0
6 198.0
7 289.0
8 251.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip 23:10 8 Jan 2006 | Eden Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 287
Fresh Water CuMtr 580
Drill Water CuMtr 480
Cement G mt 105
Cement HT (Silica) mt
Barite Bulk mt 154
Bentonite Bulk mt 68
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Last BOP Test:

Pacific Wrangler 04:40 08 Jan, 2006 On Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 355.3
Fresh Water CuMtr 196
Drill Water CuMtr 650
Cement G Mt 137
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 8.26
Bentonite Bulk Mt 42

Helicopter Movement

Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS 09:45/10:00 5/10
AUSTRALIA PTY LTD
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Last BOP Test:

DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 30

10 Jan 2006 From: Simon Rodda/ Geoff Webster Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -

Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 3758.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $22,699,889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 3753.8m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001

_ Basin Progress 0.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1511.8m | Daily Cost $474,060
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 25.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1511.8m | Cum Cost $19,604,163
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 28.77 |FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 966
Wir Dpth (LAT) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL (LAT) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 Pulling riser and BOP's
Planned Op Recover riser and BOP's

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Laid out drillpipe, tagged abandonment plug #3, set abandonment plug #4, displaced riser and C & K lines to seawater, retrieved wearbushing, jetted
wellhead and BOP's, rigged up to recover riser and BOP's

FORMATION

Name Top

Base Funa Flounder Channel 2835.00m

Top 67.5 Ma Sand 2836.00m

Near 68.5 Ma Sand 3103.00m

Near 70.3 Ma Sand 3478.00m

TD

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 10 Jan 2006

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)

PA P PLD |0000 |0300 [3.00 |3758.0m |Pumped slug. POOH and laid down 60 jts of 5" drillpipe from 1262m MDRT to 688m
MDRT

PA P TI 0300 |0400 |1.00 |[3758.0m |RIH from 688m MDRT to 1204m MDRT to tag cement plug #3. Cement samples not
firm.

PA P PLD |0400 |0530 |1.50 |3758.0m |Laid down drill pipe from 1204m MDRT to 917m MDRT.

PA P Tl 0530 |0730 [2.00 |3758.0m |RIH from917m MDRT and tag TOC plug #3 at 1421m MDRT with 5 klbs

PA P TO 0730 |0830 [1.00 |3758.0m |POOH from 1421m MDRT to 825m MDRT

PA P CMD |0830 |0900 |0.50 |3758.0m |Circulated and spotted 60 bbls high visc pill at 825m MDRT

PA P TO 0900 |0930 |0.50 |3758.0m |POOH from 825m MDRT to 721m MDRT. Rigged up cementing hose

PA P CMP |0930 |1030 |1.00 |3758.0m |Held pre job safety meeting. Pressure tested cementing line to 1000 psi. Mixed and
pumped abandonment plug # 4; 49.7 bbl 15.8 ppg, G cement + additives (see report).
Displaced with 30 bbls drilling fluid at 10.1 ppg
Plug #4 set from 721m MDRT to 625m MDRT.

PA P TO 1030 [1100 |0.50 |3758.0m |POOH from cement plug #4 from 721m MDRT to 625m MDRT

PA P CHC |[1100 |1400 |3.00 |3758.0m |Closed annular preventer, reverse circulated 2 X DP volumes (80 bbls). Displaced
choke and kill lines to seawater. Displaced riser and booster line to seawater

PA P TO 1400 [1630 |2.50 |3758.0m |Held JSA. POOH from 625m MDRT and laid out mule shoe. Cleaned cement from last
8 stands of drillpipe

PA P CHC [1630 |1800 |1.50 |3758.0m |Held JSA. Made up jet sub and wear bushing retrieval tool. RIH and jetted stack and
wellhead areas.

PA P WH 1800 [2030 |2.50 |3758.0m |Engaged wear bushing with retrieval tool and POOH. 35 kibs overpull to recover noted.
Laid out retrieval tool and jetting sub

PA P CMP [2030 |2130 |1.00 3758.0m | Held JSA. Rigged up Dowell and high pressure test pump. Pressure tested choke and
kill lines as per DOGD requirements to 250 psi low and 14,000 psi high for 10 minutes
each

BOP |P RR2 2130 |2230 |1.00 |3758.0m |Rigged down 350t elevators and picked up 500t elevators

BOP |P RR2 2230 |2400 |1.50 |3758.0m |Held JSA. Rig up floor to recover riser and BOP

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 11 Jan 2006
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Last BOP Test:

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
BOP |P RR2 |0000 |0100 |1.00 |3758.0m |Continued to rig up riser handling equipment
BOP |P RR2 0100 |0200 |1.00 |3758.0m |Picked up and installed diverter running tool. Verified tool lock with 10 kibs overpull
BOP |P RR2 0200 |0300 |1.00 |3758.0m |Removed and laid out diverter
BOP |P RR2 0300 |0430 |1.50 |3758.0m |Picked up landing joint and made up to slip joint. Scoped in slip joint
BOP |P RR2 0430 |0500 |0.50 3758.0m | Unlatched BOP's from wellhead
BOP |P RR2 0500 |0600 |1.00 |3758.0m |Removed storm saddles. Latch in SDL ring
Operations For Period Hrs to Hrs on
Phase Data to 2400hrs, 10 Jan 2006
Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 23.5|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 23.50 0.979 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 33|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 56.50 2.354 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 86.50 3.604 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 103.00 4.292 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 104.00 4.333 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 480|17 Dec 2005 |08 Jan 2006 584.00 24.333 3758.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 56.5|21 Dec 2005 |10 Jan 2006 640.50 26.688 3758.0m
PLUG AND ABANDON(PA) 50|08 Jan 2006 |10 Jan 2006 690.50 28.771 3758.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $0
Mud Type: Seawater | APl FL: Cl: Solids(%vol): Viscosity
PV
Sample-From: Active Pit | Filter-Cake: K+C*1000: H20: vp
Time: HTHP-FL: Hard/Ca: Qil(%): Gels 10s
. Gels 10m
Weight: HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: Sand:
Fann 003
Temp: PM: pH: Fann 006
PF: PHPA: Fann 100
Fann 200
Comment Final mud cost from report # 26 = $ 277 778 Fann 300
Fann 600
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 0 27.1
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 0 22.2
Diesel m3 0 17.4 -0.1 190.9
Fresh Water m3 25 24.3 0 181.8
Drill Water m3 150 65.8 0 390.6
Cement G MT 10 0 8.0
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW  Eff (%) SPM  SPP  Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(i) (ppY) (SPM)  (psi)  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (ps)) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
1 |A1700 6.000 | 10.20 97 3600.0 30 380 3.00 40 | 475 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
2 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 3600.0 30 390 3.00 40 | 480 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
3 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 0 0 0.00 [3275.0 30 320 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m)  Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m TVD (m)
650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC EN
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Last BOP Test:

Personnel On Board

ESS 8
NEXUS 3
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 8 6 X ROV, 2 X Surveyors
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 2
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 2
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 3
SCHLUMBERGER OILFIELD AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 2
CAMERON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 1
MO47 CREW 2
SMITH BITS 1
Trident Offshore Ltd 2
Total | 84
HSE Summary
Events Date of last ~ Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Drill 08 Jan 2006 |2 Days Eigllld weekly abandon rig
ri
Environental Issue 29 Dec 2005 |12 Days Environmental Audit Environmental audit by Nexus shorebase personnel.
Fire Drill 08 Jan 2006 |2 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 10 Jan 2006 |0 Days Deck =7, Mech = 3, Drill =
8, Welder =1
Man Overboard Dirill 30 Dec 2005 |11 Days Held Man Over Board Drill
Safety Meeting 08 Jan 2006 |2 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 10 Jan 2006 |0 Days Safe = 2, Un-safe = 3

Shakers, Volumes and Losses Data

Available Obbl |Losses 2,743bbl Equip. Descr. Mesh Size
Down-hole 1.515bbl Shakerl VSM 100 230, 2 X 165, 120
Shaker2 VSM 100 2 X 230,2 X 200
Dumped 1,228bbl
Shaker3 VSM 100 4 X120
Shaker4 BEM650 2 X 200, 2 X 165
Marine
Weather on 10 Jan 2006 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir. ~ Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ 36kn ‘ 180.0deg ‘1010.0mbar ‘ 23c° ‘ 1.5m 180.0deg 4s 1 298.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 287.0
3 218.0
272.0deg | 528.00klb |4273.70kb | 10m | 70.0deg | 8s A 2470
Comments 5 267.0
6 196.0
7 293.0
8 249.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip 23:00 10 Jan 2006 On Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 265
Fresh Water CuMtr 570
Drill Water CuMtr 480
Cement G mt 105
Cement HT (Silica) mt
Barite Bulk mt 154
Bentonite Bulk mt 68
Pacific Wrangler 04:40 08 Jan, 2006 On Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 344.7
Fresh Water CuMtr 191
Drill Water CuMtr 500
Cement G Mt 137
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 8.3
Bentonite Bulk Mt 42
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Last BOP Test:

Helicopter Movement

Flight # Company

Arr/Dep. Time

Pax In/Out

Comment

1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS
AUSTRALIA PTY LTD

10:56 / 11:06

15/14
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Last BOP Test:

DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 31

11 Jan 2006 From: Simon Rodda/ Geoff Webster Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -

Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 3758.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $22,699,889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 3753.8m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001

_ Basin Progress 0.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1511.8m | Daily Cost $483,017
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 26.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1511.8m | Cum Cost $20,087,180
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 29.77 |FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 967
Wir Dpth (LAT) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL (LAT) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m

Current Op @ 0600
Planned Op

Removing riser double from BOP's

Cut and retrieve PGB and wellhead. Prepare to pull anchors

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Unlatched BOP from wellhead and pulled marine riser and BOP's

FORMATION

Name Top

Base Funa Flounder Channel 2835.00m
Top 67.5 Ma Sand 2836.00m
Near 68.5 Ma Sand 3103.00m
Near 70.3 Ma Sand 3478.00m
TD

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 11 Jan 2006

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)

BOP |P RR2 0000 |0100 |1.00 |3758.0m |Continued to rig up riser handling equipment

BOP |P RR2 0100 |0200 |1.00 |3758.0m |Picked up and installed diverter running tool. Verified tool lock with 10 klbs overpull

BOP |P RR2 0200 |0300 |1.00 3758.0m | Removed and laid out diverter

BOP |P RR2 0300 |0430 |1.50 |3758.0m |Picked up landing joint and made up to slip joint. Scoped in slip joint

BOP |P RR2 0430 |0500 |0.50 3758.0m | Unlatched BOP's from wellhead

BOP |P RR2 0500 |0630 |1.50 |3758.0m |Removed storm saddles. Latch in SDL ring

BOP |P RR2 0630 |0930 |3.00 |3758.0m |Lowered slip joint. Removed choke and kill goosenecks and booster line. Picked up and
laid out landing joint. Moved rig 24 meters off lolcation

BOP |P RR2 |0930 |2400 |14.50 |3758.0m |Pulled BOP's and laid out marine riser. Back loaded 26 joints to the Pacific Wrangler for
shipment to Eden

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 12 Jan 2006

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
BOP |P RR2 0000 |0330 |3.50 |[3758.0m |Continued to pull BOP's and lay out marine riser.
BOP |P RR2 0330 |0430 |1.00 3758.0m | Pulled riser double and landed out BOP's on carrier
BOP |P RR2 0430 |0600 |1.50 |3758.0m |Removed guidelines from BOP's. Removed riser double from BOP's

Operations For Period Hrs to Hrs on

Phase Data to 2400hrs, 11 Jan 2006

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth

RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 23.5|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 23.50 0.979 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 33|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 56.50 2.354 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 86.50 3.604 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 103.00 4.292 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 104.00 4.333 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 480|17 Dec 2005 |08 Jan 2006 584.00 24.333 3758.0m
PLUG AND ABANDON(PA) 50|08 Jan 2006 |10 Jan 2006 634.00 26.417 3758.0m
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Last BOP Test:

Phase Data to 2400hrs, 11 Jan 2006

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) \ 80.5/21 Dec 2005 |11 Jan 2006 | 714.50 29.771 3758.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $ 17078
Mud Type: Seawater | API FL: Cl: Solids(%vol): Viscosity
PV
Sample-From: Active Pit | Filter-Cake: K+C*1000: H20: vp
Time: HTHP-FL: Hard/Ca: Qil(%): Gels 10s
Gels 10m
Weight: HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: Sand:
Fann 003
Temp: PM: pH: Fann 006
PF: PHPA: Fann 100
Fann 200
Comment Final mud cost from report # 27 = $ 294, 885.24 Fann 300
Fann 600
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 27.1 0 -0.0
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 22.2 0 0.0
Diesel m3 0 11.9 0 179.0
Fresh Water m3 26 315 0 176.3
Drill Water m3 0 36.1 0 354.5
Cement G MT 21.4 0 -13.4
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW Eff(%) SPM SPP  Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(in)  (ppY) (SPM)  (psi)  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (ps)) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
1 |A1700 6.000 | 10.20 97 3600.0 30 380 3.00 40 | 475 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
2 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 3600.0 30 390 | 3.00 40 | 480 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
3 | 12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 0 0 | 0.00 [3275.0 30 320 | 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m) Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 50
ESS 8
NEXUS 3
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 8 6 X ROV, 2 X Surveyors
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 2
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3 One swaco hand for new shaker being assessed for Diamond
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 3
SCHLUMBERGER OILFIELD AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 2
CAMERON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 1
MO47 CREW 2
SMITH BITS 1
Total | 83
HSE Summary
Events Date of last ~ Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Drill 08 Jan 2006 |3 Days Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Environental Issue 29 Dec 2005 |13 Days Environmental Audit Environmental audit by Nexus shorebase personnel.
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Last BOP Test:

HSE Summary

Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Fire Drill 08 Jan 2006 |3 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 11 Jan 2006 |0 Days Deck = 6, Mech = 3, Drill =
5, Welder = 2
Man Overboard Dirill 30 Dec 2005 |12 Days Held Man Over Board Drill
Safety Meeting 08 Jan 2006 |3 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 11 Jan 2006 |0 Days Safe = 2, Un-safe = 6
Marine
Weather on 11 Jan 2006 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir.  Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
3.0nm ‘ 19kn ’ 130.0deg ‘1010.0mbar ‘ 18C° ’ 1.0m 130.0deg 4s 1 291.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 281.0
3 212.0
272.0deg | 4273.70kb | 10m | 190.0deg |  8s . 2020
Comments 5 269.0
6 203.0
7 289.0
8 280.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip 23:00 10 Jan 2006 On Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 253
Fresh Water CuMtr 565
Drill Water CuMtr 480
Cement G mt 105
Cement HT (Silica) mt
Barite Bulk mt 154
Bentonite Bulk mt 68
Pacific Wrangler 04:40 08 Jan, 2006 On Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 332.3
Fresh Water CuMtr 186
Drill Water CuMtr 500
Cement G Mt 137
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 8.3
Bentonite Bulk Mt 42
Currently backloading 26 jts riser and containers. Estimated time of departure for Eden; 00:30 12 Jan 2006
Helicopter Movement
Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS / / No flight today

AUSTRALIAPTY LTD
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Last BOP Test:

DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 32

12 Jan 2006 From: Simon Rodda/ Geoff Webster Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -

Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 3758.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $22,699,889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 3753.8m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001

_ Basin Progress 0.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1511.8m | Daily Cost $460,184
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 27.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1511.8m | Cum Cost $20,547,364
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 30.77 | FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 968
Wir Dpth (LAT) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL (LAT) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m

Current Op @ 0600
Planned Op

RIH to lay down tubulars remaining in derrick

RIH and lay out tubulars in Derrrick. Cemmence retrieving anchors

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Pulled and landed BOP's on carrier. Cut and pulled 20" casing. Cut and pulled 30" casing with PGB

FORMATION

Name Top

Base Funa Flounder Channel 2835.00m
Top 67.5 Ma Sand 2836.00m
Near 68.5 Ma Sand 3103.00m
Near 70.3 Ma Sand 3478.00m
TD

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 12 Jan 2006

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)

BOP |P RR2 0000 |0330 |3.50 |[3758.0m |Continued to pull BOP's and lay out marine riser.

BOP |P RR2 |0330 |0430 |1.00 |3758.0m |Pulled riser double and landed out BOP's on carrier

BOP |P RR2 0430 |0930 |5.00 |3758.0m |Removed guidelines from BOP's. Removed clamps from pod hoses. Broke riser double
and 5 ft termination spool from BOP's. Skidded BOP's to starboard side and laid down
riser double and termination spool

BOP |P RR2 0930 [1100 |1.50 |[3758.0m |Rigged down riser handling equipment, rigged up 5" DP handling equipment and moved
rig back over location

PA P TI 1100 [1430 |3.50 |3758.0m |Held JSA, Picked up 20" X 30" casing cutter assembly. RIH with 5" DP

PA P TI 1430 |[1500 |0.50 |3758.0m |Moved rig starboard forward to stab casing cutter assembly into wellhead

PA P CCT |1500 |1530 |0.50 |3758.0m |Engaged cutter asembly and tested with 40 kibs over pull. Commenced cutting casing.
Cut 20" casing free

PA P TO 1530 [1730 |2.00 |3758.0m |POOH with wellhead and 20" casing stub. Laid out same

BOP |P HBHA |1730 [1930 |2.00 |3758.0m |Held JSA. Changed out casing cutters blades, grapple, spacer sub and centralizer on
casing cutter assembly

PA P TI 1930 (2130 |2.00 |3758.0m |RIH with casing cutter to 30" housing

PA P CCT |[2130 |2230 |1.00 |3758.0m |Engaged casing cutter assembly into housing and test with 40 klbs overpull.
Commenced cutting 30" casing. Cut 30" casing

PA P TO 2230 [2400 |1.50 |3758.0m |POOH with guide base and 30" housing

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on

13 Jan 2006

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)

PA P TO 0000 |0100 |1.00 |3758.0m |Continued POOH with guide bsae and 30" housing

PA P TO 0100 |0130 |0.50 |[3758.0m |Landed out and secured guide base on trolley. backed out cap screws on guidebase to
30" housing.
Conducted 100m radius seabed survey with ROV after pulling PGB. Furgro
documentation and DVD to follow

PA P TO 0130 |0300 |1.50 |[3758.0m |Picked up 30" housing and 30" casing cut off to rig floor. Unlatched spear and laid out
30" housing. Broke down and laid out 30" spear and casing cutting BHA

PA P TO 0300 |0430 |1.50 |3758.0m |Removed guidelines from guidebase. Moved guidebase on trolley to starboard side of
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Last BOP Test:

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
moonpool
PA P PLD [0430 |0600 |1.50 |3758.0m |RIH with 8" DC's from derrick. Laid out 8" DC's
Operations For Period Hrs to Hrs on
Phase Data to 2400hrs, 12 Jan 2006
Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 23.5|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 23.50 0.979 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 33|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 56.50 2.354 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 86.50 3.604 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 103.00 4.292 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 104.00 4.333 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 480|17 Dec 2005 |08 Jan 2006 584.00 24.333 3758.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 93.5|21 Dec 2005 |12 Jan 2006 677.50 28.229 3758.0m
PLUG AND ABANDON(PA) 61|08 Jan 2006 |12 Jan 2006 738.50 30.771 3758.0m
WBM Data Cost Today $0
Mud Type: Seawater | API FL: cl: Solids(%vol): Viscosity
PV
Sample-From: Active Pit | Filter-Cake: K+C*1000: H20: vp
Time: HTHP-FL: Hard/Ca: Oil(%): Gels 10s
X Gels 10m
Weight: HTHP-cake: 1/32nd" | MBT: Sand:
Fann 003
Temp: PM: pH: Fann 006
PF: PHPA: Fann 100
Fann 200
Comment Final mud cost from report # 28 =A$ 294,855 Fann 300
Fann 600
BHA #7
Weight(Wet) Length 146.2m | Torque(max) D.C. (1) Ann Velocity
Wt Below Jar(Wet) String Torque(Off.Btm) D.C. (2) Ann Velocity
Drilling Jar Hours Pick-Up Torque(On.Btm) H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity
Slack-Off D.P. Ann Velocity
BHA Run Description
BHA Run Comment
Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bullnose 0.39m 7.940in 2.940in | 38897D
Stab 0.79m 17.500in 2.813in | SG15
Pipe cutter 3.01lm 12.250in 3.000in | D36242 44" knives positioned 4.44m below
wellhead to cut at 609.20m MDRT
Spacer sub 1.00m 8.000in 2.813in | 38886D
Rotating spear 2.84m 18.375in 3.250in | C76094
Drill Collar 26.45m 8.000in
XIO 1.16m 8.000in
HWDP 110.57m
BHA # 8
Weight(Wet) Length 145.5m | Torque(max) D.C. (1) Ann Velocity
Wt Below Jar(Wet) String Torque(Off.Btm) D.C. (2) Ann Velocity
Drilling Jar Hours Pick-Up Torque(On.Btm) H.W.D.P. Ann Velocity
Slack-Off D.P. Ann Velocity
BHA Run Description
BHA Run Comment
Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Bullnose 0.39m 7.940in 2.940in | 38897D
Stab 0.79m 17.500in 2.813in | SG15
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Last BOP Test:

Equipment Length oD ID Serial # Comment
Pipe cutter 3.01m 12.250in 3.000in | D36242 52" knives positioned 4.57m below
wellhead to cut at 609.20m MDRT
Spacer sub 0.31m 8.000in 2.813in | 38886D
Rotating spear 2.84m 18.375in 3.250in | C76094
Drill Collar 26.45m 8.000in
XIO 1.16m 8.000in
HWDP 110.57m
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 0 -0.0
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 0 0.0
Diesel m3 50 7.7 0 221.3
Fresh Water m3 27 31.2 0 172.1
Drill Water m3 0 12 0 342.5
Cement G MT 0 0 -13.4
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW Eff(%) SPM SPP  Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(in)  (ppY) (SPM)  (psi)  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (ps)) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
1 |A1700 6.000 | 10.20 97 3600.0 30 380 | 3.00 40 | 475 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
2 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 3600.0 30 390 | 3.00 40 | 480 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
3 | 12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 0 0 | 0.00 [3275.0 30 320 | 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m) Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 54
ESS 8
NEXUS 3
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 8 6 X ROV, 2 X Surveyors
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 2
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3 One swaco hand for new shaker being assessed for Diamond
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 3
CAMERON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 1
MO47 CREW 3
SMITH BITS 1
Total | 86
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Drill 08 Jan 2006 |4 Days Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Environental Issue 29 Dec 2005 |14 Days Environmental Audit Environmental audit by Nexus shorebase personnel.
Fire Drill 08 Jan 2006 |4 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 12 Jan 2006 |0 Days Deck = 7, Subsea = 2, Drill
=9, Welder =2
Man Overboard Dirill 30 Dec 2005 |13 Days Held Man Over Board Drill
Safety Meeting 08 Jan 2006 |4 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 12 Jan 2006 |0 Days Safe = 6, Un-safe = 2
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Last BOP Test:

Marine
Weather on 12 Jan 2006 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height ~Wave Dir.  Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ 20kn ‘ 225.0deg ‘1020.0mbar ‘ 20c° ‘ 1.0m 225.0deg 4s 1 284.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 216.0
3 181.0
272.0deg | 4387.00kb | 15m | 2250deg |  8s A 2310
Comments 5 265.0
6 198.0
7 328.0
8 289.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip 23:00 10 Jan 2006 On Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 191
Fresh Water CuMtr 560
Drill Water CuMtr 480
Cement G mt 105
Cement HT (Silica) mt
Barite Bulk mt 154
Bentonite Bulk mt 68
Pacific Wrangler 00:22 12 Jan 2006 | On Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 332.3
Fresh Water CuMtr 186
Drill Water CuMtr 500
Cement G Mt 137
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 8.3
Bentonite Bulk Mt 42
Enroute Ocean Patriot from Eden ETA 04:00 -06:00 13 Jan 2006
Helicopter Movement
Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS 15:45/16:55 715
AUSTRALIA PTY LTD
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Last BOP Test:

DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 33

13 Jan 2006 From: Simon Rodda/ Geoff Webster Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -

Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 3758.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $22,699,889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 3753.8m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001

_ Basin Progress 0.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1511.8m | Daily Cost $461,375
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 28.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1511.8m | Cum Cost $21,008,739
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 31.77 | FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 969
Wir Dpth (LAT) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL (LAT) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600 De-ballasting rig. Working on Elmago brake
Planned Op De-ballast rig and commence recovering anchors

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

POOH and recovered guidebase. Racked BOP's on carrier. RIH and laid out BHA and 5" drillpipe from Derrick

FORMATION
Name Top
Base Funa Flounder Channel 2835.00m
Top 67.5 Ma Sand 2836.00m
Near 68.5 Ma Sand 3103.00m
Near 70.3 Ma Sand 3478.00m
TD
Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 13 Jan 2006
Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
PA P TO 0000 |0100 |1.00 |3758.0m |Continued POOH with guide base and 30" housing
PA P TO 0100 |0130 |0.50 |[3758.0m |Landed out and secured guide base on trolley. backed out cap screws on guidebase to
30" housing.
Conducted 100m radius seabed survey with ROV after pulling PGB. Furgro
documentation and DVD to follow
PA P TO 0130 |0300 |1.50 |[3758.0m |Picked up 30" housing and 30" casing cut off to rig floor. Unlatched spear and laid out
30" housing. Broke down and laid out 30" spear and casing cutting BHA
PA P TO 0300 |0430 |1.50 |[3758.0m |Removed guidelines from guidebase. Moved guidebase on trolley to starboard side of
moonpool
PA P PLD 0430 |1000 |5.50 3758.0m | RIH with 8" DC's and 5" HWDP from derrick. Laid out same
PA P PLD 1000 |[1400 |4.00 3758.0m | RIH with 20 stands 5" DP and laid down same
PA P PLD [1400 |1730 |3.50 |3758.0m |RIH with 20 stands 5" DP and laid out same
PA P PLD [1730 |2200 |4.50 |3758.0m |RIH with 20 stands 5" DP and laid out same. Used rig tongs to break out over torqued
pipe
PA P PLD [2200 |2400 |2.00 |3758.0m |RIH with 20 stands 5" DP and laid out 10 singles
Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on 14 Jan 2006
Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
PA TP WO 0000 |0030 |0.50 |[3758.0m |Waited on Medivac helicopter to depart to re-commence crane operations for laying out
(OTH) drillpipe
PA P PLD 0030 |0330 |3.00 |3758.0m |Continued to lay down 5" DP
PA P PLD 0330 |[0600 |2.50 |3758.0m |De-ballastrig.
Work on Elmago brake

Phase Data to 2400hrs, 13 Jan 2006

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 23.5|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 23.50 0.979 0.0m
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Last BOP Test:

Phase Data to 2400hrs, 13 Jan 2006

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
ANCHORING(A) 33|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 56.50 2.354 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 86.50 3.604 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 103.00 4.292 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 104.00 4.333 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 480|17 Dec 2005 |08 Jan 2006 584.00 24.333 3758.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 93.5|21 Dec 2005 |12 Jan 2006 677.50 28.229 3758.0m
PLUG AND ABANDON(PA) 85|08 Jan 2006 |13 Jan 2006 762.50 31.771 3758.0m
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 0 -0.0
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 0 0.0
Diesel m3 0 15.2 0 206.1
Fresh Water m3 25 30.2 -0.3 166.6
Drill Water m3 0 36.1 0 306.4
Cement G MT 0 0 -13.4
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW Eff(%) SPM SPP  Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(in)  (ppY) (SPM)  (psi)  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (ps)) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
1 |A1700 6.000 | 10.20 97 3600.0 30 380 | 3.00 40 | 475 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
2 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 3600.0 30 390 | 3.00 40 | 480 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
3 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 0 0 | 0.00 |3275.0 30 320 | 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m)  Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 54
ESS 8
NEXUS 3
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 8 6 X ROV, 2 X Surveyors
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 2
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 3 One swaco hand for new shaker being assessed for Diamond
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 3
CAMERON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 1
MO47 CREW 3
SMITH BITS 1
Total | 86
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Drill 08 Jan 2006 |5 Days Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Environental Issue 29 Dec 2005 |15 Days Environmental Audit Environmental audit by Nexus shorebase personnel.
Fire Drill 08 Jan 2006 |5 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 13 Jan 2006 |0 Days Deck = 7, Subsea = 2, Drill
=6, Welder = 2, mech =2
Man Overboard Dirill 30 Dec 2005 |14 Days Held Man Over Board Dirill
Safety Meeting 08 Jan 2006 |5 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
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Last BOP Test:

HSE Summary

Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
STOP Card 12 Jan 2006 |1 Day Safe = 2, Un-safe = 2
Marine
Weather on 13 Jan 2006 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir.  Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ 2kn ] 0.0deg ‘1022.0mbar ‘ 22C° ] 1.0m 0.0deg 1s 1 216.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 243.0
3 187.0
272.0deg ‘ ‘ 4077.00klb ‘ 1.5m ‘ 225.0deg ‘ 8s A 2340
Comments 5 271.0
6 205.0
7 271.0
8 271.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip 23:00 10 Jan 2006 On Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 180
Fresh Water CuMtr 555
Drill Water CuMtr 480
Cement G mt 105
Cement HT (Silica) mt
Barite Bulk mt 154
Bentonite Bulk mt 68
Pacific Wrangler 04:10 13 Jan 2006 On Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 299.7
Fresh Water CuMtr 176
Drill Water CuMtr 500
Cement G Mt 137
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 8.3
Bentonite Bulk Mt 42
Helicopter Movement
Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
1 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS 15:45/16:55 715
AUSTRALIA PTY LTD
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Last BOP Test:

DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 34

14 Jan 2006 From: Simon Rodda/ Geoff Webster Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -

Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 3758.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $22,699,889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 3753.8m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001

_ Basin Progress 0.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1511.8m | Daily Cost $489,283
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 29.44 | Shoe MDBRT 1511.8m | Cum Cost $21,498,022
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 32.77 | FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 970
Wir Dpth (LAT) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL (LAT) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m

Current Op @ 0600

Planned Op

Recovering anchor # 5

Complete anchor recovery and release rig to Anzon Australia Limited

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Completed laying down 5" DP from derrick. De-ballast rig and recover anchors # 6, #2, #3, 7, #1 and #5

FORMATION

Name Top

Base Funa Flounder Channel 2835.00m
Top 67.5 Ma Sand 2836.00m
Near 68.5 Ma Sand 3103.00m
Near 70.3 Ma Sand 3478.00m
TD

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 14 Jan 2006

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)
PA TP \WYe] 0000 |0030 |0.50 |[3758.0m |Waited on Medivac helicopter to depart to re-commence crane operations for laying out
(OTH) drillpipe
PA P PLD |0030 |0330 |3.00 |3758.0m |Continued to lay down 5" DP
AR P OA 0330 |0900 |5.50 |3758.0m |De-ballast rig.
Work on Elmago brake
AR P AH 0900 |2400 |15.00 |3758.0m |De-ballasting completed at 09:15

Commenced Pulling anchors as follows:
Boat------- Anchor--- PCC to Boat---Off Bottom----Anchor Racked-----PCC to Rig

Grip #6 06:45 07:35 10:40 10:47
Wrangler---#2 08:11 10:00 13:06 13:21
Grip #3 11:09 11:48 13:42 14:03
Wrangler---#7 13:35 14:30 16:22 16:31
Grip #1 14:21 19:30 21:38 21:58
Grip #5 22:16 23:05

Wrangler on put on tow bridle @ 18:20 hrs

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 0600 Hrs on

15 Jan 2006

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)

AR P AH 0000 [0230 |2.50 |[3758.0m |Far Grip pulling bight of chain back to rig to release tension @ 0020hrs.
Tension dropping on #5 anchor, commence to heave in @ 0050hrs.
Anchor #5 @ 1350m chain out, tension dropping @ 0130hrs.
Far Grip reports work wire inadvertently paid out 700m @ 0215hrs

AR TP AH 0230 |0600 |3.50 |3758.0m |Trouble shooted Far grip winch problems. Far Grip reported damage to low gear and

(OTH) only able to work with high gear. Prepared to move vessel to acertain tonnage available

in high gear

Phase Data to 2400hrs, 14 Jan 2006

Phase

Phase Hrs

Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth

RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM)

23.5|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 23.50 0.979 0.0m
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Last BOP Test:

Phase Data to 2400hrs, 14 Jan 2006

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
ANCHORING(A) 33|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 56.50 2.354 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 86.50 3.604 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5/16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 103.00 4.292 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1|17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 104.00 4.333 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 480/|17 Dec 2005 |08 Jan 2006 584.00 24.333 3758.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 93.5|21 Dec 2005 |12 Jan 2006 677.50 28.229 3758.0m
PLUG AND ABANDON(PA) 88.5|08 Jan 2006 |14 Jan 2006 766.00 31.917 3758.0m
ANCHOR RETRIEVAL(AR) 20.5|14 Jan 2006 |14 Jan 2006 786.50 32.771 3758.0m
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 0 -0.0
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 0 0.0
Diesel m3 0 11.9 0 194.2
Fresh Water m3 29 22.1 0 173.5
Drill Water m3 0 0 0 306.4
Cement G MT 0 0 -13.4
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0 0.0
Pumps
Pump Data - Last 24 Hrs Slow Pump Data
No. Type Liner MW Eff(%) SPM SPP  Flow | Depth | SPM1 SPP1 Flowl | SPM2 SPP2 Flow2|SPM3 SPP3 Flow3
(i) (ppg) (SPM)  (ps))  (bpm) | (m) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm) | (SPM) (psi) (bpm)|(SPM) (psi) (bpm)
1 |A1700 6.000 | 10.20 97 3600.0 30 380 | 3.00 40 | 475 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
2 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 3600.0 30 390 | 3.00 40 | 480 | 4.00 50 | 580 | 5.00
3 |12P160 6.000 | 10.20 97 0 0 | 0.00 |3275.0 30 320 | 3.00 40 | 360 | 4.00 50 | 450 | 5.00
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m)  Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 56
ESS 8
NEXUS 3
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 8 6 X ROV, 2 X Surveyors
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 2
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 2
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 3
CAMERON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 1
MO47 CREW 3
SMITH BITS 1
Total | 87
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Dirill 08 Jan 2006 |6 Days Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Environental Issue 29 Dec 2005 |16 Days Environmental Audit Environmental audit by Nexus shorebase personnel.
Fire Drill 08 Jan 2006 |6 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 13 Jan 2006 |1 Day Deck = 6, Marine = 1, Drill =
7, Welder = 3, Subsea =1
Man Overboard Dirill 30 Dec 2005 |15 Days Held Man Over Board Dirill
Safety Meeting 08 Jan 2006 |6 Days Weekly safety meetings with
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Last BOP Test:

HSE Summary

Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
all crew members.
STOP Card 13 Jan 2006 |1 Day Safe =3, Un-safe = 1
Marine
Weather on 14 Jan 2006 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height Wave Dir. ~ Wave Period Anchors Tension (klb)
10.0nm ‘ 25kn ’ 220.0deg ‘1017.0mbar ‘ 21C° ’ 1.5m 220.0deg 4s 1 0.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 0.0
3 0.0
272.0deg | 4062.00kb | 20m | 220.0deg |  8s . 00
Comments 5 0.0
6 0.0
7 0.0
8 0.0
Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)
Far Grip 23:00 10 Jan 2006 On Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 162
Fresh Water CuMtr 550
Drill Water CuMtr 480
Cement G mt 105
Cement HT (Silica) mt
Barite Bulk mt 154
Bentonite Bulk mt 68
Anchor handling
Pacific Wrangler 04:10 13 Jan 2006 On Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 284.7
Fresh Water CuMtr 171
Drill Water CuMtr 500
Cement G Mt 137
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 8.3
Bentonite Bulk Mt 42
Anchor handling
Helicopter Movement
Flight # Company Arr/Dep. Time Pax In/Out Comment
2 BRISTOW HELICOPTERS 09:50/ 09:58 1/0
AUSTRALIA PTY LTD
1 VICTORIA AIR 23:58 /00:34 0/1
AMBULANCE
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Last BOP Test:

DRILLING MORNING REPORT # 35

15 Jan 2006 From: Simon Rodda/ Geoff Webster Culverin 1
To: J Ah-Cann -

Well Data
Country Australia | MDBRT 3758.0m | Cur. Hole Size 12.250in | AFE Cost $22,699,889
Field Gippsland | TVDBRT 3753.8m | Last Casing OD 13.375in | AFE No. 3433-1001

_ Basin Progress 0.0m | Shoe TVDBRT 1511.8m | Daily Cost $680,037
Drill Co. DOGC Days from spud 30.06 | Shoe MDBRT 1511.8m | Cum Cost $22,178,059
Rig OCEAN PATRIOT Days on well 33.40 |FIT/LOT: /15.80ppg | Days Since Last LTI 971
Wir Dpth (LAT) 585.0m Planned TD MD
RT-ASL (LAT) 2L8M | bjanned TD TVDRT
RT-ML 606.5m
Current Op @ 0600
Planned Op

Summary of Period 0000 to 2400 Hrs

Completed recovering anchors.

Ocean Patriot on tight tow @ 15:00hrs, Jan 15, 2006. Rig handed over to Anzon Australia Limited

Statement of Facts obtained from vessels

FORMATION

Name Top

Base Funa Flounder Channel 2835.00m
Top 67.5 Ma Sand 2836.00m
Near 68.5 Ma Sand 3103.00m
Near 70.3 Ma Sand 3478.00m
TD

Operations For Period 0000 Hrs to 2400 Hrs on 15 Jan 2006

Phse Cls Op From To Hrs Depth Activity Description
(RC)

AR P AH 0000 [0230 |2.50 |[3758.0m |Far Grip pulling bight of chain back to rig to release tension @ 0020hrs.
Tension dropping on #5 anchor, commence to heave in @ 0050hrs.
Anchor #5 @ 1350m chain out, tension dropping @ 0130hrs.
Far Grip reports work wire inadvertently paid out 700m @ 0215hrs

AR TP AH 0230 |0600 |3.50 |[3758.0m |Trouble shooted Far grip winch problems. Far Grip reported damage to low gear and

(OTH) only able to work with high gear. Prepared to move vessel to acertain tonnage available

in high gear

AR P AH 0600 |1500 |9.00 |3758.0m |Pullinganchors as follows:

Boat------- Anchor--- PCC to Boat---Off Bottom----Anchor Racked-----PCC to Rig

Grip #5 08:18 08:41
Grip--------- #8 08:52 09:25 11:25 11:40
Grip--------- #4. 11:57 12:50 14:53 N/A

Wrangler put on tow bridle @ 18:20 hrs Jan 14, 2006
Ocean Patriot on tight tow @ 15:00 Jan 15, 2006
Ocean Patriot handed over to Anzon Australia Limited @ 15:00 Jan 15, 2006

Statement of facts obtained from Ocean Patriot, Wrangler and Far Grip

Phase Data to 2400hrs, 15 Jan 2006

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth

RIG MOVE/RIG-UP/PRESPUD(RM) 23.5|05 Nov 2005 |14 Dec 2005 23.50 0.979 0.0m
ANCHORING(A) 33|14 Dec 2005 |15 Dec 2005 56.50 2.354 0.0m
SURFACE HOLE(SH) 30|15 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 86.50 3.604 650.0m
SURFACE CASING(SC) 16.5(16 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 103.00 4.292 650.0m
INTERMEDIATE CASING(IC) 1/17 Dec 2005 |17 Dec 2005 104.00 4.333 650.0m
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Last BOP Test:

Phase Data to 2400hrs, 15 Jan 2006

Phase Phase Hrs Start On Finish On Cum Hrs Cum Days Max Depth
INTERMEDIATE HOLE(IH) 480|17 Dec 2005 |08 Jan 2006 584.00 24.333 3758.0m
RISER AND BOP STACK(BOP) 93.5|21 Dec 2005 |12 Jan 2006 677.50 28.229 3758.0m
PLUG AND ABANDON(PA) 88.5|08 Jan 2006 |14 Jan 2006 766.00 31.917 3758.0m
ANCHOR RETRIEVAL(AR) 35.5|14 Jan 2006 |15 Jan 2006 801.50 33.396 3758.0m
Bulk Stocks
Name Unit In Used Adjust Balance
Barite Bulk MT 0 0 0 -0.0
Bentonite Bulk MT 0 0 0 0.0
Diesel m3 0 9.8 0 184.4
Fresh Water m3 0 0 0 173.5
Drill Water m3 0 12.1 0 294.3
Cement G MT 0 0 -13.4
Cement HT (Silica) MT 0 0 0 0.0
Casing
OD (in) Csg Shoe MD (m) Csg Shoe TVD (m)  Csg Landing Depth MD  Csg Landing Depth LOT/FIT (ppg)
(m) TVD (m)
650.30 650.30 604.40 604.40
1511.77 1511.77 603.50 603.50
Personnel On Board
Company Pax Comment
DOGC 58
ESS 8
NEXUS 3
FUGRO SURVEY LTD (ROV) 8 6 X ROV, 2 X Surveyors
DOWELL SCHLUMBERGER 2
M-1 AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 2
GEOSERVICES OVERSEAS S.A. 2
CAMERON AUSTRALIA PTY LTD 1
MO47 CREW 3
Total | 87
HSE Summary
Events Date of last  Days Since Descr. Remarks
Abandon Drill 15 Jan 2006 |0 Days Held weekly abandon rig
drill
Environental Issue 29 Dec 2005 |17 Days Environmental Audit Environmental audit by Nexus shorebase personnel.
Fire Drill 15 Jan 2006 |0 Days Held weekly fire drill
JSA 15 Jan 2006 |0 Days Deck = 6, Mech = 2, Drill =
5, Welder = 2, Subsea = 2
Man Overboard Dirill 30 Dec 2005 |16 Days Held Man Over Board Dirill
Safety Meeting 15 Jan 2006 |0 Days Weekly safety meetings with
all crew members.
STOP Card 15 Jan 2006 |0 Days Safe =1, Un-safe = 1
Marine
Weather on 15 Jan 2006 Rig Support
Visibility Wind Speed ~ Wind Dir. Pressure Air Temp.  Wave Height ~ Wave Dir. ~ Wave Period Anchors Tension (kib)
10.0nm ‘ 15kn ] 225.0deg ‘1020.0mbar ‘ 21C° ] 0.5m 225.0deg 3s 1 0.0
Rig Dir. Ris. Tension VDL Swell Height Swell Dir. Swell Period Weather Comments 2 0.0
3 0.0
| 4062.00kb | 15m | 225.0deg |  6s A 00
Comments 5 0.0
6 0.0
7 0.0
8 0.0
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Last BOP Test:

Vessel Name Arrived (Date/Time) Departed Status Bulks
(Date/Time)

Far Grip 23:00 10 Jan 2006 On Location Item Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 150
Fresh Water CuMtr 545
Drill Water CuMtr 480
Cement G mt 105
Cement HT (Silica) mt
Barite Bulk mt 154
Bentonite Bulk mt 68

Anchor handling

Bulk Stock on Board as per Statement of facts Jan 15, 2006

Pacific Wrangler 04:10 13 Jan 2006 On Location Iltem Unit Used Quantity
Diesel CuMtr 2714
Fresh Water CuMtr 168
Drill Water CuMtr 500
Cement G Mt 137
Cement HT (Silica) Mt 0
Barite Bulk Mt 8.3
Bentonite Bulk Mt 42

On tow Bridle

Bulk Stock on Board as per Statement of facts Jan 15, 2006
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ABSTRACT

Between 03 and 07 November 2005, and 09 and 17 December 2005, Fugro Survey Pty Ltd
(Fugro) provided equipment and personnel for the semi-submersible Mobile Offshore Drilling
Unit Ocean Patriot rig move from Fur Seal-1 to Culverin-1 location in Permit VIC/P56 in Bass
Strait, Victoria.

Surface positioning was provided by Fugro’s Multiple Reference Differential Global Positioning
System (MRDGPS) and Starfix Seis Navigation Software.

The final position for the drill stem derived from DGPS observations at Culverin-1 location is:

Location Name: Culverin-1
Easting (m): 644437.3
Northing (m): 5748256.4
Latitude: 38°24'08.14" S
Longitude: 148° 39’ 14.92" E
Rig Heading: 272.54° (True)

This position is 7.0m on a bearing of 337.0° (Grid) from the proposed Culverin-1 location.

All coordinates in this report are referenced to the Geocentric Datum of Australia 1994 (GDA94)
and projected onto the Map Grid of Australia 1994 (MGA94) Zone 55 (CM 147 ° E), unless
otherwise stated.

All times in this report are quoted in Australian Eastern Daylight-Saving Time (EDST) unless
otherwise stated.
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INTRODUCTION

Fugro Survey Pty Ltd (Fugro) was contracted by Upstream Petroleum Pty Ltd
(Upstream) to provide navigation and positioning survey services on board the semi-
submersible Mobile Offshore Drilling Unit (MODU) Ocean Patriot, during the rig move
to Culverin-1 location in Permit VIC/P56 in Bass Strait, Victoria.

A general location diagram is shown as Figure 1-1.

This report details the equipment used, survey parameters adopted, procedures
employed and the results achieved. A section on safety is included in Section 3.0 of
this report.

Scope of Work
Personnel and equipment were provided on a 24 hour per day basis for:

> Calibration and function testing of the survey equipment on board the rig and the
two Anchor Handling Vessels (AHVS).

> Surface navigation for the Ocean Patriot, using Fugro’'s MRDGPS (Multi
Reference DGPS) and Starfix Spot DGPS services.

> Surface navigation for AHVs during anchoring operations, using Starfix Spot
DGPS.

> Final rig surface positioning for the Culverin-1 location using DGPS
observations.

> Final reporting of the positioning results.
Sequence of Events

On 03 November 2005, J. Cohen and S. Bradley departed Perth for the Ocean Patriot.
After equipment calibrations, the anchors were recovered at Fur Seal-1 location on 05
November 2005, and the rig tow to Culverin-1 commenced. However, #4 anchor
winch malfunctioned during anchor deployment at Culverin-1. The rig was towed to
Eden Bay, NSW, for repairs and Fugro personnel returned to Perth.

On 10 December 2005, R. Risah joined the rig while the rig was anchored at Eden
Bay. Anchors were recovered at Eden Bay anchorage and the rig was towed to
Culverin-1 on 12 December 2005. M. Karklin joined the rig whist undertow to Culverin-
1 location.

Between 13 and 15 December 2005, the rig was positioned on location at Culverin-1.
Fugro personnel departed the rig on 17 December 2005.

Further details of Fugro’'s involvement in the rig move are presented in the Daily
Operations Reports included in Appendix A.

P0373 Final Report Rev 0.doc Page 1-1
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RESULTS

Final Position
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The final position of the Ocean Patriot drill stem was established by calculating the
mean position from two hours of DGPS data logged between 17:00hr and 19:00hr on
16 December 2005. During this period, calculated drill stem coordinates from the
primary and secondary positioning systems were logged at a five second interval in
Starfix Seis. Data from the primary positioning system were used for the final position

calculation.

Differential GPS corrections were derived using a multi-reference solution with base
station data from Melbourne, Bathurst and Cobar.

GDA94 geographical positions for the Culverin-1 location are shown in Table 2-1.

GDA9%4

Position

Method

Latitude

Longitude

Drill Stem at Surface

MRDGPS

38°24'08.14” S

148° 39’ 14.92" E

Proposed Location

38° 24 08.35" S

148° 39 15.04" E

TABLE 2-1 : GEOGRAPHICAL POSITIONS FOR CULVERIN-1

GDA94 grid coordinates (CM 147° E) for Culverin-1 location are shown in Table 2-2.

GDA94, MGA, CM147°E
Position Method Easting (m) Northing (m)
Drill Stem at Surface MRDGPS 644437.3 5748256.4
Proposed Location - 644440.0 5748250.0

TABLE 2-2 : GRID COORDINATES FOR CULVERIN-1

This position is 7.0m at a bearing of 337.0° (Grid) from the design location.

A copy of the original rig position field report is contained in Appendix B.

Rig Heading

The heading of the Ocean Patriot was established by calculating the average heading
during two hours of corrected gyro compass readings logged between 17:00hr and
19:00hr on 16 December 2005. During this period, gyro readings were logged at a five
second interval in Starfix Seis.

The Ocean Patriot's heading is shown in Table 2-3.

Description Method True Grid
Rig Heading Gyro 272.54° 273.57°
Proposed Heading - 270.00° 271.03°
TABLE 2-3 : RIG HEADING
Page 2-1
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2.3 Anchor Positions

The approximate locations of the Ocean Patriot's anchors are shown in Table 2-4.

GDA94, MGA, CM147°E
Anchor Easting (m) Northing (m) Azimuth Deployed By
1 643461 5748853 299.9° Pacific Wrangler
2 643944 5749115 330.0° Pacific Wrangler
3 644964 5749099 30.7° Far Grip
4 645480 5748869 59.2° Pacific Wrangler
5 645467 5747566 122.1° Pacific Wrangler
6 645023 5747233 149.3° Far Grip
7 643852 5747274 208.8° Far Grip
8 643454 5747792 244.2° Pacific Wrangler

TABLE 2-4 : ANCHOR POSITIONS
The approximate coordinates of the Ocean Patriot’s anchors were calculated from:

» The azimuth from the fairlead position to the AHVs stern position at the time of
anchor deployment.

» The range from the fairlead position to the anchor, as obtained from the on board
chain counter, corrected for catenary.
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3.0 SAFETY
All work undertaken by Fugro personnel during the project was performed within the
guidelines of Fugro’s Safety Policy, as defined in Fugro’'s Safety Manual (SMS-P01)
and Offshore Survey Safety Practices (SMS-SP26).

Fugro personnel worked within all project safety guidelines and plans adopted by
Upstream and Diamond Offshore.

No safety incidents involving Fugro personnel were reported during the project.

Fugro personnel attended a vessel induction, pre-rig move meeting and muster drill
whilst on board.

A Project Specific Safety Plan was developed for positioning services on board the
Ocean Patriot for the Culverin-1 rig move.
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SURVEY OPERATIONS
Mobilisation

After the completion of #4 anchor winch repairs, a Fugro personnel departed Perth on
09 December 2005 and arrived on board the rig on 10 December 2005, whilst it was
located at Eden Bay anchorage. Following an arrival briefing, the survey equipment
on board was powered up and system and function tests completed. The second
Fugro personnel joined the rig on 12 December 2005 whilst the rig was undertow.

General Survey Procedures
The tow was conducted with the Far Grip connected to the main tow wire.

About 5 kilometres from Culverin-1 location, the Pacific Wrangler was connected to
the #4 anchor. The Far Grip and Pacific Wrangler manoeuvred the rig onto the
proposed Culverin-1 location. Once the rig was positioned over Culverin-1 location
with the assistance of the Far Grip, #4 anchor was deployed by the Pacific Wrangler.

After establishing that #4 anchor was holding and the rig was maintaining its position
at Culverin-1, the Pacific Wrangler then ran anchors #8, #5 and #1. When the primary
anchors were successfully deployed, the Far Grip was released from the tow wire and
assisted the Pacific Wrangler in deploying the remaining anchors.

Once all anchors were deployed, the anchors were systematically cross-tensioned to a
specified tension of 200 tonnes for 10 minutes and then slackened down to working
tension.

During the deployment of each anchor, the AHVs were provided with a waypoint and
the corresponding run line via the Wombat telemetry system. The AHVs ran out the
anchor chain along this line to the desired drop point. The anchor chain was stretched
out and the anchor lowered to the seabed. After confirming that the anchor was
holding, the vessel then stripped the chain chaser back to the rig.

The Ocean Patriot was positioned over the Culverin-1 location with all anchoring and
pre-tensioning completed at 09:10hr on 15 December 2005. Final position data were
logged between 17:00hr and 19:00hr on 16 December 2005. A rig positioning field
report was issued to the Upstream Company Representative (see Appendix B).
Demobilisation

All navigation systems on board the Ocean Patriot and AHVs were switched off during
demobilisation and left on board the vessels for the anchor recovery at Culverin-1.

Fugro personnel departed the rig and returned to Perth on 17 December 2005.
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EQUIPMENT CALIBRATION

DGPS Navigation Integrity Check

In order to check the correct operation of the navigation systems installed on board the
Ocean Patriot DGPS data were logged for 30 minutes on 04 November 2005, whilst

the rig was located at Fur Seal-1.

A comparison of the primary and secondary DGPS was also conducted. The results
from both of these tests are provided in Table 5-1.

GDA94, MGA, CM 147°E

Easting (m) Northing (m)
Established Well Coordinates 600995.50 5779136.70
Observed Coordinates 600995.95 5779146.60
Difference -0.45 -9.90
Primary Navigation 600995.95 5779146.60
Secondary Navigation 600996.61 5779146.16
Difference -0.66 +0.43

TABLE 5-1 : DGPS NAVIGATION INTEGRITY CHECK

The DGPS check described above demonstrated that the navigation systems on board
the Ocean Patriot were set up and working correctly.

A positioning check list was completed at Culverin-1 location to confirm the proposed
rig position and to ensure that the correct geodetic datum, transformation and
projection parameters were being used. Geodetic calculations were performed using
both Starfix Seis and the off-line geodetic calculation package GEO.

Details of all positioning checks are provided in Appendix C.
Gyro Compass Calibration

The calibration of the survey gyro compass was carried out on 04 November 2005,
whilst the rig was located at Fur Seal-1.

A series of observations were made to the sun from which the rig heading was
calculated. The calculated values were then compared to the observed gyro compass
values logged in Starfix Seis and a mean C-O value of +1.88° was determined. This
correction was applied in the navigation suite.

Details of the gyro calibration are included in Appendix C.

P0373 Final Report Rev 0.doc Page 5-1
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6.0 SURVEY PARAMETERS
6.1 Geodetic Parameters

All coordinates are referenced to the Geocentric Datum of Australia 1994 (GDA94)
unless otherwise noted. The Global Positioning System (GPS) operates on the World
Geodetic System 1984 (WGS84) datum. Fugro’s Differential GPS Reference Stations
are currently defined in the International Terrestrial Reference Frame 2000 (ITRF2000
Epoch 2005.75) datum. Due to the continual refinement of the WGS84 reference
frame, for all cases, the transformation parameters indicate that the WGS84 and
ITRF2000 reference frames are essentially identical.

Datum ; World Geodetic System 1984 (WGS84)
Reference Spheroid ; World Geodetic System 1984

Semi Major Axis ; 6378137.000m

Inverse flattening : 298.257223563

Datum : Geocentric Datum of Australia 1994 (GDA94)
Reference Spheroid : Geodetic Reference System 1980 (GRS80)
Semi Major Axis : 6378137.000m

Inverse flattening : 298.257222101

The following seven parameter datum transformation (Table 6-1) was used in Fugro’s
software, to transform WGS84 (ITRF2000 Epoch 2005.50) coordinates to GDA94
coordinates. These parameters are calculated from the 14 parameter transformation
defined by Geoscience Australia. Fugro follows the Coordinate Frame Rotation
convention (as defined by UKOOA) for datum transformations.

Transformation Parameters from WGS84 (ITRF2000 Epoch 2005.50) to GDA94
dXx -0.0156m rX +0.01445"
dy -0.0348m ry +0.013050”
dz -0.0513m rZ +0.015037"

ds +0.004977ppm

TABLE 6-1 : TRANSFORMATION PARAMETERS

The proposed drilling location and all project coordinates are grid coordinates on the
Map Grid of Australia.

Grid : Map Grid of Australia (MGA94)
Projection : Transverse Mercator

Latitude of Origin : 0°

Central Meridian : 147° E (UTM Zone 55)

Central Scale Factor : 0.9996

False Easting : 500000m

False Northing : 10000000m

Units : Metres

P0373 Final Report Rev 0.doc
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6.2 Differential GPS Reference Stations

Fugro’s Differential GPS Reference Stations are currently defined in the ITRF2000
(Epoch 2005.50) datum and are shown in Table 6-2.

ITRF 2000, EPOCH 2005.75
Station Id Latitude Longitude Height (m) Uplink
Melbourne | 385 | 37°48 29.008" S 144° 57" 48.029" E 82.06 Optus/APSat
Bathurst 336 33° 25 46.882" S 149° 34’ 01.968" E 756.66 Optus/APSat
Cobar 316 | 31°29'57.434" S 145° 50’ 20.344" E 270.17 Optus/APSat

TABLE 6-2 : DGPS REFERENCE STATIONS

6.3 Project Coordinates and Tolerances

Project target coordinates and surface tolerance for Culverin-1 location were supplied
by Upstream and are shown in Table 6-3. Project procedures are provided in Appendix

D.
GDA94, MGA, CM 147°E
Location Easting (m) Northing (m) Tolerances
Culverin-1 644440.0 5748250.0 15m radius

TABLE 6-3 : PROJECT DESIGN COORDINATES

P0373 Final Report Rev 0.doc
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SURVEY EQUIPMENT, VESSEL AND PERSONNEL
Equipment
Survey equipment used for the positioning of the Ocean Patriot was as follows:

Ocean Patriot
2X Starfix satellite DGPS (1 Optus link, 1 APSat link)

2 X Trimble 4000 series GPS receivers

2 X Pentium IV computers, running Fugro’s Starfix Seis navigation software suite
3 X 17" monitors (2 Seis, 1 Helm)

2X SG Brown gyro compass

2 X Uninterruptible power supply units (UPS)

1x Teledesign radio/modem

1x Theodolite, tripod and dark glass

1x Printer

AHVs (complete system per vessel, plus one complete set of spares)

1x Pentium Il computers, running Starfix Display/Wombat
1x Monitors

1x Starfix VBS units

1x Fluxgate compasses

1x Teledesign radio/modems

All systems were provided complete with all necessary cabling, connectors, power
supplies, antennae, accessories, manuals and consumables.

Refer to Figure 7-1 for an equipment flow diagram for the Ocean Patriot and Figure 7-
2 for the equipment flow diagram for the AHVs.

Vessels

The vessels used for anchor handling and towing the Ocean Patriot were the Pacific
Wrangler and the Far Grip. Refer to Figure 7-3, Figure 7-4 and Figure 7-5 for the
vessel offset diagrams.

Personnel

Fugro personnel involved in the rig move and positioning operations were as follows:

R. Risah Surveyor / Party Chief 09 — 17 December 2005
M. Karklin Technician 12 — 17 December 2005
J. Cohen Surveyor 03 — 07 November 2005
S. Bradley Technician 03 — 07 November 2005

P0373 Final Report Rev 0.doc
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FIGURE 7-1 : EQUIPMENT FLOW DIAGRAM — MODU OCEAN PATRIOT

P0373 Final Report Rev 0.doc

Page 7-2



UHF Telemetry Modem

S
o
—— GPS Satellite
Starfix Spot
Differential

Corrections

STARFIX

Starfix VBS Splitter

IBM Compatible

Fluxgate
Compass

GPS Ae
=N

Signal

FIGURE 7-2 : EQUIPMENT FLOW DIAGRAM — AHVS

P0373 Final Report Rev 0.doc

Page 7-3



GPS-2
(-8.2,43.9,27.0)
(-33.5,42 Ay

(-8.9,41.9,27.0)

S

(-33539.0)

&

@ CRP-Drill Stem
(0.0,0.0,0.0)

(-33.5,-24

(-33.5,-27.

5,42.0)
3.5,39.0)

p(33.5,-27.0)

VESSEL OFFSET DIAGRAM - OCEAN PATRIOT

FIGURE 7-3

us\P0O373\report\figures\figure7-3



CPR (Datum)

(0.0,0.0)
GPS Ant

(2.0,0.0)

Centre Stern

(0.0,-58.5)

—l"uman

VESSEL OFFSET DIAGRAM - PACIFIC WRANGLER

FIGURE 7-4

u\P0373\report\figures\figure7-4.dgn



CRP (Datum)
(0.0,0.0)

GPS Ant
(0.25,0.0)

Centre Stern
(0.0,-46.10)

by

—l"uman

VESSEL OFFSET DIAGRAM - FAR GRIP

FIGURE 7-5

u\PO373\report\figures\figure7-5.dgn



—I-'unnu

8.0 CONCLUSIONS AND RECOMMENDATIONS

> The Ocean Patriot was successfully positioned during the towing and anchoring
operations and at Culverin-1.

> The Pacific Wrangler and Far Grip were successfully positioned during the
towing and anchoring operations.

> The surface position of the Culverin-1 well was determined.
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9.0 DISTRIBUTION

Copies of this report have been distributed as follows:

Upstream Petroleum : 3 paper copies
Attn: John Ah-Cann . 1 electronic copy
Fugro Survey Pty Ltd . 1 paper copy

: 1 electronic copy
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APPENDIX A
DAILY OPERATIONS REPORTS



Fugro Survey Pty Ltd
PM-F50

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

CLIENT: UPSTREAM

LOCATION: CULVERIN-1

DATE: 03/11/2005

PROJECT: RIG MOVE

VESSEL: OCEAN PATRIOT

JOB NO: P0373

FROM TO SUMMARY OF OPERATIONS
1200 1830 Travel to Melbourne
1900 Check Inn Holiday Inn Melbourne
EQUIPMENT NO. | EQUIPMENT NO. | PERSONNEL TITLE
J.Cohen Surveyor
S. Bradley Engineer
VEHICLES:
CONSUMABLES:
ACCOMMODATION: 2 X HOLIDAY INN MELBOURNE
AUTHORISED CONTRACT CHANGES / COMMENTS:
Party Chief Signature: Client Repriesentative Signature: D O R Number
3. Con— 10y
¢ i\

A

Approved by the Operations Manager — 12/05/04

Page 1 of 1




Fugro Survey Pty Ltd
PM-F50

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

_F'“““'-

CLIENT: UPSTREAM

LOCATION: CULVERIN-1

DATE: 04/11/2005

PROJECT: RIG MOVE

VESSEL: OCEAN PATRIOT

JOB NO: P0373

FROM TO SUMMARY OF OPERATIONS

0715 Check-out Holiday Inn Melbourne

0730 800 Travel to Essendon Airport

0200 1030 Helicopter to Ocean Patriot

1230 All'equipment online and operational

1300 Pre-rig move meeting

1500 #6 PCC to Pacific Wrangler, changing out #6 anchor

1822 Gyro Calibration to Snapper Platform (C-O = +1 T7°)

1920 Gyro Calibration by Solar Observations (C-O = +1 .88°)

1938 Gyro Calibration by Solar Observations (C-O = +1 .93°)

Mean C-0 = +1.86° (entered into SEIS)

2201 2231 DGPS Check Fix

2210 #2 PCC to Far Grip
EQUIPMENT NO. | EQUIPMENT NO. | PERSONNEL TITLE
SEIS Computer 1 Laptop 1 J.Cohen Surveyor
Gyrocompass 1 Trimble Receivers 2 S. Bradley Engineer
Demodulators 2 Theodolite 1
AHV x 2 (Wombat) 2 Radio Modem 1
VEHICLES:
CONSUMABLES:
ACCOMMODATION:
AUTHORISED CONTRACT CHANGES / COMMENTS:

Party Chief Signature: Client Representative Signature: D O R Number
J C,Cr‘{)\/ %g P0373-2
[\

Approved by the Operations Manager — 12/05/04 ¥ V Page 1 of 1




Fugro Survey Pty Ltd
PM-F50

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

—F"G“"-

CLIENT: UPSTREAM

LOCATION: CULVERIN-1

DATE: 05/11/2005

PROJECT: RIG MOVE

VESSEL: OCEAN PATRIOT -

JOB NO: P0373

FROM TO SUMMARY OF OPERATIONS

0001 #6 anchor racked

0014 #7 PCC to Pacific Wrangler

0200 #2 anchor racked

0212 #3 PCC to Far Grip

0230 #7 anchor racked

0312 Pacific Wrangler connected to tow bridie

0430 #3 anchor racked

0455 #4 PCC to Far Grip

0857 #4 anchor racked

1053 #8 PCC to FG

1236 #8 anchor racked

1310 #1 PCC to Far Grip

15655 #1 anchor racked

1614 #5 PCC to Far Grip

1800 Rig official handover from Apache to Upstream

1815 #5 anchor racked

1830 #5 PCC back to rig, begin transit to Culverin-1

2359 Continue transit to Culverin-1
EQUIPMENT NO. | EQUIPMENT NO. | PERSONNEL TITLE
SEIS Computer 1 Laptop 1 J.Cohen Surveyor
Gyrocompass 1 Trimble Receivers 2 S. Bradley Engineer
Demodulators 2 Theodolite 1
AHV x 2 (Wombat) 2 Radio Modem 1
VEHICLES:
CONSUMABLES:
ACCOMMODATION:
AUTHORISED CONTRACT CHANGES / COMMENTS: 1800 - RIG OFFICIAL HANDOVER FROM APACHE
TO UPSTREAM

Party Chief Signature: Client ng'resentative Signature: D O R Number
B! Cﬁ?,—./\ \\Q | P0373-3
. e d M\I —

Approved by the Operations Manager - 12/05/04

\)

Page 1 of 1




Fugro Survey Pty Ltd
PM-F50

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

‘F"“"’-

CLIENT: UPSTREAM LOCATION: CULVERIN-1 DATE: 06/11/2005
PROJECT: RIG MOVE VESSEL: OCEAN PATRIOT JOB NO: P0373
FROM TO SUMMARY OF OPERATIONS
0001 Continue transit to Culverin-1
031 5 Pacific Wrangler turning onto final run-in to Culverin-1
0356 #4 PCC to Far Grip
0430 Rig on location
0900 #4 anchor on bottom (646024, 5749133)
1030 Abandon rig drill
1217 #8 PCC to Far Grip
1300 J. Cohen attends weekly safety meeting
1445 #4 winch failure — chain spooled off drum, heaving in #8 anchor, Static tow with
Pacific Wrangler. #4 bitter end approx position 644438mE, 5748284mN
1654 #8 anchor racked
1704 #8 PCC back to rig, Pacific Wrangler begin tow to Eden for rig repairs
1900 S. Bradley attends weekly safety meeting
EQUIPMENT NO. | EQUIPMENT NO. | PERSONNEL TITLE
SEIS Computer 1 Laptop 1 J.Cohen Surveyor
Gyrocompass 1 Trimble Receivers 2 S. Bradley Engineer
Demodulators 2 Theodolite 1
AHV x 2 (Wombat) 2 Radio Modem 1
VEHICLES:
CONSUMABLES:
ACCOMMODATION:
AUTHORISED CONTRACT CHANGES / COMMENTS:
Party Chief Signature: Client Reprefentative Signature: D O R Number
J.Cob— I
MLV

Approved by the Operations Manager - 12/05/04 \‘v ¥ \J

Page 1 of 1




Fugro Survey Pty Ltd
PM-F50

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

22

CLIENT: UPSTREAM

LOCATION: CULVERIN-1

DATE: 07/11/2005

PROJECT: RIG MOVE

VESSEL: OCEAN PATRIOT

JOB NO: P0373

FROM TO SUMMARY OF OPERATIONS

1000 All equipment powered down, remains mobilized for next rig move

1100 1330 Travel Ocean Patriot to Essendon Airport

1640 1740 Travel Melbourne to Perth
EQUIPMENT NO. | EQUIPMENT NO. | PERSONNEL TITLE
SEIS Computer 1 Laptop 1 J.Cohen Surveyor
Gyrocompass 1 Trimble Receivers 2 S. Bradley Engineer
Demodulators 2 Theodolite 1
AHV x 2 (Wombat) 2 Radio Modem 1
VEHICLES:
CONSUMABLES:
ACCOMMODATION:
AUTHORISED CONTRACT CHANGES / COMMENTS:

Party Chief Signature: Client Representative Signature: D O R Number
\ Codo— P0373-5

Approved by the Operations Manager — 12/05/04
Note — To ensure that this is the latest version check the Online BMS.
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Fugro Marine Division
FSHY01-1

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

e

CLIENT: UPSTREAM PETROLEUM

LOCATION: CULVERIN-1

DATE: 9 DEC 2005

PROJECT: RIG MOVE

VESSEL: OCEAN PATRIOT

JOB NO: P0373

FROM TO SUMMARY OF OPERATIONS
1515 2200 R. Risah travels from Perth to Sydney
2245 Check-in Mercure Inn hotel at Sydney airport

RIG EQUIPMENT NO. AHV EQUIPMENT | NO. | PERSONNEL TITLE
R. Risah Surveyor / PC
VEHICLES: 1x Taxi
CONSUMABLES:
ACCOMMODATION: 1x Mercure Inn Hotel
AUTHORISED CONTRACT CHANGES / COMMENTS:
Party Chief Signature: Client Representative Signature: D O R Number
oy
7 P0373-6
/ﬁ% M 2>
v

Approved by Dave Scott, Operations Manager — 08/05/01
Note - To ensure that this is the latest version check the Electronic Master File

Page 1 of 1




Fugro Marine Division

FSHY01-1

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

=

CLIENT: UPSTREAM PETROLEUM

LOCATION: CULVERIN-1

' DATE: 10 DEC 2005

PROJECT: RIG MOVE

VESSEL: OCEAN PATRIOT \ JOB NO: P0373

FROM TO SUMMARY OF OPERATIONS
0700 Check-out of hotel

0850 1030 Travel from Sydney to Merimbula

1030 1105 Travel from Merimbula to Eden

1200 Arrive onboard rig

1400 Navigation system onboard rig power-up and operational

RIG EQUIPMENT NO. AHV EQUIPMENT | NO. | PERSONNEL TITLE
Starfix Seis 2 Starfix Seis (remote) | 3 R. Risah Surveyor / PC
Starfix.Spot DGPS 2 Fluxgate compass 3

Gyro Compass 2 Radio Modem 3

Radio Modem 2 UPS 3

UPS 2

Theodolite 1

Printer 1

VEHICLES:

CONSUMABLES:

ACCOMMODATION: onboard rig

AUTHORISED CONTRACT CHANGES / COMMENTS:

Party Chief Signature: Client Representative Signature: D O R Number
L/ V -
Approved by Dave Scott, Operations Manager — 08/05/01 Page 1 of 1

Note — To ensure that this is the latest version check the Electronic Master File




Fugro Marine Division
FSHY01-1

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

e

N

CLIENT: UPSTREAM PETROLEUM LOCATION: CULVERIN-1

DATE: 11 DEC 2005

PROJECT: RIG MOVE

VESSEL: OCEAN PATRIOT

JOB NO: P0373

FROM TO SUMMARY OF OPERATIONS
1030 1800 Transfer on FRC to Far Grip to set-up navigation system
1600 2030 M. Karklin travels from Perth to Melbourne
1700 Navigation system onboard Far Grip operational
1830 2359 Anchor recovery at Eden anchorage
2100 M. Karklin checks-in Holiday Inn hotel at Melbourne airport

RIG EQUIPMENT NO. AHV EQUIPMENT | NO. | PERSONNEL TITLE

Starfix Seis 2 Starfix Seis (remote) | 3 R. Risah Surveyor / PC

Starfix.Spot DGPS 2 Fluxgate compass 3 M. Karklin Engineer

Gyro Compass 2 Radio Modem 3

Radio Modem 2 UPS 3

UPS 2

Theodolite 1

Printer 1

VEHICLES: 1x Taxi

CONSUMABLES:

ACCOMMODATION: 1x Holiday Inn hotel, 1x onboard rig

AUTHORISED CONTRACT CHANGES / COMMENTS:

Party Chief Signature: Client Representative Signature: D O R Number

M(%’ P0373-8

G

Approved by Dave Scott, Operations Manager — 08/05/01
Note — To ensure that this is the latest version check the Electronic Master File
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Fugro Marine Division
FSHY01-1

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

=

AN

CLIENT: UPSTREAM PETROLEUM LOCATION: CULVERIN-1

DATE: 12 DEC 2005

PROJECT: RIG MOVE

VESSEL: OCEAN PATRIOT

JOB NO: P0373

FROM TO

SUMMARY OF OPERATIONS
0000 0630 Anchor recover at Eden anchorage
0630 2359 Rig undertow to Culverin-1 location
0830 1000 M. Karklin travels (helo) from Melbourne to rig
1000 1130 M. Karklin arrives on the rig and attends arrival & safety induction
1030 Muster & fire drill \
2130 P. Wrangler joins rig
2300 Navigation system onboard P. Wrangler operational

RIG EQUIPMENT NO. AHV EQUIPMENT | NO. | PERSONNEL TITLE

Starfix Seis 2 Starfix Seis (remote) | 3 R. Risah Surveyor / PC

Starfix.Spot DGPS 2 Fluxgate compass 3 M. Karklin Engineer

Gyro Compass 2 Radio Modem 3

Radio Modem 2 UPS 3

UPS 2

Theodolite 1

Printer 1

VEHICLES:

CONSUMABLES:

ACCOMMODATION: 2x onboard rig

AUTHORISED CONTRACT CHANGES / COMMENTS:

Party Chief Signature: Client Representative Signature: D O R Number

/%/% MJM P0373-9
7 B

Approved by Dave Scott, Operations Manager — 08/05/01
Note — To ensure that this is the latest version check the Electronic Master File

Page 1 of 1




Fugro Marine Division -"'i.n:ano
FSHY01-1 @
DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

CLIENT: UPSTREAM PETROLEUM LOCATION: CULVERIN-1 DATE: 13 DEC 2005

PROJECT: RIG MOVE

VESSEL: OCEAN PATRIOT JOB NO: P0373

FROM TO SUMMARY OF OPERATIONS
0000 0800 Rig undertow to Culverin-1 location

0800 Commence run-in approach to #4 anchor drop location

0830 P. Wrangler connects to #4 anchor

1000 Commence anchor deployment at Culverin-1 location

1202 #4 anchor on seabed E645674 N5748964 (P. Wrangler)
1700 #4 anchor dragging, rig moves off location

2020 #4 anchor off seabed

2020 2220 P. Wrangler recovering #4 anchor to stern roller for inspection
2220 2245 P. Wrangler turning #4 anchor to correct orientation

2245 2359 P. Wrangler re-deploying #4 anchor

RIG EQUIPMENT NO. AHV EQUIPMENT | NO. | PERSONNEL TITLE
Starfix Seis 2 Starfix Seis (remote) | 3 R. Risah Surveyor / PC
Starfix.Spot DGPS 2 Fluxgate compass 3 M. Karklin Engineer
Gyro Compass 2 Radio Modem 3
Radio Modem 2 UPS 3
UPS 2
Theodolite 1
Printer 1
VEHICLES:
CONSUMABLES:
ACCOMMODATION: 2x onboard rig
AUTHORISED CONTRACT CHANGES / COMMENTS:
Party Chief Signature: Client Representative Signature: D O R Number

/ﬁ/% /%/ P0373-10

v

Approved by Dave Scott, Operations Manager — 08/05/01
Note — To ensure that this is the latest version check the Electronic Master File

Page 1 of 1




Fugro Marine Division

FSHY01-1 -ir%

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

CLIENT: UPSTREAM PETROLEUM LOCATION: CULVERIN-1 DATE: 14 DEC 2005
PROJECT: RIG MOVE VESSEL: OCEAN PATRIOT JOB NO: P0373
FROM TO SUMMARY OF OPERATIONS
0000 0110 Re-deployment of #4 anchor
0110 #4 anchor on seabed E645980 N5749156  (P. Wrangler)
0456 #8 anchor on seabed E643054 N5747606 (P. Wrangler)
0942 #5 anchor on seabed E645843 N5747319 (P. Wrangler)
1416 #1 anchor on seabed E643342 N5748969  (P. Wrangler)
1604 #1 anchor off seabed, re-deploying anchor
1648 #1 anchor on seabed E642986 N5749135 (P. Wrangler)
2045 #3 anchor on seabed EB45351 N5749728 (Far Grip)
2359 Anchor deployment ops at Culverin-1 location
RIG EQUIPMENT NO. AHV EQUIPMENT | NO. | PERSONNEL TITLE
Starfix Seis 2 Starfix Seis (remote) | 3 R. Risah Surveyor / PC
Starfix.Spot DGPS 2 Fluxgate compass 3 M. Karklin Engineer
Gyro Compass 2 Radio Modem 3
Radio Modem 2 UPS 3
UPS 2
Theodolite 1
Printer 1
VEHICLES:
CONSUMABLES:
ACCOMMODATION: 2x onboard rig
AUTHORISED CONTRACT CHANGES / COMMENTS:
Party Chief Signature: Client Representative Signature: D O R Number
/y/\t% /}///éfﬁ" P0373-11
Y e

Approved by Dave Scott, Operations Manager — 08/05/01

Page 1 of 1
Note — To ensure that this is the latest version check the Electronic Master File




Fugro Marine Division

FSHY01-1

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

=

CLIENT: UPSTREAM PETROLEUM

LOCATION: CULVERIN-1

DATE: 15 DEC 2005

PROJECT: RIG MOVE

VESSEL: OCEAN PATRIOT

JOB NO: P0373

FROM TO SUMMARY OF OPERATIONS
0000 Anchor deployment ops at Culverin-1 location in progress
0110 #7 anchor on seabed EB43652 N5746922 (Far Grip)
0250 #2 anchor on seabed E643593 N5749745 (P. Wrangler)
0514 #6 anchor on seabed E645271 N5746798 (Far Grip)
0600 Complete anchor deployment at Culverin-1 location
0635 0645 Cross tensioning anchors #4 and #8
0710 0720 Cross tensioning anchors #1 and #5
0755 0805 Cross tensioning anchors #2 and #6
0847 0857 Cross tensioning anchors #3 and #7
0910 Rig on position at Culverin-1
0930 1400 Rig ballasting down to drilling draft to 23.5m
RIG EQUIPMENT NO. AHV EQUIPMENT | NO. | PERSONNEL TITLE
Starfix Seis 2 Starfix Seis (remote) | 3 R. Risah Surveyor / PC
Starfix.Spot DGPS 2 Fluxgate compass 3 M. Karklin Engineer
Gyro Compass 2 Radio Modem 3
Radio Modem 2 UPS 3
UPS 2
Theodolite 1
Printer 1
VEHICLES:
CONSUMABLES:
ACCOMMODATION: 2x onboard rig
AUTHORISED CONTRACT CHANGES / COMMENTS:

Party Chief Signature: ) Client Representative Signature: D O R Number
/Q/\f// /%% P0373-12
=

Approved by Dave Scott, Operations Manager — 08/05/01 Page 1 of 1

Note —~ To ensure that this is the latest version check the Electronic Master File




Fugro Marine Division
FSHY01-1
DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

=2

CLIENT: UPSTREAM PETROLEUM LOCATION: CULVERIN-1 DATE: 16 DEC 2005
PROJECT: RIG MOVE VESSEL: OCEAN PATRIOT JOB NO: P0373
FROM TO SUMMARY OF OPERATIONS
0000 1700 Standby to conduct final position observation upon completion of spudding ops
1515 1700 Spudding operations
1700 1900 Logging final surface position (drill stem) at Culverin-1
Culverin-1

Easting: 644437.3m

Northing: 5748256.4m

Latitude: 38° 24’ 08.35” S

Longitude: 148° 39 14.92° E

Rig Heading: 272.5° (T)

7.0m @ 337° from design location

RIG EQUIPMENT NO. AHV EQUIPMENT | NO. | PERSONNEL TITLE

Starfix Seis 2 Starfix Seis (remote) | 3 R. Risah Surveyor / PC

Starfix. Spot DGPS 2 Fluxgate compass 3 M. Karklin Engineer

Gyro Compass 2 Radio Modem 3

Radio Modem 2 UPS 3

UPS 2

Theodolite 1

Printer 1

VEHICLES:

CONSUMABLES:

ACCOMMODATION: 2x onboard rig

AUTHORISED CONTRACT CHANGES / COMMENTS:

Party Chief Signature: Client Representative Signature: D O R Number

g =
e [ :

Approved by Dave Scott, Operations Manager — 08/05/01 Page 1 of 1

Note - To ensure that this is the latest version check the Electronic Master File




Fugro Marine Division
FSHY01-1

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

CLIENT: UPSTREAM PETROLEUM

LOCATION: CULVERIN-1

DATE: 17 DEC 2005

PROJECT: RIG MOVE

VESSEL: OCEAN PATRIOT

JOB NO: P0373

FROM TO SUMMARY OF OPERATIONS
1200 Shut down navigation system onboard rig
1400 1530 Fugro personnel depart rig for Melbourne
1810 2205 Fugro personnel return from Melbourne to Perth

RIG EQUIPMENT NO. AHV EQUIPMENT | NO. | PERSONNEL TITLE
Starfix Seis 2 Starfix Seis (remote) 3 R. Risah Surveyor / PC
Starfix.Spot DGPS 2 Fluxgate compass 3 M. Karklin Engineer
Gyro Compass 2 Radio Modem 3
Radio Modem 2 UPS 3
UPS 2
Theodolite 1
Printer 1
VEHICLES:
CONSUMABLES:
ACCOMMODATION:
AUTHORISED CONTRACT CHANGES / COMMENTS:
Party Chief Signature: Client Representative Signature: D O R Number
2 | =
S

Approved by Dave Scott, Operations Manager — 08/05/01
Note — To ensure that this is the latest version check the Electronic Master File

Page 1 of 1




APPENDIX B
FINAL POSITIONING DATA



Company Man :

W. Westman

RIG POSITION FIELD REPORT GRO
Culverin-1

Client : Upstream Petroleum Job Number : P0373
Rig : Ocean Patriot Date: 16-Dec-05
Project : Rig Move to Culverin-1, Permit VIC/P56

The results of the observations are as follows:

The surface location of the drill stem on the Ocean Patriot was derived from two hours of observations of the Primary Differential GPS Data,
between 17:00hrs and 19:00hrs on completion of anchor pre-tensioning, ballasting and spudding operations.

Geographical Coordinates

Grid Coordinates

Latitude () -038° 24' 8.14" South

Longitude (A) 148° 39' 14.92"  East

644437.3
5748256.4

Easting
Northing

The drill stem position is 7.0 m at a bearing of 337.0°

The Client supplied design location Culverin-1 .

Grid from the design location.

Geographical Coordinates

Grid Coordinates

Latitude () -038° 24' 8.35" South

Longitude (1) 148° 39' 15.04"  East

644440.0
5748250.0

Easting
Northing

The heading of the Rig, Ocean Patriot was derived from the mean of 2hrs of the Gyro heading is:

272.54° TRUE

273.57° Grid

Datum :
Spheroid :

GDA94_Australia_ICSM-ITRF2005.50
GRS80

All coordinates in this field report are quoted in the following coordinate system:

Zone (Central Meridian) :

Projection : Transverse Mercator (UTM)
55 147° East

The approximate positions of the rig anchors corrected for catenary are as follows:

Anchor Easting Northing Azimuth(®) - True

1 643461 5748853 299.9°
2 643944 5749115 330.0°
3 644964 5749099 30.7°

4 645480 5748869 59.2°

5 645467 5747566 122.1°
6 645023 5747233 149.3°
7 643852 5747274 208.8°
8 643454 5747792 244.2°

Party Chief/Surveyor:

Company Man : ///7é % i: E

“w. Westman

DOC: FSHY48-3

DC\/- N
NV, £

PAGE 1 OF 1

NATE: D7I1AINAR
WAL, L1V I




APPENDIX C
DGPS AND GYRO CHECKS



RIG POSITIONING

—ann
GEODESY AND COORDINATE CHECK LIST ——

Client : Upstream Petroleum Job Number: PO0373
Rig : Ocean Patriot Date: December 16, 2005
Project : Rig Move to Culverin-1, Permit VIC/P56

1. CONFIRMATION OF PROPOSED RIG COORDINATES and HEADING.

Well Name Culverin-1 Ensure agreement with Client onsite prior to any positioning
Well Location — Latitude(¢) -038°24'8.35" S Operations. OK(?XYVN.

Well Location — Longitude()) 148° 39'15.04" E

Rig Heading (True) 270°T

2. GEODETIC PARAMETERS (WGS84 to LOCAL DATUM)

DATUM: Dx -0.01560 m Ensure agreement with Client onsite prior to positioning operations.
Dy -0.03490 m OK (?) N.

GRS80 Dz -0.05130 m
Rx 0.01445 "

Projection: Ry 0.01305 "
Rz 0.01504 "

Transverse Mercator (UTM) Ds 0.00498 ppm

UTM Zone 55

Central Meridian 147° East

3. CHECK TRANSFORMATION OF SITE COORDINATES.

Well Location — Easting 644440.0 Ensure agreement with Starfix.Seis. OK (?@ N
Well Location — Northing 5748250.0 If not, CHECK and RECALC.
Convergence at Location 1.03°
Rig Heading (° Grid) 271.03°
4. MEAS. ANT. OFFSETS from ANT. TO D/STEM (Rel. to Datum) NAV #1 SYSTEM NAV #2 SYSTEM
( Measure two (2) separate directions, verifying closure.)
Delta X(m) -8.86 m -8.24 m
Delta Y(m) 4186 m 43.86 m
Angle between Rig Centreline and Antenna(s) (Grid) 348.05° 349.4°
Distance between Drill Stem and Antenna (m) 42.79 m 4463 m
5. MANUAL COORDINATE VERIFICATION FOR ANTENNAS NAV #1 SYSTEM NAV #2 SYSTEM
Proposed Drill Stem Position Easting 644440.0 644440.0
' Northing 5748250.0 5748250.0
Drill Stem to Antenna Proposed Hdg (G) 271.028° 271.028°
Brg (G) = Prop. Hdg. + Angle btwn centreline and antenna 259.077° 260.388°
Distance (m) 42.79 m 44.63 m
Calculated Antenna Easting 644397.99 644396.00
Coordinates (Local Datum) Northing 5748241.89 5748242.55
Latitude (¢)| -038°24'8.63" S -038° 24' 8.61" S
Longitude (A)] 148°39'13.31" E 148° 39' 13.23" E
Calculated Proposed Antenna Coords (WGS 84) Latitude (¢)] -038°24'8.61" S -038° 24' 8.59" S
Longitude (A)] 148°39 13.32" E 148° 39' 13.24" E
6. POST RIG MOVE - OBSERVED ANTENNA COORD
Observed GPS Receiver Antenna Position in Latitude (¢)|-38° 24' &-63 S -38° 24 -2 S
WGS84. Longitude (A)|148° 39" i2.=1 E 148 ° 39" (2-F% E
Ensure agreement between calculated and observed coordinates. If NO, check calcs., antenna offsets. OK(?XY N
Surveyor : %/ Date :_ \&5-OEC-20CwS
R. Risal¥”
DOC: FSHY48-1 PAGE 1 OF 1
REV: 2 DATE: 8/1/01©




RIG POSITIONING GRO
DGPS CHECK LIST (PRE RIG MOVE) Y ——
I o
Client: Upstream Job Number : P0373
Rig : Ocean Patriot Date: 4-Nov-05
Project : Rig Move to Culverin-1, Bass Strait
from Fur Seal 1 to Culverin-1

1) ESTABLISHED WELL COORDINATES
Horizontal Datum: GRS80

- Observe 30 minutes of DGPS data, logging both Primary and Secondary systems.

Establish a mean drill stem position from the primary navigation system and compare against the

established well coordinates.

Easting Northing
Established Well Coordinates 600995.50 | 5779136.70
Observed Coordinates 600995.95 | 5779146.60
Differences -0.45 -9.90

Note: Prior to logging DGPS data for the check fix, the Ocean Patriot had commenced anchor recovery and had moved off

location.
Ensure agreement OK(?) Y/ N
If No, Check and ensure that rig has not moved off location.

2) PRIMARY/SECONDARY NAV SYSTEMS
From the data logged above, compare the observed coordina
Primary and Secondary navigation systems.

tes for both

Easting Northing

Primary Navigation 600995.95 | 5779146.60
Secondary Navigation 600996.61 5779146.16
Differences -0.66 0.43

Ensure agreement OK(?)@ N

If No, Check antenna offsets and gyro calibration.

Party Chief/Surveyor: J C&ﬂ\,—\ Client Representative :
J. Cohen R. King

DOC: FSHY48-2
REV: 2

PAGE 1 OF 1
DATE: 14/9/00©




(YA sbuey 43IHO ALYV / HOAIAANS
o L8) wnwiuiy usyod aunjeubis
0 20T winwixep
100 uonelrsq "pIs
- 88°L ueap

. 06°L 26920 |.02°082|.¥0L'2ee | 22808 | LE |.6¥ [-08)]. LE6'CST [48ECC FC .EGC| .00L.60 8%} .008¥ L0 .8€0- | 91:€Z:8 | GO-AON-¥ 9

- S8'L 76920 |.0.°05Z|.9¥525Z | obb 08l | €2 | .92 |.08L] . 986°25C |.8E T VT .£GC| 400'L .60 -8¥} .008% L0 .,8€0- | #9228 | GO-AON-v g

. 181 26920 |.0206Z]|.9002GZ | 6¥L 181 | 95 |.80 [.181]. GGL'€GT |.8E°CC ¥T .£GC| .00'L 60 .87} .00'8% .0 ,8€0- | LV'1T:8 | GO-AON-§ ¥

- 20T 76920 |.0£0S¢|.0ze262 | 80608 | 8¢ [ .S [-081|.822€ST [.8ECC . ¥C -£GC| .00°L .60 -8F} .00'8¥ L0 .820- | 81:12'8 | SO-AON-v [

- 981 26920 |.0806Z|.29125C | vEL'18L | 20 |.80 [.18L] . 96Z€ST |u8ECC WC oLGC| 400'L .60 -8¥}) .00'8% L0 .820- | 1S:0Z'8 | SO-AON-¥ [4

- 98'1L 26920 |.06°06Z|.29c25Z | ¥v0' L8l | 8¢ |.20 [.18)] . 90V'€GC |u8ECT ¥T -L5C| 400'L .60 -8¥1) .00'8¥% .20 .8€0- | L0:0Z'8 | GO-AON-¥ }

6pH boqg 02a [oos [ [Baqg | Baq veq SNa Sa SING
sdaiba( spwelq jossop BpH [osson a1n () epnyubuo () spnye 1N a1eq ON
(00) | WESWS | 5q | POPO | UNS O} UORRMARININIO | 4 ynuwizy ung perernoleo UORISOd JUSWINESU >0
SUONEAISSG0

w 20 . 60 - 81 () epnybuo
. 8 .20 . 88" (¢) opneT : juswinysul jo uonisod ySONA Slewixosdde ssjug . 00 .00 .08l 3UI[3J}USD |9SSBA 0} OY WU} UOIO31I0D Jajuig
S ] a S N a s|ejaq |9ssan
siyLl I 9uoz awly
GO-AON-#0 :9)eQq usyod r uokaning
zesoel "ON [elidg wesysdn Jualo
ZL PIIAA judsWINISU| ueng ssegq ‘| -UUBAIND 0} aAoly By :uonduosaqg qor
joLjed uesoQ :Jossap £/¢0d Jaquiny qop oabngy

AYVININNS NOLLYTINDTVO - HLNNIZY NNS A9 NOILVYEITVYO SSVYdINOD OHAD




APPENDIX D
CLIENT SUPPLIED INFORMATION



CULVERIN-1
SUPPLEMENTARY DRILLING PROGRAMME
DOCUMENT No: 34332-DR-01-0002

1 MANAGEMENT SUMMARY

Culverin-1 is an exploration well to evaluate the Intra-Latrobe reservoirs. This evaluation will include mud
logging, logging-while-drilling and electric line logging.

Culverin-1 well operations will be conducted by the semi-submersible Ocean Patriot. Water depth at the
wellhead location will be approximately 585m. The Location Map in section 12 shows the location of
Culverin-1 relative to existing Gippsland Basin Fields.

1.1 Well Information Summary

Well Name & Number: Culverin-1
Designation: Exploration
Permit: VIC/P56
Permit Holder: Nexus Energy Limited
Project Manager: Upstream Petroleum Pty Ltd
Project Manager’s Representative: Duncan Nuttall (Upstream)
Operator (per NOPSA): Diamond Offshore General Company (DOGC)
Operator’s Representative: Steve Ramsey (DOGC)
Anticipated Spud Date: Nov 2005 ‘
Rig Name & Type: Ocean Patriot Semi Submersible
Drilling Contractor: . Diamond Offshore
Water Depth at LAT: 585m
RT above LAT: 22m
Surface Location
e Datum, Spheroid, Map Grid and GDAY4, GRS80, MGA, UTM Zone 55 (Central
Projection Information:: Meridian 147°E)
e Latitude: Lat: 38° 24’ 8.35” South
¢ Longitude: Long: 148° 39° 15.04” East -
¢ Easting: 644 440 mE
¢ Northing: 5748 250 mN

e Surface Location Tolerance:

15m radius circle at surface




APPENDIX 4

CEMENTING FINAL REPORT

Culverin-1 Basic Well Completion Report April 2006



Schiumberger

Cementing End Of Well Report
Culverin-1

Rig . Ocean Patriot

Well Type . Exploration

Customer : Nexus

Prepared by : Pam Kosarek
e-mail  pkosarek@perth.oilfield.slb.com
Tel (61) - 8 — 9420 4639
Fax (61) - 8 — 9322 3110

Date : 10 March 2006
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Well Summary

Client Representative

No Name Position
1 W. Westman  [Drilling Supervisor
2 B. Webb Drilling Supervisor
3 R. King Drilling Supervisor
4 S. Rodda Drilling Supervisor

Dowell Supervisor

No Name Position
1 R. Beresford [Field Specialist
2 P. Kosarek Field Engineer
3 N. Macatangay | Cementing Assistant
4 E. Llagas Field Specialist
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Miscellaneous Pumping and Pressure Testing

Job Job Started Type of | Pressure Job Finished
° Date Fluid Max, Psi Date
BOP Test 22/12/2006 Sw 7500 23/12/2006
Leak Off Test 24/12/2006 MUD 1662 24/12/2006




, oL
DOWELL — Australia, NZ & PNG sfiiiimnanaan
SUIIUIgUl o)
END WELL REPORT
Culverin-1

JOB DESIGN & EXECUTION SUMMARY

36" HOLE / 30" X 20" CASING

1.1 Drilling/Casing:

The 36" hole was drilled to a total depth of 650 m with seawater and Hi-vis sweeps. 30" Casing was run and set at 650 m
with a 5" DP inner string.

1.2 Design

A single 15.8 ppg tail slurry was planned to provide strong cement at the 20" shoe:

Tail Slurry
G Cement: 944 sacks

Seawater: 5.313 gal/sk

D047 (antifoam): 0.01 gal/sk
S001 (accelerator): 1.0 % BWOC
Density — 15.8 ppg

Yield - 1.19 cuft/sk

Slurry Volume — 200 bbls

TOC - Seabed

Open Hole Excess — 200%

1.3 Execution

While circulating with seawater after the casing was landed, a Job Hazard Analysis with the Rig Crews and Barge
Captain was performed to inform them of their job role and the potential hazards that may occur during execution.

Job Procedure:
1) Pump 5 bbl sea water with dye.
2) Pressure test surface lines to 2000psi.
3)  Pump 15 bbl sea water with dye
4)  Mix & pump 200 bbl of tail slurry @ 15.8ppg
5) Displace with 64 bbl seawater.
6) Bleed off pressure and check floats.

1.4 Evaluation

Job executed according to procedure.



DOWELL — Australia, NZ & PNG

171/2" HOLE / 13 3/8” CASING

2.1 Drilling/Casing:

The 17 1/2" hole was drilled to a total depth of 1525 m with seawater and Hi-vis sweeps. 13 3/8" casing was run and set
at 1511 m. A DeepSea EXPRES* cement head was used for top and bottom plug release.

2.2 Design:
Lead Slurry Tail Slurry
G Cement G Cement
Sea water: 12.718 gal/sk Sea water: 5.324 gal/sk
D047 (antifoam): 0.01 gal/sk D047 (antifoam): 0.01 gal/sk
D075 (extender): 0.42 gal/sk
Density —12.5 ppg Density — 15.8 ppg
Yield — 2.23 cuft/sk Yield — 1.18 cuft/sk
Slurry Volume — 398 bbl Slurry Volume — 208 bbl

2.3 Execution:

After the casing was landed and cement line rigged up, a Job Hazard Analysis with the Rig Crews and Barge Captain was
performed to inform them of their job role and the potential hazards that may occur during execution.

Job Procedure:

1)
2)
3)
4)
)
6)
7)
8)
9)
10)
11)
12)
13)
14)
15)

Rig up DeepSea Express Surface Dart Launcher and Subsea Tool to landing string
Rig up cement lines

Conduct Job Hazard Analysis

Pump 5 bbl sea water ahead

Pressure test lines to 2000 psi

Pump 15 bbl sea water ahead

Pump 20 bbl sea water with dye

Release bottom dart

Mix & pump 398 bbl lead slurry @ 12.5 ppg

Mix & pump 208 bbl tail slurry @ 15.8 ppg

Release top dart

Displace with 40 bbl sea water to release top plug
Switch to rig pumps for final 418 bbl mud displacement
Bump plug and pressure test casing

Bleed off pressure and check floats ok.

2.4 Evaluation:

Job executed according to procedure.



DOWELL — Australia, NZ & PNG

121/4” HOLE / WELL ABANDONMENT

3.1 Well Abandonment

After completion of the 12 4" hole section and formation evaluation, the well was abandoned using cement plugs.

3.2 Design:
Plug 1 Plug 2 Plug 3 Plug 4
HTB Cement HTB Cement HTB Cement G Cement
Drill water: 5.549 gal/sk Drill water: 5.810 gal/sk Sea water: 6.629 gal/sk Sea water: 5.324 gal/sk

D047 (antifoam): 0.01 gal/sk D047 (antifoam): 0.01 gal/sk D047 (antifoam): 0.01 gal/sk D047 (antifoam): 0.01 gal/sk
D145A (dispersant): 0.1 gal/sk ~ D145A (dispersant): 0.095 -
gal/sk
D110 (retrarder): 0.01 gal/sk
D193 (fluid loss): 0.75 gal/sk D193 (fluid loss): 0.5 gal/sk -
Density —15.8 ppg Density — 15.8 ppg Density — 15.8 ppg Density — 15.8 ppg

Yield — 1.53 cuft/sk Yield — 1.53 cuft/sk Yield — 1.56 cuft/sk Yield —1.18 cuft/sk
Slurry Volume — 102 bbl Slurry Volume — 65 bbl Slurry Volume — 71 bbl Slurry Volume — 50 bbl

3.3 Execution:

Before each job a Job Hazard Analysis with the Rig Crews and Barge Captain was performed to inform them of their job
role and the potential hazards that may occur during execution.

Job Procedure - Plug 1:
1) Pump 5 bbl drill water
2) Pressure test lines to 1000 psi
3)  Pump 5 bbl drill water
4)  Mix & Pump 102 bbl slurry @ 15.8 ppg
5)  Pump 1.5 bbl drill water
6) Displace with 195 bbl mud

Job Procedure - Plug 2:
1) Pump 5 bbl drill water
2)  Pressure test lines to 1000 psi
3)  Pump 5 bbl drill water
4)  Mix & Pump 65 bbl slurry @ 15.8 ppg
5)  Pump 1.5 bbl drill water
6) Displace with 149 bbl mud

Job Procedure - Plug 3:
1) Pump 5 bbl sea water.
2)  Pressure test lines to 1000 psi
3) Pump 5 bbl sea water
4)  Mix & Pump 71 bbl slurry @ 15.8 ppg
5)  Pump 1.5 bbl drill water
6) Displace with 74 bbl mud

Job Procedure - Plug 4:
1) Pump 5 bbl sea water.
2)  Pressure test lines to 1000 psi
3)  Pump 5 bbl sea water
4)  Mix & Pump 50 bbl slurry @ 15.8 ppg
5)  Pump 1.5 bbl sea water
6) Displace with 30 bbl mud

3.4 Evaluation

The jobs were performed as per design and procedure.



schiumberger

Laboratory Cement Test Report- Culverin-1 30” Conductor

Signatures

Fluid No : AUPT 790001 Client : Nexus Location / Rig : Ocean Patriot

Date : Dec-03-2005 Well Name  : Culverin 1 Field : Portland Brenton

Job Type Conductor Depth 607.0 m TVD 607.0 m

BHST 8 degC BHCT 20 degC BHP 1196 psi

Starting Temp. 27 degC Time to Temp. 00:16 hr:mn Heating Rate  0.56 degF/min

Starting Pressure 300 psi Time to Pressure  00:16 hr:mn Schedule 9.3-3
Composition

Density 15.80 Ib/gal Yield 1.20 ft3/sk Mix Fluid 5.313 gal/sk

Porosity 59.3 % Solid Fraction 40.7 % Slurry type Conventional

Code Concentration  Sack Reference Component Blend Densit Lot Number |

G 94 |b of BLEND Blend 199.77 Ib/ft3 Rig

Sea water 5.303 gal/sk Base Fluid Rig

D047 0.010 gal/sk antifoam Lab

S001 2.000 %BWOC %95-%97 accelerator Lab

Rheology (Average readings
~ (rpm) (deg)

300 190.0
200 169.0
100 128.0
60 111.0
30 95.0
6 34.0
3 24.0
10 sec Gel 24
10 min Gel 34
| Temperature | 20 degC |
Pv: 108.391 cP
Ty: 88.69 Ibf/100ft2

Thickening Time
40 Bc 03:00 hr:mn
70 Bc 04:02 hr:mn
100 Bc 04:40 hr:mn
Remark : Thickening time do not include batch time
Free Fluid
1.5 mL/250mL in 2 hrs
At 27 degC and 0 deg incl.
Sedimentation None
Water Analysis

Chloride Calcium Magnesium
>3000.00 mg/L (Ib/bbl) (Ib/bbl)

Comments

General Comment : S001 is prehydrated
Fann Reading Comment :

Thickening Time Comment :

Page 9



Schiumberger

Laboratory Cement Test Report-Culverin-1 1338 Lead Slurry

Signatures
Fluid No : AUPT 792001 Client : Nexus Location / Rig : Ocean Patriot
Date : Nov-06-2005 Well Name _ : Culverin 1 Field : Portland Brenton
Job Type cond Depth 1500.0 m TVD 1500.0 m
BHST 33 degC BHCT 24 degC BHP 2500
Starting Temp. 27 degC Time to Temp. (00:20) Heating Rate  (degF/min)
Starting Pressure 396 Time to Pressure  (00:20) Schedule @)
Composition
Density 12.50 Ib/gal Yield 2.23 ft3/sk Mix Fluid 13.148 gal/sk
Porosity 78.9 % Solid Fraction 211 % Slurry type Conventional
Code Concentration  Sack Reference Component Absolute Density Lot Number |
G 94 Ib of Class G Cmt Class G Cmt 199.77 Ib/ft3 Rig
Sea water 12.718 gal/sk Base Fluid Rig
D047 0.010 gal/sk antifoam Lab
D075 0.420 gal/sk extender Lab
Rheology (Average readings
(rpm) (deg)
300 30.0
200 24.0
100 21.0
60 18.0
30 16.0
6 12.0
3 10.0
10 sec Gel 9
10 min Gel 15
[ Temperature | 27 degC |
Pv: 15.227 cP
Ty: 14.82 |bf/100ft2

Thickening Time
Consistency Time

40 Bc 08:20 hr:mn

70 Bc 11:00 hr:mn

100 Bc 16:40 hr:mn

Remark : Thickening time do not include batch time
Free Fluid

2.5 mL/250mL in 2 hrs

At 27 degC and 0 deg incl.

Sedimentation None
Comments

General Comment :

Fann Reading Comment :

Thickening Time Comment :

Other test Comment :;; ;;

Page 10
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Laboratory Cement Test Report-Culverin-1 1338Tail_Without CaCl2

Signatures
Fluid No : AUPT 792003 Client : Nexus Location / Rig : Ocean Patriot
Date : Nov-07-2005 Well Name  : Culverin-1 Field : Casing Paul
Job Type Casing Depth 1500.0 m TVD 1500.0 m
BHST 33 degC BHCT 24 degC BHP (2500psi)
Starting Temp. (23degC) Time to Temp. 00:20 Heating Rate  (degF/min)
Starting Pressure (396psi) Time to Pressure  00:20 Schedule ()
Composition
Density 15.80 Ib/gal Yield 1.18 ft3/sk Mix Fluid 5.334 gal/sk
Porosity 60.2 % Solid Fraction 39.8 % Slurry type Conventional
(ofoT. [} Concentration  Sack Reference Component Absolute Density Lot Number
G 94 Ib of Class G Cmt Class G Cmt 199.77 Ib/ft3 Rig
Sea water 5.324 gal/sk Base Fluid Rig
| D047 0.010 gal/sk antifoam Lab
Rheology (Average readings
(rpm) (deg) (deg)
300 108.0
200 89.5
100 79.0
60 67.0
30 54.5
6 245
3 18.5
10 sec Gel 19
10 min Gel 25
| Temperature | 27 degC | (degC)
k:1.42E-1 k : (Ibf.s*n/ft2)
Ibf.s”n/ft2 n:()
n:0.325 Tv: (Ibfi100ft2)
Ty: 1.40 Ibf/100ft2

Thickening Time
Consistency Time

40 Bc 03:52 hr:mn

70 Bc 04:19 hr:mn

100 Bc 04:46 hr:mn

Remark : Thickening time do not include batch time
Free Fluid

mL/250mL in 2 hrs

At (degC) and (deg) incl.

Sedimentation
Water Analysis

Chloride Calcium Magnesium

(Ib/bbl) (Ib/bbl) (Ib/bbl)
Fluid Loss

API Fluid Loss mL

mL in 30 min  at (degC) and (psi)
Comments

General Comment :
Fann Reading Comment :
Thickening Time Comment :

Page 11
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Laboratory Cement Test Report-Culverin-1 HTB Plug 1 @ 3750m
(Database Lab Test from Basker-2)

Signatures
Fluid No : AUPT 756001 Client : Nexus Location / Rig : Ocean Patriot
Date : Aug-25-2005 Well Name : Culverin-1 Field : Brenton
Job Type Plug Depth 3750.0 m TVD 3750.0 m
BHST 99 degC BHCT 68 degC BHP 6190 psi
Starting Temp. 27 degC Time to Temp. 00:49 hr:mn Heating Rate  0.84 degC/min
Starting Pressure 642 psi Time to Pressure  00:49 hr:mn Schedule 9.7-3
Composition
Density 15.80 Ib/gal Yield 1.53 ft3/sk Mix Fluid 6.419 gal/sk
Porosity 56.2 % Solid Fraction 43.8 % Slurry type Conventional
Code Concentration  Sack Reference Component Blend Density Lot Number |
G 94 Ib of BLEND Blend 199.77 Ib/ft3
Fresh water 5.549 gall/sk Base Fluid
D066 35.000 %BWOC silica Rig
D193 0.750 gal/sk fluid loss Lab
D145A 0.100 gal/sk dispersant Lab
D110 0.010 gal/sk retarder Lab
D047 0.010 gal/sk antifoam Lab
Rheology (Average readings
(rpm) (deg)
300 63.0
200 43.5
100 27.5
60 225
30 17.0
6 10.5
3 9.5
10 sec Gel 9
10 min Gel 15
| Temperature | 68 degC |
Pv: 50.460 cP
Ty: 11.43 Ibf/100ft2

Thickening Time

40 Bc 04:06 hr:mn

70 Bc 04:30 hr:mn

100 Bc 04:45 hr:mn

Remark : Thickening time do not include batch time
Free Fluid

1.0 mL/250mL in 2 hrs

At 27 degC and 0 deg incl.

Sedimentation None
Water Analysis

Chloride Calcium Magnesium

0.11 Ib/bbl (Ib/bbl) (Ib/bbl)
Fluid Loss

API Fluid Loss 56 mL

28 mL in 30 min  at 68 degC and 1000 psi

Comments
General Comment :
Fann Reading Comment :
Thickening Time Comment :
